ORDINANCE NO. 2013-23

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF
THE CITY OF PEORIA, ARIZONA AMENDING
CHAPTER 9 OF THE PEORIA CITY CODE (1992) BY
AMENDING SECTION 9-31, INTERNATIONAL FIRE
CODE, ADOPTED; AMENDING SECTION 9-33
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, LOCAL AMENDMENTS;
PROVIDING FOR SEPARABILITY; AND PROVIDING
FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

THEREFORE, IT IS ORDAINED by the Mayor and Council of the City of
Peoria, Maricopa County, Arizona as follows:

SECTION 1. Chapter 9 of the Peoria City Code (1992) is amended by
amending Section 9-31 pertaining to the International Fire Code, Adopted and which
shall read as follows:

Sec. 9-31.  International Fire Code, Adopted.

(@) There is adopted by the City for the purpose of prescribing minimum
regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire and
explosion, that certain code which is now on file in the City Clerk’s office known as
the “International Fire Code (IFC) 20062012 Edition” as amended from time to time
and not inconsistent with anything herein provided, and the Referenced Standards
as published by the International Code Council, as amended from time to time and
not inconsistent with anything herein provided and that such codes and standards
may hereafter be referred to as the IFC and the following appendix chapters.

(b)  Where there is a conflict between the provision of the International Fire
Code and this Chapter of the City Code, the more restrictive shall apply.

(c)  The following Appendices of the International Fire Code are adopted in
their entirety:
Appendix B-Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings
Appendix C-Fire Hydrant Locationg and Distribution
Appendix D-Fire Apparatus Access Roads
Appendix E-Hazard Categories
Appendix F-Hazard Ranking
Appendix G- Cryogenic Fluids, Weight and Volume Equivalents
Appendix H-Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP) and

Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS) Instructions
Appendix |-Fire Protection Systems—Noncompliant Conditions

endix J-Buildina Information Sign



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 2 of 51

SECTION 2. Chapter 9 of the Peoria City Code (1992) is amended by amending
Section 9-33 pertaining to the International Fire (‘ndp Local Amendments and which

shall read as follows:
Sec. 9-33. International Fire Code, Local Amendments.
(a) Section 102.3 Change of Use or Occupancy is amenaea by repiacing

the words “/nifernationai—Existing—Buiiding—Gede this code” with “the _cGurrently

adopted Fire Code and amendments,” designating the existing text as subsection 1
and adding the foliowing paragraph as subsection 2.

Section 102.3 Change of Use or Occupancy.

2. All changes of occupancy shall be coordinated with the Fire Marshal
prior to issuance of a Temporary or Permanent Cerificate of
Occupancy.

(b)  Section 102.4 Application of building code is amended by adding the
words “and the currently adopted Fire Code and amendments” after “International

Evintimee

mﬂ‘ﬂy‘DU"UH Iy \JUUU

(c)  Section 102.56 Historic buildings is amended by adding the words “and
tne currently adopted Fire Code and amendments” after ‘InternationalExisting

roved fire protection plan.”

(d)  Section 104.3 Right of entry is hereby amended by adding the
following:

The Fire Department shall inspect, as often as necessary, buildings and
premises, including such other hazards or appliances designated by the Fire Chief
for the purposes of ascertaining and causing to be corrected any of the conditions
which would reasonably tend to cause fire or contribute to its spread, or any violation
of the purpose or provisions of this code and of any other law or standard affecting
fire safety. Any person who refuses entry for purposes of this provision shall be in
violation of Peoria City Code Section 9-43(a) and subject to the penalties prescribed
in Peoria City Code Section 9-42, including civil sanctions identified in 9-42(b).

(e) Section 104.6 Official Records is hereby amended by adding the
following:

104.6.5 Required information. Each business and building owner shall
provide the following information to the Fire Code Official upon request: Responsible
party address, responsible party telephone number, building owner address, building
owner telephone number, square footage of the building and/or leased space,
Insurance company name, Insurance company policy number, and Insurance
company telephone number.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 3 of 51

(f Section 104.10 Fire Investigations is amended with the following new
section:

104.10 Fire Investigations. The Fire Department shall investigate or cause to
be investigated promptly the cause, or|g|n and circumstance of each and
every fire occ mg in the juu:.uu.uuu mvuwmg ioss of me or injury (o a person

Fire uepartmem mamng the investigation that such fire is of suspicious origin,
the member shall notify the appropriate law enforcement agency and shall
secure the site until the law enforcement agency takes control of the site.
The Fire investigator shall continue to pursue the investigation to its
conclusion.

(@) Section 104.11.4 Restricting Public Access is amended with the
following new section:

It shall be the duty of the Police Department, at the time of any fire, to place
ropes or guards across all streets, lanes or alleys on which shall be situated any
building on fire,-and at such other points as are deemed expedient and necessary.
Any person entering within the line indicated by such ropes or guards and refusing to
go outside such lines when directed to do so by any police officer or officer of the fire
department shall be guiity of a class one misdemeanor.

(h)  Section 105 Permits, 105.1.1 Permit Required, is amended by

renumbering—the—existing—text—as—subsection—1—and adding the following as

subsection 24.

24. It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to use a building
or premises or engage in any activities for which a permit is determined to be
required by the Fire Code Official without having first obtained such permit from the

Fire Department.
(i) Section 105.2 Application is amended with the following new section:

Section 105.2 Application. Application for a permit required by this code shall
be made to the fire code official in such form and detail as prescribed by the fire
code official no later than thirty (30) days prior to date of the event. Applications for
permits shall be accompanied by such plans as prescribed by the fire code official.

Scope. Fees for reviewing plans, issuing permits and conducting inspections relating
to construction or installation of automatic sprinkler systems, fire alarm system, hood
and duct fire-extinguishing systems and other fire- and life-safety systems for
compliance with the International Fire Code and other laws and ordinances, and
other services provided shall be set by the Fire Department. The following contains a
Uniform Fees and Charges Program for the City of Peoria Fire Department.

Permit and Service Fees Ordinance



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 4 of 51

Purpose. The purpose of this ordinance is to establish fees for specific Fire Code
permits as defined in the International Fire Code, as adopted by this jurisdiction and
for the establishment of fees for service performed by the Fire Department.

Definitions. All terminology not defined in this chapter shall be defined as stated in
the International Fire Code as adopted by this jurisdiction. Permits and Service
Fees. A fee in accordance with the foiilowing scheduie shaii be paid to the Fire
Department at the time of application for: (1) a RENEWABE PERMIT, (2) and
INSTALLATION or REMOVAL and ALTERATION PERMIT, (3) an ACTIVITY
PERMIT, (4) any OTHER SERVICE, (5) any RECORDS, PHOTOGRAPHS or
DOCUMENTS, or (6) a HAZARDOUS MATERIALS STORAGE PERMIT. Such fee
shall not be refunded upon failure of an applicant to receive the permit. Failure to
apply for necessary permits or services may result in an order from the Fire Marshal
to obtain a permit or service. Fees are payable upon permit application. Failure to
pay for permit, plan review or inspection fees imposed by this fee schedule, within
the time period specified, shall render such permit null and void.

EXCEPTION: These permit charges shall not apply to activities of nonprofit
Corporations or civic or fraternal organizations that possess an Internal Revenue
Service tax exempt status. However, these groups will be assessed plan review and
inspection fees.

Standard Hourly Fee: There shall be a standard hourly fee of fiftyone hundred
dollars ($508100.00), with a one (1) hour minimum, charge for all inspection and plan
review work unless specifically exempted. All reinspections (follow-up inspections)
shall be charged at the standard hourly fee with a one (1) hour minimum, unless
otherwise specified. All inspections, plan reviews and consultations shall be charged
this standard hourly fee, unless otherwise specified. The overtime hourly fee shall be
one and one half (1 ¥2) the standard hourly fee, when the department is requested to
review plans or conduct inspections outside of the normal work day.

Renewable Permit Fees: When an inspection or plan review is conducted by the Fire
Prevention Division to ensure proper design, installation or permit compliance, the
standard hourly fee for the first hour of inspection or the first hour of plan review,
when required, shall be paid at the time of application. Fees for subsequent hours of
plan review shall be paid prior to the issuance of a permit. The permit fee shall be in
addition to the standard hourly fee in accordance with Table 9-33(a) Renewable
Permit Fees: Inspection and Plan Review Fees for Installation.

Installation, Removal or Alterations of Equipment.

When an inspection or plan review is conducted by the Fire Department to
ensure proper design and installation, the standard hourly fee for the first hour of
inspection or the first hour of plan review, when required, shall be paid at the time of
application. Fees for subsequent hours of plan review shall be paid prior to the
issuance of the permit. Fees for subsequent hours of inspection shall be paid prior to



Ordinance No. 2013-23

Page 5 of 51
issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy. All Fees shall be in accordance with Table 9
33(b).
Inspection or Plan Review Fees for Activity Permits,
General. When an i"-spe‘-tion or plan review is conducted by Fire Prevention

to ensire proper ueS|gn inst n or permit compliance, the standard hourly fee
for the first hour of inspection or tne first hour of pian review, when required, shall be
paid at the time of application. Fees for subsequent hours of plan review and
inspection shall be paid prior to the issuance of the permit. A separate permit for a
specific period of time shall be obtained for each location where such operations are
performed. The permit fees shall be in addition to the standard hourly fee in

accordance with Table 9-33(c).

D
ET

Annual Hazardous Materials Storage Permit Fee

The annual fee is based on quantities stored, manufactured, used in process,
sold, transported or otherwise utilized in the form of liquids, solids or gases. When
re muiltiple forms the highest range wili be used, as set forth in Tabie 9-33(a).

o)

thmrn
LHiciIe

)] Section 105.3.1 Expiration is amended by adding the following:

Operational Permits shall expire en—Qeeembef—éM» -each-year one vear from
the date of issuance unless otherwise noted. If—appheatlen—fer-an-gperanenal—PeFmA

WWMWWWMMMQW
MWWMWMM&F&W

(k) Section 105.6.2 Amusement building is amended with the following
new section:

Section 105.6.2 Amusement buildings. An operational permit is required to
operate a special amusement building for a period of time not to exceed 45 days.
Plans shall be submitted to the Fire Department and approved 30 days before the
opening of the building or structure to the public.

I Section 105.6.8 Compr d gases is amended with the followi
section and Table 105.6.8:

resse s in excess of the am s listed in Table 105.6.

pr gggllmg the vehicle. T



Ordinance No. 2013-23

Page 6 of 51
JABLE 105.6.8
PERMIT AMOUNTS FOR COMPRESSED GASES
TYPE OF GAS eu) Mﬁ P
Corrosive 200
Flammable (except cryogenic fluids and liguefied
petroleum gases) 200
Highly toxic Any Amount
‘ i Xi a ioXi 6.000
) digxide onl 200
Oxidizing (including oxygen) 504
Pyrophoric Any Amount
Toxic Any Amount

(lm) Section 105.6.23 Hot Work Operations is amended by adding the
following section:

Section 105.6.23.1 Hot Work Permits. Operational permits are required to be
filled out by the responsible party for the site, structure, occupancy, or property prior
to the hot work operation. Hot work permits must be kept on file for 90 days and be
made available to the Fire Department or any other regulatory agency upon request.

(n)  Section 105-7+43-2 105.6.47 Any person, corporation, partnership or
other entity engaged in the business of design, install, monitor, sell, or service within
the City of Peoria shall, obtain a permit from the Fire Department. The permit
application shall include the following: Copy of State and City license and Copy of
Certification.



Ordinance No. 2013-23

Page 7 of 51

(o)  Section 1076.5 is amended by adding the following:

1. A fee (Table 9-33(d) Fees for Other Services) shall be assessed to the
bunldmg owner or business occupancy for the annual inspection and for all re-

Y S 7 Ty e |

inspections required to gain compliance with this Code.

2. If a

if a building is occupied by a business occupancy that is
different from the owner, then the business occupancy shall be
required to pay the assessed inspection fees.

If a building is occupied by the owner or is vacant, then the
owner shall be required to pay the assessed inspection fees.

building is split into muitiple occupancies, the inspection fees shall

be assessed as follows:

Each separate business occupancy that is required to possess
and maintain a City of Peoria business license shaii be
assessed inspection fees based on the square footage of the
specified space within the building that has been issued a
Certificate of Occupancy for such business. The owner shall not
be responsible to pay the inspection fees for any separate
business occupancy within the building.

For all portions of a building that are not under the control of
separate business occupancies subject to subsection (i), the
owner shall be responsible to pay the inspection fees, which
shall be calculated by adding together all of the square footage
in those portions of the building.

3. Afee wil not be charged for additional inspections that the Fire Chief
deems necessary throughout the year.

4, The Fire Chief can limit the maximum inspection fee assessed for a
~ facil

(p) Section 108 is amended as follows:

Section 108.4 Administrative appeal. Whenever a violation of this code has
been found and the applicant wishes to appeal the decision of the staff because the
code or the rules legally adopted there under have been incorrectly interpreted or an
equivalent method of protection or safety is proposed, an appeal may be filed as

follows:

1. The épplicant shall file a written appeal, within ten (10) working days



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 8 of 51

after receiving notice of the violation. The appeal shall be filed with the
Building Official and a copy filed with the Fire Chief. At this time, the
applicant may request an informal review before the Fire Code Official.

N

n applicant requests an informal review, the review will be heard by
Fire Code Official or his designee within 15 wummg days after the
uest is filed. The chief, or an authorized representative, may use a
Committee consisting of such staff as is deemed appropriate to provide
advice on a particular request for informal review.

f
h

L
o 0o

('I

-
-

3. The applicant shall provide specific information on the basis for the
appeal and the relief requested.

4. If the informal review upholds the decision of the Fire Official, the

applicant shall comply with the requirement(s) of the fire code or
rpnnpcf a hnnrmn hv the Fire Board of Annnals within ten {w’ wcrkms

days following the mforma! review as provided in Sec. 108.3 of this
code.

(q) Section 109 is amended as follows:
109.34. Violation penalties.

Penalties for violations of this Code are set forth in Peoria City Code,
Sections 9-36 through 9-43.

(r) Section 109.5 is added as follows:
109.5 Investigation fee.

Any person who commences_any work on a fire or life safety system

before obtaining the necessa ermits all be i (s}
established by the City Council t shall be in addition to the requi

permit fees. The fire code official will incur certain cost (i.e.: inspection
and administrative time) when investigating and citing a person who

has commenced work without having obtained a permit. The fire code
official is therefore entitled to recover these costs, in_addition to that

responsible party.

(s) Section 202 is amended to include the following additional definitions.
Section 202 — General Definitions

The following definitions are hereby added to read as follows:



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 9 of 51

ACCESS GRADES. Access grades shall include the table set forth in this
deﬁmhenTable 9-33(d).

ALL WEATHER SURFACE. An Aall weather surfaces (AW) is a road
" surface made up of materials compacted to 90% and capable of supporting
vehicles in excess of 75,000 pound gross vehicle weight (GVW) under any

weather condition.

COMMERCIAL OCCUPANCY.Commercial—occupancy—C A commercial

occupancy is any building that falls under the International Building Code
(IBC) occupancy classification of A, B, E, F, H, |, M, R1, R-2, R-4, and S.

E ri i re e [0}
the public street to the structure.

v . Drive Width i from h

DRIVE WIDTH. Drive Width is measured from the edges of the designated
improved drivable surface. 2-12-2 and 2-16-2, is a 2 foot clear AW surface on
both sides of a 12 or 16 foot hard surface drive.

linati r r
(see slope).
H i iv
vers designed to support vehicles in excess of 7 ounds GVW unde
any weather condition.

hydrant, is a permanent extnsiog of the regg!;ed ﬂre f ighting gageg §uggI¥ for
a

ilding. Th rizontal standpipe can be below grade and can be a wet or
dry standpipe. The horizontal standpipe is required to be able to supply a

minimum of 500 gallons per minute at the outlet. The use of horizontal
standpipes must be approved by the Fire Code Official,

HOSE LAY. Hose Lay is the extension of a_hand held fire hose as it is
extended around the perimeter of the structure. If the hose lay is more than
200 feet from the road i he exterior, an Operational Pl m
i$ required.
investigating work that has been commenced prior to a it being issued.
PL M i Pl m j r d i
where _the emergency vehicle i ed while performing emergency medi
or fire fighting operations. The pl shall be 20 feet b eet with a
maxi Cross de of 5 per . Operati | platforms required wh

a drive or adjacent street grade is_greater than 12% slope or the hose lay



Ordiﬁance No. 2013-23
Page 10 of 51

from the truck staging area to all portions of the exterior of the structure are
areater than 200 feet.
. fi i i nt i “like f ike”
lacem f n n r fro h
same manufacturer and be th me model and part number.

[l o 1B Valed ¥ 1 cd Y& o ~— . a z -~

i n tecti
must be the same nufacturer same model an art number
Replacement of a component by a different manufacturer, model or part
umb to obsolescence is considered an upgrade.

SLOPE. Slope is the ground, road or other surface that forms a natural or

artificial incline. The percentage of slope is determined by dividing the rise by
the horizontal run multiplied by 100 [% slope = (Rise/Run) X 100].

E m is S ili r
reed upo ified peri ime.

-A- -a- i i r emer

JURN-A-ROUND. A turn-a-round is required for emergency vehicles when
the structure is more than 200 feet from the road. This can be accomplished
with a circle drive with an outside radius of 40'6", T-Type hammer head 16’ X

76’, or a variation there of.

U D i i i de i
the required area for fire apparatus movement. Fire apparatus movement is
- i h ica
ssociation of State Highway and Transportation Officials (AASHT
TURN-OUT. A turn-out is required on all extended driveways 300 feet or
greater in length to a single residence. A_turnout shall widen to 20 feet
inimum wi mini of 45 fi

(u)  Section 308.3.63 is amended by adding the following additional
subsections:

308.3.6-43 Audience control. The audience shall be at least 30 feet away
from the closest projection of an open flame device. Audience control shall be
established by use of a physical barrier which can be easily moved or removed in



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 11 of 51

the event of an emergency and shall remain in place throughout the entire
performance.

308.3.6-24 Attendant. Performances shall be constantly attended by a person
knowledgeable in the use of a fire extinguisher at the rate of at least 1 attendant for

~0 4L

every 2 active devices. Attendants shall remain at the performance until all the fire
v ~ .

308.3.6-35 Fire extinguishers. Adequate fire extinguishing equipment
including but not limited to buckets of water, water soaked rags, water extinguishers,
charged hose lines, shall be readily available for use during the performance.
Portable fire extinguishers shall be provided at a minimum of one 20BC extinguisher
for every four simultaneous devices.

308.3.6.4 Clearance from Combustibles. A 25 foot clearance from all
combustibles shall be maintained in all directions.

fallbmiasn .
TOUNMCOYWOT




Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 12 of 51

v) Section 311 is amended to delete exceptions 1 and 2 under section

(w)  Section 314.4, item 3 is amended and shaii read as foliows:

3. Fuel tanks and fill openings are closed and sealed to prevent
tampering and the escape of vapors.

(x)  Section 3169 is added and which shall read as follows:
Section 3169 — HEAT-PRODUCING APPLIANCES

Section 3169.1 General. Heating appliances shall be installed and maintained
in accordance with their listing and the Building, Electrical, and Mechanical codes.
Clearance from combustible material shail be maintained as set forth in the Buiiding
and 'Mechanical codes and the product listing.

Section 3169.2 Clothes dryers. Clothes dryers shall be frequently cleaned to
maintain the lint trap, mechanical and heating components free from excessive
accumulations of lint.

EXCEPTION: Clothes dryers within private dwelling units of Group R occupancies.

(y)  Section 401.1 Scope is amended by deleting the exception in its
entirety.

(2) Section 401.3 is amended to add Section 401.3.1 which shall read as
follows:

401.3.1 False Alarms shall not be given, signaled or transmitted in any
manner.

(aa) Section 403.1:23 is amended to-add-Sesction-403-1-2.3-whichand shall

read as follows:

403.42.3 Crowd managers. All public assembly occupancies with an
occupant load of 150 or more shall have crowd managers as described in Section
2404.20.

(bb) Section 408.2 is amended to add Section 408.2.3 which shall read as
follows:

Section 408.2.3 Automatic External Defibrillators (AED). All Public Assembly



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 13 of 51

equipped with AEDs so that they optimally achieves a 3-minute response time
from the collapse of a patient to on-scene arrival of the AED with a trained lay
rescuer, in accordance with the American Heart Association
recommendations and the following conditions:

1. The instaliations of AEDs are a iife safety device and the maintenance
of the device shalil be the responsibility of the owner of the Certificate
of Occupancy.

2. It shall be the responsibility of the owner to obtain and maintain

medical oversight from a licensed physician.

3. It shall be the responsibility of the owner to train its employees in
Cardio Pulmonary Resuscitation and the use of AEDs in accordance
with the Guidelines of the American Heart Association or the Red
Cross.

4. Training and equipment maintenance records shall be kept on
premises and be available to the fire Department upon request.

5. AEDs shall be mounted in an accessible spot free from blocking by
storage and equipment. The top of the AED shall be not more than 5 ft
(1.5 m) above the floor. The AED should be easy to reach and remove
and should be placed where it will not be damaged -- on hangers or in
the brackets supplied by the manufacturer, mounted in cabinets, or
placed on sheives.

. {cc) Section 501.3 Construction Documents is amended and which shall
read as follows: '

Section 501.3 Construction Documents. Construction documents for
proposed fire apparatus access, location of fire lanes, means of egress, fire
protection systems, hydraulic calculations for fire hydrants and suppression
systems, and construction documents specifying interior finish and fire
resistance rated construction shall be submitted to the Fire Department; in
addition to Building Safety for review and approval prior to construction. Upon
completion of construction and prior to issue of a Certificate of Occupancy, a
copy of finished drawings shall be supplied to the Fire Department in the
following format:

501.3.1 Record Electronic Files: A copy of the building site plan, fire alarm
system, fire sprinkler system shall be provided in Portable Document Format
(PDF).

(dd) Section 501 is amended to add section 501.5 which shall read as



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 14 of 51

follows:
Section 501.5. Wildland/Urban Interface Areas. Areas considered by the Fire
code official to be classified as “Wildland/Urban Interface” shall meet the

requirements of the 20032012 International Urban-Wildland Interface Code.

(ee) Section 503.2 is amended to add Section 503.2.7 which shali read as
foiiows:

Section 503.2.7. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be within
the limits established by the Fire Code Official based upon the Fire Department'’s
apparatus. The maximum grade(s) allowable are:

1. Major Arterials — 9.0%

2. Minor Arterials — 9.0%

3. Couplets — 9.0%

4. Rural/ESL Minor Collectors - 12.0%

5. Local Collectors — 12.0%

6. Local Residential — 15.0%

With the following conditions:

1. All residential and commercial structures where any access grades

exceed 10% must be equipped throughout with an automatic fire

sprinkler system that meets the requirements of the 20032012
International Fire Code and the Peoria Fire Code Amendments.

2. All residential and commercial structures and developments meet the
requirements of the 20032012 International Urban-Wildland Interface
Code (IUWIC)

3. All residential and commercial structures are constructed to the

minimum level of Class 1 lgnltlon Resistant Constructlon as defined in
Sectlon 504 of the 20032012 IUWIC.

(ff) Section 503.3 is amended and shall read as follows:

Sec. 503.3 Fire apparatus access roads posting. Every fire apparatus access
roadway required under the authority of this section shall be posted with signs
readable from either direction of travel and vertically installed at points not more than
eighty (80) feet on center along the length of the required fire apparatus access



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 15 of 51

roadway. Fire Lane signs, with indicating arrows, shall be posted at the beginning
and end of each fire lane with the indicating arrow pointing in the direction of the fire
lane. If the fire lane is intersected by a drive, then a two-way arrow shall be installed
at that location..

id marked “NO PARKING FIRE
eriicai face of the curb and spaced

Only fire apparatus access roadways required under the authority of this
section or as approved by the Chief may be posted or identified as such.
Unauthorized use of signs shall be removed.

Sec. 503.3.1 Maintenance. The person(s) in possessnon of the premises on
and into which a fire apparatus access roadway is required shall be solely
rpqnnnmhln fﬂl‘ the mamfnn:nrn nf such rnnd\un\,le and ali rnqnhred S'Qno No owner,
manager or other person(s) in charge of premises served by a required fire
apparatus access roadway shall abandon or close the fire apparatus roadway or any

aronf arithe i d ot

part thereof without permission of the code official.

The person(s) in possession of the premises shall be responsible in ensuring
that fire apparatus roadways are clear at all times.

(ag) Section 503.4 Obstruction of Fire Apparatus Roads is amended and
shall read as follows:

Sec. 503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus roads. The required width of any fire
apparatus access roadway on City or private property shall not be obstructed in any
manner, including the parking or stopping of any vehicle other than an authorized
emergency vehicle. A vehicle parked illegally in a fire apparatus access roadway
may be removed and impounded under the provisions of the Peoria Code. An owner
or operator of a vehicle parked illegally in a fire apparatus access roadway or the
person responsible for any non-vehicular obstruction shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor.

(hh) Section 503.6 Security Gates is added and shall read as follows:

Sec. 503.6.1 Gate Access (Information and Scale Plans shall be submitted to
the Fire Department for a permit)

All gates limiting access will be required to provide emergency Access
controls for Fire Department entry.

503.6.1.1 The gates shall be designed so that the access roadway or turning
radius (WBS50) shall not be obstructed by the operation of the gate. Minimum set
back from the public streets shall be a distance determined by the City Engineer and



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 16 of 51

allow the emergency vehicle the ability to safely operate the lock box or panel.
Turning radius from the public street shall be WB50.

503.6.1.3 Clear width of the roadway shall be minimum of twenty (20) feet
clear width on aII entrances Exit roadways shall be a minimum of sixteen (16) feet
|

PR S }

503.6.1.4 Sub-divisions may have a divided entrance and exit gates. The
entrance side shall have a clearance of twenty (20) feet clear width, the exit side
sixteen (16) feet clear width.

503.6.1.5 Access controls shall be exterior to the gate and located for
activation by the vehicle operator without dismounting from the vehicle. The height
of the lock box/control panel shall be sixty-six (66) inches, measured from the
finished grade line of the street.

503.6.1.6 The lock box, padlock or key switch, must be an approved model
utilized by the Peoria Fire Department. Lock Box Authorized Forms may be plcked
up at the City of Peoria Fire Prevention, Monday through Friday 8:00 am to 9:00 am.

503.6.1.7 Traffic Preemption opening device shall be on all motorized gates.
Opticom, 3M, Model 722 receiver (no coding model) or compatible shall be used.

EXCEPTION: Fire Stations are not required to provide a preemption opening
device.

503.6.1.8 Gates must open to a clear width of twenty (20) feet within twenty
(20) seconds of activation and remain in the open position until closed by operation
of the electrical control device.

503.6.1.9 The control pedestal must be identified with a minimum six (6) inch
by Ten (10) inch sign with red letters on a white background. This sign must be
securely fastened to the pedestal and legible from the approaching vehicle.
EMERGENCY FIRE DEPARTMENT ACCESS.

503.6.1.10 Battery back-up for all motorized gates is required, unless the gate
fail safe (open) in the event of a power failure.

503.6.1.11 Secondary “Exit Only” gates shall be set up for Fire Department
emergency access. Exit only gates, which are not motorized, shall be installed per
City of Peoria Fire Department Standard detail. Details are available at the City of
Peoria Fire Prevention. Exit only gates shall have a minimum clearance of twenty
(20) feet clear width and be posted with a sign that states “Caution Gate Opens
Out.” The ground shall be painted with a yellow strip showing the depth of the gate
swing.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 17 of 51

503.6.1.12 Operation at the gate shall be by pre-emption device and key
switch.

(i) Section 505.1 is amended to read as follows:

ess numbers. New and existing buiidings shaii have approved
address numbers, buiiding numbers or approved buiiding identification piaced in a
position that is plainly iegibie and visible from the street or road fronting the property.
Address numbers shall be installed according to Gity-ef-Peeriathe following address
display requirements.

1. Il addr num shall be on a contrastin ckqround.
2. No_numbers are permitted on glass except suite numbers.
3 All numbers shall be visible from all street frontages

4 Address numbers located twelve (12) feet and higher as measured
from the finished grade shali be a minimum of iweive (12) inches in

height.
Address numbers located belo ve feet as measured from the
ished de. monument si and commercial_suites shall have a

minimum of six (6) inch numbers.

6. __ Additional address numbers may be required when, in the opinion of
the Fire Code Official, emergency response may be delayed due to the
physical layout of the building.

(ji) Section 505 js amended by adding subsection 505.3 which shall read
as follows:

. 505.3 Address directory. An approved address directory shall be installed at
properties containing one of the following:

1. __More than one (1) principal building.
2. Buildings with unit identification numbers.

: . . . e . ]
may be delayed due to physical layout of the complex.
ificati Drawi r Il i e

Fire Degarimggt for review and approval for all required address directories.
905.3.2 Dimensions. The minimum size for the address directory is to be



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 18 of 51

IhLegL&)_thLthLeeia) feet. | arger sizes mav be reauired where the site cannot fit
on the standard size and still be leaible.

505.3.4 lllumination. The address directory is to be illuminated internally by a
white light. The light shall be suffici illuminate the entire si lan with ev
light. The addr directory is to be illuminated from d o dawn. The illumin

can be turned on and off by an automatic timer or photo cell.

505. Ins all re uirements. The a dress directo o be installed a

Fire Off'mal. € suppo st or stanchions are set in concre
505.3.6 Depiction requirements. The address direct haii depict ihe site in
a clear, easily understood manner from a distance of eight (8) feet. The address
direc shall depict struc buildin mbers, units artment space numbe

tennis cou swimming pools, drivewa treets, fire hydrants and any other ar

as determined by the Fire Code Official. Construction of the address directory shail
comply with the following requirements:

1. Address directories shal a r rint on a contrasting light
background.
2. The name and address of the com e requi b Il no

exceed ten (10) percent of the total size of the site directory.

3. Any water areas shall be blue (i.e.: pogls. fountains, canals, etc.).
4. Tennis courts shall be green,

S Fire hydrants shall be a 1/4" diameter black circle filled with a_yellow
center. The abbreviation "HYD" must be affixed by the location of the

r r e f

hydrant on the directory.
6. The address directory shall be oriented to the wggeg with a red
bol 1) | in di ith t s "YOU ARE HERE

h Wi "

affixed at the appropriate location of the directory.

7. North must be indicated on the site pian by an arrow no less than three
3) inch in si



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 19 of 51

8. The buildina numbers must be ane (1) inch in diameter_located directlv
adjacent to the building on the driveway side.

9. T colors he site dire ay not be duplicated to
represent more than one (1) item.

905.3.7 Setback requirements. The address directory shali be installed on the
occupant's property. A scaled plan_shall be submitted showing the proposed location
of the address directory, streets, drive aisles, any gate controls and traffic islands.

o1 T ocatio h ess direc | be far enough from the

street for the fire apparatus to be safely on the property while reviewing

the address directorv. The location of the address directorv cannot

conflict with the traffic visibility zone.

No landsc or archi ral desians may obstru e viewing of the
address directory.

.3.8 Prohibition o adverising_or additional artwork _is allowed on the
-address directory,

(kk) Section 506.1 is amended by adding subsection 506.1.23 which shall
read as follows:

Section 506.1.23 Locations Key boxes shall be installed in a location as
determined by the Fire Code Official. A full set of keys to open all areas inside and
outside the structure, to include the fire alarm panel, shall be placed inside the key
box. Key Boxes are to be located no higher than 60 inches above finished grade.

( Section 5087.1 is amended to read as follows:

5087.1 Required water supply. An approved water supply capable of
supplying the required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to premises upon
which facilities, building or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved
into or within the jurisdiction. Where property is subdivided with or without the
creation of public or private streets for the express purpose of providing said
subdivided parcels for sale or otherwise permitting separate and/or individual
development to occur, an approved water supply capable of supplying the projected
fire flow for fire protection shall be provided and extended to serve directly any and
all subdivided properties. The projected fire flow will be based on the greatest
potential demand posed by any type of occupancy allowed by zoning laws on the
projected property.

(mm) Section 5087.5.1 is amended to read as follows:
Sec. 5087.5.1. Where required. Where a portion of a facility or building

hereafter constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 300 feet
(91.5m) from a fire hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 20 of 51

approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, additional fire hydrants
and/or mains shall be provided where required by the fire code official.

Exception:

1. For Group R-3 and Group U Occupancies, the distance requirement
shail be 500 feet (122m).

(nn)  Section 5087.5.2 is amended to include the following new subsection
5087 5.2.1 pertaining to required installations:

Section 5087.5.2.1 Required installations. Fire hydrants installed as a result
of any order or permit shall be spaced so that short hose lines can be employed and
so there are a sufficient number of fire hydrants within a reasonable distance to
obtain the required fire flow as determined using Appendix B. In other than single
family residential areas, hydrants shall be spaced so that they are not more than 300
feet (91.5m) apart. For single-family residential areas, hydrants shall be spaced so
that they are not more than 500 feet (152.5m) apart and not more than 400 feet
(122m) hose lay distance from any structure. Hydrant spacing and hose lay
requirements may be modified by the code official when all structures are protected
with automatic fire sprinkler systems in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2
or 903.3.1.3

Private fire hydrants. All private fire hydrants (those not on the City of Peoria
water system and located on private property) must be flushed and maintained
annually in accordance with the American Water Works Association, Manual of
Water Supply Practices, Installation Field Testing and Maintenance of Fire hydrants,
AWWA M17. Selected hydrants, as determined by the Fire Chief, shall be tested to
determine Available Fire Flow according to test procedures outlined in the American
Water Works Association Manual of Water Supply Practices, Distribution System
Requirements for Fire Protection, AWWA M31.

Public Fire Hydrants. All public fire hydrants must be flushed and maintained
annually in accordance with the American Water Works Association, Manual of
Water Supply Practices, Installation Field Testing and Maintenance of Fire hydrants,
AWWA M17. Selected hydrants, as determined by the Utilities Director, shall be
tested to determine Available Fire Flow according to test procedures outlined in the
American Water Works Association Manual of Water Supply Practices, Distribution

System Requirements for Fire Protection, AWWA M31.

Fire Hydrants. All fire hydrants shall be wet barrel as defined by AWWA M17
and specified by the City of Peoria Public Works/Engineering Department. Fire
Hydrants used in commercial applications shall have two (2) — 2 % inch outlet and
one (1) — 4 % inch outlet. Fire Hydrants used in residential (R-3) applications shall
have one (1) — 2 % inch outlet and one (1) — 4 % inch outlet.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 21 of 51

(o0) Section 5087.5.3 pertaining to Private fire service mains and water
tanks shall be amended to read as follows:

5087.5.3 Private fire service mains and water tanks. Private fire service mains
and water tanks shall be periodically inspected, tested and maintained in

accordance with NFPA25 at the following intervals:
1. Private fire hydrants (all types): Inspection annually and after each

operation; flow test and maintenance annually.

2. Fire service main piping: Inspection of exposed, annually; flow test
every 5 years.

3. Fire service main piping strainers: Inspection and maintenance after
each use.
4 Fire hydrant systems. Plans and specifications for fire hydrant systems

shall be submitted to the Fire Department for review and approval prior
to construction. Plans and specifications for fire hydrant systems shaii
be submitted to the Fire Department for review and approval prior to
City Council action on the final subdivision plat, or in the case of an
individual building or structure, for review and approval prior to
issuance of the building permit. The Fire Department shall obtain the
approval of the Engineering Department on the submitted plans and
specifications.

5. Each water service provider, whether municipal or private shall submit
to the Fire Department a map identifying the location of fire hydrants
within the service area of the water provider. The map required under
this subsection shall be submitted on or before December 31, of each
year, and shall be updated by the water service provider as new fire
hydrants are installed. On May 31, of each subsequent year, a map
identifying the location of the fire hydrants within the service area of the
water provider shall be submitted to the fire department.

In the event a water service provider fails to submit the map required
under subsection (5) of this section, the Fire Department is authorized
to prepare a map of the fire hydrant locations within the service area of
water service provider, and charge the cost of preparation of the map
to the water service provider, together with an administrative fee equal
to fifteen percent of the cost of preparation of the map.

A water service provider, whether municipal or private having a portion
of its service area in which no distribution or service lines are located,
shall identify such areas on the map required by this subsection. Such
areas shall be exempt from the requirements of Sections 508.1



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 22 of 51

6. On or before December 31, of each year, each water service provider,
whether municipal or private shall have prepared and filed with the
City, a plan that: (1) indicates sufficient hydrants on all streets within its

Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, including but not limited to
Table C105.1 or (2) a five year Capital Improvement Plan indicating
plans for the construction of sufficient hydrants on all streets within it
water service area containing water utility distribution or service lines to
comply with the requirements of International Fire Code, Appendix C-
Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution, including but not limited to
Table C105.1 within five (5) years from the date of submission of the
plan.

On or before January 10, of each year following submission of the
plan, the Fire Department shall file with the City Clerk, the Directors of
Community Development, Utilities Department, Engineering
Department and the applicable water provider, a written notice
indicating each water service provider who is not in compliance with’
the requirements of subsection (5) of this section. Upon filing of the
written notice with the City Clerk, no building permit shall be issued
within the service area of a water service provider who is not in
compliance with the requirements of subsection (5) of this section,
unless the permit requires an automatic sprinkler system with
applicable fire flow requirements complied with to be installed with in
the structure.

7. A water service provider that believes a notice has been improperly
issued under this section may appeal the issuance of the notice to the
City Manager, by filling a written notice of appeal to the City Manager
within ten (10) days after filing of the Notice in subsection (6) with the
City Clerk. The City Manager or his designee shall hold a hearing on
the appeal within thirty (30) days after filing of the appeal. "




Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 23 of 51

(pp) Section 901.2 is amended by deleting Section 901.2.1 in its entirety
and enacting the following new subsections.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 24 of 51

Sec. 901.2.1 Plans for fire sprinkler systems. Complete plans and hydraulic
calculations for fire sprinkler systems installations shall be submitted for review and
approval prior to beginning installation, modification or alteration. Plans shail be
drawn to an indicated scale, on sheets of uniform size and shall show, as a minimum

the data required by NFPA 13-2002. Water bupply data for hydrauiic caicuiations

shall be based on the availabie water supply as deiermined by fiow test information

iess a 10 psi safety factor. An additionai copy of these pians shaii be submitted in an
lectronic format suitable to the fire department.

901.2.2 Fire Alarm Plan submittals shall be in accordance with the standard
plan review format as provided by the Arizona Automatic Fire Alarm Association.
Fire_Sprinkler Plan submittals shall be in accordance with the standard plan
submittal as provided by the Arizona Fire Marshals Association.

901.2.3 Plan Certification for fire alarms and occupant notification. Al fire
alarm and occupant notification system plans shall be designed by a professional
reglstrant in accordance with the Arizona Board of Technical Registration. Fire alarm

instaliation shop drawings shail bear a review certification of a minimum NICET
Level Il in Fire Alarms.

901.2.4 Plan certification for fire sprinkler systems. All fire sprinkler system
plans shall be designed by a professional registrant in accordance with the Arizona
Board of Technical Registration. Fire alarmsprinkler installation shop drawings shall
bear a review certification of a minimum NICET Level Il in Fire AlarmsSprinklers.

901.2.5 Plan certification for all other fire protection systems. Plan certification
for all other fire protection systems will be accompanied by a certification of
competence when required.

901.2.6 On-Site Plans. Plans and specifications shall be submitted to the fire
department for review and approval prior to construction. One set of fire department
approved plans shall be on the job site for each inspection.

(qq) Section 901.4. Installation is amended to read as follows:

901.4 Installation. Fire protection systems shall be maintained in accordance
with the original installation standards for that system. Systems shall be extended,
altered, or augmented as necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever
the building is altered, remodeled or added to. Alterations to fire protection systems
shall be done in accordance with applicable standards.

(rr)  Section 901.6 is amended by adding the following new subsections
901.6.3 Testing and 901.6.4 Qualifications of Testing Personnel which shall read as
follows:



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 25 of 51

901.6.2.2 Records. All individuals/businesses performing tests, maintenan

CadCTS> Lerniurninn Y

enanc
or repair on any fire protection system shall forward m:-mrzpd reports of such work to

the Flre Code Off' C|al within 30 days of the work performed.

Exception: R3 and R5 occupancies not including residential care facilities.

Section 901.6.3 Testing. Aii fire protection systems and fire extinguishers (fire
alarms, fire hydrants; fire sprinkiers; standpipes; Halon systems and other special
types of automatic fire extinguishing systems; basement pipe inlets; and other fire-
protection systems and appurtenances) shall be tested annually or as required by
natlonally recognized standards. System test certification shall be retained by the
occupant of the building where the system is located and a copy mailed to the
Peoria Fire Department, Fire Prevention Division. These systems shall be inspected,
tested and maintained by a contractor holding a permit from the City of Peoria Fire
Prevention Division.

Section 901.6.4 Qualifications of Testing Personnel. All permitted personnel
must meet one or more of the qualifications listed in Section 901.101.2 of these
amendments.

(ss) Section 901.7. Systems out of service is amended to read as follows:

901.7 Systems out of service. Where a required fire protection system is out
of service, the fire department and the fire code official shall be notified immediately,
and where required by the fire code official, the building shall either be evacuated or
an approved fire watch shall be provided for all occupants left unprotected by the
shut down until the fire protection system has been returned to service.

Where utilized, fire watches shall be provided with at least one approved
means for notification of the fire department and their only duty shall be to perform
constant patrols of the protected premises and keep watch for fires.

No required fire sprinkler system or fire alarm system shall be placed out of
service for more than 8 hours in any one day without written authorization by the fire
code official.

()  Section 901.10]1 is amended by adding Section 901.101.2 as follows:
Section 901.181.2 Each fire protection system installation, modification, or
inspection job shall receive “direct supervision” from a “competent on-site person” or

persons possessing the following necessary approvals:

Section 901.181.2.1 For Fire Alarm installation, modification, or inspections
one or more of the following:

1. National Institute of Certification in Engineering Technology



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 26 of 51

—

NICET) fire alarm level Il; o

N [+ %

2. Successful completion of Local Exam; or

3. Other certification acceptable to the Fire Code Official.

~a oan -

Section 901.181.2.2 For Fire Sprinkier System and underground fire line

instaiiation, modification, or inspections one or both of the following:

1. National [nstitute Certification in Engineering Technolo
(NICET) fire sprinkler level |I; or
2. Successful completion of Local Exam; or

23.  Other certification acceptable to the Fire Code Official.

. Section 901.101.2.3 For Fire Special Hazard Fire System installation,
modification or inspection for one or more of the following:

1. National Institute of Certification in Engineering Technology
(NICET) special hazards suppression systems level li_ot

2. Successful completion of Local Exam; or
3. Other certification acceptable to the Fire Code Official.

Section 901.181.2.4 The “competent on-site person” shall have in their
possession documentation of their qualifications and a picture |.D. These documents
must be presented to the Fire Code Official or designated representative upon
request.

(uu) Section 903.42. GereralWhere required is amended to read as foliows:

Sec. 903.442 All commercial occupancies for which a building or construction
permit is obtained shall be equipped throughout the entire structure with a fully
automatic sprinkler system meeting the requirements of NFPA 13.




Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 27 of 51

I " ' I ! Iv ﬁ - I I - I II I- _
EXCEPTION: The exception in this section is to be numbered as subsection 1
and the following subsections are to be added:

Tl ou

not require fire sprinklers. Unattached outer buildings of two hundred (200)
square feet or less shall be located three (3) feet or more from any structure

on the property.

2. Unattached outer hllilr’lingc twao-hundrad {200) square faet or less do

Vehicle rkin soline di ing island ca ies a 0
cheres not attached and at le ree (3) feet or more from an
structure.

4. Public restrooms associated with parks, playgrounds_and qolf courses
rovided all of the following items are met:

L. The structure is to be of Type | fire resistive construction as

fi i m u

ii. The structure shall be limited to a maximum of_six hundred
twenty five (625) square feet.

iii. No combustible material shall be used or stored in the structure.

This is to include li fixtures nd other con fruc ion
c as Iawn mowers asolme ferili rs etc. shall be ermn d
ithi wi i

quantities sufficient to support only the needs of the structure.

V. No other structures are to be built within one hundred (100) feet
of the exempted restrooms.

i i buildin

. N it if | | id
character shall be permitted without requiring a full fire suppression



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 28 of 51

svstem being installed.

5. Temporary use buildings (i.e.: construction trailers, sales trailers, etc.)

as rov the Fire C Official.
vv) Section 903.3 is amended d the following subsection:

903. +423.8 Identification of sprinkier system capabilities and
limitations. An adhesive label shall be permanently installed at or adjacent to each
sprinkler riser. When a building contains more than four risers, the sign shall be
located at an approved location inside the building. When sprinkler risers are located
outside of the building, the sign shall be stamped metal. The minimum sign
dimension is 6-inches high by 4 inches wide. The sign shall specify the capabilities
and limitations of the automatic sprinkler system. The sign shall include the following
information:

1. The design base or basis, including the edition used.

2. A statement indicating if the sprinkier design is the control mode
density area method, control mode specific application, suppression
mode, or any combination thereof.

3. When used, all of the storage conditions stipulated NFPA 13, Section
12.7 for special designs.

4. The maximum storage height.
5. The minimum required aisle width.
6. If storage is in racks, the maximum rack width and minimum transverse

and longitudinal flue widths.

7. Commodities that can be protected by the automatic sprinkler system.

8. Commodities that cannot be protected by the automatic sprinkler
system.

9. Limits on storage heights of idle wood and plastic storage.

10.  Limits on storage heights of miscellaneous Group A plastic, tire and
rolled paper storage.

11.  Locations where in-rack sprinklers are required.

12.  Locations where horizontal and/or vertical barriers are required.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 29 of 51

13. Information explaining the manufacturer, sprinkler identification
number, k-factor, and operating temperature of t 1hp overhead sprinklers

protecting the high pile storage o

‘(ww) Section 803.2.2 is aménded to read as follows:

Sec. 903.2.2 Group E. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all Group E Occupancies.

(xx) Section 903.2.78, “Group R,” is amended by adding the following
subsections which shall read as follows:

903.2.78.1 Group R, Division 2 Occupancies.

903.2.78.1.1 New Construction: All new Group R, Division 2 occupancies
shall be required to install a residential fire sprinkler system for the FIRE AREA of
the building. If any portion of a patio has livable space directly above the patio, the
patio shall have sprinkler protection below the livable space.

903.2.78.1.2 Remodeling: If an existing Group R, Division 2 occupancy
requires a City permit to modify the structure, then the existing and new portions of
the occupancy shall be required to have a residential fire sprinkler system if any one
or more of the following conditions exist:

903.2.48.1.2.1 The FIRE AREA square footage of the building, including the
remodel, is five thousand (5,000) square feet or greater.

903.2.78.1.2.2 Fire flows to the entire building cannot be met in accordance
with Appendix B Fire Fiow Requirements For Buildings and Table B105.1
Minimum Required Fire Flow and Flow Duration For Buildings.

903.2.78.1.2.3 The occupancy is not connected to a public or public service
corporation water system.

903.2.78.2 Group R, Division 3 Occupancies.

903.2.78.2.1 Group R, Division 3 Occupancies South of and immediately



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 30 of 51

River. In any new (‘mnn R, Division 3 occunancies located South of

WP TN AT T iR L

adjacent to the centerline of Dixileta Road alignment and East of the Agua Fria
'I a

-

-

D
=3
%

1]
e

Road ailgnment and East of the Agua Fna River alignment where the FIRE AREA
square footage of the building is five thousand (5000) square feet or greater, an
automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building.

903.2.48.2.1.1 Exception: Residential sprinkiers shall be permitted to be
omitted from such occupancies if both of the following conditions are met: (1)
the FIRE AREA square footage is less than five thousand (5000) square feet,
and (2) the required fire flows are met in accordance with Appendix B Fire
Flow Requirements For Buildings and Table B105.1 Minimum Required Fire
Flow and Flow Duration For Buildings. If the fire flows cannot be met, a
residential sprinkler system shall be installed.

903.2.48.2.1.2 Remodeling: If an existing occupancy is to be changed by the
enclosure of existing patios, porches, entry ways, or by the addition of new
enclosed space which increases the total square footage of the Fire Area as
defined in this Code to Five Thousand (5,000) square feet or greater, then
this requirement shall apply.

903.2.78.2.1.3 Livable Space Above Patios: If a residence has sprinkler
protection and any portion of a patio has livable space directly above the
patio, the patio shall have sprinkler protection below the livable space.

Exception: FIRE AREA shali exclude covered unenclosed patios if there is no
livable space directly above.

903.2.78.2.1.4 Home Buyer Option: In any new Group R, Division 3
occupancies located South of the Dixileta Road alignment and East of the Agua Fria
River alignment, each builder, contractor or developer shall offer to each home
buyer as an option, at the time of purchase, a residential fire sprinkler system.

903.2.78.2.1.4.1 The option shall include a competitive cost of installing an
automatic fire sprinkler system equipped with residential fire sprinkler heads for the
FIRE AREA of the structure. This option is to be included on the development list of
options.

903.2.48.2.1.4.2 The builder, contractor or developer shall provide to each
home buyer a copy of educational materials prepared by the City on residential fire
sprinkler systems with each model price list.

903.2.78.2.1.4.3 A signed affidavit, using a form approved by the Peoria Fire
Department, by the buyer indicating that this option was offered shall be retained by
the developer at his home office, available for inspection by the City for a period of
one (1) year from the time of closure of the residence.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 31 of 51

903.2.78.2.2 Group R, Division 3 Occupancies North of and immediately
adjacent to the centerline nf Dixileta R i a

Fria River.

903.278.2.2.1 New Construction: In all new Group R, Division 3
occupancies located North of the Dixileta Road alignment and West of the Agua Fria
River ailignment, an automatic sprinkier system shaii be instaiied throughout the
buiiding.

903.2.78.2.2.2 Remodeling: If an existing Group R, Division 3 occupancy
located North of the Dixileta Road alignment and West of the Agua Fria River
alignment requires a City permit to modify the structure, then the existing and new
portions of the occupancy shall be required to have a residential fire sprinkler system
if any one or more of the following conditions exist:

903.2.78.2.2.2.1 The FIRE AREA square footage of the building, including the
remodel, is five thousand (5,000) square feet or greater.

903.2.78.2.2.2.2 Fire flows to the entire building cannot be met in accordance
with Appendix B Fire Flow Requirements For Buildings and Table B105.1
Minimum Required Fire Flow and Flow Duration For Buildings.

903.2.78.2.2.2.3 The occupancy is not connected to a public or public service
corporation water system.

903.2.78.2.3 Wildland/Urban Interface. In Group R, Division 3 occupancies
in areas that are classified by the code official as Wildland/Urban Interface, if an
occupancy has a private or shared drives leading to one or more single family
dwelling, the occupancy shall be required to install a residential fire sprinkier system
for the FIRE AREA of the building.

903.2.78.2.4 Water Supply. In Group R, Division 3 occupancies that are new
or require a City permit to modify the structure, regardless of location, if they are not
connected to a public or public service corporation water system and are on a
private well, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the building.
If any portion of a patio has livable space directly above the patio, the patio shall
have sprinkler protection below the livable space.

903.2.78.3 Group R, Division 4 Occupancies.

903.2.78.3.1 New Construction: All new Group R, Division 4 occupancies
licensed by the Arizona Department of Health Services for more than five (5)
residents or day care shall be required to install a residential fire sprinkler system for
the FIRE AREA of the building. If any portion of a patio has livable space directly
above the patio, the patio shall have sprinkler protection below the livable space.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 32 of 51

-

903.2.78.3.2 Remodeling: If an existing Group R, Division 4 occupancy tha
is licensed hv the Arizona npnarfmpnt of Hpalfh QAr\lgces for more than five (5)
residents or day care requires a Clty permit to modify the structure, then the existing
and. new portions of the occupancy shall be required to have a residential fire

sprinkler system.

903.2.78.4 Urban-Wiidiand interface Area. Aii Group R Occupancies in an
Urban-Wiidiand interface Area shaii comply with the 208312 internationai Urban-
Wildland Interface Code and the following:

903.2.#8.4.1 Definitions: See Subsection u, Section 202 for definitions.




. Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 33 of 51

903.2.78.4.2 Determination of Requirements: To determine specific fire
service feature requirements for Urban Wildland Interface areas based upon
access grades to the structure or parcel, Table 9-33(ed) shall be used.

(vyy) Section 903.4.1. SignralsMonitoring, is amended to read as follows:

903.4.1 Signals. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly
different and shall be automatically transmitted to an Underwriters Laboratory listed
or Factory Mutual approved central station, remote supervising station, or proprietary
supervising station as defined in NFPA 72. As an alternative, when approved by the
Fire Code Official, such signals shall sound an audible signal at a constantly
attended location.

Exceptions:

1. Underground key or hub valves in roadway boxes provided by the
municipality or public utility are not required to be monitored.

2. Backflow prevention device test valves, located in the limited area

sprinkier system supply piping, shall be locked in the open position. In
occupancies required to be equipped with a fire alarm system, the
backflow preventer valves shall be electrically supervised by a tamper
switch installed in accordance with NFPA 72 and separately
annunciated.

(zz) Section 906.1 is amended by repealing the exception in its entirety.
(aaa) Section 906.2 is amended by repealing the exception in its entirety.

(bbb) Section 907.2. Where required-new buildings and structures is
amended to read as follows:

Section 9807.2. Where required-new buildings and structures. An approved
manual, automatic, or manual and automatic fire alarm system shall be provided in
all new buildings and structures and_in accordance with Sections 907.2.1 through
907.2.23. Where automatic sprinkler protection is installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 is provided and connected to the building fire alarm
system, automatic heat detection required by this section shall not be required. A}l

required-fire-alarmsshall-be-designed-as-GlassA-



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 34 of 51

apphanee&—and—eqmpment—sha#—smnply—wﬂh—Seeﬂen—Q@H—z—The automatlc fire

detectors shall be smoke detectors, except that an approved alternative type of
detector shall be installed in spaces such as boiler rooms, where, during normal
operation products of combustion are present in sufficient quantity to actuate a

PRI PR [ Wy

simoke detecior.

(cee) Seétion 807210-5908.7 is enacted—andamended to includes the
following subsections which shali read as follows:

00674-2-10-1-5-4808.7.2 Additions, alterations or repairs to these Qccupancies.
When the valuation of an addition, alteration or repair to a Group R or | Occupancy
exceeds $1000.00, a permit is required, or when Gas (Natural or LPG), Oil,
Kerosene or Wood burning appliances isare added to the structure a carbon
monoxide alarm and detecterion system shall be installed in accordance with
Sections 908.78-Carbon-Monoxide-Detectors.

(ddd) Section 1003-61030.3 Means—of—egress—econtinuityObstructions is
amended by adding the following subsections +003-6-41030.3.1 and 4803-21030.3.2

which shall read as follows:

4003-6-11030.3.1 The required width of a means of egress is defined as the
total width of the corridor, exit, exit access, and exit discharge that was designed in
the structure or building when it was constructed.

4003-6-21030.3.2 Storage in any part of a means of egress, corridor, exit, exit
access, or exit discharge is prohibited.




Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 35 of 51

(eee) Section 1103.5 is hereby amended and shall read as follows:

1103.5 Sprinkler systems.

An automatic fire sprinkier system shali be provided in existing buildings in
accordance with Sections 1103.5.1, 1103.5.2 and Table 1103.5.1 if the square

ootage requirements of Table 1103.5.1 are met by either a change in use or an
increase in the total square footage.

EXCEPTION:

1. Spaces or areas in telecommunications buildings used exclusively for
telecommunications equipment, associated electrical power distribution

equi nt, batteries an ndby engines; provided those spaces or
areas are equipped throughout with an automatic smoke detection

system in accordance with Section 907.2 and are separated from the
remainder of the building by not less than 1 hour fire barriers
constructed in accordance with Section 707 of the International

Building Code or not less than 2 hour horizonta! assemblies
constructed in accordance with Section 712 of the International

Building Code or both.

) Unattache er buildings -hundred (200) square feet or less do

not require fire sprinklers. Unattached outer buildings of two hundred

200) square f r less shal located three (3) feet or more from

any structure on the property.
3. Vehicle parking, gasoline dispensing island canopies, and Porte

cocheres not attached to and at least three feet from the buildin
shall.

4. Public restrooms associated with parks, playarounds and golf courses

provided all of the following items are met:

i, he structure is to be of Type | Fire Resistive construction as
in th jonal Buildin

ii. ru hall limi a maxi of si ndred

twenty five (625) square feet.
iii. No combustible material shall be used or stored in the structure;

his i incl i I n h ructi

material. No storage of landscape material or other park



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 36 of 51

~ supplies, in gquantiti fficien onl needs of
structure. )

iv. No other structures are to be built within one hundred (100) feet
of the exempied restrooms.

V. No additions to or modifications changing the buildings use or
character shall be permitted without requiring a full suppression
system being installed. . '

5. Temporary use buildings (i.e.: construction trailers, sales trailers, etc.)
as approved by the Fire e Official.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 37 of 51

PPEMMM
BEL | EL B =
Qccupancy | A-l A2 AR} A4 Ah B E E-1 E-2 | through m_ijﬂl_l M % R:3 Py S:1 | S:2(8)
H-5 X

- 2.000 | 5.000 | 12.000 1.000 000 | 12.000 2.000 | 12.000 0 0 12.000 0 NP Q 12,000 000

A2 000 | 5.000 | 12.000 [ 000 [ 12.000 | 12.000 [ 12.000 |0 0 [ 12000 | 0 | NP | 0 | 12.000 | 12000

A 2.000 | 5.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1.000 0 [ 12.000 | 12.000 ol 0 (12000 0 | NP | 0 12000 | 12.000

a4 2.000 | 5.000 [ 12.00¢ 1.000 00 | 12,000 | 12.000 0] o 0 [ 12000 | 0 | NP | 0 [ 12000 [ 12.000

A-5 000 | 5,000 | 12.00! 1,000 | 12,000 000 000 | 12,000 i] Q 00| 0 NP | 0 00 000

Bl |12 5.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1,000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12000 | 12.000 | 0 q 000 [0 [ NP [0 0 [ 12.000

B2 000 | 5.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1.000 [ 12.000 | 12000 [ 12000 | 12000 @ q 0] o [ NP [0 0 [ 12000

H3 [ 12000 | 5,000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12000 | 12000 | @ ) 000 0 | NP ] D 5] 12000

Hazard. H4 | 12.000 | 5,000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1,000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12000 | 0 D | 12000 [ 0 [ NP | 0 | 12.000

Level 1 HS 000 | 5 12.000 1,000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12000 0 0 12000 0 | NP | 0 [ 12000 | 12.000

-1 000 2,000 2.000 | 12.000 | 1.000 00 | 12.000 2.000 2.000 0 0 12.000 0 NP Q 12,000 | 12.000

-2 000 2,000 000 | 12.000 | 1.000 00 onn 000 000 1] Q 12.00 0 NP 12.000 | 12.000

-3 12.000 2.000 | 12,000 | 1.000 00 [ 12.000 | 12.000 | 120001 0 0 12000 0 | NP [0 [ 12000 | 12.000

4 000 | 5.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1.000 | 12000 | 12.000 | 12000 | 120001 0 0 D00 ] 0 | NP | 0 | 12000 12000

R1 000 | 5.000 12.000 | 1 00 000 [ 12000 0 Q 00 | 0 | NP | 0 | 12000 | 12.000

R2 | 12.000 | 5000 [ 12000 | 12.000 | 1,000 | 12.000 000 [ 120007 0 0 00 | 0 | NP | 0 [ 12000 [ 12.000

R-3 12,000 | 5,000 2.000 | 12.000 | 1,000 [ 12.000 000 000 0 0 00 0 5.000 Q 2.000 | 12.000

R4 [ 12000 | 5000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 0 0 0] 0 | NP | 0 | 12000 12000

Hazard F-1 | 12.000 | 5.000 [ 12.000 | 12.000 | 1,000 | 12000 | 12000 | 12000 | 120001 o D (12000 0 [ NP | 0 | 12000 | 12.000

Level 2 S-1 000 | 5.000 [ 12 [ 12,000 | 1,000 | 12.000 | 12,000 00D D00 P) 0 12000 0 [ NP |0 000 000

E 000 | 5.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 [ 120007 0 0 (12000 0 | NP | 0 [ 12000 12.000

Hazard, E2 000 | 5.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 000 000 000 | 12.000 0 0 12000 | 0 | NP | 0 | 12.000 | 12.000

Leveld S2 000 | 5.000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 1,000 | 12.000 | 12.000 | 12000 | 12000 0 0 12000 0 | NP | 0 | 12000 12.000

Hazard B 000 | 5 12.000 | 12.000 | 1 000 | 12.000 | 12000 [ 12000 "0 D [ 12000 0 | NP | 0 | 12000 | 12.000
Leveld M 12,000 | 5000 | 12000 | 12.000 | 1.000 | 12.000 ] 12,000 | 12.000 | 12,000 | _ 0 9 112000 ) 0 [ NE | 0 12,000 |




(fffy  Section 14423312.1 is amended by-adding-Sectioni4121-whichand shall read as

follows:

141213312.1 When required. An approved water supply for fire protection, either
temporary or permanent, shaii be made avaiiabie before combustibie materiai arrives on the
site. The minimum fire flow requirement when a contractor or developer brings combustible
materials on site is 1,500 gpm at 20 psi. At least one fire hydrant shall be within 500 feet of any
combustible materials and capable of delivering the minimum fire flow requirement. Any hydrant
may be either temporary or permanent as the project schedule permits. In addition, there are
times when hydrants and valves must be closed temporarily for repair work or construction of
the water system. The developer/contractor is responsible for ensuring.that the water supply is
available at all times. When the work is complete, developer/contractor shall coordinate with the
Utilities Department to make sure that the fire hydrants are active and the valves are open.

(ggg) Section 2208323083 is amended by adding the following subsection
2208-3-22308.3.2 Vehicle impact protection.

Section 2208-3-22308.3.2 Vehicle impact protection. Vehicle impact protection for CNG
gas storage containers, pumps and dispensers shall be provided in accordance with section
2206-42306.4.

# Table 2306.2 6 rep! . tollowing.tal



SIZE-OFRHIGH
GCOMMODHY RILED- ALLSTORAGE-AREAS (Soo-Bections-2306, SOLID-RILED- STORAGE-SHELFE-
CLASS STORAGE- 307-and-2308) STORAGE-AND PALLETIZED-
AREA-{(square STORAGE (cee-Section2307.3)-
feet)-{cee-
Sections-
3306-2-and-
2208 A\ .
220841 .
Automatic- boards- )
Firo- Building- E“I f"' f_“O‘- Maxi Maximum- Maxi
Spriakier Access Bile- pormissible pite-
Systom- {s00- Formova 230653 " i storage- "
460_& Section- sl“|' heights
Soction 23306-8) 2306.2) eet Hoot)-
23064}
Not Not Not-
2:504-12.000- Yos- Required: Required | Requi 100- 40- 400-000-
MNot-
Mot
Graaler-than- Not-
600-000: Yoe- Yoe- Yoe Required- 100- 40- 400900
Not- Not- Not-
High Not-
Hazard 2503-300.000- Yos- Yos- Yas- Requited- 50- 35 765:000-
300.001+ Neot-
C_ Mhen 3-W Gen &P 1 1 ¥ ! 3F8 o eod for Mh_:l :h“-‘n'n 1thoea-in l‘hg:l-' z'l' :he £ M ﬂ .hn & ¥
B g-the-high-piled-siorage-aoa-shallbe-designed-in dance-with-Sections-2307-and-2308-

(hhh) Section 2604-2.63504.2.6 Fire extinguishers is amended to read as follows:

2604-2:63504.2.6 Fire extinguisher. A minimum of one portable fire extinguisher
complying with Section 906 and with a minimum 2-A:20-B:C rating shall be readily accessible
within 30 feet (9144 mm) of the location where hot work is performed and shall be accessible
without climbing stairs or ladders.



‘Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 40 of 51
(i)  Section 2704-55001.5 Permits is amended to read as follows:

2764-565001.5 Permits. Permits shall be required as set forth in Sections 105.6 and
105.7.

When required by the fire code official, permittees shall apply for approval to permanently
close a storage, use or handling facility. Such application shall be submitted at least 30 days
prior to the termination of the storage, use or handling of hazardous materials. The fire code
official is authorized to require that the application be accompanied by an approved facility
closure plan in accordance with Section 27204535001 6.3.

Definitions:

Group 0: No Hazardous Materials on site.

Group 1: Special Information is required to be submitted
-.:i&-d e - . a

CHH PN H la meamban bby S
guanuues Or CnémiCars greaier mian e permil

Fire Code, but less than the following:

a.)  55gallons of a liquid

b.) 500 pounds of a salid

c.) 200 cubic feet of a gas

d) 2,500 pounds of an aerosol product.
Special Information that must be submitted shall include:

a) A hazardous materials classification form. -

b.) A hazardous materials inventory s_tatement (HMIS).
Group 2: Special information is required to be submitted by any facility that has quantities
of chemicals on site greater than the following but less than the exempt amounts as
determined by the Intemnational Fire Code:

a.) 55 gallons of a liquid.

b.) 500 pounds of a solid.

c) 200 cubic feet of a gas.

d.) 2,500 pounds of an aerosol product:

Special Information that must be submitted shal! include:



a.)
b.)

c.)

A hazardous materials classification form.
A hazardous materials inventory statement (HMIS).

A hazardous materials storage plan.

Group 3. Special information comprised of a Hazardous Materials Management Plan
(HMMP) shall be submitted whenever:

a)
b.)

c)

d)

e)

f)

Hazardous Materials exceed exempt amounts specified in IFC
IFC requires detached storage.

The building or site has multiple international Buiiding Code Group H
occupancy classifications.

The facility is a Group H-5 Semiconductor facility.

SARA Title Ill extremely hazardous substance is used, handled or
stored on site in quantities requiring an IFC permit and which are
above threshold planning quantities.

When otherwise determined necessary by the Fire Marshal because
of unique circumstances.

(i)  Section 2784+-5-45001.5.1 Hazardous Materials Management Plan is amended to

read as follows:

2704-5-15001.5.1 Hazardous Materials Management Plan. When required by the fire

code official, each application for a permit shall include a Hazardous Materials

Management Plan (HMMP). The HMMP shall include a facility site plan and include the
_ information set forth below.

st

HMMP shall be submitted annually no-later-than-March— -of-each-calendaryearupon
renewal of the Operational Permit or more often if the hazardous material amounts change by
greater than 10% in any single category or overall. HMMP shall be submitted electronically in a
format acceptable to the Peoria Fire Department. The submittal shall be required to determine
Fire Code Permitting criteria for storage, use, and/or handling of hazardous materials within the
City of Peoria. Any electronic submittal is acceptable as long as the data will import or interface
with the software program currently being used by the Fire Department. Electronic reporting
shall be required for all new and existing facilities upon permit renewal.

1. Storage and use areas.

2. Maximum amount of each material stored or used in each area.

3. Range of container sizes



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 42 of 51

4, Locations of emergency isolation and mitigation valves and devices.

5. Product conveying piping containing liquids or gases, other than utility-owned fuel
gas lines and low pressure fuel gas lines.

6. On and off positions of valves for valves that are of the self indicating type.

7. Storage plan showing the intended storage arrangement, including the
location and dimensions of aisles.

8. The location and type of emergency equipment. The plans shall be legible
and drawn approximately to scale. Separate distribution systems are allowed
to be shown on separate pages.

(kkk) Section 2704-5:25001.5.2 Hazardous Materials inventory Statement is amended
to read as follows:

2402-6-25001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS). Where required by
the fire code official, an application for a permit shafl include an HMIS, such as SARA
(Superfund Amendments and Reauthorization Act of 1986) Title lll, Tier 1l Report, or other
approved statement. The HMIS shalil include the information set forth below.

A HMIS shall be submitted annually re-laterthan-March—4 @Leaeh—salendar—yea;

renewal of the Qperational Permit or more often if the hazardous material amounts change by
greater than 10% in any single category or overall. HMIS shall be submitted electronically in a
format acceptable to the Peoria Fire Department. The submittal shall be required to determine
Fire Code Permitting criteria for storage, use, and/or handling of hazardous materials within the
City of Peoria. Any electronic submittal is acceptable as long as the data will import or interface
with the software program currently being used by the Fire Department. Electronic reporting
shall be required for all new and existing facilities upon permit renewal.

1. Manufacturer's name.
2. Chemical name, trade names, hazardous ingredients.
3. Hazard classification.

4. MSDS or equivalent.

5. United Natioﬁs (UN), North America (NA) or the Chemical Abstract Service
identification number.

6. Maximum quantity stored or used on site at one time.

7. Storage conditions related to the storage type, temperature and pressure.



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 43 of 51

() Section 2703-55003.5 Hazard Identification Signs is amended and shall read as
follows:-

2703-65003.5 Hazardous Identification Signs. Unless otherwise exempted by the fire
chief, visible hazardous identification signs as specified in NFPA 704 for the specific material
contained shall be placed on stationary containers and above ground tanks and at entrances to
locations where hazardous materials are stored, dispensed, used or handied in quantities
requiring a permit or as required by the fire chiefcode official at specific entrances and locations
designated by the fire ehiefcode official.

{mmm) Section 330424560124 is amended by adding Section
3304-2-4-35601.2.4.3 which shall read as follows:

3364-2:4-35601.2.4.3 Notification requirements. Prior to conducting blasting operations
or fireworks displays the permit holder is required to notify all residents within a 2,000 ft. radius
of the property line of the property subject to the permit.

Sec. 3308.11 Retail display and sale. It is unlawful to sell, use or possess for. use
consumer fireworks. Fireworks may only be possessed by a person having a validly issued
permit from the Fire Code Official for a display permitted on a specific date.







Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 45 0of 5

ANNE 27 4 4 lnnmrmenatihia cvirfanne A limiid swvunan anmnatihia Arin o nan chall ha

SECTION 5308
COMPRESSED GAS SYSTEMS UTILIZING CARBON DIOXIDE
5308.1 Scope. Carbon Dioxide used for beverage dispensing systems, whether stored
as a liqui | required to obtain al rmits for al istin

systems installed.
5308.2 Permits. The followi . ired:



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 46 of 51

MMMM”%M%

mpr utilizi ioxi r mmgLILsLaLe_tojs

incorporated into the submittal nrocass for the constriction permite and are cuhiact to
L0 b/ SARSebd  TEIONT M ES o WWAREEIARAY IS sdod ISEE 810 MOMLINALIANWAINGIS,  pew i i irasy Saviyd _Sot > wathejiews S

inspection comments,




Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 47 of 51

located, if the cylinder is located outside. If the building has areas that are lower than the
level iti detecti i I rovided.

neck i ;| ati ing ala ]
additi other reguir ignals to be sent to the Centra

EANO A2 4 4 Cunamrienm: aiqanal A crinansianns cinnal e pa ha cant

he qa r acti 1.5%. This shal i rvi
signal at the fire alarm control panel and shall report a supervisory siqnat to

the Central Station.

B.4 iana 3la i is to be when the
r_acti %. This shall provide an alarm signal at the fire
larm r |, provi Il buildi tion and shall r “CO-

> Alamn” signal to the Centeal Stat

building fire alarm system shall be designed to monitor two (2) points on the gas

detection system. The building fire alarm system shall be capable of reporting

specific signal ntral Station for the followi rms. These signals are j
ition Lir ignal entral Station.

wi etector activates at 1.5% i rovid rvi
ignat at the fir ol panel and shail r isory signal
the Central Station,




larm is n habl nitoring and transmittin eparate signal
entral Station ilding fire alar s ollowing signal

m r
= &

hgnt as _detector activa .5%. This shall id rvi
| at the fire alar rol nd shall repol ervis ignal
L@Cgm@m
5308.4.3.3.2 Alarm sianal, An alarm qlnnal is to he sent when the
%
al control panel, provide full V. ion and_shall r n
m sign h | i

d alarms inside the buildin Lagglti_cmal_aiamm_is_to_g

located outsi e buildi he Fi epartm entran 0o n
rsonnel of a - ivation is_devi It b lb_e[e_d_s_a_C_Q;
-alarm and shall activate ivation of the CO-2 sensor
submitting for the Construction Permit, Submittals that are not complete will not X

1. Carbon Dioxi linder/container | ion.
2. Pressure requlator location,

3. Eill port location,

4 ipe t ion

5. n Dioxide sensor location.

6. Carbon Dioxide alarm devices locations.



w

Ordinance No. 2013-2
Page 49 of 51

1. Fire alarm panel location.
2. Method of connections.
3. Data sheets,

5308.5.4 C ! hecklist. A C | Gas Checklist | !
completed and submitted.

- ntil C
Operations
. 291 — Fl ing of

NFPA 418 — 2 li

3 = Protection in Wastewater Treatment and Collection Facilities
____ NFPA 1141 — 2012 Infrastructure for Land Development in Suburban and Rural Areas

NFPA 2010 — 2010 Fij r ' inquishi

Section D1 i f

= 0ad N_EX oo
pICAL SARMA W SA MRS b wiNe 11 L

j 4 ad end fire 3 S S
wi i n rou roVisi in ince with Table D103.4 and



Ordinance No. 2013-23
Page 50 of 51

Chapter 5 of NFPA 1141 — e

(rrry  Section D105 is amended by adding the following subsection D105.4 which shall
read as follows:

Section D105.4 Buildings exceeding 30 feet (9144 mm) in height above the lowest level
of Fire Department access shall meet the requirements listed in Section D104.1.

Exception:  Apartment buildings equipped with an NFPA 13R sprinkler system.

{sss) Section D107.1 is amended to read as follows:

ion D107.1 On family dwellin idential developme vel ents of

Cummmbimeme-
CXACEPUONS.
1 Where there are mor lling uni ingle public or priv

olopment, as determined by the Fire Code Official.

SECTION 3. Providing for Separability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause,
phrase or portion of this Ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional by any court
of competent jurisdiction, such portion shall be deemed a separate, distinct and independent
provision; and such shall not effect the validity of the remaining portions hereof.



SECTION 4. Providing an Effective Date. This ordinance shall become effective in the

manner provided by law.
PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Mayor and Council of the City of Peoria, Arizona this 5"

day of November, 2013.

Bob Barrett, Mayor

Moy (p, 2O Z

Date Signed /

Rhénda Geriminsky, City Clerk
APPROVED AS TO FORM:

<8tephen M. Kemp, City Attorney

Published in Peoria Times:

Publication Dates: November 15 and 22, 2013

Effective Date: DG 11,2013





