
ORDINANCE NO. 2019-11 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE MAYOR AND COUNCIL OF THE 
CITY OF PEORIA, ARIZONA AMENDING CHAPTER 9 OF 
THE PEORIA CITY CODE (1992) BY AMENDING SECTION 
9-31, INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, ADOPTED;(
AMENDING SECTION 9-33 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE,(
LOCAL AMENDMENTS; PROVIDING FOR SEPARABILITY;(
AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.(

THEREFORE, IT IS ORDAINED by the Mayor and Council of the City of 
Peoria, Maricopa County, Arizona as follows: 

SECTION 1. Chapter 9 of the Peoria City Code (1992) is amended by 
amending Section 9-31 pertaining to the International Fire Code, Adopted and which 
shall read as follows: 

Sec. 9-31. International Fire Code, Adopted. 

(a)( There is adopted by the City for the purpose of prescribing minimum(
regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire and 
explosion, that certain code which is now on file in the City Clerk's office known as 
the "International Fire Code (IFC) 2018 Edition" as amended from time to time and 
not inconsistent with anything herein provided, and the Referenced Standards as 
published by the International Code Council, as amended from time to time and not 
inconsistent with anything herein provided and that such codes and standards may 
hereafter be referred to as the IFC and the following appendix chapters. 

(b)( Where there is a conflict between the provision of the International Fire(
Code and this Chapter of the City Code, the more restrictive shall apply. 

(c)( The following Appendices of the International Fire Code are adopted in(
their entirety: 

Appendix B-Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings(
Appendix C-Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution(
Appendix D-Fire Apparatus Access Roads(
Appendix E-Hazard Categories
Appendix F-Hazard Ranking(
Appendix G-Cryogenic Fluids, Weight and Volume Equivalents(
Appendix H-Hazardous Materials Management Plan (HMMP} and(
Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS) Instructions
Appendix I-Fire Protection Systems-Noncompliant Conditions(

Appendix K-Construction Requirements for Existing Ambulatory Care(
Facilities(



Ord inance No. 20 1 9-1 1 
Page 2 of 40 

Appendix L-Requ irements for F i re F ighter Air Replen ishment Systems 
Appendix M-H ig h  R ise Bu i ld ings-Retroactive Automatic Sprinkler 
Requ irement 
Appendix N-l ndoor Trade Shows and Exhibit ions 

(d)( Assuming Jurisd ict ion of Fi re Prevention  Standards :(
Pursuant to A.RS.  Section 37-1 383, the City of Peoria , having i n  effect a(

nationally recogn ized fire code ,  does hereby assume ju risd iction from the Office of 
State Fire Marshal for prescribing and enforcing fi re prevention standards throughout 
the C ity. The C ity of Peoria does not have authority that supersedes and is ·not 
exempt from the State Fire Code establ ished pursuant to A. R .S .  Section 37-
1 383(A)(5) in State o r  county owned bu i ld i ngs wherever located th roughout the 
State . 

SECT ION 2 .  Chapter 9 of  the Peoria C ity Code ( 1 992) is amended by amending 
Section 9-33 perta in ing to the I nternationa l  F ire Code, Loca l Amendments and wh ich 
shall read as follows: 

Sec. 9-33. International F ire Code , Local  Amendments. 

(a)( Section 1 02.3 Change of Use or  Occupancy is amended by rep lacing(
the words "this code"  with "the  currently adopted Fire Code and amendments , "  
designati ng the existi ng text as subsection 1 and add ing the fo llowing paragraph as 
subsection 2 .  

Section 1 02 . 3  Change of Use or  Occupancy. 
2.( All changes of occupancy sha l l  be coord inated with the F i re Marshal(

prior to issuance of a Temporary or  Permanent Certificate of Occupancy. 

(b)( Section 1 02.4 App l ication of bu i ld ing code is amended by add ing the(
words "and the currently adopted Fire Code and amendments" after "International 
Building Code."  

(c)( Section 1 02 .6  H istoric bu i ld i ngs is amended by add ing  the words "and(
the currently adopted Fire Code and amendments" after "approved fire protection 
plan . "  

(d )( Section 1 04.3 R ight of entry is hereby amended by add ing the(
following : 

The Fire-Medical Department shal l  i nspect, as often as necessary, bu i ld i ngs 
and premises, including such other hazards or  appl iances designated by the Fire 
Ch ief for the purposes of ascerta in ing and causing to be corrected any of the 
cond itions which wou ld reasonably tend to cause fire or contribute to its spread , o r  
any violation of  the purpose or  provisions of  th is code and of  any other  law or  
standard affecting fire safety. Any person who refuses entry for purposes of  th is 



Ord inance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 3 of 40 

provision shall be in vio lation of Peoria City Code Section 9-43(a) and subject to the 
penalties prescribed in Peoria City Code Section 9-42,  including civil sanctions 
identified in 9-42(b). 

(e) Section 1 04.6 Official Records is hereby amended by add ing the 
following : 

1 04 .6 .5 Required information .  Each bus iness and build ing owner  sha ll p rovide the 
fol lowing information to the Fire Code Official upon request: Responsib le party 
address, responsible party telephone number, bu ild ing owner address, building 
owner telephone number, square footage of the build ing and/or leased space , 
I nsurance company name, Insurance company policy number, and Insurance 
company telephone number. 

(f)( Section 1 04. 1 0  Fire Investigations is amended with the following new(
section : 

1 04. 1 0  Fire Investigations. The Fire-Medical Department shal l  investigate or 
cause to be investigated promptly the cause ,  o rig in and circumstance of each and 
every fire occurring in the jurisd iction involving loss of life or injury to a person or 
destruction or damage to property,  and if it appears to the member of the Fi re­
Medical Department making the investigation that such fire is of suspicious orig i n ,  
the member sha l l  notify the appropriate law enforcement agency and  shall secure 
the site until the law enforcement agency takes control of the site. The Fire 
Investigator shall continue to pursue the investigation to its conclusion .  

(g)( Section 1 04. 1 1 .4 Restricting Public Access is amended with the(
following new section : 

It shal l be the duty of the Po lice Department, at the time of any fire , to place 
ropes or guards across all streets , lanes or a lleys on wh ich shall be situated any 
building on fire , and at such other points as a re deemed expedient and necessary. 
Any person entering within the line ind icated by such ropes o r  guards and refus ing to 
go outside such lines when d irected to do so by any police officer or officer of the fire 
department shall be gu ilty of a class one misdemeanor. 

(h)( Section 1 05 . 1 . 1  Permits req u ired is amended by add ing the following(
at the end of the paragraph. 

It shall be un lawful for any person ,  firm or corporation to use a bu i ld ing o r  
premises or engage in any activities for wh ich a permit is determined to be required 
by the Fire Code Official without having first obtained such permit from the Fire­
Med ical Department. 

(i)( Section 1 05.2 Application is amended and replaced with the following(
new section.(



Ordinance No . 20 1 9-1 1 
Page 4 of 40 

Section 1 05.2 Application . App lication for a permit requ ired by this code shal l  
be made to the F i re Code Official in such fo rm and deta i l  as p rescribed by the F i re 
Code Official no later  than th irty (30) days prior to date of the event . Appl ications for 
permits sha l l  be accompan ied by such p lans as p rescribed by the fire code officia l .  

Scope . Fees for reviewing plans ,  issu ing permits and conduct ing inspections re lating 
to construction or insta l lation of automatic sprinkler systems , fi re a larm systems, 
hood and duct fire-extingu ishing systems and other fire- and life-safety systems for 
compliance with the I nternationa l  F ire Code and other laws and ord inances, and 
other services provided sha ll be set  by the Fi re-Medica l Department. The fol lowing 
conta ins a Un iform Fees and Charges P rogram for the C ity of Peoria F i re-Med ical 
Department. 

Permit and Service Fees Ord inance 

Purpose. T he purpose of this o rd inance is to establ ish fees for specific Fi re Code 
permits as defined i n  the I nte rnationa l  F i re Code , as  adopted by th is j u risd iction and 
for the estab l ishment of fees for service performed by the Fi re-Medica l  Department. 

Defin itions . All te rm inology not  defined in th is chap te r  shal l  be defi ned as stated in 
the Inte rnational F i re Code as adopted by th is ju risd iction . 

Perm its and Service Fees : A fee in acco rdance with the fo l lowing schedu le sha ll be 
paid to the F i re Department at the t ime of app l ication for: ( 1 ) a REN EWABE 
PERM IT, (2 ) and I N STALLATION o r  REMOVAL a nd ALTE RAT ION PERM IT ,  (3)  an 
ACTIVITY PERM IT ,  (4) any  OTHER SERVICE ,  (5) any RECORDS ,  
PHOTOGRAPHS or DOCUMENTS ,  or  (6) a HAZARDOUS  MATERIALS STORAGE 
PERM IT . Such fee s hal l  not be refu nded u pon fa i l u re of an  app l icant  to receive the 
permit .  Fa i l u re to apply for necessary permits or services may res u lt i n  an  o rder from 
the F i re Code Offic ia l to obta in  a permit o r  serv ice .  Fees a re payab le u pon permi t  
a ppl ication . Fa i l u re to pay for  permit , p lan  review o r  in spectio n fees imposed by th is 
fee schedu le ,  with i n  the t ime pe riod specified , sha l l  re nder  such perm it n u l l a nd vo id . 

EXCEPTION : These perm it cha rges s h a l l not app ly to a ct iv ities of nonprofit 
Corporations or civic or fraterna l organ izatio n s  that possess a n  Inte rn a l  Reve n u e  
Se rvice tax exempt statu s .  H oweve r, these g ro ups wil l  be assessed pla n  review and 
inspection fees . 

Sta nda rd H o u rly Fee : The re sha ll be a sta n d a rd ho u r ly fee , as esta b l ished in th e 
a ppropriate fee table , or one h u n d red do lla rs ($ 1 00 .00) per h o u r, wh icheve r is 
g reater, w ith a one ( 1 ) h o u r  mi n imu m ,  cha rge fo r a ll inspection a nd p la n  review work 
u n less specifica) l ly exempted . All re-i n spectio ns (follow-u p in spectio n s )  sha l l  be)
charged at the sta nd a rd hou rly fee with a one (1 ) h o u r  m in im um , u n less othe rwise)
specified . All inspect io n s ,  p la n  rev iews a nd con s u )ltatio n s  sh a l l be ch a rged th is)
standa rd hou rly fee , u n less otherwise specified . The ove rtime hou r ly fee sh a ll  be)



Ord inance No. 201 9- 1 1 
Page 5 of 40 

one and one ha lf (1 ½) the standa rd hourly fee, or as establ ished in an appropriate 
fee table, when the department is requested to review p lans or conduct i nspections 
outside of the normal work day. Overtime cha rges shal l be a min imum of two (2))
hours.)

Renewable Permit Fees : When an inspection or  p lan review is cond ucted by the F i re 
Prevention Divis ion to ensure proper design ,  i nsta l lat ion or permit compliance ,  the 
standard hourly fee for the first hou r of inspection or  the first hour of p lan review, 
when requ i red , shal l  be pa id at the t ime of appl ication. Fees for subsequent hou rs of 
plan review sha l l  be paid prior to the issuance of a permit. The permit fee sha l l  be in 
add ition to the standard hourly fee in accordance with Table 9-33(a) Renewable 
Permit Fees : I nspection and Plan Review Fees for Insta llation . 

I nstal lation , Remova l or Alte rations of Equ ipment .  

When an i nspection or  p lan review is conducted by the Fi re-Medical 
Department to ensu re p roper des ign and insta l lation ,  the standa rd hourly fee for the 
first hou r of in spection or the first hou r of plan review, when requ ired, sha l l  be pa id at 
the time of appl ication . Fees for subsequen t  hours of p lan review sha ll be paid prior 
to the issuance of the permit. Fees for subsequent hou rs of inspection sha ll be paid 
prior to issuance of a Certifica te of Occupancy .  All Fees shal l  be in accordance with 
Table 9-33(b) . 

I nspection or P lan  Review Fees fo r Activity Permits . 

Genera l. When an  i nspectio n o r  p l an  review is  cond ucted by the Fi re 
P revention Divis ion to ensu re p roper design ,  i n sta l la tion or permit comp l ia nce ,  the 

estanda rd hou rly fe for the first hou r  of inspection or the fi rst hou r  of p lan  review , 
when req u i red , sha ll be paid at the t ime of app l ica tio n .  Fees for s ubsequent  hou rs of 
p la n  review and  i nspect ion  sha l l  be pa id p rior  to the issu a nce of t he  permit. A 
separa te perm it fo r a specific period of t ime sha ll be obta ined fo r  each locat ion 

ewhe re s uch operations a re pe rfo rmed . The pe rm it fes sha ll be in  add ition to the 
standa rd hou rly fee in  acco rda n ce with Ta ble 9-3 3 (c) . 

An n u a l  Haza rdous  Mate ria ls Sto rage Perm it Fee 

T he a n nu a l  fee is based on q uantitie s sto red , ma nufactu red , u sed in process , 
so ld , transported o r  otherwise uti l ized in the fo rm of l iq u id s , so lids or gases. When 
the re a re mu ltip le fo rms the h ig hest ra ng e wil l be used , as set fo rth in Ta b le 9-33 (a ) .  

G)) Section 1 05 . 3 . 1 Exp iration is a me nded by add ing the followi ng :)

Ope ration a l Pe rmits s h a l l exp ire o ne yea r fro m the date of iss u a nce u n less 
otherwise noted . 



Ordinance No.  201 9-1 1 
Page 6 of 40 

(k)( Section 1 05 .6 .2 Amusement bu i ld ings is amended with the fol lowing(
new section:  

Section 1 05 .6 .2 Amusement bui ld ings. An operational permit is requ i red to 
operate a special amusement bu i ld ing for a period of time not to exceed 45 days .  
P lans sha l l  be submitted to the Fi re-Med ical Department and approved 30 days 
before the open ing of the bu ild ing or structure to the pub l ic. 

(I)( Section 1 05 .6 .8  Compressed gases is amended with the fo l lowing new(
section and Table 1 05 .6 .8 :  

Section 1 05.6 .8 Compressed gases. An operational permit is requ ired for the 
storage, use or handl ing at normal temperatu re and pressure (NTP) of compressed 
gases in  excess of the amou nts l isted in Table 1 05 .6 .8 .  

Exception: Veh icles equ ipped for and us ing compressed gas as a fue l  for 
propell ing the veh icle . 

TABLE 1 05 .6 .8 
PERMIT AMOUNTS FOR COMPRESSED GASES 

AMOUNTTYPE OF GAS (cubic feet at NTP) 
Carbon d ioxide used in carbon d ioxide en richment 438 (50 lbs.)  systems 
Carbon dioxide used in insu lated l iqu id carbon d ioxide 438 (50 lbs . )  beverage d ispensing app l ications 
Corrosive 200 
Flammab le (except cryogenic flu ids and l iquefied 200petroleum gases) 
High ly toxic Any Amount 
I nert and s imple asphyxiant (except carbon d ioxide) 6 ,000 

Oxid izing (includ ing oxygen) 504 
Pvrophoric Anv Amou nt 
Toxic Any Amou nt 

(m)( Section 1 05 .6 .23 Hot Work Operations is amended by add ing the(
fol lowing section: 

Section 1 05 .6 .23. 1 Hot Work Permits . Operational perm its are requ i red to be 
filled out by the respons ible party for the site ,  structu re ,  occupancy ,  or property prior 
to the hot work operation.  Hot work perm its must be kept on  file for 90 days and be 
made ava ilable to the Fire-Medical Department or any other regu latory agency upon 
request. 

https://105.6.23


Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 (
Page 7 of 40 

(n)( Section 1 05 .6.30 Mobile food preparation vehicles is amended by(
adding the following exception . 

Exception : A permit is not required where specifica lly exempted by State law. 

(o)( Section 1 05.6.51 Any person ,  corporation ,  partnership or other entity(
engaged in the business of design , instal l ,  mon itor, sell, or service with i n  the City of 
Peoria sha l l ,  obta in a permit from the Fire-Medical Department. The permit 
application shall include the fo llowing : Copy of State and City license and Copy of 
Certification.  

(p)( Section 106.5 is amended by add ing the following :(

1 .  A fee (Table 9-33(d ) Fees for Other Services) shall be assessed to the(
building owner or business occupancy for the annual inspection and for all re­
inspections required to gain compliance with this Code.(

i . ( If a build ing is occupied by a business occupancy that is(
d ifferent from the owner, then the business occupancy shall be required to pay the 
assessed inspection fees. 

i i . ( If a build ing is occupied by the owner or  is vacant, then the(
owner shall be required to pay the assessed inspection fees .  

2 . ( I f  a build ing is  split into multiple occupancies, the inspection fees sha ll(
be assessed as follows: 

i.( Each separate business occupancy that is requ ired to possess(
and maintain a City of Peoria business l icense shall be assessed inspection fees 
based on the square footage of the specified space within the bu ild ing that has been 
issued a Certificate of Occupancy for such business. The owner shall not be 
responsible to pay the inspection fees for any separate business occupancy within 
the bu ilding . 

i i . ( For all portions of a bu ild ing that are not under the control of(
separate business occupancies subject to subsection (i) , the owner shall be 
responsible to pay the inspection fees , which shal l  be ca lculated by adding together 
all of the square footage in those portions of the bu i ld ing. 

3.( A fee will not be charged for additiona l inspections that the Fire Ch ief(
deems necessary throughout the year. 

4. The Fi re Chief can limit the maximum inspection fee assessed for a 
facil ity. 

https://105.6.51
https://105.6.30


Ord inance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 8 of 40 

(q )( Section 1 09 is amended as follows :(

Section 1 09.4 Admin istrative appeal .  Whenever a violation of this code has 
been found and the applicant wishes to appeal the decision of the staff because the 
code or the rules lega lly adopted there under have been incorrectly in terpreted or an 
equ ivalent method of protection or safety is proposed , an appeal may be filed as 
follows: 

1 .  The appl icant shall file a written appeal , with i n  ten ( 1 0) working days 
after receiving notice of the violation. The appeal shall be fi led with the Bu ild i ng 
Official and a copy filed with the Fi re Ch ief. At this time, the applicant may request 
an informal review before the Fire Code Official. 

2.( I f  an applicant requests an  informal review, the review wil l be heard by(
the F ire Code Official  or his designee with in 1 5  working  days after  the request is 
filed. The Fire Chief, or an authorized representative, may use a Committee 
consisting of such staff as is deemed appropriate to provide advice on a particular  
request for informal review. 

3.( The applicant shall provide specific information on the basis for the(
appeal and the relief requested. 

4 .( If the informal review upholds the decision of the Fire Code Officia l ,  the(
applicant shall comply with the requirement(s) of the fire code or request a hearing 
by the Fire Board of Appeals with in ten ( 1 0) working days following the informal 
review as provided in  Sec. 1 08.3 of this code . 

(r)( Section 1 1 0  is amended as follows :(

1 1 0.4. Violation penalties. (

Penalties for violations of this Code are set forth in Peoria C ity Code,(
Sections 9-36 through 9-43. 

(s)( Section 1 1 0 .5  is added as fol lows :(

1 1 0.5 Investigation/Inspection fee.(

Any person who commences any work on a fire or life safety system(
before obta ining the necessary permits shall be subject to a fee established by the 
C i ty Counci l that shal l  be in add ition to the requ ired permit fees. The Fire Code 
Official will incur certain cost (i.e . :  i nspection and admin istrative time) when 
investigating/inspecting and citing a person who has commenced work without 
having obtained a permit. The Fire Code Official is therefore entitled to recover these 
costs , in addition to that collected when the required permit is issued , to be imposed 
on the responsible party.  



Ord inance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 9 of 40 

(t)( Section 202 is amended to include the following additional definitions.(

Section 202 - Genera l Definitions(

The following defin itions are hereby added to read as follows : 

ACCESS GRADES. Access grades shall include the table set forth in Table 
9-33(e).(

ALL WEATHER SURFACE. An all-weather surface (AW) is a road surface 
made up of materials compacted to 90% and capable of supporting vehicles in 
excess of 75,000 pound gross veh icle weight (GVW) under any weather condition. 

COMMERCIAL OCCUPANCY. A commercial occupancy is any build ing that 
falls under the International Bu ild ing Code (IBC) occupancy classification of A, B, E ,  
F ,  H ,  I ,  M ,  R 1 ,  R-2, R-4, and S. 

DRIVE LENGTH. Drive Length is measured from the entrance of the drive at 
the public street to the structu re. 

DRIVE WIDTH. Drive Width is measured from the edges of the designated 
improved drivable surface. 2-12-2 and 2-1 6-2, is a 2 foot clear AW surface on both 
sides of a 1 2  or 1 6  foot hard surface drive. 

GRADE. Grade is the degree of inclination of a slope, road , or other surface 
(see slope) . 

HARD SURFACE. Hard Surface is a drive surface of concrete, asphalt, or 
pavers designed to support vehicles in excess of 75,000 pounds GVW under any 
weather condition . 

HORIZONTAL STANDPIPE.  A horizontal standpipe, also known as a yard 
hydrant, is a permanent extension of the required firefighting water supply for  a 
bui lding. The horizonta l standpipe can be below grade and can be a wet or  d ry  
standpipe. The horizontal standpipe is req uired to b e  able to supply a min imum of 
500 gallons per minute at the outlet. The use of horizonta l standpipes must be 
approved by the Fire Code Official .  

HOSE LAY. Hose Lay is  the extension of  a hand held fire hose as it i s  
extended around the perimeter of  the structure. If the hose lay is more than 200 feet 
from the road to al l  portions of the exterior, an Operational Platform is required . 

INVESTIGATION/INSPECTION FEE. An investigation/inspection fee is a fee 
assessed for  investigating/inspecting work that has been commenced prio r to a 
permit being issued . 



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 (
Page 1 0  of 40 

OPERATION PLATFORM. Operational Platform is an area located on site 
where the emergency vehicle is staged wh ile performing emergency medical or 
firefighting operations. The platform shall be 20 feet by 30 feet with a maximum 
cross grade of  5 percent .  Operationa l  platforms are requ ired when a drive or 
adjacent street grade is greater than 1 2% slope or the hose lay from the truck 
staging area to all portions of the exterior of the structure are greater than  200 feet. 

REPAIR. Repair of any fire p rotection equ ipment is a " l ike for like" 
replacement of a component. The component replaced must be from the same 
manufacturer and be the same model and part number. 

REPLACEMENT. Replacement of any fire protection system component 
must be by the same manufacturer, the same model and part number. Replacement 
of a component by a different manufactu rer, model or  part number due to 
obsolescence is considered an  upgrade. 

SLOPE. Slope is the ground , road or  other surface that forms a natural o r  
artificial incline. The percentage of  slope is determined by dividing the rise by the 
horizontal run multiplied by 1 00 [% slope = (Rise/Run) X 1 00) . 

TEM PORARY USE. Temporary Use is the use of a facility or structure for an 
agreed upon specified period of time. 

TURN-A-ROUND. A turn-a-round is req u ired for emergency veh icles when 
the structure is  more than 200 feet from the road.  This can be accomplished with a 
circle drive with an outside radius of 40'-6" ,  T-Type hammer head 1 6' X 76', or a 
variation there of. 

TURNING RADIUS.  A turning rad ius, for the purpose of th is code ,  defines 
the required a rea for fire apparatus movement. Fire apparatus movement is based 
on the WB-50 turning template as p roduced by the American Association of State 
Highway and Transportation Officials (AAS HTO). 

TURN-OUT. A turn-out is requ i red on al l  extended d riveways 300 feet or 
g reater in length to a sing le residence .  A turnout shall widen to 20 feet minimum 
width over a minimum length of 45 feet. 

UPGRADE. Upgrade of a fire protection system is anytime a major system 
component is replaced by a different manufacturer, model or part number d ue to 
obsolescence or to expand capacity. 

(u)( Section 308 . 1 .6 .3  Sky lanterns is amended and replaced with the(
following new text: 

A person shall not release or  cause to be released a sky lantern , Ch inese 
lantern or other similar device with in the City of Peoria . 



Ordinance No. 20 1 9-1 1 
Page 1(1 of 40 

(v)( Section 308 .3 .3  is amended by adding the following add itiona l (
subsections:  

308.3.3 Audience control .  The aud ience shal l  be at least 30 feet away from 
the closest projection of an open flame device . Audience control sha l l be established 
by use of a physica l barrie r wh ich can be eas i ly moved or removed in  the event of an  
emergency and shal l  remain i n  p lace throughout the enti re performance .  

308 .3 .4 Attendant. Performances sha l l  be constantly attended by a person 
knowledgeable in the use of  a fi re extingu isher at  the rate of  at  least 1 attendant for 
every 2 active devices. Attendants shal l  rema in  at the performance unt i l  a l l  the fi re 
has been extinguished . 

308.3 .5 F i re extingu ishers .  Adequate fire extingu ish ing equipment i nclud ing 
but not l imited to buckets of water, water soaked rags ,  water extingu ishers ,  charged 
hose lines, sha l l  be read ily ava i lable for use during the performance .  Portab le fire 
extingu ishers shal l  be provided at a m in imum of one 2-A:20-8 :C extingu isher for 
every four  simu ltaneous devices.  

308.3.6 Clearance from Combustibles . A 25 foot clearance from al l  
combustibles shal l  be ma intained i n  a l l  d i rections.  

(w)( Section 40 1 . 1  Scope is amended by de let ing the exception in its(
entirety . 

(x)( Section 403 .2 is amended to add Section 403 .2 .5  wh ich shal l  read as(
follows : 

Section 403.2 .5  Automatic External Defibril lators (AED} .  All Publ ic Assembly 
occupancies with an occupant load of th ree hundred (300} or g reater shal l  be 
eq u ipped with AEDs so that they optimally ach ieves a 3-m inute response time from 
the col lapse of a patient to on-scene arriva l of the AED with a tra ined lay rescuer ,  i n  
accordance with the American Heart Association recommendations and the 
following cond itions: 

1 .  The insta llat ions of AEDs are a life safety device and the maintenance 
of the device sha l l  be the respons ib i l ity of the owner of the Certificate of Occupancy. 

2.( It shal l  be the responsibi l ity of the owner to obta in and mainta in (
medica l oversight from a l icensed physician . 

3 . ( I t  sha l l be the responsib i l ity of the owner to tra in its employees i n (
Cardio Pulmonary Resuscitation and the use of  AEDs i n  accordance with the 
Guidel i nes of the American Heart Association or the Red Cross . 



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 1 2  of 40 

4.( Training and equ ipment ma intenance records sha l l  be kept on(
premises and be ava ilable to the fire Department upon request. 

5.( AEDs shal l  be mounted i n  an accessible spot free from blocking by(
storage and equipment. The top of the AED sha l l  be not more than 5 ft. ( 1 . 5 m) 
above the floor. The AED shou ld be easy to reach and remove and shou ld be placed 
where it wi l l  not be damaged -- on hangers or in the brackets supplied by the 
manufacturer, mounted in cab inets , or p laced on she lves . 

(y)( Section 501 .3  Construction Documents is amended and which shal l (
read as follows : 

Section 501(.3  Construction Documents . Construction documents fo r 
proposed fire apparatus access, location of fire lanes, -hyd rau l ic ca lcu lations for fire 
hydrants and construct ion documents sha l l  be submitted to the F ire-Med ica l 
Department for review and approva l prio r  to construction .  U pon completion of 
construction and prior to issue of a Certificate of Occupancy, a copy of finished 
drawings shall be supplied to the Fire-Med ica l Department in the fol lowing format: 

501 . 3 . 1  Record E lectronic Fi les : A copy of the bu i ld i ng site p lan ,  fi re a larm 
system, fire sprinkler system shal l be provided i n  Portab le Document Format (PDF) . 

(z) Section 501 is amended to add section 501 .5  wh ich shal l  read as 
follows: 

Section 501(.5 .  Wild land/Urban Interface Areas. Areas considered by the Fire 
Code Officia l to be classified as  "Wild land/U rban Interface" sha l l  meet the 
requirements of the 201 8  I nternational Urban-Wild land I nterface Code . 

(aa) Section 503 .2 .7  is amended to read as follows:  

Section 503.2 .7 .  The grade of the fire apparatus access road shal l  be with in 
the l imits established by the Fire Code Official  based upon the F i re-Med ica l 
Department's apparatus.  The maximum grade(s) a l lowable are : 

1 . ( Major Arterials - 9 .0% 

2.( M inor Arteria ls - 9 .0%(

3. Couplets - 9 .0%(

4. Rural/ESL Minor Col lectors - 1 2 .0%(

5 . ( Loca l Collectors - 1 2 .0%(

6 .  Loca l Res identia l - 1 5 .0%(



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 1 3  of 40 

With the fol lowing cond itions: 

1 .  Al l  residential and commercia l  structures where any access grades 
exceed 1 0% must be equ ipped throughout with an  automatic fi re sprinkler system 
that meets the requ i rements of the 201 8 I nternationa l  Fire Code and the Peoria Fi re 
Code Amendments. 

2 . ( Al l residentia l  and commercial structures and developments meet the
requirements of the 201 8  International Urban-Wi ld land I n terface Code ( I UWIC) 

3 . ( Al l  res identia l  and commercia l structures are constructed to the(
min imum level of C lass 1 Ign ition  Resistant Construct ion as defined in  Section 504 
of the 201 8  I UWIC .  

(bb) Section 503 .3 is amended and shal l  read as follows : 

Sec. 503.3 Fire apparatus access roads posti ng.  Every fi re apparatus access 
roadway requ i red under the authority of th is section shal l  be posted with s igns 
readable from either d irection of trave l and vertical ly i nstal led at points not more than 
eighty (80) feet on center along the length of the requ ired fi re apparatus access 
roadway. Fire Lane signs ,  with ind icating arrows , shall be posted at the beg inn ing 
and end of each fi re lane with the ind icat ing arrow pointing i n  the d i rect ion of the fire 
lane.  If the fire lane is intersected by a drive , then a two-way arrow sha l l  be insta lled 
at that location. 

In l ieu of s igns the curb can be pa inted red and marked "NO PARKI NG F IRE 
LANE" in four (4) inch wh ite b lock letters on the vertica l face of the cu rb and spaced 
e ighty (80) feet on center. 

On ly fire apparatus access roadways requ i red under the authority of th is 
section or as approved by the F i re Ch ief may be posted or identified as such . 
Unauthorized use of signs shall be removed . 

Sec. 503.3 . 1  Ma intenance . The person(s) in possession of the p remises on 
and into which a fi re apparatus access roadway is requ i red sha l l  be so lely 
responsible for the ma intenance of such roadways and al l  requ i red signs .  No owner, 
manager o r  other person(s) in charge of p remises served by a requ i red fire 
apparatus access roadway shall abandon or close the fire apparatus roadway or any 
part thereof without permiss ion of the Fire Code Officia l .  

The person(s) in possession of the premises shal l  be responsible in ensuring 
that fire apparatus roadways are clear at al l t imes . 

(cc)( Section 503.4 Obstruction of F i re Apparatus Roads is amended and(
shal l read as fol lows: 



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 14  of 40 

Sec. 503.4 Obstruction  of fire apparatus roads. The required width of any fire 
apparatus access roadway on C ity or private property shal l  not be obstructed in any 
manner, including the parking or stopping of any veh icle other than an authorized 
emergency veh icle . A veh icle parked il lega l ly i n  a fire apparatus access roadway 
may be removed and impounded under the provisions of the Peoria C ity Code . An 
owner or operator of a vehicle parked i l legal ly in a fire apparatus access roadway or 
the person responsible for any non-veh icu lar obstruction sha l l  be gu ilty of a 
misdemeanor. 

(dd)( Section 503 .6  Security Gates is added and shal l read as follows : (

Sec. 503.6. 1 Gate Access ( I nformation and Scale Plans shal l be submitted to 
the Fire-Medica l Department for a permit) 

Al l  gates limiting access wi l l  be required to p rovide emergency Access 
controls for Fire-Medical Department entry. 

503.6. 1 . 1 The gates shal l  be designed so that the access roadway or turn ing 
radius (WB50) sha l l  not be obstructed by the operation of  the gate . M in imum set 
back from the publ ic streets shal l  be a d istance dete rmined by the City Engineer and 
a l low the emergency veh icle the abi l ity to safe ly operate the lock box or  pane l .  
Turn ing rad ius  from the pub l ic street shal l  be WB50. 

503.6. 1 .2 C lear width of the roadway sha l l  be min imum of twenty (20) feet 
clear width on all entrances . Exit roadways sha l l  be a min imum of s ixteen ( 1 6) feet 
clear width or larger on  al l  exits . Un less otherwise approved by the fire department. 

503.6. 1 .3 Sub-d ivisions  may have a d ivided entrance and exit gates.  The 
entrance s ide shal l have a clearance of twenty (20) feet clear width , the exit s ide 
s ixteen ( 1 6) feet clear width . 

503.6 . 1 .4 Access controls shal l  be exterior to the gate and located for 
activation by the veh icle operator without d ismount ing from the veh icle . The height 
of the lock box/contro l  panel shal l  be s ixty-six (66) inches , measured from the 
fin ished grade l ine of the street. 

503.6. 1 .5 The lock box , padlock or key switch , must be an approved model 
util ized by the Peoria Fire-Med ica l Department wh ich is manufactu red by the Knox 
Company. 

503 .6 . 1 .6 Traffic Preemption opening device sha ll be on a l l  motorized gates.  
Opticom, 3M, Model 722 rece iver (no coding model) o r  compatible sha l l  be used . 

503 .6 . 1 . 7 Gates must open to a clear width of twenty (20) feet within twenty 
(20)(seconds of activation and remain  in the open posit ion unti l closed by operation(
of the e lectrical contro l device .(



Ord inance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 1 5  of 40 

503.6 . 1 .8 The contro l  pedestal must be identified with a min imum s ix (6) inch 
by Ten ( 1 0) inch sign with red letters on  a wh ite background. This s ig n  must be 
securely fastened to the pedesta l and leg ible from the approach ing veh icle . 
EM ERGENCY FIRE DEPARTMENT ACCESS. 

503.6 . 1 .9 Battery back-up for a l l  motorized gates is requ i red , un less the gate 
fa i l  safe (open) in the event of a power fa i lure .  

503.6 . 1 . 1 0  Secondary "Exit On ly" gates sha l l  be set up  for F ire-Med ica l 
Department emergency access . Exit on ly gates ,  which are not motorized , sha l l  be 
insta lled per City of Peoria F i re-Med ical Department Standard deta i l .  Deta i ls are 
ava i lable at the City of Peoria Fire Prevention . Exit only gates shal l  have a m in imum 
clearance of twenty (20) feet clear width and  be posted with a s i gn  that states 
"Caution Gate Opens Out." The ground sha l l  be painted with a yel low str ip showing 
the depth of the gate swing. 

503.6. 1 . 1 2  Operation  at the gate shal l  be by pre-emption device or  key
switch . 

(ee) Section 505 . 1  is amended to read as fol lows : 

505. 1 Address numbers. New and existi ng bu ild ings sha ll have approved(
address numbers , bu i ld i ng  numbers or approved bui ld ing identification p laced in a 
posit ion that is plain ly leg ible and visible from the street o r  road fronti ng  the property. 
Address numbers sha l l  be insta l led accord ing to the fo llowing add ress d isp lay 
requ irements. 

1 . ( Al l  address numbers sha l l  be on a contrasting background . 

2 . ( No numbers a re permitted on g lass except su ite numbers .(

3 . ( All numbers shal l  be vis ible from a l l  street frontages .(

4 . ( Address numbers located twelve ( 1 2) feet and h igher as  measured(
from the fin ished grade shal l be a min imum of twelve ( 1 2) inches in height . 

5.( Address numbers located be low twelve ( 1 2 )  feet as measured from the(
fin ished grade, monument signs  and commercial suites shal l have a minimum of six 
(6)(i nch numbers .(

6 . ( Add it ional address numbers may be requ ired when , in the op in ion of(
the Fire Code Officia l , emergency response may be delayed d ue to the physica l 
layout of the bui ld ing.  

(ff) Section 505 is amended by adding subsection 505 .3  wh ich shal l  read 
as follows : 

https://503.6.1.12
https://503.6.1.10


Ordinance No .  201 9-1 1 
Page 1 6  of 40 

505 .3 Address d i rectory. An approved add ress directory sha ll be i nsta l led at 
p roperties conta in ing one of the fol lowing : 

1 . ( More than one ( 1 ) pri ncipa l  bu i ld i ng . 

2 . ( Bu ild i ngs with un it identification numbers .(

3 .( When in the opin ion of the Fire Code Officia l , emergency response(
may be de layed d ue to phys ica l layout of the complex. 

505.3 . 1  Specifications.  Drawings and/or samples shall be submitted to the 
Fire-Medica l Department for review and approva l for all requ ired address directories.  

505.3.2 D imensions. The minimum size for the address d i rectory is to be 
th ree (3) feet by th ree (3) feet. Larger sizes may be requ i red where the site cannot fit 
on the standard size and sti l l  be legib le .  

505.3.3 Protection . The address d i rectory is to  be su itab ly constructed to  be 
insta lled outdoors . The graph ics sha l l  be protected from vandal ism and weather by a 
clear polycarbonate cover. The cover sha l l  be a min imum of 1 /Bn th ick and sea led to 
protect the graph ics from weather damage .  

505.3.4 Il luminatio n .  The address directory is to  be i l luminated interna l ly by a 
wh ite l ight. The l ight shal l be sufficient to i l lum inate the enti re site p lan with even 
l ight. The address directory is to be i l luminated from dusk to dawn . The i l lum ination 
can be turned on and off by an automatic timer or photo ce l l .  

505 .3.5 Insta l lation requ irements . The address d i rectory is to be i nsta lled a 
m in imum of th irty six (36) inches above the fin ished grade. Larger sizes of add ress 
directories can be mounted no lower than twenty fou r  (24) inches when approved by 
the Fire Code Officia l .  The support post or  stanchions a re to be set i n  concrete .  

505 .3 .6 Depiction requ irements . The address d i rectory sha l l  dep ict the site i n  
a clear, easily understood manner  from a d istance of  eight (8) feet. The address 
d i rectory shall dep ict structures, bui ld i ng n umbers, un its , apartment space numbers ,
tenn is courts, swimming poo ls, d riveways, streets , fi re hydrants and any other areas 
as determined by the Fire Code Officia l .  Construction of the address directory sha l l  
comply with the fol lowing requ i rements: 

1 .  Address directories shal l be a dark p ri nt on a contrasti ng l ight 
background. 

2.( The name and address of the comp lex are requ i red , but sha l l  not(
exceed ten ( 1 0) percent of the tota l size of the s ite d i rectory. 

3.( Any water areas shall be b lue (i .e . :  pools ,  founta ins , cana ls ,  etc. ) .(



Ord inance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 1 7  of 40 

4.( Tennis courts shal l  be green .(

5 .( Fire hydrants shall be a 1 /4" d iameter black circle filled with a yellow(
center. The abbreviation MHYD" must be affixed by the location of the hydrant on the 
directory. 

6.( The address directory shall be oriented to the viewer with a red(
symbol , one ( 1 ) inch in d iameter ,  with the words "YOU ARE H ERE" affixed at the 
appropriate location of the d irectory. 

7.( North must be ind icated on  the site plan by an arrow no less than three(
(3)(inch in s ize .(

8 . ( The building numbers must be one ( 1 ) inch in diameter, located directly(
adjacent to the bu ilding on the driveway s ide .  

9 . ( The colors used on  the site d i rectory may not be duplicated to(
represent more than one ( 1 ) item. 

505 .3.7 Setback requ irements .  The add ress d i rectory shall be installed on the 
occupant's p roperty. A sca led plan shal l  be submitted showing the proposed location 
of the address directory, streets , drive a isles, any gate controls and traffic islands. 

1 .  The location of the address d irectory shall be far enough from the 
street for the fire apparatus to be safely on  the property while reviewing the address 
d irectory. The location of the address d irectory cannot confl ict with the traffic vis ib ility 
zone. 

2 . ( No landscape or arch itectu ra l  designs may obstruct the viewing of(
The address directory. 

505 .3 .8 Proh ibitions. No advertising or additiona l  artwork is allowed on the 
address directory. 

(gg) Section  506.1  is amended by adding subsection 506. 1 .3 which sha ll 
read as follows: 

Section 506 . 1 .3 Locations .  Key boxes shall be installed in a location as 
determined by the Fire Code Official . A fu ll set of keys to open all a reas inside and 
outside the structu re , to include the fire alarm panel, shall be placed inside the key 
box. Key Boxes are to be located no h ig her than 60 inches above fin ished grade. 

(hh) Section 507 . 1  is amended to read as follows : 

507 . 1  Required water supply . An approved water supply capable of supplying 
the required fire flow for fi re p rotection shall be provided to premises upon wh ich 
facilities,  bu ild ing or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or moved into or 



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 1 8  of 40 

within the ju risd iction .  Where property is subd ivided with or  without the creation of 
publ ic or private streets for the express purpose of providing said subd ivided parcels 
for sale or otherwise permitting separate and/or ind ividual deve lopment to occur, an  
approved water supply capable of  supplying the projected fire flow for fire protection 
shall be provided and extended to serve directly any and al l  subd ivided properties. 
The projected fi re flow wil l be based on the greatest potentia l  demand posed by any 
type of occupancy allowed by zoning laws on the projected property. 

(ii)( Section 507 .5. 1 is amended to read as fol lows :(

Sec. 507.5.1 .  Where required. Where a portion of a facility or  bu ilding 
hereafter constructed or moved into or within the ju risdiction is more than 300 feet 
(91 .5m) from a fire hyd rant on a fire apparatus access road , as measured by 
approved route around the exterior of the facil ity or  build ing, additional fire hydrants 
and/or mains shall be provided where required by the F ire Code Officia l .  

Exception: 

1 . ( For Group R-3 and Group U Occupancies, the distance requ i rement 
shall be 500 feet ( 1 22m) . 

(jj)  Section 507 .5 .2 is amended to include the following new subsection 
507.5.2. 1 pertaining to req uired instal lations : 

Section 507 .5 .2 . 1 Required installat ions . Fire hydrants installed as a result of 
any order or permit shal l  be spaced so that short hose lines can be employed and so 
there a re a sufficient number of fire hydrants within a reasonable distance to obtain 
the required fire flow as determined using Appendix B. In other than single family 
residential areas, hyd rants shall be spaced so that they are not more than 300 feet 
(91 .5m) apart. For single-family residential areas , hydrants shall be spaced so that 
they are not more than 500 feet ( 1 52 .5m) apart and not more than 400 feet ( 1 22m) 
hose lay distance from any structure. Hydrant spacing and hose lay requirements 
may be modified by the F ire Code Official when a ll structures are protected with 
automatic fire sprinkler systems in accordance with Section 903 .3. 1 . 1 , 903.3. 1 .2 o r  
903.3. 1 .3 

Private fire hydrants . All private fire hydrants (those not on the City of Peoria 
water system and located on private property) must be flushed and mainta ined 
annually in accordance with the American Water  Works Association ,  Manual of 
Water Supply Practices,  Insta llation Field Testing and Maintenance of Fire hydrants , 
A\N\NA M1 7. Selected hydrants, as determined by the Fire Ch ief, shall be tested to 
determine Available Fire Flow accord ing to test procedures outlined in the American 
Water Works Association Manual of Water Supply Practices , D istribut ion System 
Requirements for Fire Protection, A\N\NA M31(. 



Ordinance No .  201 9-1 1 
Page 1 9  of 40 

Public Fire Hydrants .  Al l public fi re hydrants must be flushed and mainta ined 
annual ly in accordance with the American Water Works Assoc iation ,  Manual  of 
Water Supply Practices, Insta l lation F ield Testing and Ma intenance of Fire hydrants ,  
AWWA M 1 7 . Selected hydrants ,  as determined by the Util ities Director, sha ll be 
tested to determine Ava i lable Fire Flow accord ing to test procedures outl ined in the 
American Water Works Association Man ual of Water Supply Practices , D istribut ion 
System Requirements for Fire Protection ,  AWWA M31(. 

Fire Hydrants . All fi re hyd rants sha ll be wet barrel as  defined by AWWA M 1 7 
and specified by the C ity of Peoria Publ ic Works/Engineering Department. F i re 
Hydrants used in commercia l  appl ications sha l l  have two (2) - 2 ½ inch outlet and 
one ( 1 ) - 4 ½ inch outlet. Fire Hyd rants used i n  res ident ia l (R-3) app l ications sha l l  
have one ( 1 ) - 2 ½ inch outlet and one ( 1 ) - 4 ½ inch outlet. 

(kk) Section 507 .5.3 pertain ing to Private fire service mains and water 
tanks shall be amended to read as follows: 

507 .5 . 3  Private fire service mains and water tanks .  Private fire service mains 
and water tanks sha l l  be period ica l ly inspected , tested and mainta ined i n  
accordance with NFPA25 at the fol lowing interva ls: 

1 . ( P rivate fire hydrants (all types) : I nspection annua lly and after each 
operation ;  flow test and maintenance annua l ly. 

2 . ( Fire service ma in piping : Inspection of exposed , annua lly; flow test(
every 5 years . 

3 . ( F i re service main p ip ing stra iners : I nspection and ma intenance after(
each use . 

4 . ( Fire hydrant systems. P la ns and specifications for fi re hydrant systems(
shall be submitted to the Fire-Med ical Department for review and approva l prior to 
construction . Plans and specifications for fire hydrant systems shall be submitted to 
the Fire-Med ical Department for review and approval p rior to C ity Cou nci l  action on 
the final subdivision plat, or i n  the case of an individua l  bui ld ing or  structure ,  for 
review and approval prior to issuance of the bui ld ing permit. The F i re-Medical 
Department shal l  obta in  the approva l of the Eng ineering Department on the 
submitted plans and specifications . 

5 . ( Each water service p rovider, whether mun icipa l or private shal l  submit(
to the Fire-Medical Department a map identifying the location of fire hydrants within 
the service area of the water provider. The map required under th is subsection sha l l  
be submitted on  or before December  31(, o f  each year, and sha l l  be updated by the 
water service provider as new fire hydrants are insta l led .  On May 31 (, of each 
subsequent year, a map identifying the location of the fire hydrants with in the service 
area of the water provider shall be submitted to the fire department. 



Ordinance No . 20 1 9-1 1 (
Page 20 of 40 

In  the event a water service provider  fa ils to submit the map requ ired under 
subsection (5) of th is section, the Fire-Med ica l Department is authorized to prepare 
a map of the fire hydrant locations with in the service area of water service provider, 
and charge the cost of preparation of the map to the water service provider, together 
with an administrative fee equal to fifteen percent of the cost of p reparation of the 
map. 

A water service provider, whether municipal or private having a portion of its service 
area in which no distribution or service lines are located , shall identify such areas on  
the map required by this subsection. Such areas shall be exempt from the 
requ i rements of Sections 508 . 1  through 508.4 and Appendix B and C until 
d istribution or service l ines are insta lled by the water service provider. 

6.( On or before December 3 1 ,  of each year, each water service provider,(
whether municipa l o r  private shall have prepared and filed with the C ity, a plan that: 
( 1 ) ind icates sufficient hydrants on all streets with in its water service area conta in ing 
water util ity distribution or service lines to comply with the requirements of 
International Fire Code, Appendix C-F ire Hyd rant Locations and D istr ibution , 
includ ing but not l imited to Table C1 05 . 1  or (2 ) a five year Capital Improvement Plan 
indicating plans for the construction of sufficient hyd rants on all streets with in  it water 
service a rea conta in ing water utility d istribution or service l ines to comply with the 
requirements of International Fire Code , Appendix C- F ire Hydrant Locations and 
Distribution,  includ ing but not l im ited to Table C1 05 . 1  with in five (5) years from the 
date of submission of the plan. 

On or  before January 1 0, of each year following submission of the plan ,  the 
Fire-Medical Department shall file with the City Clerk, the Directors of Community 
Development, Util ities Department, Engineering Department and the applicable 
water provider, a written notice indicating each water service provider who is not in 
compliance with the requirements of subsection (5) of this section. Upon fi ling of the 
written notice with the City Clerk, no building permit shal l  be issued with in the 
service area of a water service provider who is not in compliance with the 
requirements of subsection (5 )  of  th is section, unless the permit requ i res an 
automatic sprinkler system with applicable fire flow requirements complied with to  be 
insta lled within the structure. 

7.( A water service provider that believes a notice has been improperly(
issued under this section may appeal the issuance of the notice to the C ity Manager, 
by filling a written notice of appeal to the C ity Manager with in ten ( 1 0) days after 
filing of the Notice in subsection (6) with the C ity Clerk. The C ity Manager or h is 
designee shal l  hold a hearing on the appeal within thirty (30) days after filing of the 
appeal. 

(II) Section 51 1 Fire-Fighters Ai r Systems is added and shall read as 
follows : 



Ordinance No .  201 9- 1 1 
Page 21  of 40 

Section 51 1 - F IRE F IGHTERS AI R SYSTEMS.  

51 1 . 1 Fire F ig hters A i r  Systems. A l l  bu ild i ngs having floors used for human 
occupancy located five (5) stories or  more above or below the lowest level of  fire 
department veh icular access shal l be equ ipped with an approved rescue a i r  
replen ishment system. Such systems sha l l  be des igned , insta lled and maintained 
per the requ irements estab lished in Appendix L of this Code. 

(mm)) Section 901 .2 is amended by delet ing Section 901).2 . 1 in its ent irety)
and enacting the fo l lowing new subsections .  

Sec. 901 .2 . 1  Plans for fire spr ink ler systems . Comp lete p lans and hyd rau l ic 
ca lcu lations for fire sprinkler system insta l lations sha ll be submitted for review and 
approva l prior to beg inn ing i nstal lat ion ,  modification or  a lteration . Plans shal l  be 
d rawn to an ind icated scale, on sheets of un iform size and shal l  show, as a minimum 
the data requ i red by Chapter 23 of NFPA 1 3 . Water supply data for  hyd raul ic 
ca lcu lations sha l l be based on the availab le water  supply as determined by flow test 
information ,  less a 1 0  psi sa fety facto r. An add itiona l  copy of these p lans  sha l l  be 
subm itted in an e lect ron ic format su itable to the fire department. 

90 1 .2 .2 Plans fo r fi re a la rm systems .  Complete plans sha l l  be subm itted for 
review and  approva l  prior to beg inn ing insta l lat ion ,  mod ification or  a lteration . P lans 
sha ll be d rawn to an ind icated sca le ,  on sheets of un ifo rm size and sha ll show, as a 
min imum, the data requ i red by Chapter 7 of NFPA 72 . 

901 .2 . 3 P lan  Certificat ion for fi re a l a rms and occupant  no tificat io n .  Al l fire 
a larm and  occupant notificat ion system p lans s ha ll be des ig ned by  a p rofess iona l  
reg istra nt in  acco rdance with t he  Substa n tive Pol icy for Fi re Sprinkler and  F i re Ala rm 
Systems from the Arizona Boa rd of Techn ica l  Reg istra tion . F i re a la rm i nsta l la tion 
shop d rawings sha ll bea r  a review certifica tion of a m i n imum N ICET Leve l I l l  i n  F i re 
Alarms . 

90 1 . 2 .4 Pla n  certificatio n fo r fi re spri nk l e r  systems. Al l  fi re sprin k ler system 
p la ns  s h a ll be des ig ned by a p rofess i ona l  reg istra nt  in acco rda nce with the 
Su bstanti ve Po licy fo r  F i re Spri n k le r  and F i re Ala rm Systems from th e Arizo na Boa rd 
of Techn ica l Reg istration . F ire sp ri n kle r i n sta llation shop d rawings s h a l l bea r a 
review certification of a min imum  N IC ET Leve l I l l  i n  F ire Sp rin klers. 

90 1 . 2 . 5  Pla n ce rtificatio n fo r a ll  oth e r  fire p rotectio n  systems . P la n  certification 
fo r a ll  other fi re p rotection systems wi ll be accom pa n ied by a certificatio n of 
competen ce when req u ired . 

90 1).2 . 6  On-Site P lans . P la ns a nd specificatio ns sh a l l be su bm itted to the 
Fire-Medical Department for review a n d  app rova l prio r to co n stru ctio n .  On e set of 
Fire-Med ical De pa rtme nt a pp roved p la n s  sh a l l be ma intained on the jo b site fo r ea ch 
in spection . 



Ord inance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 22 of 40 

(nn) Section 901 .4 . Installat ion is amended to read as follows : 

901(.4 Installation . Fire protection systems shall be ma inta ined in accordance 
with the orig inal installation standards for that system.  Systems shall be extended , 
a ltered , or  augmen ted as  necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever 
the bu ilding is altered , remodeled or added to . Alterations to fire protection systems 
shall be done in accordance with current ,  applicable standards. 

(oo) Section 901(.4 .6 Pump and riser room size is amended by adding the 
following sectio n :  

901 .4.6.5 Outside  door. Whe re p rovided , fi re pump rooms and automatic fi re 
sprink ler riser rooms a re to be constru cted a long an outside wa ll with d i rect access 
th rough an  outside door. 

(pp) Section 901(.6 is amended by adding the following new subsections 
901(.6 .3 Testing and 901(.6.4 Qualifications  of Testing Pe rsonnel which shall read as  
follows:  

901 .6 . 2 .2  Reco rds .  Al l  ind ividua ls/bus i nesses pe rforming tests , maintenance, 
or repa ir on any fi re p rotection system sha ll forwa rd itemized reports of such work to 
the F i re Code Official with in 30 days of the work pe rformed . 

Exception : R3 and R5 occupancies , not i n clud ing residential ca re facilities .  

Section  90 1 . 6 . 3  Testing . All fi re p ro tection systems and fi re extingu ishers (fire 
a larms ; fi re hyd ran ts ; fi re sp rin klers ; s ta ndpipes ; gaseo us  fi re supp ression systems 
and  other special types of a u tomatic fi re exti ng u ish i ng systems ; basement  pipe 
in lets ; a nd other  fi re-p rotection syste ms and  a pp u rtena nces) s hall be tested a n n ually 
o r  as  requ i red by nationally recog n ized sta nda rd s  (i .e . , Na tio nal F i re P rotect i on (
Associa t ion) , whicheve r is more stringent. System test ce rt ificatio n  sha ll be reta ined(
by the occupant  of t he  bu ild ing wh e re the syste m is located and a co py mailed to the(
Peoria F i re-Med ica l Depa rtment , Fi re P reve ntio n Divisio n .  Th ese systems sha (ll be(
inspected(, tested a n d  ma i nta i ned by a co n t ra cto r ho ld ing a cu rre nt Fi re P rotectio n(
Contractor's pe rm it from the C ity of Peo ria F i re-M ed ical Depa rtme nt, Fi re P revention(
Division(.(

Sectio n 90 1(.6.4 Q ualif icatio ns of Testing Person nel. All pe rm itted pe rson ne l 
m u st meet one or mo(re of the q u a lifications listed in Section 90(1(.(1 1 (.2 of these 
a mendments(. 

(qq) Section 90 1 . 7 .  Syste ms out of service is a men ded to read as fo llows: 



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 23 of 40 

901 .7 Systems out of service . Where a requ i red fire protection system is out 
of service , the Fire-Medica l Department and the Fire Code Official shal l be notified 
immed iately, and where requ i red by the Fire Code Officia l ,  the bu i ld ing shall either 
be evacuated or an approved fire watch shal l  be provided for al l  occupants left 
unprotected by the shut down unti l the fire protection system has been returned to 
service . 

Where uti lized , fire watches shal l be provided with at least one approved 
means for notification of the F i re-Medical Department and the i r  o n ly duty sha ll be to 
perform constant patro ls of the protected premises and keep watch for fires. 

No requ ired fire sprinkle r system or  fire alarm system sha l l  be placed out of 
service for more than 8 hours in any one day without written authorization by the fire 
code officia l . 

(rr) Sect ion 901 . 1 1 is amended by adding Section 901 . 1 1 .2 as follows: 

Section 901 . 1 1 .2 Each fire protection system instal lation , mod ification , or 
i nspection job sha l l  receive "di rect supervis ion» from a "competent on-site person» or)
persons possessing the following necessary approva ls : 

Section 901 . 1 1 .2 . 1  For F i re Alarm insta llation , mod ification ,  or  inspections 
one or more of the fol lowing: 

1 .  National I nstitute of Certification i n  Eng ineering Technology 
(N ICET) fire a larm level I I ;  or  

2 .  Successfu l completion o f  Loca l Exam;  or 

3 .  Other certification acceptable to  the F i re Code Officia l .  

Section 901 . 1 1 .2.2 For F i re Sprinkle r  System and underground fire l i ne 
insta l lation, modification ,  or i nspections one or both of the following : 

1 . ) National I nstitute of Certification i n  Engineering Technology 
(N ICET) fi re sprinkler level I I ;  o r  

2 .  Successfu l completion of  Loca l Exam; or 

3 .  Other certification acceptable to  the Fi re Code Official .  

Section 901 . 1 1 .2 .3 For Fire Special Hazard F i re System instal lation ,  
modificat ion or  inspection for one o r  more o f  the fol lowing : 

1 . ) Nationa l  I nstitute of Certification in  Engineering Techno logy 
(N ICET) specia l  hazards suppression systems leve l I I ;  or  

2 .  Successfu l completion of Loca l Exam; or 



Ord inance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 24 of 40 

3.( Other certification acceptab le to the F i re Code Officia l . (

Section 901(. 1 1 . 2 .4 The "competen t  on-s ite person" sha l l  have i n  their  
possession documentation of their qual ifications a nd a picture 1 .0 .  These documents 
must be p resented to the Fire Code Official or designated representative upon 
request. 

(ss) Section 903 .2.  Where required is amended to read as fo l lows : 

Sec. 903.2 Al l commercia l  occupancies for which a bu ild ing or  construction  
permit is obtained sha l l  be equ ipped th roughout the enti re structu re with a fu l ly 
automatic sprinkler system meet ing the requ i rements of N FPA 1 3. 

EXCEPTION: The exception in  th is section is to be numbered as subsection 1 
and the fo l lowing subsections are to be added : 

2.( Unattached outer bu i ld i ngs two-h undred (200) square feet or  less do(
not requ ire fire sprinklers .  Unattached outer  bu i ld i ngs of two hund red (200) square 
feet or less shal l  be located three (3) feet or  more from any structu re on  the property. 

3.( Veh icle parking , gasol ine d ispensing island canop ies and porte(
cocheres not attached to and at least th ree (3) feet or  more from any structu re . 

4 . ( Publ ic restrooms associated with parks, p laygrounds and go lf courses
provided al l  of the following items are met: 

i.( The structure is to be of Type I fire resistive construction as defined in(
the International Building Code. 

i i . ( The structu re sha l l  be l imited to a maximum of s ix hundred twenty five(
(625)(square feet.(

i i i . No combustible materia l  shal l  be used or  sto red in the structu re .  

i v . ( Th is  is to i nclude l ight fixtu res and any other construction mater ia l .  No(
storage of  landscape materia l o r  other  park equ ipment, such as lawn mowers , 
gasol i ne, fertil izers,  etc. shal l be permitted within the structure with the exception of 
restroom suppl ies in quantities sufficient to support on ly the needs of the structu re . 

v.( No other structures are to be bu i lt within one hundred ( 1 00) feet of the(
exempted restrooms. 

vi . ( No additions to or  mod ifications  chang ing the bu i ld i ngs use or (
character shal l be permitted without requ iri ng a fu l l  fi re suppression system being
instal led . 



Ordinance No. 201 9- 1 1 
Page 25 of 40 

5 . ( Temporary use bu ild ings ( i.e. : construction tra ile rs ,  sa les trailers, etc . }(
as approved by the Fire Code Official. 

(tt} Section 903.2 .2 is amended to read as follows : 

Sec. 903.2.2 Group E. An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be provided 
throughout all Group E Occupancies . 

(uu) Section 903.2.8, "Group R, "  is amended by adding the following 
subsections which shall read as follows: 

903.2.8. 1 Group R, D ivision 2 Occupancies . 

903.2 .8 . 1 . 1  New Construction : All new Group R ,  Division 2 occupancies shall 
be required to install a residentia l fire sprinkler system for the FIRE AREA of the 
bui lding. If any portion of a patio has l ivable space directly above the patio ,  the patio 
shall have sprinkler protection below the livab le space . 

903.2 .8 .1 .2 Remodeling : If an  existing Group R ,  Division 2 occupancy 
requires a City permit to modify the structure, then the existi ng and new portions of 
the occupancy shall be required to have a residential fire sprinkler system if any one 
or more of the following cond itions exist: 

903.2 .8 . 1 . 2. 1 The FIRE AREA square footage of the bu ild ing, including the 
remodel, is five thousand (5,000) square feet or g reater. 

903.2 .8 . 1 .2.2 Fire flows to the entire building cannot be met in  accordance 
with Appendix B Fi re Flow Requirements For Bu ildings and Table 8 1 05. 1 M inimum 
Required Fire Flow and Flow Du ration For Build ings. 

903.2.8. 1 .2 .3  The occupancy is not connected to a public or public service 
corporation water system .  

903.2.8 .2 Group R ,  Division 3 Occupancies. 

903.2.8. 2 . 1  Group R,  Division 3 Occupancies South of and immediately 
adjacent to the centerl ine of D ixileta Road alignment and East of the Agua Fria 
River. In any new Group R, Divis ion 3 occupancies located South of the Dixileta 
Road alignment and East of the Agua Fria R iver a lignment where the FIRE AREA 
square footage of the bui ld ing is five thousand (5000) square feet o r  greater, an 
automatic sprinkler system shal l  be installed throughout the build ing .  

903 .2.8.2.1 . 1  Exception :  Residential sprinklers shall be permitted to be 
omitted from such occupancies if both of the following conditions are met : ( 1 ) the 
F IRE  AREA square footage is less than five thousand (5000) square feet, and (2) 
the required fire flows are met in accordance with Append ix B Fire Flow 



Ordinance No . 201 9-1 1 
Page 26 of 40 

Req u irements For Bui ld ings and Table 8 1 05 . 1 M in imum Requ ired F ire F low and 
Flow Duration For Bui ld ings. If the fi re flows cannot be met , a residentia l sprink ler 
system shal l be i nsta l led . 

903.2 .8 .2 . 1 (.2  Remodel ing : If an  existing occupancy is to be changed by the 
enclosure of existing patios,  porches, entry ways, or by the addit ion of new enclosed 
space wh ich i ncreases the total square footage of the Fire Area as defined in this 
Code to F ive Thousand (5,000) square feet o r  g reater ,  then th is requ i rement sha l l  
apply. 

903 .2.8.2. 1 .3 Livable Space Above Patios : If a residence has sprinkler 
protection and any portion of a patio has l ivable space directly above the patio, the 
patio shall have sprinkler protection  below the livable space . 

Exception : F IRE  AREA sha l l  exclude covered u nenclosed patios if there is no  
l ivab le space directly above . 

903 .2.8 .2 . 1(.4 Home Buyer Option : I n  any new Group R ,  Divis ion 3 
occupancies located South of the D ix i leta Road al ignment and East of the Agua Fria 
River a l ignment, each bu ilder, contractor or deve loper shal l  offer to each home 
buyer as an option , at the time of purchase , a residentia l fi re sprinkler system . 

903.2.8.2. 1 .4. 1 The option shal l  i nclude a competit ive cost of insta ll ing an 
automatic fire sprinkle r system equipped with res identia l  fi re sprinkle r heads for the 
F IRE  AREA of the structure . This option is to be included on the deve lopment l ist of 
options. 

903.2 .8 .2 . 1 .4 .2 The bui lder, contractor or developer  shal l provide to each 
home buyer  a copy of educationa l materia ls prepared by the City on res identia l  fire 
spri nkler systems with each mode l  price l ist. 

903.2.8.2. 1 .4 .3 A signed affidavit , using a form approved by the Peoria Fire­
Med ical Department, by the buyer ind icating that this option was offered sha l l  be 
retained by the developer at h is home office , avai lable for i nspection by the C ity fo r a 
period of one ( 1 ) year  from the time of closure of the residence . 

903.2 .8 .2 .2 Group R ,  D ivision 3 Occupancies North of and immed iate ly 
adjacent to the centerl ine of D ix i leta Road Alignment and West of the Agua Fria 
River. 

903 .2.8.2 .2. 1 New Construction : In al l new Group R ,  D ivision 3 occupancies 
located North of the Dixi leta Road a l ignment and West of the Agua Fria River 
a lignment, an  automatic sprinkler system shal l  be insta lled throughout the bui ld in g .  

903.2.8 .2.2.2 Remodel ing : I f  an  existing Group R ,  Division 3 occupancy 
located North of the D ixi leta Road al ign ment and West of the Agua Fria River 



Ord inance No .  201 9-1 1 
Page 27 of 40 

al ignment requ ires  a C ity permit to modify the structu re ,  then the exist ing and new 
portions of the occupancy shal l  be requ i red to have a res identia l fi re sprin kle r system 
if any one or  more of the fol lowing cond it ions exist: 

903.2 .8 .2 .2 .2 . 1 The F IRE  AREA square footage of the bu i ld i ng ,  i nclud ing the 
remodel ,  is five thousand (5 ,000) square feet or  greater. 

903 .2.8.2.2 .2 .2 F i re flows to the enti re bui ld ing cannot be met i n  accordance 
with Appendix B F i re Flow Requ i rements For Bui ld ings and Tab le 81 05 . 1  Min imum 
Requ i red Fire Flow and Flow Duration For Bui ld ings. 

903 .2 .8 .2 .2 .2 .3  The occupancy is not connected to a publ ic or  publ ic service 
corporation water system .  

903.2.8.2.3 Wild land/Urban Interface. I n  Grou p R ,  D ivis ion 3 occupancies in  
areas that a re classified by the code officia l as Wild land/Urban I nterface, i f  an  
occupancy has a private or shared drives leading to  one or  more single fami ly 
dwe l l ing, the occupancy shal l be requ i red to i nsta l l a residentia l  fi re sprinkle r system 
for the F IRE  AREA of the bui ld ing . 

903.2 .8 .2 .4 Water Supply . I n  Group R ,  D ivision 3 occupancies that are new or  
require a C ity permit to  mod ify the structu re ,  regard less of  location , i f  they are not 
connected to a public or  publ ic service corporation water system and are on a 
private well , an  automatic spr inkler system shall be i nsta l led throughout the bu i ld i ng . 
If any portion of a pat io has l ivable space d i rectly above the patio , the patio shal l  
have sprinkler protection be low the l ivable space . 

903.2.8 .3 Group R ,  D ivision 4 Occupancies. 

903.2 .8 .3. 1 New Construction : All new Group R ,  D iv is ion  4 occupancies 
l icensed by the Arizona Department of Health Services for more than five (5)
residents or day care shal l be requ i red to insta ll a res ident ial fire sprinkler system for 
the F IRE AREA of the building . If any portion of a patio has l ivab le space directly 
above the patio , the patio shal l  have sprinkler protection be low the l ivable space . 

903 .2.8.3.2 Remodel ing : I f  an  existi ng Group R ,  D ivision 4 occupancy that is 
l icensed by the Arizona Department of Health Services for  more than five (5)
residents or day care requ i res a City permit to modify the structure ,  then the existi ng 
and new portions of the occupancy sha l l be requ i red to have a res identia l  fire 
sprinkler system . 

903.2 .8 .4 Urban-Wild land I nterface Area. Al l  Group R Occupancies i n  an  
Urban-Wild land Interface Area shal l  comp ly with the 201 8 Internationa l  Urban­
Wildland I nterface Code and the following :  

903 .2.8 .4 . 1  Defin it ions : See Section 202 for  defin it ions . 



Ordinance No . 201 9-1 1 
Page 28 of 40 

903 .2 .8.4.2 Determination of Requirements : To determine specific fire service 
featu re requirements for Urban Wildland Interface areas based upon access grades 
to the structure or  parcel ,  Table 9-33(d) shall be used. 

(vv)( Section 903 .3  is amended to add the following subsection :(

903.3 .  7 Identification of sprinkle r system capabilities and lim itations . An 
adhesive label shal l be permanently installed at or adjacent to each sprinkler riser. 
When a building contains more than four  risers , the s ign shall be located at an 
approved location inside the bu i ld ing . When sprinkler risers are located outside of 
the bu i ld ing , the s ign shall be stamped metal. The minimum s ign dimension is 6-
inches high  by 4 inches wide .  The sign shall specify the capabilities and lim itations 
of the automatic sprinkler system . The s ign shall include the following information :  

1(. The design base or basis , includ ing the edition used . 

2 . ( A statement ind icating if the sprinkle r design is the control mode(
density area method, control mode specific application, suppression mode ,  or any 
combination thereof. 

3.( When used , all of the sto rage conditions stipulated NFPA 1 3 , Section(
12 .7 for special designs .  

4 . ( The maximum storage height . (

5 . ( The min imum requ ired aisle wid th .(

6 . ( If storage is in racks , the maximum rack width and min imum transverse(
and longitudinal flue widths. 

7.( Commodities that can be protected by the automatic sprinkle r system.(

8 . ( Commod ities that cannot be protected by the automatic sprinkler(
system. 

9.( Limits on storage heights of idle wood and plastic storage.(

1 0. Lim its on storage heights of m isce llaneous Group A plastic , ti re and 
rolled paper storage . 

1 (1 . ( Locations where in-rack sprinklers are required . 

1 2 . Locations where horizontal and/or vertica l barriers are required . 



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 29 of 40 

1 3 . I nformation expla in ing the manufacturer ,  sprinkler identification 
number, k-factor, and operating temperature of the overhead sprinklers protecting 
the h igh p i le storage . 

(ww) Section 903 is amended by adding the fo llowing section : 

Section 903 .3 . 1 .3 . 1  Garage coverage. Where an automatic fi re sprinkler 
system is requ i red to be insta lled in  a one and two family dwe l l ing , Group R-3 , 
Group R-4 or townhouse by other sections of th is code, any attached garage sha l l  
be provided with fire spr inkler coverage. Coverage sha l l  be based on a two head 
flowing ca lcu lat ion and sha l l  use intermed iate temperatu re fire sprinkler heads. 

(xx)) Section 903 .4 . 1 .  Mon itoring, is amended to read as follows :)

903.4 . 1  Signa ls .  Alarm, supervisory and troub le signals shal l  be d istinctly 
d ifferent and sha l l  be automatica lly transmitted to an Underwrite rs Laboratory listed 
or Factory Mutual approved centra l station ,  remote supervising station , or p roprietary 
supervising station as defined in  NFPA 72 . As an a lte rnative, when approved by the 
Fire Code Officia l ,  such signals sha l l  sound an audib le signa l  at a constantly 
attended location .  

Exceptions :  

1 .  Underg round key or hub va lves in roadway boxes provided by the 
mun ic ipa l ity or publ ic uti l ity are not requ ired to be monitored . 

2 .  Backflow prevention device test va lves, located in the l imited area 
sprinkler system supply piping, shall be locked in the open position .  In  occupancies 
requ ired to. be equ ipped with a fire alarm system, the backflow preventer  va lves shal l  
be e lectrical ly supervised by a tamper switch insta l led i n  accordance with NFPA 72 
and separately annunciated . 

(yy) Section 906.1 is amended by repeal ing the exception i n  its entirety. 

(zz) Section  906.2 is amended by repea l i ng the exception in its entirety .  

(aaa) Section 907 .2 .  Where requ i red-new bu ild ings and structures is 
amended to read as follows: 

Section 907 .2. Where requ ired-new bui ld ings and structures. An approved fi re 
a larm system insta lled i n  accordance with the provis ions of th is code and NFPA 72 
shal l  be provided in  a l l  new bui ld ings and structu res and in accordance with Sections 
907.2 . 1  th rough 907 .2 .23 and provide occupant notification in accordance with 
Section 907.5, un less other requ irements are provided by another section of this 
code, whichever is more stringent. 

https://907.2.23


Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 30 of 40 

Where automatic fire detectors are requ ired , they shall be smoke detectors , 
except that an approved a lternative type of detector shal l  be insta lled in spaces such 
as boiler rooms ,  where, during normal operation , products of combustion are present 
in sufficient quantity to actuate a smoke detector. 

A minimum of one manual fire alarm box shall be provided in an approved 
location to in itiate a fire alarm signal for fire a larm systems employing automatic fire 
detectors or water-flow detection devices. Where other sections of this code a llow 
el imination of fire alarm boxes due to sprinklers, a sing le fire alarm box sha ll be 
installed. 

Exceptions: 

1 . ( The manual fire alarm box is not required for fi re a larm systems 
dedicated to elevator reca l l contro l  and supervisory service. 

2 . ( The manual fire alarm box is not req u ired for Group R-2 occupancies(
unless required by the Fire Code Official to provide a means for fire watch personnel 
to initiate an alarm during a sprinkler system impairment event. Where provided , the 
manual fi re a larm box shal l  not be located in an area that is accessible to the public. 

(bbb) Section 1030 .3 Obstructions is amended by adding the following 
subsections 1 030.3.1 and 1 030.3.2 wh ich shal l  read as  follows: 

1 030.3 . 1 The required width of a means of egress is defined as the total width 
of the corridor, exit, exit access, and exit discharge that was designed in the 
structure or building when it was constructed. 

1 030 .3 .2  Storage in  any part of a means of egress , corridor, exit, exit access, 
or  exit d ischarge is proh ibited .  

(ccc)( Section 1 1 03 .5 is hereby amended and shall read as fo l lows:(

1 1 03.5 Sprinkler systems.  

An automatic fire sprinkle r system shal l  be p rovided in existing bu ild ings in 
acco rdance with Sections 1 1 03.5. 1 , 1 1 03 .5 .2  and Table 1 1 03.5 . 1 if the square 
footage requirements of Table 1 1 03 .5 . 1 are met by e ither a change in use or an 
increase in the total square footage. 

EXCEPTION: 

1 .  Spaces or areas in  te lecommun ications buildings used exclus ively for 
telecommunications equ ipment, associated electrical power distribution equipment, 
batteries and standby eng ines , provided those spaces or areas are equ ipped 
throughout with an automatic smoke detection system in accordance with Section 



Ordinance No. 20 1 9-1 1 (
Page 31  of 40 

907.2 and are separated from the remainder of the bu i ld ing by not less than 1 hour  
fire barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 of  the International Building 
Code or not less than 2 hour horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with 
Section 7 1 2  of the International Building Code or both . 

2 . ( Unattached outer build ings two-h undred (200} square feet o r  less do(
not requ i re fire sprinklers .  Unattached outer bu i ldings of  two hundred (200) square 
feet or less shal l be located three (3) feet o r more from any structure on the property. 

3 . ( Vehicle parking, gasoline d ispensing is land canopies,  and porte(
cocheres not attached to and at least three (3) feet from the bui ld ing shall. 

4.( Public restrooms associated with parks, playgrounds and golf courses ,(
provided all of the following items are met : 

i.( The structu re is to be of Type I F i re Resistive construction as(
defined in the lntemational Building Code. 

i i .( The structure shal l  be limited to a maximum of six hund red(
twenty five (625) square feet. 

ii i . ( No combustible material shall be used or sto red in the structu re ; this is(
to include light fixtures and any other  construction material. No storage of landscape 
materia l or other park equipment, such as lawn mowers , gasoline , fertilizers , etc. 
shall be permitted within the structure, with the exception of restroom supplies,  in 
quantities sufficien t  to support on ly the needs of the structure .  

iv .( No other structures are to be bu ilt with i n  one hundred (1 00) feet of  the(
exempted restrooms. 

v.( No add itions to or modifications  changing the bu ildings use or(
character sha ll be permitted without req uiring a full suppression system being 
installed . 

5.( Temporary use build ings ( i .e. : construction tra i lers ,  sales tra i le rs ,  etc. )(
as approved by the Fire Code Official. 



- ------------~·-------� 

1 2 ,000 

000 1 2,000 1 2,

1 2,000 

1 ,000 

CII 
1 2,000 

1 2 ,000 000 1 2,
1 2,000 

1 2,000 5,000 1 2,000 ,1 2 000 

1 2,000 

Ord inance No. 201 9- 1 1(
Page 32 of 40(

TABLE 1 1 03.5.1 

F IRE SPRINKLER REQU IREMENTS WITH CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY OR BUILDING INCREASE 

EXISTING NON-SPRINKLERED BUILDINGS 
Prono.act Final Occu :,ancv 

Occupancy A-11 A-21 A-31 A-4 A·S 8( 10) E F·1 F·2 
H-1  

through 
H-5 

1 · 1  
through 

1-4 
M 

R·1 
And 
R-2 

R-31 R· 

4 S·1 S.2(8) 

A-1 1 2,000 5.000 12 ,000 12 000 1 .000 1 2 ,000 12 000 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2  000 
A-21 1 2 1000 5 000 1 2  000 1 2  000 1 000 1 2  000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 0 0 112 000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 
A-31 1 2  000 5,000 12 ,000 1 ,000 1 2  000 1 2,000 12 ,000 1 2  000 0 0 1 2  000 0 NP 0 12 000 1 2  000 
A-41 12 ,000 5 000 1 1 2 000 1 2 ,000 1 000 1 2  000 1 2  000 1 2,000 12 ,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 
A-51 1 2 ,000 5,000 12 ,000 1 2 ,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 12 ,000 1 2 ,000 0 0 1 2,000 0 NP 0 1 2,000 1 2  000 

1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2  000 0 0 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2  000 H-11 1 2 ,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2 000 1 ,000 
H-2 1 2  000 5 000 1 2  000 1 2,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 12 ,000 0 0 1 2,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 

li' H-31 1 2,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 ,000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2 000 
C Hazard H-4 1 2,000 5,000 1 2 000 1 2,000 1 000
& 

1 2 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 12 ,000 
Level 1 H-5 1 2 ,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 12 ,000 

1 -1 1 2,000 5.000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 12 ,000 1 2  000 0 0 1 2,000 0 NP 0 1 2 .000 1 2 000 
1-21 12 000 5 000 1 2  000 1 2  000 1 000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 12 ,000 

1 2,000 1 2  000 0 0 1 2  000 0 NP1-31 1 2  000 5 000 1 2  000 1 2 ,000 1 ,000 1 2  000 0 1 2,000 1 2,000 
1 2,0001-41 12 000 5 000 1 2 000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2  000 0 NP 0 

R-11 1 2,000 5,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2  000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP1 2 ,000 0 1 2 ,000 12 ,000 
R-21 1 2,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2  000 0 NP 0 1 2,000 1 2,000 
R-31 1 2,000 5,000 1 2 000 1 2,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 12 ,000 12 000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 5 ,000 0 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 
R-41 1 2,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 
F-11 1 2  000 1 000 1 2,000 12 000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2  000 0 NP 0 1 2 000  1 2 000 Hazard 

Level 2 S- 1 1 2 ,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 1 2  000 
E 1 2 000 5 000 1 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 000 1 2,000 1 2 000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2 000 1 1 2,000 

Hazard 
F-21 1 2  000 5 000 1 1 2,000 1 2  000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2,000 12,000

level13 
S·2 1 2,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2,000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 1 2,000 0 0 1 2 ,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 12 000 

Hazard B 1 2  000 5 000 1 1 2  000 1 2  000 1 ,000 1 2  000 1 2 000 1 2 000 0 0 1 2  000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 12,000 
Level 4 M 1 2,000 5,000 1 2,000 1 2 000 1 ,000 1 2,000 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 1 2 ,000 0 0 1 2,000 0 NP 0 1 2 ,000 12 ,000 

Footnotes: 
1 .  T he  top row i s  the proposed final  occupancy for the buildlng and/or suite. 
2.1 The left column Is the existing occupancy to be changed from.1
3.1 If the new occupancy square footage exceeds the timits shown. a fire sprinkle< system is required to be instaned throughout the entire building.1
4.  For mul i-tenant bui ld l.ngs, occupancy requirements for the fire sprinkler system shal l  be based on the highest Hazard level occupancy In use in the structure. 
5 .  Only one (1)  change in occupancy or increase in the building square footage iS allowed. The 2"" change in occupancy or  Increase in the building square footage shall  require 

the insta .llation of a fire sprinkler system throughout the entire building. 
6 .  NP ,. Not Permitted. 
7 .  Hazard Level 1 Is the highest fire hazard rating and Hazard Level 4 is the lo\Wst fire hazard rating. 
8 .  Any change in occupancy to. or increase In , the square footage for a Group S-2 enclosed parking garage will require an automatic fire sprinkler system to be instal led. 
9 .  Occupancies with a Fi re Barrier constructed per International Building Code (/BC), section 706 requirements can be cons idered as separate fire areas. 
1 o. Ambulatory Care Faci lities are required to be provided with an automatic fire spri nk ler system regardless of the square footage (zero square footage) . 



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 33 of 40 (ddd) Section 331 2 . 1  i s  amended and shall read as  fol lows :i

331 2. 1 When required.  An approved water supply for fi re protection , either temporary or 
permanent, sha l l  be made avai lable before combust ible material  arrives on the site . The 
m in imum fi re flow requ i rement when a contracto r or  developer  bri ngs combustib le materials on 
site is 1i , 500 gpm at 20 psi .  At least one fi re hyd rant shal l be with in 500 feet of any combustible 
materia ls and capable of del ivering the min imum fire flow requirement. Any hydrant may be 
either temporary or permanent as the p roject schedule perm its . I n  add ition , there a re times 
when hydrants and valves must be closed temporari ly for repair  work or construction of the 
water system. The deve lope r/contractor is responsib le for ensuring that the water supply is 
avail able at al l times. When the work is complete , deve loper/contracto r sha l l  coord inate with the 
Util ities Department to make su re that the fi re hydrants are active and the va lves are open.  

(eee) Section 2308.3 is amended by add ing the fol l owing subsection 2308 .3 .2  Veh icle 
impact protect ion. 

Section 2308 .3 .2 Veh icle impact protection . Veh icle impact pro tection for CNG gas 
storage containe rs, pumps and dispensers sha l l  be p rovided in accordance with section 2306.4 . 

(fff) Section 3504.2 .6 Fire extingu ishers is amended to read as fo l lows: 

3504 .2 . 6 Fi re extingu isher. A m in imum of one portable fi re extinguisher comply ing with 
Section 906 and with a min imum 2-A:20-B :C rating shal l be read i ly accessib le with i n  30 fe et 
(9 1 44  mm) of the location whe re hot work i s  pe rformed and shal l  be accessi b le without c l imbing 
sta i rs or ladde rs .  

(ggg) Section 5 307 is hereby renumbe red and amended with the fol lowing : 

5307 . 3 Scope .  I nsu lated l iquid carbon d ioxide sys tems used for beve rage d i s pensing 
systems , whether sto red as  a l iqu id o r  gas , with mo re than 50 pounds or  500 cub ic feet NTP 
sha l l be requ i red to comply wi th th is  section for a l l new and existi ng systems insta l l ed .  

5307 . 3 . 1  Ope rat iona l  Pe rm it. An Ope rat iona l  Pe rmi t  i s  req u i red to store , use o r  hand le  a 
previously approved insu la ted l iq u id carbon d iox ide systemthat  exceeds the amou nt ind icated 
on Table 1 05 .6 . 8 . 

5307 . 3 .2 Constructio n  Perm it. A co nstruction pe rmi t is req u i red to instai ll , repa i r  d amage 
to , a ba ndon , re move , p la ce te mpora ri l y o ut of se rvice , close o r  substantia i l ly mod ify a 
com pressed gas system i n  excess of the amou nts l isted i n  Table 1 05 . 6 . 8 , whethe r  new o r  
ex isting . 

5307 . 3 . 3 I nsu la ted liquid ca rbon d ioxid e  syste m used in beverage d ispensing 
a pplications . The followi ng req u i reme nts a pply to a ll  in su lated l iq u id carbon d ioxid e systems that 
exceed the a mount i nd icated on Ta b le 1 0 5. 6 . 8 . These req uirements are to be inco rporated into 

uthe subm ittal process for the constr ction permits and a re su bject to i nspectio n com m ents. 

5307 . 3 . 3. 1 Venting . A ll  venting is to be piped to the outside atmosp he re . 

5307 . 3 . 3 .2 Anchoring . When used , ins u lated l iq u id carbon d ioxid e  conta iners a re to be 
anchored to the s lab. 



Ord inance No.  201 9- 1 1 
Page 34 of 40 

5307.3 .3 .3 Movement. When used , high pressure compressed gas carbon dioxide 
cyl inders a re to be properly secured from movement. 

5307 .3.3 .4 Hose and fittings .  Al l hoses and fittings used on the system are to be 
manufacturer approved . 

5307 .3 .3 .5 Warning signs .  Warn ing s igns are to be provided. 

5307 .3 .3.6 Slave cyl i nders. When using high p ressure compressed gas cyl inders ,  only
one ( 1 ) cyl i nder can be connected i nto the beverage system at a time. A second cyl i nder can be 
connected as long as a three way transfer switch is  used so that no more than one ( 1 ) cyl i nder 
can be used at a time. Th is option wi l l  not requ i re a permit from the F ire Department. 

5307.3.4 Design Requirements . Where ever carbon-d ioxide is used in a compressed gas 
system, the following provis ions are to be incorporated into the system design .  This will apply 
whether the carbon-d ioxide for the system is stored as a gas or in a l iquid form . The submittals 
a re to address the fo l lowing requ i rements and a re to include a floor plan drawing showing the 
location of al l major components a long with providing data sheets for the equipment provided . 

5307 .3 .5  Detection . A carbon d ioxide gas detection system is to be provided . The 
detector is to be installed per the manufacturer's instructions . A minimum of one ( 1 ) detector is 
requ i red to be placed by the cyl inder or where the pressure regu lators are located , if the 
cylinder is located outside. I f  the build ing has areas that are lower than the grade level , 
additional detection devices are to be provided. 

5307 .3.6 Loca l a larm .  A loca l a la rm and strobe are to be provided . The alarm device is to 
provide a minimum 75 dBA at 1 0  feet. The strobe is to provide a m inimum 1 00 Cd.  The devices 
are to be located in an area that will alert the occupants of the bui ld i ng . 

5307 .3 .7  New bui ld ings. For bui ld ings that are constructed new, the build ing fire a larm 
system shall be designed to monitor two (2) points on  the gas detection system . The build ing 
fire a larm system shal l  be capable of reporting specific signals to the Central Station for the 
fol lowing a larms. These s ignals a re in  add ition to the other requ i red signals to be sent to the 
Centra l Station. 

5307.3.7 . 1  Supervisory signa l .  A supervisory signal i s  to be sent when the gas detector 
activates at 1 .5%. Th is shal l  provide a supervisory signal at the fire a la rm contro l panel and 
shall report a supervisory signal to the Central Station .  

5307 .3 .7 .2  Alarm s igna l .  An a larm s igna l  is to be sent when the gas detector activates at 
3%. This sha l l  provide an a larm signal at the fire a larm control panel , p rovide fu l l bui ld ing
evacuation and shal l  report a "C0-2 Alarmn signal to the Central Stat ion. 

5307.3.8 Existing bui ld ings with a capable fi re alarm system . For bu i ld ings that are 
exist ing, the bui lding fire alarm system is to be eva luated to determine the capabi l ity of 
monitori ng the gas detection system. If capable, the bu i ld ing fire alarm system shal l be 
designed to monitor two (2) points on the gas detection system. The bui ld ing fi re a larm system 
shall be capable of reporting specific signals to the Central Station for the fol lowing a larms .  
These signa ls are in add ition to the other requ i red signa ls to be sent to the Centra l  Station .  



Ordinance No. 201 9-1 1 
Page 35 of 40 

5307 .3 .8 . 1 Supervisory signa l .  A supervisory signal  i s  to be sent when the gas detecto r 
activates at 1 . 5%. This shal l provide a supervisory s ignal at the fire alarm contro l panel and 
shal l  report a supervisory signal to the Centra l  Station .  

5307 .3.8 .2  Alarm s ignal . An a larm signa l i s  to be sent when the gas detector activates at 
3%. This shal l provide an alarm signal at the fire alarm control pane l ,  provide fu l l  bu i lding 
evacuation and shal l report a "C0-2 Alannn signal to the Central Station .  

5307 .3 .9  Existing bui ld i ngs without a capable fire a larm system .  For bui ld ings that a re 
exist ing ,  the build ing fire alarm system is to be evaluated to determ ine the capabil ity of 
mon itoring the gas detection system . If the bu i lding fi re alarm system is not capable of 
monitoring and transmitting a separate signa l  to the Centra l Station ,  the build i ng fi re a larm 
system sha l l  report the fol lowing signals to the Central Station for the following a larms . These 
signals are in  addition to the other required signals to be sent to the Central Station . 

5307.3 .9. 1 Supervisory signa l .  A supervisory signal i s  to be sent when the gas detector 
activates at 1 .5%. This shal l  provide a supervisory signal at the fire alarm contro l panel and 
sha l l  report a supervisory signal to the Centra l  Station . 

5307 .3 .9 .2 Alarm signal . An a larm signal i s  to be sent when the gas detector activates at 
3%. This shal l p rovide an a larm signal at the fire a larm contro l  panel ,  p rovide fu l l  bu i ld ing
evacuation and sha l l  report an alarm signal to the Centra l Station .  

5307 .3.9.3 Exterior alarm device . An alarm device i s  to be instal led outside the bu i lding 
at the Fire Department entrance to notify personnel of a CO-2 activation . This device shal l  be 
labe led as a CO-2 alarm and shal l activate upon activation of the CO-2 sensor. 

5307 .3. 1 0  Exist ing build ings without a fire a larm system. For bui ld i ngs that do not have a 
bu i lding fi re alarm system ,  the following is to be provided .  

5307 .3. 1 0. 1  Exterior a larm device. In  add ition to the CO-2 detection and a larms inside 
the bu i ld ing, an additional a larm device is to be located outside the build ing at the F i re 
Department entrance to notify personnel of a CO-2 activation .  Th is device shal l  be labeled as a 
CO-2 a larm and sha l l  activate upon activat ion of the CO-2 sensor. 

(hhh) Section 5607 Blasting is amended and shal l  read as fo l lows: 

5607. 1  Genera l .  Blasti ng operations sha l l  be conducted only by approved , authorized 
operators fami l iar with the requ ired safety precautions and the hazards involved and in 
accordance with the provis ions of NFPA 495 . Certificates and/or  l icenses ( loca l ,  State or 
Federal) are to be provided when requested by the Fire Code Officia l .  

5607 . 1 . 1  Attendance. The approved and authorized blaster sha l l  be in attendance when 
the explosive materials arrive at the site and sha l l  remain in  attendance unti l the b lasti ng 
operation is completed. 

5607 .2  Manufacturer's instructions.  B last ing operat ions sha l l  be performed in  accordance 
with the instructions of the manufacturer of the explosive materia ls being used .  



Ordinance No. 201 9- 1 1 
Page 36 of 40 

5607 .3  Blasting in  congested areas . When blasting i s  done i n  a congested a rea o r  i n  
close proximity to a structure, ra i lway or h ighway, or  any other insta l lation , precautions sha l l  be 
taken to m in im ize earth vibrations and air blast effects. B lasting mats or other protective means 
shall be used to prevent fragments from be ing thrown . 

5607 .4 Restricted hours. Surface-blasti ng operations shal l only be conducted Monday 
through Friday, 8:00 a .m .  to 5 :00 p .m .  Blasting operations are not a l lowed on legal or  city­
observed holidays. 
Exception : Un less otherwise approved by the F i re Code Officia l .  

5607 . 5  Utility notification . Whenever blasting i s  being conducted i n  the v ici n ity of uti l ity 
l ines or rights-of-way, the blaster shal l  notify the appropriate representatives of the utilities at 
least 24 hours in advance of blasting, specifying the location and intended time of such blasting . 
Verba l notices sha l l  be confirmed with written notice . Confirmation of such contacts and 
approvals from the uti l it ies or right-of-way governing authority is to be p rovided to the F ire Code 
Official when requested . 
Exception: I n  an emergency s ituation , the time l im it shal l  not apply when approved by the F i re 
Code Officia l .  

5706 .6  Neighborhood notification .  When requi red by the F ire Code Officia l ,  the blasting 
contractor sha l l  provide written notification to the owner or occupant of each bui ld ing or 
structure within a 500-foot ( 1 52 400 mm) radius of the use site or as recommended by the 
seismic study, whichever is greater. The notificat ion sha l l  be requ i red at a time interval specified 
by the F ire Code Officia l but not less than 24 hours p rior to the d ischarge of explos ive materia ls .  
Neighborhood notification sha l l  i nclude the following information:  

1 .  Dates and times of blasting. 
2 . ( Contact information for the blast ing company.(
3.( Description of what to except such as dust, vibration ,  noise , etc .(
4.( Traffic detours . (
5 . ( Websites for additiona l information or notices .(

5607.7 Pre-blast surveys . Prior to the d ischarge of exp losive materials, a pre-b last 
survey of al l structures or bui ldings within  a 500-foot ( 1 52 400 mm) rad ius of the blast site or as 
recommended by the seismic study, whichever is greater, sha l l  be conducted , documenting
existing structural damage.
The contractor sha l l  make a min imum of four attempts to contact the owner or  operator of a 
structure or build ing in  the pre-blast survey area. At least two of the attempted contacts shal l  be 
made between 6 :00 p.m .  and 8:00 p .m . local t ime. If unsuccessfu l ,  a statement on contractor 
letterhead detail ing the address , dates , times and the name of the person(s) attempted to be 
contacted sha l l  be submitted to the F ire Code Official prior to blasti ng operations beg inn ing . 
When access to the property is  denied , a statement on contractor letterhead deta i l ing the name 
of the person denying access, the address, dates, times and the name of the person attempting 
to make the contacts shal l  be submitted to the F ire Code Officia l .  

5607 .8  Monitoring . Seismic (g round vibration) and air b last monitoring sha l l  be conducted 
when bui ld ings or structures are located with in a 500-foot ( 1 52 400 mm) rad ius of the blast s ite 
or as recommended by the seismic study, whichever i s  greater. The monitoring sha l l  be 
conducted at the closest bui ld ing or structure . When seismic and air b last mon itori ng a re 
required , the maximum al lowable values shal l  be as follows : 
Seismic: 1 inch per second ( 1 . 0) peak particle velocity. Air blast: 1 29 decibels. 



Ord inance No.  20 1 9-1(1 
Page 37 of 40 

5607 .9  Electric detonator precautions. Precautions shal l be taken to prevent accidental 
d ischarge of e lectric detonators from currents induced by radar and rad io transmitters, l ightning ,  
adjacent power l ines , dust and snow storms, or other sources of extraneous electricity . 

5607 . 1 0  Nonelectric detonator precautions. Precautions sha l l  be taken to prevent 
accidental in itiation of nonelectric detonators from stray currents induced by l ightn ing or static 
electricity . 

5607 . 1 1  Blasti ng area security . Dur ing the time that holes are being loaded or  are loaded 
with exp losive materials , b lasting agents or detonators, only authorized persons engaged in 
dri l l ing and loading operations or otherwise authorized to ente r  the site shal l  be a l lowed at the 
blast site. The blast site shal l  be guarded or barricaded and posted . Blast site security sha l l  be 
maintained until after the post-blast inspection has been completed . 

5607 . 1 2  Dri l l  holes. Holes dri l led fo r the loading of explosive cha rges sha l l  be made and 
loaded in  accordance with NFPA 495. 

5607 . 1 2. 1  Loading of holes .  Explosive materia ls sha l l  not be loaded into the ground until 
a va l id permit, issued by the Fire Code Officia l ,  is on-site .  Explosive materia ls  sha l l  not be left in 
the ground overnight. 

5607 . 1 3  Remova l  of excess exp losive materials . After loading for a blast is completed 
and before firing , excess explos ive materia ls sha l l  be removed from the area and returned to 
the proper storage facil ities. 

5607 . 1 4  In itiation means. The i n itiation of blasts sha l l  be by means conforming to the 
provisions of NFPA 495 . 

5607 . 1 5  Connect ions. The blaster shal l  supervise the connecting of the blastholes and 
the connection of the load l ine to the power source or  in itiation point. Connections shall be made 
progressively from the blasthole back to the i n itiation point. 
Blasting lead lines sha ll remain shunted (shorted) and sha l l  not be connected to the blasti ng 
machine or other source of current unti l the blast is to be fi red . 

5607 . 1 6 Firing contro l .  No blast shal l  be fi red unt i l  the blaster has made certa in  that a l l  
surplus explosive materia ls are in  a safe place in accordance with Section 5607 . 1 3 , a l l  persons 
and equ ipment a re at a safe distance or under sufficient cover and that an adequate warn ing 
signal has been g iven .  

5607 . 1 7  Post-blast procedures. After the blast, the fo l lowing procedures sha l l  be 
observed . 

1 . No person shall return to the blast area unti l a l l owed to do so by the blaster i n  
charge. 

2 . ( The blaster shal l a l low sufficient t ime for smoke and fumes to d issipate and for(
dust to settle before return ing to or approaching the blast area .  

3.( The blaster shal l inspect the enti re blast site for misfi res before a l lowing other(
personnel to return to the blast area .  



Ord inance No. 201 9- 1 (1 
Page 38 of 40 

5607 . 1 8  Misfires. Where a m isfi re is suspected , a l l  i n it iat ing c ircu its shall be traced and a 
search made for unexploded charges. Where a misfire is found, the blaster sha l l  p rovide proper 
safeguards for excluding a l l  personnel from the blast a rea.  Misfires shal l  be reported to the 
blasting supervisor immediately. Misfires sha l l  be hand led under the d i rection of the person i n  
charge of  the blast ing operation i n  accordance with NFPA 495. 

5607 . 1 9  Blast log . A b last log sha l l  be maintained by the approved and authorized 
blaster. The log sha l l  document the fire department permit number, blaster's name and any
l icense number, location of where the exp losive materials were used , the date and time of each 
use, the seism ic and air blast mon itoring read ings and the name of the ind ividual o r  firm who 
conducted the monitor ing.  A copy of the blast log sha l l  be submitted to the F ire Code Official .  
Fa i lure to submit the log may cause the Fire Code Officia l  to d isconti nue perm it issuance until 
Code compliance . 

5607 .20 Marked items. Blast ing cap wi res and any items or devices marked 
"EXPLOSIVE" or "BLASTI NG CAP" sha l l  be removed from the blast site at the end of each work 
day and properly disposed of . 

. 5607.21 Traffic barricading . Traffic barricading sha l l  be provided with in 1 ,000 feet (304 
800 mm) of public rights-of-way or as requ i red by the City of Peoria Traffic Engineeri ng
Department. The blaste r shall submi t  for and obta in  a permit for a traffic control p lan with the 
City of Peoria Traffic Engineering Department prior to explosive materia ls be ing b rought on site. 

5607 .22 S ignage. Signs read ing "BLASTI NG ZONE AH EAD" and "TURN OFF TWO­
WAY RADIOS" shal l be provided when explosive materia l  use is proposed with in 1 , 000 feet 
(304 800 mm) of publ ic rights-of-way. 

5607 .23 Post-blast surveys . When requ i red by the Fi re Code Officia l , after d ischarge of 
explosive materials a post-blast survey of a l l  structures or bui ld ings identified in the p re-blast 
survey sha l l  be conducted document ing structura l damage . 
The contractor shal l make a min imum of four  attempts to contact the owner or operator of a 
structure or bui ld ing in  the post-blast survey area . At least two of the attempted contacts shal l 
be made between 6:00 p .m .  and 8:00 p .m .  local time . If unsuccessfu l ,  a statement on contractor 
letterhead detail i ng the address, dates, times and the name of the person(s) attempted to be 
contacted shall be submitted to the Fire Code Officia l .  
When access to the property is  denied , a statement on contractor letterhead deta i l ing the name 
of the person denying access, the address ,  dates, t imes and the name of the person attempting 
to make contacts shall be submitted to the F i re Code Official .  

5607 .24 Additiona l requ i rements. When deemed necessary, the Fire Code Official is 
authorized to make add itional requi rements . 

5607 .25 Standby personnel and equ ipment. When necessary for the p reservation of l ife 
or property, the Fire Code Official is authorized to require the attendance of standby personnel 
and fire equipment. 

5607 .26 Hold harmless agreement. In add ition to the financia l  responsibi l ity requi red i n  
5601 .2 .4 , the app l i cant sha l l  execute a Hold Harmless Agreement in favor of the City of  Peoria .  



Ordinance No .  20 1 9-1 1 
Page 39 of 40 

( i i i )( Chapter 80 is amended to include the fo l lowing reference standards:(

NFPA 37 - 201 0  Stationary Combustion Engines and Gas Turb i nes 
NFPA 45 - 201 1 Fire Protection for Laboratories Using Chemicals 
NFPA 75 - 201 3 Protection of Information Techno logy Equipment 
NFPA 76 - 201 2  Telecommunication Facil ities 
NFPA 82(- 2009 Incinerators , Waste and Linen Handl ing Systems and Equ ipment 
NFPA 88A - 201 1 Parking Structures 
NFPA 91  - 201 0  Exhaust Systems for Ai r Conveying of Gases, etc. 
NFPA 92A - 2012  Smoke Control Systems 
NFPA 96 - 201(1 Venti lation  Control and Fire Protection of Commercial Cooking 

Operations 
NFPA 291 - 201 3  Fire F low Testing and Marking of Hydrants 
NFPA 41 8 - 201 1 Hel iports 
NFPA 6 10  - 201 4  Motorsports Venues 
NFPA 820 - 201 2 F ire Protection in Wastewater Treatment and Collection Faci l it ies 
NFPA 1 141  - 201 2 Infrastructure for Land Development in  Suburban and Rura l  Areas 
NFPA 201 0 (- 201 0  Fixed Aerosol Fire Extinguishing Systems 

(jjj) Section 01 03 .4 is amended to read as fol lows: 

Section 0 1 03.4 Dead ends. Dead end fi re apparatus access roads in  excess of 1 50 feet 
shal l  be provided with width and turnaround provis ions in accordance with Table 01 03.4 and 
Chapter 5 of NFPA 1 141  - 2012 .  

(kkk) Section 0 105 is amended by  add ing the fo l lowing subsection 01 05.4 wh ich shall 
read as follows: 

Section 01 05.4 Bu i l dings exceed ing 30 feet (9 1 44 mm) in height above the lowest level 
of Fire Department access shall meet the requ irements l i sted in Section 01 04. 1 . 

Exception :  Apartment bu i ld ings equ ipped with an NFPA 1 3R sprinkler system.  

(I l l) Section 0 107 . 1  is  amended to read as follows : 

Section 01 07 . 1  One or two fami ly  dwel l ing residential developments . Developments of 
one or two fami ly dwe l l i ngs where the number of dwel l ing un its exceeds 30 sha l l  be provided 
with two separate and approved fire apparatus access roads, and shall meet the requ irements 
of Section 0 104.3 and Chapter 5 of NFPA 1 14 1  - 201 2 .  

Exceptions: 

1 .  Where there are more than 30 dwel l ing un its on a s ingle pub l ic  o r  private 
fire apparatus access road and all dwell ing un its are equipped throughout with an approved 
automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903 .3 . 1 . 1 ,  903 .3 . 1 . 2 or 903.3 . 1 . 3 of the 
International Fire Code, access from two directions sha l l  not be required . 

2 . ( The number of dwel l ing un its on a single fi re apparatus access road sha l l (
not be increased unless fi re apparatus access roads wi l l  connect with future development, as 
determined by the Fire Code Official .  



Ordinance No. 201 9- 1 1 
Page 40 of 40 

SECTION 3. Provid ing for Separab i l ity. If any section , subsection , sentence , clause, 
phrase or portion of this Ordinance is for any reason held inva l id or  unconstitutional by any court 
of competent jurisdiction,  such portion sha l l  be deemed a separate , distinct and i ndependent 
provision; and such shal l  not effect the va l id ity of the remain ing portions hereof. 

SECTION 4 . Providing an Effective Date. This ord inance sha l l  become effective i n  the 
manner provided by law. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Mayor and Council of the City of Peoria ,  Arizona th is  
21 st day of May ,  201 9 .  

Date Signed 

ATTEST: 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 

��/h'�Va sa Hickman��omey 

Publ ished in  Peoria Times : 
Publ ication Date: May 30, 201 9 
Effective Date : ..J\J.,.,n, :L :Z.,)...,l..<'.:) \ <\ 




