P11-0001 Replacement Parts for Refuse Trucks

American Equip Svcs dba

Innovation Industrial

RLS Services, Inc. OEM Parts Products Valley Truck & Trailer McNeilus Truck
A. Heil Parts
PS # |Description Qty. (UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
257|Spring, 60/90, RLS-0180804 40 |Each $4.40 $176.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $7.43 $297.20
260|Impulse,Relay, RLS-E1P6 5 Each $49.26 $246.30 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $53.18 $265.90
261|Overspeed Box,RLS-1084545 1 Each $365.63 $365.63 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $387.81 $387.81
267|Switch, Packer, Heil, #108-503 18 |Each $65.36 $1,176.48 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $40.55 $729.90
269|Linkage Pin 1.5,RLS H-P2560 45 |Each $36.50 $1,642.50 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $27.37 $1,231.65
283|Bearing, 2",RLS H-0034432 17 |Each $22.38 $380.46 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $34.15 $580.55
284|Bearing, 4",RLS H-0034438 3 Each $68.69 $206.07 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $95.33 $285.99
307|Dc Solenoid, RLS-0315598210 9 Each $178.88 $1,609.92 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $147.87 $1,330.83
318|Bearing Keeper, RLS H-P14 2 Each $11.35 $22.70 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $29.27 $58.54
612|0-Ring, Cover, 075-0711-003 28 |Each $0.86 $24.08 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $1.13 $31.64
613|0-Ring, Insert, 075-0711-006 28 |Each $1.34 $37.52 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $1.85 $51.80
614|Gasket, By Pass, 075-0711-007 6 |Each $15.99 $95.94 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $16.11 $96.66
854|Double Link Top, RLS H-P2540 6 Each $69.43 $416.58 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $94.20 $565.20
855|Single Link Thick, RLS H-P252 6 Each $99.00 $594.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $73.05 $438.30
856|Double Link Bottom, RLS H-P253 6 Each $46.67 $280.02 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $53.93 $323.58
1958|Roller,rubber RLS H-0620717 81 |Each $6.83 $553.23 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $6.63 $537.03
1959|Belt,dump arm,RLS H-0710837 12 |Each $21.36 $256.32 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $13.59 $163.08
1960|Arm,Gripper,RLS H-0932614 9 Each $263.62 $2,372.58 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $407.39 $3,666.51
1961|Arm,Inner,RLS H-0932642 2 Each $74.34 $148.68 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $116.59 $233.18
1963|Gripper,Inner,RLS H-0932632 1 |Each $75.60 $75.60 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $198.24 $198.24
1982 |Whisker kit, RLS H-P6P301 2 Each $29.75 $59.50 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2062|Pin, cylinders, RLS H-0485644 22 |Each $10.04 $220.88 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $17.97 $395.34
2195|Rodeye, Female, RLS H-00161690 10 |Each $62.94 $629.40 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $140.91 $1,409.10
2207|Limit Switch, RLS H-1087381 51 [Each $150.31 $7,665.81 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $94.78 $4,833.78
2209|Pin, Lift Pivot, RLS H-0485856 1 Each $58.80 $58.80 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $90.78 $90.78
2253|Cushion Kit, Small, In/Out Cyl H-L19kit 10 |Each $84.00 $840.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $43.10 $431.00
2254|Cushion Kit, Large, In/Out Cyl H-L19N 10 |Each $107.48 $1,074.80 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $58.34 $583.40
2271|Hydraulic Filter, #H-0750724-0 13 |Each $89.38 $1,161.94 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $74.97 $974.61
2332|Roller, Rubber, 4 in., RLS H-062-0712 1 Each $7.90 $7.90 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $6.63 $6.63
2334|Rocker Switches (Soft Touch),1087544 44 |Each $12.38 $544.72 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $8.62 $379.28
2433|Extra Long Actuator Arm RLS H-1082096S 34 |Each $26.07 $886.38 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $19.23 $653.82
2493|Spacer Plate, Thick RLS H-0063251SP 1 Each $48.75 $48.75 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $233.14 $233.14
2496|PTO PSI Swicth (Muncie) RLS MP-30T37954 1 Each $63.25 $63.25 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $49.93 $49.93
2533|Can Counter H1085683 4 Each $110.10 $440.40 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $184.81 $739.24
2534/ Air Pressure Regulator w/gauge H0750721 4 |Each $59.78 $239.12 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $49.77 $199.08
2535(Rod Eye,Female, Lift Cylinder H0016404-014 8 |Each $134.75 $1,078.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $112.71 $901.68
2536|Coordinator Board Il H1087697 12 |Each $175.88 $2,110.56 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $711.23 $8,534.76
2537|4 Stack End Harness, Diode, Deustch Plug H263-0675-005P 4 Each $469.35 $1,877.40 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $679.12 $2,716.48
25384 Stack End Harness, No Diode, Deustch Plug 263-0675-003 1 Each $304.69 $304.69 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $350.21 $350.21
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2539|Cross Port Relief Valve H0316082005 2 Each $298.02 $596.04 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $277.12 $554.24
2552|1/2" Double Run Tube Clamp H0361633 11 |Each $3.91 $43.01 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $8.13 $89.43
2553|1" Unistrut Tube Clamp H0361474008 5 Each $5.74 $28.70 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $3.77 $18.85
2630|Solenoid Assy. W/Din Connector H372-1748 21 |Each $179.39 $3,767.19 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $132.01 $2,772.21
2631|Center Wire Harness, Small End 14Pin # H2630675-002 23 |Each $323.77 $7,446.71 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $384.54 $8,844.42
2634|Rodeye, Extra Long, Female # H016407-005 1 Each $62.94 $62.94 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $194.90 $194.90
2658|1" SINGLE TUBE CLAMP # 12-3254 25 |Each $3.18 $79.50 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $3.77 $94.25
2675|2" CAM FOLLOWERS# 0034450 64 |[Each $31.88 $2,040.32 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $56.74 $3,631.36
2676|4" CAM FOLLOWERS# 0034449 12 |Each $138.75 $1,665.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $198.90 $2,386.80
2678|BELT RETAINER # H0932630 12 |Each $15.94 $191.28 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $22.13 $265.56
2684|HOSE CLAMP # 0361819 2 Each $19.13 $38.26 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $21.34 $42.68
2699|Grip Gear # H093845 8 Each $323.38 $2,587.04 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $255.00 $2,040.00
2700|Idler Gear #H0932737 11 |Each $268.13 $2,949.43 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $225.25 $2,477.75
2701|Tie Bar #H2341151 8 Each $34.69 $277.52 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $67.81 $542.48
2702|3/4" Bearing #H0016163003 16 |Each $5.63 $90.08 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $15.10 $241.60
2715|Hydraulic Filter, 06 Autocar # H0750912001 9 Each $61.72 $555.48 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $90.45 $814.05
2737|Filter Indicator Switch # H-075-0711-012, Heil 4 Each $41.35 $165.40 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $52.68 $210.72
2767|RELAY # 108-6752 2 Each $34.72 $69.44 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $41.46 $82.92
2768 |PRESSURE SWITCH # 063-0116 21 |Each $69.38 $1,456.98 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $134.80 $2,830.80
2769|UPPER HARNESS # 263-1213 4 Each $486.41 $1,945.64 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $679.12 $2,716.48
2775|Paddle New # H-1280466 3 Each $1,575.00 $4,725.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $1,395.00 $4,185.00
2776|Actuator Plate, New # H-272862 3 Each $536.02 $1,608.06 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $425.00 $1,275.00
2778|Packer Seal Kit, # H-272-7649 2 Each $167.02 $334.04 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $120.19 $240.38
2837|Pump Block , Volvo # H-0316078 1 Each $180.00 $180.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $440.90 $440.90
2838|Mac Valve, Refuse Trucks # H0315724012 2 Each $39.02 $78.04 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $37.79 $75.58
2839|Loader Latch Air Assy Kit # HO016393KIT 1 Each $84.41 $84.41 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $64.31 $64.31
2842|Pigtail for Relay, Refuse Truck # H1086752005 1 Each $23.54 $23.54 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $9.87 $9.87
2843 (Relay, Refuse Trucks # H1086752001 4  |Each $9.60 $38.40 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $34.08 $136.32
2845|Cam Limit Switch, # H0960576 13 |Each $23.51 $305.63 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $62.46 $811.98
2846|Tricuff, Refuse Trucks # H3720233 1 Each $393.25 $393.25 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $600.11 $600.11
2866|Din Connector, Refuse Trucks # H-1087383 7 |Each $45.00 $315.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $44.09 $308.63
2886|Receptical Kit # 5HD441814 6 Each $53.15 $318.90 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2915|Crossport Relief Valve # H0316082006 6 Each $151.70 $910.20 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $129.57 $777.42
2916|Grip Section Valve # H0316082105 3 Each $323.75 $971.25 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $298.64 $895.92
2917|Rear Vision System # SV-LCD 1 Each $895.00 $895.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $445.33 $445.33
2919|Square Ring # H0316082031 24 |Each $0.25 $6.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $3.33 $79.92
2920|Spring # H0316082131 6 Each $3.07 $18.42 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $2.07 $12.42

Dump Arm Assembly # H-0932280 1 Each $1,283.60 $1,283.60 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $1,445.90 $1,445.90
Lift Arm Assembly Complete # H-3720332 1 Each $1,354.86 $1,354.86 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $2,647.98 $2,647.98
Track Assy Complete # H-0932734 4 |Each $2,385.95 $9,543.80 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $3,014.28| $12,057.12
Pressure Release Cartridge # H-0315631002 6 |Each $122.41 $734.46 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $143.87 $863.22
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Main Relief Valve # H-0316283002 5 Each $498.96 $2,494.80 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00 $426.16 $2,130.80
Subtotal A: $82,665.53 $0.00 $0.00 $95,311.46
Tax Rate ____ % Taxes: 9.30% S 7,687.89 9.30% $0.00 9.10% $0.00 9.50%( $ 9,054.59
Total A: $90,353.42 $0.00 $0.00 $104,366.05
B. Wayne Parts
PS # |Description Qty. |UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
2780|Filter Element, Wayne Trucks # W-510-011-016 12 |Each $67.57 $810.84 $72.50 $870.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2781|0-Ring Kit -Filter Element, Wayne Trucks # W-510-011-0160K 10 |Each $6.55 $65.50 $0.10 $1.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2782|Wheel, Packer Panel, Wayne Trucks # W-30408-00-WA 37 |Each $26.45 $978.65 $26.99 $998.63 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2783|Axle, Wheel Packer Panel, Wayne Trucks # W-24618-02-0A 25 |Each $22.50 $562.50 $25.49 $637.25 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2784|Snap Ring, Packer Panel, Wayne Trucks # W-470-016-001 44 |Each $0.26 $11.44 $0.21 $9.24 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2785|Bushing, Packer Panel, Wayne Trucks # W-440-016-000 56 |Each $0.34 $19.04 $0.20 $11.20 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2786|Roll Pin, Wayne Trucks # W-480-005-032 29 |[Each $0.32 $9.28 $0.22 $6.38 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2787|Grip Pad, Wayne Trucks # W-11407-02-WB 3 Each $15.94 $47.82 $13.80 $41.40 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2788|Roller, Wayne Trucks # W-24879-00-WA 3 Each $28.13 $84.39 $29.63 $88.89 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2789|Bronze Bushing, Hopper , Wayne # W-432-005-038B 1 |[Each $37.50 $37.50 $5.45 $5.45 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2790(Journal Block, Hopper , Wayne # W-432-005-038J 1 |[Each $31.88 $31.88 $5.45 $5.45 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2791 |Proximity Switch, Wayne Trucks # W-345-014-009 15 |Each $81.00 $1,215.00 $88.25 $1,323.75 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2798|Tailgate Seal, Wayne Trucks # W-20155020A 2 Each $32.50 $65.00 $22.22 $44.44 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2799|Sight Glass, Wayne Trucks # W-500-004-001 1 |Each $44.70 $44.70 $43.93 $43.93 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2800(Breather Filter , Wayne Trucks # W-13062 1 |[Each $10.62 $10.62 $19.51 $19.51 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2801|Air Cylinder, Wayne Trucks # W-538-018-010 5 Each $34.26 $171.30 $32.20 $161.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2802|Bearing, Wayne Trucks # W-110-026-000 12 |Each $24.44 $293.28 $24.76 $297.12 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2840|Air Cylinder For Wayne Hopper # W538018005 1 |[Each $205.97 $205.97 $160.84 $160.84 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2841|Wayne Hopper Cover (Set) # W3414300ABKIT 1 Each $1,000.85 $1,000.85 $699.20 $699.20 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2844|Clevis, Wayne Truck # W33710000A 3 Each $15.72 $47.16 $10.14 $30.42 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2858|Pressure Switch, Wayne Trucks # W345063012 1 Each $132.47 $132.47 $155.48 $155.48 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2859|Gasket, Wayne Trucks # W638011081 10 |Each $9.50 $95.00 $1.89 $18.90 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
2914|Quick release valve # W-538030000 2 Each $30.20 $60.40 $44.62 $89.24 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Hydraulic Tube # W-2156200AA 1 Each $44.89 $44.89 $40.48 $40.48 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Packer Assy Cover Complete # W2424000AC 1 Each $725.00 $725.00 $736.00 $736.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Clamp # W432003016 1 Each $2.75 $2.75 $1.55 $1.55 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Pin Assy # W2656800AA 4 Each $24.38 $97.52 $9.16 $36.64 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Reinforced Belt # W98001R 2 Each $19.28 $38.56 $25.14 $50.28 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Reinforced Belt # W98002R 1 Each $19.28 $19.28 $15.93 $15.93 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Reinforced Belt # W98003R 1 |[Each $19.28 $19.28 $14.37 $14.37 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Tip Belt # W98004 2 Each $7.52 $15.04 $9.07 $18.14 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Body Pivot Pin # W30737000A 3 Each $70.00 $210.00 $79.80 $239.40 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Terminal Remote # W341002016 2 Each $448.88 $897.76 $483.00 $966.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
3043|Double Pin Assy # W001265900 1 Each $75.00 $75.00 $69.46 $69.46 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Bearing # W110026000 4 Each $24.44 $97.76 $24.76 $99.04 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00




P11-0001 Replacement Parts for Refuse Trucks

American Equip Svcs dba

Innovation Industrial

RLS Services, Inc. OEM Parts Products Valley Truck & Trailer McNeilus Truck
Joystick # W32272010A 3 Each $714.15 $2,142.45 $789.38 $2,368.14 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Air Actuator # W545004216 2 Each $178.85 $357.70 $152.71 $305.42 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Pipe # W003241900AA 1 Each $54.11 $54.11 $80.32 $80.32 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Rear Cover # W2377100AC 2 |Each $768.00 $1,536.00 $749.22 $1,498.44 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Front Cover # W2424000AC 1 Each $725.00 $725.00 $736.00 $736.00 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Hydraulic Tube # W2516200AA 1 Each $44.89 $44.89 $40.48 $40.48 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Hydraulic Tube # W2516300AA 1 Each $56.54 $56.54 $40.48 $40.48 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Screen # W28823040B 1 |Each $236.38 $236.38 $50.46 $50.46 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Relay, I/O PLC Remote Output, CT # W342013010 22 |Each $15.00 $330.00 $13.80 $303.60 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Relay, 24 Volt Function # W342017000 8 Each $18.70 $149.60 $12.88 $103.04 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
3042|Rocker Switch, 24 Volt Momentary # W345011008 2 Each $17.50 $35.00 $13.80 $27.60 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
3044|Spacer, Bearing # W0017959000A 6 |Each $6.00 $36.00 $3.14 $18.84 No bid $0.00 No bid $0.00
Subtotal B: $13,947.10 $13,578.83 $0.00 $0.00
Tax Rate ___ % Taxes: 9.30% S 1,297.08 9.30% S 1,262.83 9.10% $0.00 9.50% $0.00
Total B: $15,244.18 $14,841.66 $0.00 $0.00
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C. Heil Cylinders
PS # |Description Qty. |UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
861|Grip, cyl,New, # RLS-0016331 4 [Each $443.52 $1,774.08 No bid $0.00 $346.00 $1,384.00 $596.70 $2,386.80 $340.51 $1,362.04
2186(In/Out Cylinder, # RLS H-0016403 10 |[Each $725.01 $7,250.10 No bid $0.00 $560.00 $5,600.00 $717.54 $7,175.40 $565.19 $5,651.90
2296|Dump Cylinder (new), # RLS00164 10 |[Each $471.24 $4,712.40 No bid $0.00 $346.00 $3,460.00 $547.64 $5,476.40 $247.70 $2,477.00
2502 |Lift Cylinder, Male End Thread # H0016404 7 |Each $529.10 $3,703.70 No bid $0.00 $407.00 $2,849.00 $514.80 $3,603.60 $343.77 $2,406.39
3088|Packer Cylinder, New OEM # 16406 11 |Each $1,063.92 $11,703.12 No bid $0.00 $820.00 $9,020.00 $902.34 $9,925.74 $743.41 $8,177.51
Subtotal C: $29,143.40 $0.00 $22,313.00 $28,567.94 $20,074.84
Tax Rate ____ % Taxes: 9.30% S 2,710.34 9.30% $0.00 9.10%| $ 2,030.48 9.50%| $ 2,713.95 9.30%| $ 1,866.96
Total C: $31,853.74 $0.00 $24,343.48 $31,281.89 $21,941.80
D. Wayne Cylinders
PS # |Description Qty. |UOM | Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
2792|Dump Cylinder, Wayne Trucks # W-23150-04-AB 5 |Each $472.50 $2,362.50 $448.50 $2,242.50 $375.00 $1,875.00 No bid $0.00 $301.46 $1,507.30
2793|Grip Cylinder, Wayne Truck # W-23137-07-AB 1 |[Each 497.25 $497.25 $447.31 $447.31 $374.00 $374.00 No bid $0.00 $504.05 $504.05
2794|Arm Lift Cylinder, Wayne truck # W-23157-06-WB 2 |Each 708.75 $1,417.50 $634.80 $1,269.60 $577.00 $1,154.00 No bid $0.00 $483.01 $966.02
2795(In/Out Cylinder, Wayne Trucks # W-23144-06-AB 6 |Each 1012.65 $6,075.90 $807.30 $4,843.80 $680.00 $4,080.00 No bid $0.00 $624.31 $3,745.86
2796|Tailgate Cylinder, Wayne Truck # W-11164-02-WB 1 |Each 629.75 $629.75 $448.50 $448.50 $460.00 $460.00 No bid $0.00 $855.14 $855.14
2797|Packer Cylinder 6", Wayne Truck # W-31427-20-AB 1 |Each 3437.5 $3,437.50 $2,851.08 $2,851.08 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 No bid $0.00|| $4,076.81 $4,076.81
Subtotal D: $14,420.40 $12,102.79 $10,743.00 $0.00 $11,655.18
Tax Rate % Taxes: 9.30%| $  1,341.10 9.30% $1,125.56 9.10% $977.61 9.50% $0.00 9.30%| $ 1,083.93
Total D: $15,761.50 $13,228.35 $11,720.61 $0.00 $12,739.11
Subtotal $140,176.43 $25,681.62 $33,056.00 $123,879.40 $31,730.02
Tax $ 13,036.41 $2,388.39 $3,008.10 $ 11,768.54 S 2,950.89
Grand Total $153,212.84 $28,070.01 $36,064.10 $135,647.94 $34,680.91
1 Bidder offers ____ days for deliver A.R.O. 1 same 2 3 1
2 Bidder offers days for delivery on backorders A.R.O. 3 5 4 5 4
3 Discount Percentage offered off catalog __ % 0 8% 0 32% -
4 Bidder hours of operation ___a.m.to___p.m. 6 am-6 pm 8 am-9 pm 10 am-6 pm 7 am-5 pm 6:30 am-5 pm
5 Bidder delivery hours a.m. to p.m. 6 pm-6 pm 8am-9 pm 10 am-6 pm 7 am-5 pm 7am-5pm
6 After hours delivery ___ p.m.to___p.m./a.m. 6 pm-6 pm 5 pm-9:30 pm As required As required
Exceptions None None None None 180 day replacement part warranty

2-yr replacement cylinder warranty



