
Q10-03, T-Shirts
Bid Tabulation

Item No D i ti Qt U it U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i
Long Beach Graphix

Southwest Promotions 
& Designs Comade Inc.

Promotional Buying 
Group  Anton Sport

Jimmi J Graphic 
Design

International 
Corporate Apparel AdWear

New Age Marketing 
Group Promos Distributors

Byassee Screen 
Printing My T-Stylin

Pinnacle Prints and 
Embroidery Screenprint Plus Inc

Absolute Grahics Inc. 
(bid alternate) Combustion Media Wildheart Apparel Globe Electric Co, Inc. Aminator, Inc All Star Embroidery Universal Athletic DJ's Specialty Apparel

Touchdown 
Sportswear TeamSport Outfitters M&J Trophies Awards by C&L

Excel Screen Printing 
USA Inc.

Valmarq Embroidery, 
Inc.

Quality W
LAbsolute Grahics Inc.
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1. Staff Short Sleeve T-Shirts

A. Winter Order:  Total = 510 shirts HANES GILDAN HANES
AS-XL 452 EA $6.95 $3,141.40 $6.00 $2,712.00 $6.55 $2,960.60 $4.00 $1,808.00 $3.90 $1,762.80 $5.00 $2,260.00 $3.68 $1,663.36 $2.57 $1,161.64 $3.40 $1,536.80 $3.49 $1,577.48 $5.00 $2,260.00 $3.00 $1,356.00 $6.26 $2,829.52 $4.13 $1,866.76 $4.36 $1,970.72 $3.61 $1,631.72 $4.27 $1,930.04 $4.98 $2,250.96 $4.20 $1,898.40 $4.59 $2,074.68 $5.57 $2,517.64 $4.20 $1,898.40 $4.50 $2,034.00 $3.83 $1,731.16 $3.30 $1,491.60 $3.68 $1,663.36 $4.45 $2,011.40 $3.48 $1,572.96 $6.42 $2,901.84 $4.33
XXL 55 EA $7.95 $437.25 $7.00 $385.00 $8.63 $474.38 $5.00 $275.00 $5.16 $283.80 $6.75 $371.25 $5.22 $287.10 $3.96 $217.80 $3.95 $217.25 $4.49 $246.95 $7.00 $385.00 $4.25 $233.75 $8.15 $448.25 $5.13 $282.15 $6.08 $334.40 $4.88 $268.40 $5.60 $308.00 $6.98 $383.90 $5.75 $316.25 $6.20 $341.00 $7.98 $438.90 $4.20 $231.00 $5.50 $302.50 $4.86 $267.30 $4.49 $246.95 $3.68 $202.40 $5.95 $327.25 $4.83 $265.65 $7.68 $422.40 $5.79
XXXL 2 EA $7.95 $15.90 $10.00 $20.00 $8.63 $17.25 $5.50 $11.00 $5.30 $10.60 $7.00 $14.00 $5.33 $10.66 $3.96 $7.92 $3.95 $7.90 $5.49 $10.98 $8.00 $16.00 $4.25 $8.50 $8.19 $16.38 $5.13 $10.26 $6.08 $12.16 $4.88 $9.76 $5.72 $11.44 $6.98 $13.96 $5.75 $11.50 $6.30 $12.60 $8.13 $16.26 $4.20 $8.40 $5.50 $11.00 $4.98 $9.96 $4.55 $9.10 $3.68 $7.36 $6.05 $12.10 $4.95 $9.90 $7.68 $15.36 $5.79
XXXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $10.00 $10.00 $8.63 $8.63 $6.00 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50 $7.00 $7.00 $5.45 $5.45 $3.96 $3.96 $4.25 $4.25 $6.49 $6.49 $9.00 $9.00 $4.25 $4.25 $8.39 $8.39 $5.13 $5.13 $6.08 $6.08 $4.88 $4.88 $5.91 $5.91 $7.50 $7.50 $6.10 $6.10 $6.40 $6.40 $8.43 $8.43 $4.20 $4.20 $5.50 $5.50 $5.15 $5.15 $4.75 $4.75 $3.68 $3.68 $6.15 $6.15 $5.05 $5.05 $7.68 $7.68 $5.79

B. Spring Order:  Total = 110 shirts
AS-XL 86 EA $6.95 $597.70 $6.00 $516.00 $7.25 $623.50 $4.00 $344.00 $4.04 $347.44 $5.00 $430.00 $3.68 $316.48 $2.57 $221.02 $3.40 $292.40 $3.49 $300.14 $6.10 $524.60 $3.00 $258.00 $7.50 $645.00 $4.13 $355.18 $4.62 $397.32 $3.87 $332.82 $4.65 $399.90 $4.98 $428.28 $4.20 $361.20 $4.99 $429.14 $5.57 $479.02 $4.40 $378.40 $4.50 $387.00 $4.21 $362.06 $3.30 $283.80 $3.68 $316.48 $5.40 $464.40 $3.48 $299.28 $8.35 $718.10 $4.40
XXL 22 EA $7 95 $174 90 $7 00 $154 00 $8 63 $189 75 $5 00 $110 00 $5 30 $116 60 $6 75 $148 50 $5 22 $114 84 $3 96 $87 12 $3 95 $86 90 $4 49 $98 78 $8 10 $178 20 $4 25 $93 50 $9 36 $205 92 $5 13 $112 86 $6 18 $135 96 $4 98 $109 56 $5 93 $130 46 $6 98 $153 56 $5 70 $125 40 $6 60 $145 20 $7 98 $175 56 $4 40 $96 80 $5 50 $121 00 $5 31 $116 82 $4 49 $98 78 $3 68 $80 96 $6 90 $151 80 $4 83 $106 26 $9 61 $211 42 $5 86XXL 22 EA $7.95 $174.90 $7.00 $154.00 $8.63 $189.75 $5.00 $110.00 $5.30 $116.60 $6.75 $148.50 $5.22 $114.84 $3.96 $87.12 $3.95 $86.90 $4.49 $98.78 $8.10 $178.20 $4.25 $93.50 $9.36 $205.92 $5.13 $112.86 $6.18 $135.96 $4.98 $109.56 $5.93 $130.46 $6.98 $153.56 $5.70 $125.40 $6.60 $145.20 $7.98 $175.56 $4.40 $96.80 $5.50 $121.00 $5.31 $116.82 $4.49 $98.78 $3.68 $80.96 $6.90 $151.80 $4.83 $106.26 $9.61 $211.42 $5.86
XXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $10.00 $10.00 $8.63 $8.63 $5.50 $5.50 $5.44 $5.44 $7.00 $7.00 $5.33 $5.33 $3.96 $3.96 $3.95 $3.95 $5.49 $5.49 $9.10 $9.10 $4.25 $4.25 $9.40 $9.40 $5.13 $5.13 $6.18 $6.18 $4.98 $4.98 $6.05 $6.05 $6.98 $6.98 $5.70 $5.70 $6.70 $6.70 $8.13 $8.13 $4.40 $4.40 $5.50 $5.50 $5.41 $5.41 $4.55 $4.55 $3.68 $3.68 $7.00 $7.00 $4.95 $4.95 $9.61 $9.61 $5.86
XXXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $10.00 $10.00 $8.63 $8.63 $6.80 $6.80 $5.55 $5.55 $7.00 $7.00 $5.45 $5.45 $3.96 $3.96 $4.25 $4.25 $6.49 $6.49 $10.10 $10.10 $4.25 $4.25 $9.60 $9.60 $5.13 $5.13 $6.18 $6.18 $4.98 $4.98 $6.46 $6.46 $7.50 $7.50 $6.10 $6.10 $6.80 $6.80 $8.43 $8.43 $4.40 $4.40 $5.50 $5.50 $5.50 $5.50 $4.75 $4.75 $3.68 $3.68 $7.10 $7.10 $5.05 $5.05 $9.61 $9.61 $5.86

C. Summer Order:  Total = 170 shirts
AS-XL 167 EA $6.95 $1,160.65 $6.00 $1,002.00 $7.25 $1,210.75 $4.00 $668.00 $4.04 $674.68 $5.00 $835.00 $3.68 $614.56 $2.57 $429.19 $3.40 $567.80 $3.49 $582.83 $5.80 $968.60 $3.00 $501.00 $7.38 $1,232.46 $4.13 $689.71 $4.62 $771.54 $3.87 $646.29 $4.65 $776.55 $4.98 $831.66 $4.20 $701.40 $4.79 $799.93 $5.57 $930.19 $4.95 $826.65 $4.50 $751.50 $4.17 $696.39 $3.30 $551.10 $3.68 $614.56 $4.85 $809.95 $3.48 $581.16 $7.54 $1,259.18 $4.40
XXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $7.00 $7.00 $8.63 $8.63 $5.00 $5.00 $5.30 $5.30 $6.75 $6.75 $5.22 $5.22 $3.96 $3.96 $3.95 $3.95 $4.49 $4.49 $7.80 $7.80 $4.25 $4.25 $9.24 $9.24 $5.13 $5.13 $6.18 $6.18 $4.98 $4.98 $5.93 $5.93 $6.98 $6.98 $5.75 $5.75 $6.40 $6.40 $7.98 $7.98 $4.95 $4.95 $5.50 $5.50 $5.20 $5.20 $4.49 $4.49 $3.68 $3.68 $6.35 $6.35 $4.83 $4.83 $8.80 $8.80 $5.86
XXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $10.00 $10.00 $8.63 $8.63 $5.50 $5.50 $5.44 $5.44 $7.00 $7.00 $5.33 $5.33 $3.96 $3.96 $3.95 $3.95 $5.49 $5.49 $8.80 $8.80 $4.25 $4.25 $9.28 $9.28 $5.13 $5.13 $6.18 $6.18 $4.98 $4.98 $6.05 $6.05 $6.98 $6.98 $5.75 $5.75 $6.50 $6.50 $8.13 $8.13 $4.95 $4.95 $5.50 $5.50 $5.35 $5.35 $4.55 $4.55 $3.68 $3.68 $6.45 $6.45 $4.95 $4.95 $8.80 $8.80 $5.86
XXXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $10.00 $10.00 $8.63 $8.63 $6.00 $6.00 $5.55 $5.55 $7.00 $7.00 $5.45 $5.45 $3.96 $3.96 $4.25 $4.25 $6.49 $6.49 $9.80 $9.80 $4.25 $4.25 $9.48 $9.48 $5.13 $5.13 $6.18 $6.18 $4.98 $4.98 $6.46 $6.46 $7.50 $7.50 $6.10 $6.10 $6.60 $6.60 $8.43 $8.43 $4.95 $4.95 $5.50 $5.50 $5.40 $5.40 $4.75 $4.75 $3.68 $3.68 $6.55 $6.55 $5.05 $5.05 $8.80 $8.80 $5.86

2. Staff Long Sleeve T-Shirts2. Staff Long Sleeve T Shirts
A. Winter Order – Total = 40 shirts

AS-XL 26 EA $8.95 $232.70 $9.00 $234.00 $10.30 $267.80 $6.00 $156.00 $6.25 $162.50 $6.25 $162.50 $6.54 $170.04 $4.79 $124.54 $5.40 $140.40 $5.49 $142.74 $9.80 $254.80 $5.00 $130.00 $12.80 $332.80 $6.13 $159.38 $7.27 $189.02 $5.87 $152.62 $7.32 $190.32 $6.40 $166.40 $6.60 $171.60 $8.00 $208.00 $7.76 $201.76 $7.25 $188.50 $6.75 $175.50 $6.39 $166.14 $5.45 $141.70 $6.85 $178.10 $8.85 $230.10 $5.97 $155.22 $12.98 $337.48 $7.06
XXL 12 EA $9.95 $119.40 $9.00 $108.00 $11.80 $141.60 $7.00 $84.00 $7.70 $92.40 $7.75 $93.00 $8.69 $104.28 $6.21 $74.52 $5.75 $69.00 $6.49 $77.88 $11.80 $141.60 $6.25 $75.00 $13.53 $162.36 $7.63 $91.56 $8.00 $96.00 $7.25 $87.00 $8.80 $105.60 $8.40 $100.80 $6.74 $80.88 $8.80 $105.60 $10.52 $126.24 $7.25 $87.00 $8.50 $102.00 $7.49 $89.88 $6.55 $78.60 $6.85 $82.20 $11.10 $133.20 $7.25 $87.00 $14.24 $170.88 $8.32
XXXL 1 EA $9.95 $9.95 $12.00 $12.00 $11.80 $11.80 $7.50 $7.50 $7.86 $7.86 $8.25 $8.25 $9.37 $9.37 $6.21 $6.21 $6.25 $6.25 $7.49 $7.49 $12.80 $12.80 $6.25 $6.25 $13.73 $13.73 $7.63 $7.63 $8.00 $8.00 $7.25 $7.25 $9.32 $9.32 $8.40 $8.40 $6.74 $6.74 $8.90 $8.90 $11.28 $11.28 $7.25 $7.25 $8.50 $8.50 $7.59 $7.59 $6.75 $6.75 $6.85 $6.85 $11.60 $11.60 $7.35 $7.35 $14.24 $14.24 $8.32
XXXXL 1 EA $9.95 $9.95 $12.00 $12.00 $11.80 $11.80 $8.00 $8.00 $7.97 $7.97 $9.00 $9.00 $10.17 $10.17 $6.21 $6.21 $6.25 $6.25 $8.49 $8.49 $13.80 $13.80 $6.25 $6.25 $14.90 $14.90 $8.63 $8.63 $8.00 $8.00 $7.25 $7.25 $9.46 $9.46 $9.90 $9.90 $7.15 $7.15 $9.70 $9.70 $12.18 $12.18 $7.25 $7.25 $8.50 $8.50 $7.69 $7.69 $6.85 $6.85 $6.85 $6.85 $12.45 $12.45 $7.45 $7.45 $14.24 $14.24 $8.32

B. Fall Order – Total = 310 shirts
AS-XL 293 EA $8.95 $2,622.35 $9.00 $2,637.00 $10.07 $2,950.51 $6.00 $1,758.00 $6.30 $1,845.90 $6.25 $1,831.25 $6.54 $1,916.22 $4.79 $1,403.47 $4.90 $1,435.70 $5.49 $1,608.57 $8.40 $2,461.20 $5.00 $1,465.00 $10.66 $3,123.38 $6.13 $1,796.09 $7.27 $2,130.11 $5.87 $1,719.91 $6.33 $1,854.69 $6.40 $1,875.20 $6.60 $1,933.80 $7.40 $2,168.20 $7.76 $2,273.68 $7.25 $2,124.25 $6.75 $1,977.75 $6.49 $1,901.57 $5.45 $1,596.85 $6.85 $2,007.05 $7.25 $2,124.25 $5.97 $1,749.21 $9.44 $2,765.92 $6.98
XXL 15 EA $9.95 $149.25 $9.00 $135.00 $11.50 $172.50 $7.00 $105.00 $7.88 $118.20 $7.75 $116.25 $8.69 $130.35 $6.21 $93.15 $5.50 $82.50 $6.49 $97.35 $10.40 $156.00 $6.25 $93.75 $11.39 $170.85 $7.63 $114.45 $8.00 $120.00 $7.25 $108.75 $7.81 $117.15 $8.40 $126.00 $6.75 $101.25 $8.20 $123.00 $10.52 $157.80 $7.25 $108.75 $8.50 $127.50 $7.59 $113.85 $6.55 $98.25 $6.85 $102.75 $9.50 $142.50 $7.25 $108.75 $10.70 $160.50 $8.22
XXXL 1 EA $9.95 $9.95 $12.00 $12.00 $11.50 $11.50 $7.50 $7.50 $8.00 $8.00 $8.25 $8.25 $9.37 $9.37 $6.21 $6.21 $5.50 $5.50 $7.49 $7.49 $11.40 $11.40 $6.25 $6.25 $11.59 $11.59 $7.63 $7.63 $8.00 $8.00 $7.25 $7.25 $8.33 $8.33 $8.40 $8.40 $6.75 $6.75 $8.30 $8.30 $11.28 $11.28 $7.25 $7.25 $8.50 $8.50 $7.65 $7.65 $6.75 $6.75 $6.85 $6.85 $10.00 $10.00 $7.35 $7.35 $10.70 $10.70 $8.22$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
XXXXL 1 EA $9.95 $9.95 $12.00 $12.00 $11.50 $11.50 $8.00 $8.00 $8.25 $8.25 $9.00 $9.00 $10.17 $10.17 $6.21 $6.21 $5.50 $5.50 $8.49 $8.49 $12.40 $12.40 $6.25 $6.25 $12.76 $12.76 $8.63 $8.63 $8.00 $8.00 $7.25 $7.25 $8.47 $8.47 $9.40 $9.40 $7.15 $7.15 $9.10 $9.10 $12.18 $12.18 $7.25 $7.25 $8.50 $8.50 $7.75 $7.75 $7.85 $7.85 $6.85 $6.85 $10.85 $10.85 $7.45 $7.45 $10.70 $10.70 $8.22

3. Staff Tank Top Shirts
A. Winter Order – Total = 110 shirts

AS-XL 107 EA $6.33 $677.31 $6.00 $642.00 $6.62 $708.34 $6.00 $642.00 $4.68 $500.76 $4.75 $508.25 $4.30 $460.10 $3.38 $361.66 $4.30 $460.10 $5.70 $609.90 $5.80 $620.60 $3.50 $374.50 $6.59 $705.13 $4.60 $492.20 n/a - $4.48 $479.36 $5.75 $615.25 $6.30 $674.10 $7.00 $749.00 $5.18 $554.26 $5.58 $597.06 $6.45 $690.15 $5.50 $588.50 $4.89 $523.23 $3.80 $406.60 $4.25 $454.75 $5.90 $631.30 $4.30 $460.10 $8.96 $958.72 $4.67
XXL 1 EA $7.33 $7.33 $7.00 $7.00 $8.34 $8.34 $6.00 $6.00 $6.04 $6.04 $5.25 $5.25 $5.97 $5.97 $4.62 $4.62 $4.70 $4.70 $6.70 $6.70 $7.80 $7.80 $5.00 $5.00 $8.30 $8.30 $5.90 $5.90 n/a - $5.65 $5.65 $6.93 $6.93 $8.30 $8.30 $7.00 $7.00 $6.25 $6.25 $7.34 $7.34 $6.45 $6.45 $6.50 $6.50 $5.99 $5.99 $5.15 $5.15 $4.25 $4.25 $8.20 $8.20 $5.47 $5.47 $10.22 $10.22 $5.74
XXXL 1 EA $7.33 $7.33 $9.00 $9.00 n/a n/a $6.00 $6.00 $6.15 $6.15 no bid $10.90 $10.90 $4.62 $4.62 $4.70 $4.70 $7.70 $7.70 $8.80 $8.80 n/a - $8.30 $8.30 $5.90 $5.90 n/a - n/a - $9.00 $9.00 $8.30 $8.30 $9.00 $9.00 $10.00 $10.00 $8.81 $8.81 $6.45 $6.45 n/a $6.25 $6.25 n/a $4.25 $4.25 $8.70 $8.70 $5.47 $5.47 n/a $7.74
XXXXL 1 EA $7.33 $7.33 $11.00 $11.00 n/a n/a $6.00 $6.00 $6.23 $6.23 no bid $12.24 $12.24 $4.62 $4.62 $4.70 $4.70 $8.70 $8.70 $9.80 $9.80 n/a - $8.30 $8.30 $5.90 $5.90 n/a - n/a - $9.00 $9.00 $10.00 $10.00 $9.00 $9.00 $12.00 $12.00 $10.57 $10.57 $6.45 $6.45 n/a $6.35 $6.35 n/a $4.25 $4.25 $8.80 $8.80 $7.47 $7.47 n/a $9.74

B. Spring Order – Total = 110 shirts
AS-XL 73 EA $6.33 $462.09 $7.00 $511.00 $6.62 $483.26 $6.00 $438.00 $4.68 $341.64 $4.75 $346.75 $4.30 $313.90 $3.38 $246.74 $4.30 $313.90 $5.70 $416.10 $5.80 $423.40 $3.50 $255.50 $6.59 $481.07 $4.60 $335.80 n/a - $4.68 $341.64 $5.75 $419.75 $6.30 $459.90 $7.00 $511.00 $5.18 $378.14 $5.58 $407.34 $7.15 $521.95 $5.50 $401.50 $5.25 $383.25 $3.80 $277.40 $4.25 $310.25 $5.90 $430.70 $4.30 $313.90 $9.38 $684.74 $4.67
XXL 35 EA $7.33 $256.55 $7.00 $245.00 $8.34 $291.90 $7.00 $245.00 $6.04 $211.40 $5.25 $183.75 $5.97 $208.95 $4.62 $161.70 $4.70 $164.50 $6.70 $234.50 $7.80 $273.00 $5.00 $175.00 $8.30 $290.50 $5.90 $206.50 n/a - $5.87 $205.45 $6.93 $242.55 $8.30 $290.50 $7.00 $245.00 $6.25 $218.75 $7.34 $256.90 $7.15 $250.25 $6.50 $227.50 $6.35 $222.25 $5.15 $180.25 $4.25 $148.75 $8.20 $287.00 $5.47 $191.45 $10.64 $372.40 $5.74
XXXL 1 EA $7.33 $7.33 $9.00 $9.00 n/a n/a $7.00 $7.00 $6.15 $6.15 no bid $10.90 $10.90 $4.62 $4.62 $4.70 $4.70 $7.70 $7.70 $8.80 $8.80 n/a - $8.30 $8.30 $5.90 $5.90 n/a - n/a - $9.00 $9.00 $8.30 $8.30 $9.00 $9.00 $10.00 $10.00 $8.81 $8.81 $7.15 $7.15 n/a $6.70 $6.70 n/a $4.25 $4.25 $8.70 $8.70 $5.47 $5.47 n/a $7.74
XXXXL 1 EA $7.33 $7.33 $11.00 $11.00 n/a n/a $7.00 $7.00 $6.23 $6.23 no bid $12.24 $12.24 $4.62 $4.62 $4.70 $4.70 $8.70 $8.70 $9.80 $9.80 n/a - $8.30 $8.30 $5.90 $5.90 n/a - n/a - $9.00 $9.00 $10.00 $10.00 $9.00 $9.00 $12.00 $12.00 $10.57 $10.57 $7.15 $7.15 n/a $6.80 $6.80 n/a $4.25 $4.25 $8.80 $8.80 $7.47 $7.47 n/a $9.74

4. Program Short Sleeve T-Shirts 

Vendor shall indicate extra charge for single color print on back of program 
shirts (including artwork and screen fees here:  $_________/each. EA - $1.00 - $0.35 $0.60 - - $0.14 $0.45 $0.40 $0.85 $0.75 $0.61 $0.65 $0.95 $0.95 $0.55 $0.25 $0.00 $.55 - $.70 $15.00 $0.65 - $.45-$.60 $0.75 $0.00 $0.90 $0.60 - -

A. One-Color Print
i. Winter Order: Total = 2850 shirts

YS-YXL 2500 EA $5.89 $14,725.00 $6.00 $15,000.00 $5.80 $14,500.00 $3.50 $8,750.00 $3.27 $8,175.00 no bid $3.15 $7,875.00 $2.51 $6,275.00 $2.95 $7,375.00 $2.99 $7,475.00 $4.75 $11,875.00 $2.95 $7,375.00 $3.87 $9,675.00 $3.53 $8,825.00 $3.55 $8,875.00 $2.87 $7,175.00 $3.27 $8,175.00 $3.54 $8,850.00 $4.45 $11,125.00 $3.80 $9,500.00 $3.80 $9,500.00 $3.32 $8,300.00 $4.00 $10,000.00 $3.35 $8,375.00 $3.25 $8,125.00 $3.68 $9,200.00 $3.30 $8,250.00 $2.97 $7,425.00 $5.65 $14,125.00 $4.03
AS-XL 318 EA $6.30 $2,003.40 $6.00 $1,908.00 $7.48 $2,378.64 $3.00 $954.00 $4.53 $1,440.54 no bid $3.31 $1,052.58 $2.43 $772.74 $2.95 $938.10 $2.99 $950.82 $4.75 $1,510.50 $3.00 $954.00 $6.16 $1,958.88 $3.53 $1,122.54 $3.62 $1,151.16 $2.87 $912.66 $3.50 $1,113.00 $4.98 $1,583.64 $6.55 $2,082.90 $3.94 $1,252.92 $3.66 $1,163.88 $3.32 $1,055.76 $4.00 $1,272.00 $3.19 $1,014.42 $3.30 $1,049.40 $3.68 $1,170.24 $3.45 $1,097.10 $2.88 $915.84 $5.65 $1,796.70 $4.28
XXL 30 EA $7.30 $219.00 $10.00 $300.00 $7.48 $224.40 $4.50 $135.00 $4.63 $138.90 no bid $4.85 $145.50 $3.82 $114.60 $3.25 $97.50 $4.49 $134.70 $6.75 $202.50 $4.25 $127.50 $8.02 $240.60 $4.53 $135.90 $5.28 $158.40 $4.08 $122.40 $4.88 $146.40 $6.98 $209.40 $6.55 $196.50 $5.55 $166.50 $5.69 $170.70 $3.32 $99.60 $5.00 $150.00 $4.29 $128.70 $4.49 $134.70 $3.68 $110.40 $4.95 $148.50 $4.23 $126.90 $6.91 $207.30 $5.74
XXXL 1 EA $7.30 $7.30 $10.00 $10.00 $7.48 $7.48 $4.50 $4.50 $6.27 $6.27 no bid $4.96 $4.96 $3.82 $3.82 $3.55 $3.55 $5.49 $5.49 $7.75 $7.75 $4.25 $4.25 $8.06 $8.06 $4.53 $4.53 $5.28 $5.28 $4.08 $4.08 $4.98 $4.98 $6.98 $6.98 $6.55 $6.55 $5.65 $5.65 $5.87 $5.87 $3.32 $3.32 $5.00 $5.00 $4.45 $4.45 $4.55 $4.55 $3.68 $3.68 $5.05 $5.05 $4.35 $4.35 $6.91 $6.91 $5.74
XXXXL 1 EA $7.30 $7.30 $12.00 $12.00 $7.48 $7.48 $4.50 $4.50 $6.39 $6.39 no bid $5.08 $5.08 $3.82 $3.82 $3.65 $3.65 $6.49 $6.49 $8.75 $8.75 $4.25 $4.25 $8.26 $8.26 $4.53 $4.53 $5.28 $5.28 $4.08 $4.08 $5.17 $5.17 $8.00 $8.00 $6.55 $6.55 $5.75 $5.75 $6.02 $6.02 $3.32 $3.32 $5.00 $5.00 $4.50 $4.50 $4.75 $4.75 $3.68 $3.68 $5.15 $5.15 $4.45 $4.45 $6.91 $6.91 $5.74

ii. Spring Order: Total = 750 shirts
YS-YXL 750 EA $5.89 $4,417.50 $6.00 $4,500.00 $5.80 $4,350.00 $3.50 $2,625.00 $3.33 $2,497.50 no bid $3.15 $2,362.50 $2.51 $1,882.50 $2.95 $2,212.50 $3.49 $2,617.50 $5.00 $3,750.00 $2.95 $2,212.50 $3.90 $2,925.00 $3.63 $2,722.50 $3.60 $2,700.00 $2.92 $2,190.00 $3.32 $2,490.00 $3.64 $2,730.00 $4.45 $3,337.50 $3.95 $2,962.50 $3.80 $2,850.00 $3.39 $2,542.50 $4.00 $3,000.00 $3.45 $2,587.50 $3.25 $2,437.50 $3.68 $2,760.00 $3.45 $2,587.50 $2.97 $2,227.50 $4.31 $3,232.50 $4.03S 50 $5 89 $ , 50 $6 00 $ ,500 00 $5 80 $4,350.00 $3 50 $2,625.00 $3 33 $2,497.50 o b d $3 5 $2,362.50 $ 5 $1,882.50 $ 95 $2,212.50 $3 9 $2,617.50 $5 00 $3,750.00 $ 95 $2,212.50 $3 90 $ ,9 5 00 $3 63 $ , 50 $3 60 $ , 00 00 $ 9 $ , 90 00 $3 3 $ , 90 00 $3 6 $ , 30 00 $ 5 $3,337.50 $3 95 $2,962.50 $3 80 $2,850.00 $3 39 $2,542.50 $ 00 $3,000.00 $3 5 $2,587.50 $3 5 $2,437.50 $3 68 $2,760.00 $3 5 $2,587.50 $ 9 $2,227.50 $ 3 $3,232.50 $ 03

B. Two-Color Print:
i. Winter Order: Total =  1130 shirts

YS-YXL 580 EA $6.54 $3,793.20 $9.00 $5,220.00 $6.04 $3,503.20 $3.50 $2,030.00 $3.36 $1,948.80 no bid $3.47 $2,012.60 $2.56 $1,484.80 $3.25 $1,885.00 $3.29 $1,908.20 $5.60 $3,248.00 $3.15 $1,827.00 $6.03 $3,497.40 $4.03 $2,337.40 $3.65 $2,117.00 $2.97 $1,722.60 $3.54 $2,053.20 $3.89 $2,256.20 $4.70 $2,726.00 $4.00 $2,320.00 $3.85 $2,233.00 $3.51 $2,035.80 $4.50 $2,610.00 $3.50 $2,030.00 $3.70 $2,146.00 $4.29 $2,488.20 $3.45 $2,001.00 $3.07 $1,780.60 $5.92 $3,433.60 $4.09
AS-XL 407 EA $6.95 $2,828.65 $9.00 $3,663.00 $6.04 $2,458.28 $3.50 $1,424.50 $4.61 $1,876.27 no bid $3.63 $1,477.41 $2.48 $1,009.36 $3.15 $1,282.05 $3.29 $1,339.03 $5.60 $2,279.20 $3.30 $1,343.10 $6.80 $2,767.60 $4.03 $1,640.21 $3.72 $1,514.04 $2.97 $1,208.79 $3.88 $1,579.16 $5.23 $2,128.61 $6.80 $2,767.60 $4.14 $1,684.98 $3.71 $1,509.97 $3.51 $1,428.57 $5.50 $2,238.50 $3.35 $1,363.45 $3.75 $1,526.25 $4.29 $1,746.03 $3.60 $1,465.20 $2.98 $1,212.86 $5.92 $2,409.44 $4.34
XXL 141 EA $7.95 $1,120.95 $9.00 $1,269.00 $7.76 $1,094.16 $4.50 $634.50 $4.75 $669.75 no bid $5.17 $728.97 $3.87 $545.67 $3.35 $472.35 $4.29 $604.89 $7.70 $1,085.70 $4.50 $634.50 $8.66 $1,221.06 $5.03 $709.23 $5.60 $789.60 $4.40 $620.40 $5.23 $737.43 $7.23 $1,019.43 $6.80 $958.80 $5.75 $810.75 $5.74 $809.34 $3.51 $494.91 $5.50 $775.50 $4.45 $627.45 $4.94 $696.54 $4.29 $604.89 $5.10 $719.10 $4.33 $610.53 $7.18 $1,012.38 $5.80
XXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $11.00 $11.00 $7.76 $7.76 $4.50 $4.50 $4.87 $4.87 no bid $5.28 $5.28 $3.87 $3.87 $3.65 $3.65 $5.29 $5.29 $8.60 $8.60 $4.50 $4.50 $8.70 $8.70 $5.03 $5.03 $5.60 $5.60 $4.40 $4.40 $5.35 $5.35 $7.23 $7.23 $6.80 $6.80 $5.85 $5.85 $5.92 $5.92 $3.51 $3.51 $5.50 $5.50 $4.55 $4.55 $5.00 $5.00 $4.29 $4.29 $5.20 $5.20 $4.45 $4.45 $7.18 $7.18 $5.80
XXXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $11.00 $11.00 $7.76 $7.76 $4.00 $4.00 $4.92 $4.92 no bid $5.40 $5.40 $3.87 $3.87 $3.85 $3.85 $6.29 $6.29 $9.60 $9.60 $4.50 $4.50 $8.90 $8.90 $5.03 $5.03 $5.60 $5.60 $4.40 $4.40 $5.45 $5.45 $8.95 $8.95 $6.80 $6.80 $5.95 $5.95 $6.07 $6.07 $3.51 $3.51 $5.50 $5.50 $4.65 $4.65 $5.20 $5.20 $4.29 $4.29 $5.30 $5.30 $4.55 $4.55 $7.18 $7.18 $5.80

ii. Spring Order: Total = 330 shirts
YS-YXL 110 EA $6.54 $719.40 $9.00 $990.00 $6.15 $676.50 $3.50 $385.00 $3.70 $407.00 no bid $3.47 $381.70 $2.56 $281.60 $3.25 $357.50 $3.29 $361.90 $5.85 $643.50 $3.15 $346.50 $5.91 $650.10 $4.03 $443.30 $3.91 $430.10 $3.23 $355.30 $3.65 $401.50 $3.89 $427.90 $5.00 $550.00 $4.10 $451.00 $3.85 $423.50 $3.69 $405.90 $4.50 $495.00 $3.70 $407.00 $3.70 $407.00 $4.29 $471.90 $3.85 $423.50 $3.07 $337.70 $7.11 $782.10 $4.25
AS-XL 137 EA $6.95 $952.15 $9.00 $1,233.00 $6.15 $842.55 $3.50 $479.50 $4.96 $679.52 no bid $3.63 $497.31 $2.48 $339.76 $3.25 $445.25 $3.29 $450.73 $5.85 $801.45 $3.30 $452.10 $6.86 $939.82 $4.03 $552.11 $4.03 $552.11 $6.28 $860.36 $3.99 $546.63 $5.23 $716.51 $7.10 $972.70 $4.24 $580.88 $3.71 $508.27 $3.69 $505.53 $4.50 $616.50 $3.55 $486.35 $3.75 $513.75 $4.29 $587.73 $4.00 $548.00 $2.98 $408.26 $7.11 $974.07 $4.50
XXL 81 EA $7.95 $643.95 $9.00 $729.00 $7.88 $638.28 $4.50 $364.50 $5.10 $413.10 no bid $5.17 $418.77 $3.87 $313.47 $3.35 $271.35 $4.29 $347.49 $7.85 $635.85 $4.50 $364.50 $8.72 $706.32 $5.03 $407.43 $5.15 $417.15 $4.55 $368.55 $5.34 $432.54 $7.23 $585.63 $7.10 $575.10 $5.85 $473.85 $5.74 $464.94 $3.69 $298.89 $5.50 $445.50 $4.65 $376.65 $4.94 $400.14 $4.29 $347.49 $5.50 $445.50 $4.33 $350.73 $8.37 $677.97 $5.96
XXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $11.00 $11.00 $7.88 $7.88 $4.50 $4.50 $5.22 $5.22 no bid $5.28 $5.28 $3.87 $3.87 $3.65 $3.65 $5.29 $5.29 $8.85 $8.85 $4.50 $4.50 $8.76 $8.76 $5.03 $5.03 $5.75 $5.75 $4.55 $4.55 $5.46 $5.46 $7.23 $7.23 $7.10 $7.10 $5.95 $5.95 $5.92 $5.92 $3.69 $3.69 $5.50 $5.50 $4.75 $4.75 $5.00 $5.00 $4.29 $4.29 $5.60 $5.60 $4.45 $4.45 $8.37 $8.37 $5.96
XXXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $11.00 $11.00 $7.88 $7.88 $4.50 $4.50 $5.32 $5.32 no bid $5.40 $5.40 $3.87 $3.87 $3.85 $3.85 $6.29 $6.29 $9.85 $9.85 $4.50 $4.50 $8.95 $8.95 $5.03 $5.03 $5.75 $5.75 $4.55 $4.55 $5.56 $5.56 $8.95 $8.95 $7.10 $7.10 $6.05 $6.05 $6.07 $6.07 $3.69 $3.69 $5.50 $5.50 $4.85 $4.85 $5.20 $5.20 $4.29 $4.29 $5.70 $5.70 $4.55 $4.55 $8.37 $8.37 $5.96

iii. Summer Order: Total = 380 shirts
AS-XL 296 EA $6.95 $2,057.20 $9.00 $2,664.00 $6.15 $1,820.40 $3.50 $1,036.00 $4.96 $1,468.16 no bid $3.47 $1,027.12 $2.48 $734.08 $3.25 $962.00 $3.29 $973.84 $5.85 $1,731.60 $3.30 $976.80 $6.79 $2,009.84 $4.33 $1,281.68 $4.03 $1,192.88 $3.28 $970.88 $3.99 $1,181.04 $5.23 $1,548.08 $7.10 $2,101.60 $4.24 $1,255.04 $3.71 $1,098.16 $3.69 $1,092.24 $4.50 $1,332.00 $3.55 $1,050.80 $3.75 $1,110.00 $4.29 $1,269.84 $4.00 $1,184.00 $2.98 $882.08 $7.11 $2,104.56 $4.50
XXL 78 EA $7.95 $620.10 $9.00 $702.00 $7.88 $614.64 $3.50 $273.00 $5.10 $397.80 no bid $5.17 $403.26 $3.87 $301.86 $3.25 $253.50 $4.29 $334.62 $7.85 $612.30 $4.50 $351.00 $8.65 $674.70 $5.33 $415.74 $5.75 $448.50 $4.55 $354.90 $5.34 $416.52 $7.23 $563.94 $7.10 $553.80 $5.85 $456.30 $5.74 $447.72 $3.69 $287.82 $5.50 $429.00 $4.65 $362.70 $4.94 $385.32 $4.29 $334.62 $5.50 $429.00 $4.33 $337.74 $8.37 $652.86 $5.96
XXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $11.00 $11.00 $7.88 $7.88 $3.50 $3.50 $5.22 $5.22 no bid $5.28 $5.28 $3.87 $3.87 $3.55 $3.55 $5.29 $5.29 $8.85 $8.85 $4.50 $4.50 $8.69 $8.69 $5.33 $5.33 $5.75 $5.75 $4.55 $4.55 $5.46 $5.46 $7.23 $7.23 $7.10 $7.10 $5.95 $5.95 $5.92 $5.92 $3.69 $3.69 $5.50 $5.50 $4.75 $4.75 $5.00 $5.00 $4.29 $4.29 $5.60 $5.60 $4.45 $4.45 $8.37 $8.37 $5.96
XXXXL 5 EA $7.95 $39.75 $11.00 $55.00 $7.88 $39.40 $3.50 $17.50 $5.32 $26.60 no bid $5.48 $27.40 $3.87 $19.35 $3.75 $18.75 $6.29 $31.45 $9.85 $49.25 $4.50 $22.50 $8.89 $44.45 $5.33 $26.65 $5.75 $28.75 $4.55 $22.75 $5.56 $27.80 $8.95 $44.75 $7.10 $35.50 $6.05 $30.25 $6.07 $30.35 $3.69 $18.45 $5.50 $27.50 $4.85 $24.25 $5.20 $26.00 $4.29 $21.45 $5.70 $28.50 $4.55 $22.75 $8.37 $41.85 $5.96

iv. Fall Order: Total = 260 shirts
AS-XL 188 EA $6.95 $1,306.60 $9.00 $1,692.00 $6.15 $1,156.20 $3.50 $658.00 $4.96 $932.48 no bid $3.47 $652.36 $2.48 $466.24 $3.25 $611.00 $3.29 $618.52 $5.85 $1,099.80 $3.30 $620.40 $6.83 $1,284.04 $4.33 $814.04 $4.24 $797.12 $3.49 $656.12 $4.05 $761.40 $5.23 $983.24 $7.10 $1,334.80 $4.34 $815.92 $3.71 $697.48 $3.69 $693.72 $4.50 $846.00 $3.65 $686.20 $3.75 $705.00 $4.29 $806.52 $4.05 $761.40 $2.98 $560.24 $7.87 $1,479.56 $4.62
XXL 70 EA $7.95 $556.50 $9.00 $630.00 $7.88 $551.60 $4.50 $315.00 $5.10 $357.00 no bid $5.17 $361.90 $3.87 $270.90 $3.25 $227.50 $4.29 $300.30 $7.85 $549.50 $4.50 $315.00 $8.69 $608.30 $5.33 $373.10 $5.97 $417.90 $4.77 $333.90 $5.39 $377.30 $7.23 $506.10 $7.10 $497.00 $5.95 $416.50 $5.74 $401.80 $3.69 $258.30 $5.50 $385.00 $4.75 $332.50 $4.94 $345.80 $4.29 $300.30 $5.55 $388.50 $4.33 $303.10 $9.13 $639.10 $6.08
XXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $11.00 $11.00 $7.88 $7.88 $4.50 $4.50 $5.22 $5.22 no bid $5.28 $5.28 $3.87 $3.87 $3.55 $3.55 $5.29 $5.29 $8.85 $8.85 $4.50 $4.50 $8.73 $8.73 $5.33 $5.33 $5.97 $5.97 $4.77 $4.77 $5.51 $5.51 $7.23 $7.23 $7.10 $7.10 $6.05 $6.05 $5.92 $5.92 $3.69 $3.69 $5.50 $5.50 $4.80 $4.80 $5.00 $5.00 $4.29 $4.29 $5.65 $5.65 $4.45 $4.45 $9.13 $9.13 $6.08
XXXXL 1 EA $7.95 $7.95 $11.00 $11.00 $7.88 $7.88 $4.50 $4.50 $5.32 $5.32 no bid $5.48 $5.48 $3.87 $3.87 $3.75 $3.75 $6.29 $6.29 $9.85 $9.85 $4.50 $4.50 $8.93 $8.93 $5.33 $5.33 $5.97 $5.97 $4.77 $4.77 $5.61 $5.61 $8.95 $8.95 $7.10 $7.10 $6.15 $6.15 $6.07 $6.07 $3.69 $3.69 $5.50 $5.50 $4.95 $4.95 $5.20 $5.20 $4.29 $4.29 $5.75 $5.75 $4.55 $4.55 $9.13 $9.13 $6.08

C. Three-Color Print:
i. Winter Order: Total =  330 shirts

AS XL 309 EA $7 60 $2 348 40 $12 00 $3 708 00 $6 85 $2 116 65 $3 75 $1 158 75 $3 86 $1 192 74 no bid $4 06 $1 254 54 $2 53 $781 77 $3 45 $1 066 05 $3 49 $1 078 41 $6 15 $1 900 35 $3 45 $1 066 05 $7 45 $2 302 05 $4 43 $1 368 87 $4 13 $1 276 17 $3 38 $1 044 42 $4 05 $1 251 45 $5 48 $1 693 32 $8 50 $2 626 50 $4 54 $1 402 86 $3 77 $1 164 93 $4 24 $1 310 16 $5 00 $1 545 00 $3 93 $1 214 37 $4 15 $1 282 35 $4 80 $1 483 20 $4 25 $1 313 25 $3 13 $967 17 $8 87 $2 740 83 $4 55AS-XL 309 EA $7.60 $2,348.40 $12.00 $3,708.00 $6.85 $2,116.65 $3.75 $1,158.75 $3.86 $1,192.74 no bid $4.06 $1,254.54 $2.53 $781.77 $3.45 $1,066.05 $3.49 $1,078.41 $6.15 $1,900.35 $3.45 $1,066.05 $7.45 $2,302.05 $4.43 $1,368.87 $4.13 $1,276.17 $3.38 $1,044.42 $4.05 $1,251.45 $5.48 $1,693.32 $8.50 $2,626.50 $4.54 $1,402.86 $3.77 $1,164.93 $4.24 $1,310.16 $5.00 $1,545.00 $3.93 $1,214.37 $4.15 $1,282.35 $4.80 $1,483.20 $4.25 $1,313.25 $3.13 $967.17 $8.87 $2,740.83 $4.55
XXL 15 EA $8.60 $129.00 $12.00 $180.00 $8.57 $128.55 $4.75 $71.25 $5.11 $76.65 no bid $5.60 $84.00 $3.92 $58.80 $3.55 $53.25 $4.49 $67.35 $8.15 $122.25 $4.75 $71.25 $9.31 $139.65 $5.43 $81.45 $5.86 $87.90 $4.66 $69.90 $5.37 $80.55 $7.48 $112.20 $8.50 $127.50 $6.15 $92.25 $5.80 $87.00 $4.24 $63.60 $6.00 $90.00 $4.99 $74.85 $5.30 $79.50 $4.80 $72.00 $5.75 $86.25 $4.48 $67.20 $10.13 $151.95 $6.01
XXXL 5 EA $8.60 $43.00 $14.00 $70.00 $8.57 $42.85 $4.75 $23.75 $5.25 $26.25 no bid $5.71 $28.55 $3.92 $19.60 $3.75 $18.75 $5.49 $27.45 $9.15 $45.75 $4.75 $23.75 $9.35 $46.75 $5.43 $27.15 $5.86 $29.30 $4.66 $23.30 $5.48 $27.40 $7.48 $37.40 $8.50 $42.50 $6.25 $31.25 $5.98 $29.90 $4.24 $21.20 $6.00 $30.00 $5.20 $26.00 $5.45 $27.25 $4.80 $24.00 $5.85 $29.25 $4.60 $23.00 $10.13 $50.65 $6.01
XXXXL 1 EA $8.60 $8.60 $14.00 $14.00 $8.57 $8.57 $4.75 $4.75 $5.37 $5.37 no bid $5.83 $5.83 $3.92 $3.92 $3.95 $3.95 $6.49 $6.49 $10.15 $10.15 $4.75 $4.75 $9.55 $9.55 $5.43 $5.43 $5.86 $5.86 $4.66 $4.66 $5.58 $5.58 $9.00 $9.00 $8.50 $8.50 $6.35 $6.35 $6.13 $6.13 $4.24 $4.24 $6.00 $6.00 $5.40 $5.40 $5.80 $5.80 $4.80 $4.80 $5.95 $5.95 $4.70 $4.70 $10.13 $10.13 $6.01

ii. Spring Order: Total =  410 shirts
YS-YXL 410 EA $7.19 $2,947.90 $12.00 $4,920.00 $6.85 $2,808.50 $3.75 $1,537.50 $3.86 $1,582.60 no bid $3.90 $1,599.00 $2.61 $1,070.10 $3.35 $1,373.50 $3.49 $1,430.90 $6.15 $2,521.50 $3.30 $1,353.00 $5.67 $2,324.70 $4.43 $1,816.30 $4.02 $1,648.20 $3.34 $1,369.40 $3.77 $1,545.70 $4.14 $1,697.40 $5.50 $2,255.00 $4.40 $1,804.00 $3.91 $1,603.10 $3.97 $1,627.70 $5.00 $2,050.00 $4.09 $1,676.90 $4.10 $1,681.00 $4.80 $1,968.00 $4.10 $1,681.00 $3.22 $1,320.20 $8.55 $3,505.50 $4.30

iii. Summer Order: Total =  360 shirts
AS-XL 339 EA $7.60 $2,576.40 $12.00 $4,068.00 $6.85 $2,322.15 $3.75 $1,271.25 $3.86 $1,308.54 no bid $4.06 $1,376.34 $2.53 $857.67 $3.45 $1,169.55 $3.49 $1,183.11 $6.15 $2,084.85 $3.45 $1,169.55 $7.43 $2,518.77 $4.43 $1,501.77 $4.13 $1,400.07 $3.38 $1,145.82 $4.10 $1,389.90 $5.48 $1,857.72 $8.50 $2,881.50 $4.54 $1,539.06 $3.77 $1,278.03 $3.97 $1,345.83 $5.00 $1,695.00 $3.93 $1,332.27 $4.15 $1,406.85 $4.80 $1,627.20 $4.25 $1,440.75 $3.13 $1,061.07 $8.85 $3,000.15 $4.55
XXL 15 EA $8.60 $129.00 $12.00 $180.00 $8.57 $128.55 $3.75 $56.25 $5.11 $76.65 no bid $5.60 $84.00 $3.92 $58.80 $3.55 $53.25 $4.49 $67.35 $8.15 $122.25 $4.75 $71.25 $9.29 $139.35 $5.43 $81.45 $5.86 $87.90 $4.66 $69.90 $5.45 $81.75 $7.48 $112.20 $8.50 $127.50 $6.15 $92.25 $5.80 $87.00 $3.97 $59.55 $6.00 $90.00 $4.99 $74.85 $5.30 $79.50 $4.80 $72.00 $5.75 $86.25 $4.48 $67.20 $10.11 $151.65 $6.01
XXXL 5 EA $8 60 $43 00 $14 00 $70 00 $8 57 $42 85 $3 75 $18 75 $5 25 $26 25 no bid $5 71 $28 55 $3 92 $19 60 $3 85 $19 25 $5 49 $27 45 $9 15 $45 75 $4 75 $23 75 $9 33 $46 65 $5 43 $27 15 $5 86 $29 30 $4 66 $23 30 $5 57 $27 85 $7 48 $37 40 $8 50 $42 50 $6 25 $31 25 $5 98 $29 90 $3 97 $19 85 $6 00 $30 00 $5 20 $26 00 $5 45 $27 25 $4 80 $24 00 $5 85 $29 25 $4 60 $23 00 $10 11 $50 55 $6 01XXXL 5 EA $8.60 $43.00 $14.00 $70.00 $8.57 $42.85 $3.75 $18.75 $5.25 $26.25 no bid $5.71 $28.55 $3.92 $19.60 $3.85 $19.25 $5.49 $27.45 $9.15 $45.75 $4.75 $23.75 $9.33 $46.65 $5.43 $27.15 $5.86 $29.30 $4.66 $23.30 $5.57 $27.85 $7.48 $37.40 $8.50 $42.50 $6.25 $31.25 $5.98 $29.90 $3.97 $19.85 $6.00 $30.00 $5.20 $26.00 $5.45 $27.25 $4.80 $24.00 $5.85 $29.25 $4.60 $23.00 $10.11 $50.55 $6.01
XXXXL 1 EA $8.60 $8.60 $14.00 $14.00 $8.57 $8.57 $3.75 $3.75 $5.37 $5.37 no bid $5.83 $5.83 $3.92 $3.92 $3.95 $3.95 $6.49 $6.49 $10.15 $10.15 $4.75 $4.75 $9.53 $9.53 $5.43 $5.43 $5.86 $5.86 $4.66 $4.66 $5.67 $5.67 $9.00 $9.00 $8.50 $8.50 $6.35 $6.35 $6.13 $6.13 $3.97 $3.97 $6.00 $6.00 $5.40 $5.40 $5.80 $5.80 $4.80 $4.80 $5.95 $5.95 $4.70 $4.70 $10.11 $10.11 $6.01

iv. Fall Order: Total =  310 shirts
AS-XL 282 EA $7.60 $2,143.20 $12.00 $3,384.00 $6.85 $1,931.70 $3.75 $1,057.50 $3.86 $1,088.52 no bid $4.06 $1,144.92 $2.53 $713.46 $3.45 $972.90 $3.49 $984.18 $6.15 $1,734.30 $3.45 $972.90 $7.45 $2,100.90 $4.43 $1,249.26 $4.24 $1,195.68 $3.49 $984.18 $4.10 $1,156.20 $5.48 $1,545.36 $8.50 $2,397.00 $4.54 $1,280.28 $3.77 $1,063.14 $3.98 $1,122.36 $5.00 $1,410.00 $3.93 $1,108.26 $4.15 $1,170.30 $4.80 $1,353.60 $4.25 $1,198.50 $3.13 $882.66 $8.93 $2,518.26 $4.55
XXL 22 EA $8.60 $189.20 $12.00 $264.00 $8.57 $188.54 $3.75 $82.50 $5.11 $112.42 no bid $5.60 $123.20 $3.92 $86.24 $3.55 $78.10 $4.49 $98.78 $8.15 $179.30 $4.75 $104.50 $9.31 $204.82 $5.43 $119.46 $5.97 $131.34 $4.77 $104.94 $5.45 $119.90 $7.48 $164.56 $8.50 $187.00 $6.15 $135.30 $5.80 $127.60 $3.98 $87.56 $6.00 $132.00 $4.99 $109.78 $5.30 $116.60 $4.80 $105.60 $5.75 $126.50 $4.48 $98.56 $10.19 $224.18 $6.01
XXXL 5 EA $8.60 $43.00 $14.00 $70.00 $8.57 $42.85 $3.75 $18.75 $5.25 $26.25 no bid $5.71 $28.55 $3.92 $19.60 $3.85 $19.25 $5.49 $27.45 $9.15 $45.75 $4.75 $23.75 $9.35 $46.75 $5.43 $27.15 $5.97 $29.85 $4.77 $23.85 $5.57 $27.85 $7.48 $37.40 $8.50 $42.50 $6.25 $31.25 $5.98 $29.90 $3.98 $19.90 $6.00 $30.00 $5.20 $26.00 $5.45 $27.25 $4.80 $24.00 $5.85 $29.25 $4.60 $23.00 $10.19 $50.95 $6.01
XXXXL 1 EA $8.60 $8.60 $14.00 $14.00 $8.57 $8.57 $3.75 $3.75 $5.37 $5.37 no bid $5.83 $5.83 $3.92 $3.92 $3.95 $3.95 $6.49 $6.49 $10.15 $10.15 $4.75 $4.75 $9.55 $9.55 $5.43 $5.43 $5.97 $5.97 $4.77 $4.77 $5.67 $5.67 $9.00 $9.00 $8.50 $8.50 $6.35 $6.35 $6.13 $6.13 $3.98 $3.98 $6.00 $6.00 $5.40 $5.40 $5.80 $5.80 $4.80 $4.80 $5.95 $5.95 $4.70 $4.70 $10.19 $10.19 $6.01

6. Special Orders
A. Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirts (AS-XL) 50 EA $14.95 $747.50 $21.00 $1,050.00 $20.64 $1,032.00 $7.50 $375.00 $11.51 $575.50 $14.80 $740.00 $14.88 $744.00 $16.30 $815.00 $14.85 $742.50 $17.95 $897.50 $25.89 $1,294.50 $17.00 $850.00 $24.87 $1,243.50 $14.70 $735.00 $20.75 $1,037.50 $20.75 $1,037.50 $18.48 $924.00 $18.90 $945.00 $42.00 $2,100.00 $13.94 $697.00 $24.49 $1,224.50 $17.60 $880.00 $19.50 $975.00 $22.75 $1,137.50 $16.99 $849.50 $19.50 $975.00 $18.45 $922.50 $21.00 $1,050.00 $23.11 $1,155.50 $22.81A. Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirts (AS XL) 50 EA $14.95 $747.50 $21.00 $1,050.00 $20.64 $1,032.00 $7.50 $375.00 $11.51 $575.50 $14.80 $740.00 $14.88 $744.00 $16.30 $815.00 $14.85 $742.50 $17.95 $897.50 $25.89 $1,294.50 $17.00 $850.00 $24.87 $1,243.50 $14.70 $735.00 $20.75 $1,037.50 $20.75 $1,037.50 $18.48 $924.00 $18.90 $945.00 $42.00 $2,100.00 $13.94 $697.00 $24.49 $1,224.50 $17.60 $880.00 $19.50 $975.00 $22.75 $1,137.50 $16.99 $849.50 $19.50 $975.00 $18.45 $922.50 $21.00 $1,050.00 $23.11 $1,155.50 $22.81

Extra charge for XXL 1 EA $15.95 $21.00 $3.00 $0.00 $15.27 $16.80 $2.95 $3.11 $15.85 $18.95 $27.89 $19.25 $3.34 $17.39 $21.95 $21.95 $19.69 $2.00 $42.00 $1.50 $2.09 $0.00 $20.50 $24.25 $18.99 $0.00 $2.00 $2.00 - $6.03
Extra charge for XXXL 1 EA $15.95 $25.00 $4.00 $0.00 $16.00 $18.80 $4.00 $4.89 $16.85 $19.95 $28.89 $19.25 $5.81 $17.69 $24.15 $24.15 $21.78 $2.00 $42.00 $2.50 $2.23 $0.00 $22.50 $24.50 $19.99 $0.00 $3.00 $3.00 - $6.03
Extra charge for XXXXL 1 EA $15.95 $30.00 $5.00 $0.00 $16.50 $19.80 $4.00 n/a $17.85 $20.95 $29.89 $19.25 - $18.69 $25.27 $25.27 $23.16 $3.00 $42.00 $3.50 $5.00 $0.00 $23.50 $24.70 n/a $0.00 $4.00 $4.00 - $6.03

B. Crewneck 100 EA $9.88 $988.00 $12.00 $1,200.00 $12.08 $1,208.00 $5.50 $550.00 $10.40 $1,040.00 $8.25 $825.00 $9.16 $916.00 $6.19 $619.00 $9.95 $995.00 $8.95 $895.00 $13.00 $1,300.00 $7.50 $750.00 $11.37 $1,137.00 $7.44 $744.00 $11.75 $1,175.00 $11.75 $1,175.00 $9.63 $963.00 $9.65 $965.00 $12.70 $1,270.00 $8.52 $852.00 $9.15 $915.00 $10.35 $1,035.00 $14.25 $1,425.00 $9.97 $997.00 $9.10 $910.00 $14.00 $1,400.00 $11.45 $1,145.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $10.38 $1,038.00 $11.39
Extra charge for XXL 1 EA $10.88 $14.00 $3.00 $0.00 $11.03 $10.25 $1.77 $3.07 $10.95 $9.95 $15.00 $9.00 $3.59 $8.96 $12.25 $12.25 $10.84 $2.00 $13.70 $1.83 $3.02 $0.00 $15.50 $11.00 $11.25 $0.00 $2.00 $1.05 - $2.00
Extra charge for XXXL 1 EA $10.88 $16.00 $4.00 $0.00 $11.79 $11.00 $2.04 $3.07 $11.95 $10.95 $16.00 $9.00 $3.59 $8.96 $13.35 $13.35 $11.66 $2.00 $13.70 $2.08 $3.18 $0.00 $15.50 $11.25 $11.75 $0.00 $3.00 $1.55 - $2.00
Extra charge for XXXXL 1 EA $10.88 $17.00 $5.00 $0.00 $12.15 $11.25 $2.37 n/a $12.95 $11.95 $17.00 $9.00 - $10.96 $13.65 $13.65 $11.94 $3.00 $13.70 $2.58 $5.60 $0.00 $15.50 $11.40 $12.75 $0.00 $4.00 $2.55 - $4.00

C. Chore Coat 30 EA $59.95 $1,798.50 $70.00 $2,100.00 $55.20 $1,656.00 $7.00 $210.00 $81.95 $2,458.50 no bid $36.68 $1,100.40 $34.74 $1,042.20 $58.95 $1,768.50 $46.99 $1,409.70 $61.00 $1,830.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $85.99 $2,579.70 $59.90 $1,797.00 $44.50 $1,335.00 $44.50 $1,335.00 $55.00 $1,650.00 $49.95 $1,498.50 $72.60 $2,178.00 $45.00 $1,350.00 $76.84 $2,305.20 $44.81 $1,344.30 $35.50 $1,065.00 $39.50 $1,185.00 no bid - $46.00 $1,380.00 $52.95 $1,588.50 $44.00 $1,320.00 $45.31 $1,359.30 $40.72
Extra charge for XXL 1 EA $61.95 $80.00 $3.00 $0.00 $81.95 no bid $3.34 $1.50 $68.95 $47.99 $63.00 $62.25 $7.40 $59.90 $46.67 $46.67 $56.65 $2.00 $75.70 $5.00 $7.50 $0.00 $35.50 $40.50 n/a $0.00 $2.00 $1.00 - $5.00
Extra charge for XXXL 1 EA $61.95 $85.00 $4.00 $0.00 $81.95 no bid $3.34 $3.00 $68.95 $48.99 $64.00 $65.00 $7.40 $59.90 $48.89 $48.89 $58.30 $4.00 $78.90 $7.00 $7.50 $0.00 $38.50 $41.50 n/a $0.00 $4.00 $3.00 - $6.75
Extra charge for XXXXL 1 EA $61.95 $95.00 $5.00 $0.00 $81.95 no bid $6.67 n/a $78.95 $49.99 $65.00 $65.00 - $59.90 $51.10 $51.10 $60.17 $6.00 $82.00 $8.00 $15.00 $0.00 $38.50 $42.50 n/a $0.00 $6.00 $4.00 - $8.00

Vendor offers a ____________%  Discount off Catalog Items not listed on the Price 
Sheet % off 0.00% 10% - 15% 10.00% 45.00% 20.00% n/a 20.00% 30.00% 0.00% 40.00% 10.00% 15.00% 17.50% 5.00% 0.00% 0.00% 0.00% 12.00% 0.00% 30.00% 15.00% 30.00% - 25.00% 15.00% 20.00% 10.00% 10.00% - 35.10%

The City requires delivery within 10 days from date of order
Vendor offers delivery within days from date of order DAYS 10 14 8 10 10 10 10 10-15 10 10 10 12 10 10 10 10 10 14 9 10 10 - 10 10 10 10 10 10 10      Vendor offers delivery within _______ days from date of order DAYS 10 14 8 10 10 10 10 10-15 10 10 10 12 10 10 10 10 10 14 9 10 10 - 10 10 10 10 10 10 10

City requires vendor to deliver reprints/add-ons within 48 hours of order
      Vendor offers ______ hours for reprints/add-ons HRS 48 96 48 48 48 72 48 96+ 48 48 48 288 48 96 96 48 48 48 48 48 48 - 48 48 48 48 48 - 48

Subtotal $60,397.10 $71,413.00 $59,191.86 $33,305.80 $37,648.53 $8,947.00 $34,435.76 $25,682.43 $31,230.85 $32,825.70 $52,225.10 $31,331.40 $54,933.80 $38,050.00 $37,347.77 $32,493.07 $36,967.01 $42,834.30 $53,492.97 $40,272.69 $41,047.38 $36,000.30 $42,536.75 $35,578.84 $33,250.22 $39,019.70 $38,103.55 $31,950.91 $60,760.78

Tax Rate ________% Taxes: 6.30% $4,499.02 n/a n/a 6.30% $2,371.86 8.10% $724.71 6.10% $2,100.58 n/a n/a 1.00% 8.80% $4,595.81 8.50% $2,663.17 7.95% $4,367.24 n/a n/a n/a 8.25% $3,049.78 n/a use tax 8.30% $3,342.63 8.30% $3,406.93 8.10% $2,916.02 8.30% $3,530.55 8.10% $2,881.89 8.50% $2,826.27 8.30% $3,238.64 8.10% $3,086.39 8.10% $2,588.02 n/a 8.50%

Grand Total: $75,912.02 $59,191.86 $33,305.80 $40,020.39 $9,671.71 $36,536.34 $25,682.43 $31,230.85 $32,825.70 $56,820.91 $33,994.57 $59,301.04 $38,050.00 $37,347.77 $32,493.07 $40,016.79 $42,834.30 $53,492.97 $43,615.32 $44,454.31 $38,916.32 $46,067.30 $38,460.73 $36,076.49 $42,258.34 $41,189.94 $34,538.93 $60,760.78



Q10-03, T-Shirts
Bid Tabulation

Item No D i ti Qt U it E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i U it P i E t P i

Commotion 
Promotions, Ltd. HP2, Inc

Ameripride Linen & 
Apparel ServicesHP2, Inc (bid alternate)

Won Promos 
LLC Suncraft

Quality Won Promos LLC (bid 
alternate) Creative Concepts

Item No. Description Qty Unit
1. Staff Short Sleeve T-Shirts

A. Winter Order:  Total = 510 shirts
AS-XL 452 EA
XXL 55 EA
XXXL 2 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

B. Spring Order:  Total = 110 shirts
AS-XL 86 EA
XXL 22 EA

Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

ALTERNATE TO HANES COLORS WHITES
$1,957.16 $3.83 $1,731.16 $4.65 $2,101.80 $5.83 $2,635.16 $3.85 $1,740.20 $3.81 $1,722.12 $3.07 $1,387.64 $3.54 $1,600.08

$318.45 $5.29 $290.95 $6.25 $343.75 $7.77 $427.35 $5.45 $299.75 $5.81 $319.55 $5.07 $278.85 $3.54 $194.70
$11.58 $5.29 $10.58 $6.40 $12.80 $7.81 $15.62 $5.50 $11.00 $6.81 $13.62 $6.07 $12.14 $3.54 $7.08
$5.79 $5.29 $5.29 $6.50 $6.50 $7.99 $7.99 $5.65 $5.65 $7.81 $7.81 $7.07 $7.07 $3.54 $3.54

$378.40 $4.00 $344.00 $5.00 $430.00 $5.83 $501.38 $4.40 $378.40 $3.81 $327.66 $3.07 $264.02 $3.54 $304.44
$128 92 $5 48 $120 56 $6 95 $152 90 $7 77 $170 94 $6 00 $132 00 $5 81 $127 82 $5 07 $111 54 $3 54 $77 88XXL 22 EA

XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

C. Summer Order:  Total = 170 shirts
AS-XL 167 EA
XXL 1 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

2. Staff Long Sleeve T-Shirts

$128.92 $5.48 $120.56 $6.95 $152.90 $7.77 $170.94 $6.00 $132.00 $5.81 $127.82 $5.07 $111.54 $3.54 $77.88
$5.86 $5.48 $5.48 $7.20 $7.20 $7.81 $7.81 $6.10 $6.10 $6.81 $6.81 $6.07 $6.07 $3.54 $3.54
$5.86 $5.48 $5.48 $7.30 $7.30 $7.99 $7.99 $6.20 $6.20 $7.81 $7.81 $7.07 $7.07 $3.54 $3.54

$734.80 $4.00 $668.00 $4.75 $793.25 $5.83 $973.61 $4.15 $693.05 $3.81 $636.27 $3.07 $512.69 $3.54 $591.18
$5.86 $5.48 $5.48 $6.75 $6.75 $7.77 $7.77 $5.75 $5.75 $5.81 $5.81 $5.07 $5.07 $3.54 $3.54
$5.86 $5.48 $5.48 $7.00 $7.00 $7.81 $7.81 $5.85 $5.85 $6.81 $6.81 $6.07 $6.07 $3.54 $3.54
$5.86 $5.48 $5.48 $7.10 $7.10 $7.99 $7.99 $5.95 $5.95 $7.81 $7.81 $7.07 $7.07 $3.54 $3.54

2. Staff Long Sleeve T Shirts
A. Winter Order – Total = 40 shirts

AS-XL 26 EA
XXL 12 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

B. Fall Order – Total = 310 shirts
AS-XL 293 EA
XXL 15 EA
XXXL 1 EA

$183.56 $6.34 $164.84 $7.75 $201.50 $9.13 $237.38 $6.90 $179.40 $5.91 $153.66 $5.12 $133.12 $6.10 $158.60
$99.84 $8.25 $99.00 $8.75 $105.00 $9.77 $117.24 $8.70 $104.40 $7.91 $94.92 $7.12 $85.44 $6.10 $73.20
$8.32 $8.25 $8.25 $9.00 $9.00 $9.95 $9.95 $9.25 $9.25 $8.91 $8.91 $8.12 $8.12 $6.10 $6.10
$8.32 $8.25 $8.25 $10.25 $10.25 $10.21 $10.21 $9.95 $9.95 $9.91 $9.91 $9.12 $9.12 $6.10 $6.10

$2,045.14 $6.34 $1,857.62 $7.50 $2,197.50 $9.13 $2,675.09 $6.05 $1,772.65 $5.91 $1,731.63 $5.12 $1,500.16 $6.10 $1,787.30
$123.30 $8.25 $123.75 $8.50 $127.50 $9.77 $146.55 $8.15 $122.25 $7.91 $118.65 $7.12 $106.80 $6.10 $91.50

$8.22 $8.25 $8.25 $8.75 $8.75 $9.95 $9.95 $8.70 $8.70 $8.91 $8.91 $8.12 $8.12 $6.10 $6.10
XXXXL 1 EA

3. Staff Tank Top Shirts
A. Winter Order – Total = 110 shirts

AS-XL 107 EA
XXL 1 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

B. Spring Order – Total = 110 shirts

$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
$8.22 $8.25 $8.25 $10.00 $10.00 $10.21 $10.21 $9.05 $9.05 $9.91 $9.91 $9.12 $9.12 $6.10 $6.10

$499.69 $4.67 $499.69 $4.55 $486.85 $9.13 $976.91 $5.00 $535.00 $4.49 $480.43 $3.92 $419.44 $5.37 $574.59
$5.74 $5.74 $5.74 $5.70 $5.70 $9.77 $9.77 $6.20 $6.20 $6.49 $6.49 $5.92 $5.92 $5.37 $5.37
$7.74 $7.74 $7.74 $6.00 $6.00 $9.95 $9.95 n/a n/a n/a $5.37 $5.37
$9.74 $9.74 $9.74 $7.00 $7.00 $10.21 $10.21 n/a n/a n/a n/a

AS-XL 73 EA
XXL 35 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

4. Program Short Sleeve T-Shirts 

Vendor shall indicate extra charge for single color print on back of program 
shirts (including artwork and screen fees here:  $_________/each. EA

$340.91 $4.67 $340.91 $4.85 $354.05 $5.48 $400.04 $5.00 $365.00 $4.49 $327.77 $3.92 $286.16 $5.37 $392.01
$200.90 $5.74 $200.90 $6.00 $210.00 $6.97 $243.95 $6.20 $217.00 $6.49 $227.15 $5.92 $207.20 $5.37 $187.95

$7.74 $7.74 $7.74 $6.30 $6.30 $7.47 $7.47 n/a n/a n/a $5.37 $5.37
$9.74 $9.74 $9.74 $7.30 $7.30 $7.73 $7.73 n/a n/a n/a n/a

$0.57 $0.40 - $0.40 $0.63 $0.63 $0.70

A. One-Color Print
i. Winter Order: Total = 2850 shirts

YS-YXL 2500 EA
AS-XL 318 EA
XXL 30 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

ii. Spring Order: Total = 750 shirts
YS-YXL 750 EA

$10,075.00 $3.79 $9,475.00 $3.70 $9,250.00 $4.40 $11,000.00 $2.85 $7,125.00 $3.07 $7,675.00 $2.47 $6,175.00 $4.75 $11,875.00
$1,361.04 $3.90 $1,240.20 $3.75 $1,192.50 $4.76 $1,513.68 $3.20 $1,017.60 $3.18 $1,011.24 $2.44 $775.92 $4.89 $1,555.02

$172.20 $5.36 $160.80 $5.80 $174.00 $6.71 $201.30 $4.70 $141.00 $5.18 $155.40 $4.44 $133.20 $4.89 $146.70
$5.74 $5.36 $5.36 $5.95 $5.95 $6.75 $6.75 $4.80 $4.80 $6.18 $6.18 $5.44 $5.44 $4.89 $4.89
$5.74 $5.36 $5.36 $6.10 $6.10 $6.92 $6.92 $4.90 $4.90 $7.18 $7.18 $6.44 $6.44 $4.89 $4.89

$3,022.50 $3.79 $2,842.50 $3.80 $2,850.00 $4.16 $3,120.00 $2.90 $2,175.00 $3.07 $2,302.50 $2.47 $1,852.50 $4.75 $3,562.50S 50

B. Two-Color Print:
i. Winter Order: Total =  1130 shirts

YS-YXL 580 EA
AS-XL 407 EA
XXL 141 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

ii. Spring Order: Total = 330 shirts

$3,022.50 $3 9 $2,842.50 $3 80 $2,850.00 $ 6 $3,120.00 $ 90 $2,175.00 $3 0 $2,302.50 $ $1,852.50 $ 5 $3,562.50

$2,372.20 $3.85 $2,233.00 $3.75 $2,175.00 $4.60 $2,668.00 $3.10 $1,798.00 $3.15 $1,827.00 $2.55 $1,479.00 $4.75 $2,755.00
$1,766.38 $3.96 $1,611.72 $3.85 $1,566.95 $4.90 $1,994.30 $3.50 $1,424.50 $3.26 $1,326.82 $2.53 $1,029.71 $4.89 $1,990.23

$817.80 $5.42 $764.22 $5.85 $824.85 $6.91 $974.31 $5.05 $712.05 $5.26 $741.66 $4.53 $638.73 $4.89 $689.49
$5.80 $5.42 $5.42 $6.00 $6.00 $6.95 $6.95 $5.15 $5.15 $6.26 $6.26 $5.53 $5.53 $4.89 $4.89
$5.80 $5.42 $5.42 $6.15 $6.15 $7.12 $7.12 $5.25 $5.25 $7.26 $7.26 $6.53 $6.53 $4.89 $4.89

YS-YXL 110 EA
AS-XL 137 EA
XXL 81 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

iii. Summer Order: Total = 380 shirts
AS-XL 296 EA
XXL 78 EA
XXXL 1 EA

$467.50 $3.85 $423.50 $3.95 $434.50 $4.60 $506.00 $3.15 $346.50 $3.15 $346.50 $2.55 $280.50 $4.75 $522.50
$616.50 $3.96 $542.52 $4.05 $554.85 $4.96 $679.52 $3.55 $486.35 $3.26 $446.62 $2.53 $346.61 $4.89 $669.93
$482.76 $5.42 $439.02 $6.00 $486.00 $6.91 $559.71 $5.15 $417.15 $5.26 $426.06 $4.53 $366.93 $4.89 $396.09

$5.96 $5.42 $5.42 $6.15 $6.15 $6.95 $6.95 $5.25 $5.25 $6.26 $6.26 $5.53 $5.53 $4.89 $4.89
$5.96 $5.42 $5.42 $6.30 $6.30 $7.12 $7.12 $5.35 $5.35 $7.26 $7.26 $6.53 $6.53 $4.89 $4.89

$1,332.00 $3.96 $1,172.16 $3.95 $1,169.20 $4.96 $1,468.16 $3.55 $1,050.80 $3.26 $964.96 $2.53 $748.88 $4.89 $1,447.44
$464.88 $5.42 $422.76 $4.05 $315.90 $6.91 $538.98 $5.15 $401.70 $5.26 $410.28 $4.53 $353.34 $4.89 $381.42

$5.96 $5.42 $5.42 $6.00 $6.00 $6.95 $6.95 $5.25 $5.25 $6.26 $6.26 $5.53 $5.53 $4.89 $4.89
XXXXL 5 EA

iv. Fall Order: Total = 260 shirts
AS-XL 188 EA
XXL 70 EA
XXXL 1 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

C. Three-Color Print:
i. Winter Order: Total =  330 shirts

AS XL 309 EA

$29.80 $5.42 $27.10 $6.15 $30.75 $7.12 $35.60 $5.35 $26.75 $7.26 $36.30 $6.53 $32.65 $4.89 $24.45

$868.56 $3.96 $744.48 $4.10 $770.80 $4.96 $932.48 $3.75 $705.00 $3.26 $612.88 $2.53 $475.64 $4.89 $919.32
$425.60 $5.42 $379.40 $4.20 $294.00 $6.91 $483.70 $5.30 $371.00 $5.26 $368.20 $4.53 $317.10 $4.89 $342.30

$6.08 $5.42 $5.42 $6.15 $6.15 $6.95 $6.95 $5.40 $5.40 $6.26 $6.26 $5.53 $5.53 $4.89 $4.89
$6.08 $5.42 $5.42 $6.30 $6.30 $7.12 $7.12 $5.50 $5.50 $7.26 $7.26 $6.53 $6.53 $4.89 $4.89

$1 405 95 $4 17 $1 288 53 $4 00 $1 236 00 $5 16 $1 594 44 $3 75 $1 158 75 $3 34 $1 032 06 $2 60 $803 40 $4 89 $1 511 01AS-XL 309 EA
XXL 15 EA
XXXL 5 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

ii. Spring Order: Total =  410 shirts
YS-YXL 410 EA

iii. Summer Order: Total =  360 shirts
AS-XL 339 EA
XXL 15 EA
XXXL 5 EA

$1,405.95 $4.17 $1,288.53 $4.00 $1,236.00 $5.16 $1,594.44 $3.75 $1,158.75 $3.34 $1,032.06 $2.60 $803.40 $4.89 $1,511.01
$90.15 $5.63 $84.45 $4.25 $63.75 $7.11 $106.65 $5.30 $79.50 $5.34 $80.10 $4.60 $69.00 $4.89 $73.35
$30.05 $5.63 $28.15 $6.25 $31.25 $7.15 $35.75 $5.40 $27.00 $6.34 $31.70 $5.60 $28.00 $4.89 $24.45
$6.01 $5.63 $5.63 $6.40 $6.40 $7.32 $7.32 $5.50 $5.50 $7.34 $7.34 $6.60 $6.60 $4.89 $4.89

$1,763.00 $4.06 $1,664.60 $4.00 $1,640.00 $4.60 $1,886.00 $3.35 $1,373.50 $3.23 $1,324.30 $2.63 $1,078.30 $4.75 $1,947.50

$1,542.45 $4.17 $1,413.63 $4.25 $1,440.75 $5.16 $1,749.24 $3.75 $1,271.25 $3.34 $1,132.26 $2.60 $881.40 $4.89 $1,657.71
$90.15 $5.63 $84.45 $6.25 $93.75 $7.11 $106.65 $5.30 $79.50 $5.34 $80.10 $4.60 $69.00 $4.89 $73.35
$30 05 $5 63 $28 15 $6 40 $32 00 $7 15 $35 75 $5 40 $27 00 $6 34 $31 70 $5 60 $28 00 $4 89 $24 45XXXL 5 EA

XXXXL 1 EA
iv. Fall Order: Total =  310 shirts

AS-XL 282 EA
XXL 22 EA
XXXL 5 EA
XXXXL 1 EA

6. Special Orders
A. Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirts (AS-XL) 50 EA

$30.05 $5.63 $28.15 $6.40 $32.00 $7.15 $35.75 $5.40 $27.00 $6.34 $31.70 $5.60 $28.00 $4.89 $24.45
$6.01 $5.63 $5.63 $6.55 $6.55 $7.32 $7.32 $5.50 $5.50 $7.34 $7.34 $6.60 $6.60 $4.89 $4.89

$1,283.10 $4.17 $1,175.94 $4.25 $1,198.50 $5.16 $1,455.12 $3.75 $1,057.50 $3.34 $941.88 $2.60 $733.20 $4.89 $1,378.98
$132.22 $5.63 $123.86 $6.25 $137.50 $7.11 $156.42 $5.30 $116.60 $5.34 $117.48 $4.60 $101.20 $4.89 $107.58
$30.05 $5.63 $28.15 $6.40 $32.00 $7.15 $35.75 $5.40 $27.00 $6.34 $31.70 $5.60 $28.00 $4.89 $24.45
$6.01 $5.63 $5.63 $6.55 $6.55 $7.32 $7.32 $5.50 $5.50 $7.34 $7.34 $6.60 $6.60 $4.89 $4.89

$1,140.50 $19.05 $952.50 $15.95 $797.50 $26.79 $1,339.50 $16.25 $812.50 $14.10 $705.00 $12.98 $649.00 $19.82 $991.00A. Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirts (AS XL) 50 EA
Extra charge for XXL 1 EA
Extra charge for XXXL 1 EA
Extra charge for XXXXL 1 EA

B. Crewneck 100 EA
Extra charge for XXL 1 EA
Extra charge for XXXL 1 EA
Extra charge for XXXXL 1 EA

$1,140.50 $19.05 $952.50 $15.95 $797.50 $26.79 $1,339.50 $16.25 $812.50 $14.10 $705.00 $12.98 $649.00 $19.82 $991.00
$5.23 $28.43 $17.50 $16.10 $14.98 $19.82
$5.23 $28.43 $20.00 $17.10 $15.98 $19.82
$5.23 $29.20 $21.50 $18.10 $16.98 $19.82

$1,139.00 $9.83 $983.00 $9.00 $900.00 $13.63 $1,363.00 $9.50 $950.00 $8.23 $823.00 $6.30 $630.00 $12.04 $1,204.00
$2.00 $17.47 $11.20 $10.23 $8.30 $12.04
$2.00 $17.47 $11.45 $11.23 $9.30 $12.04
$2.00 $17.87 $11.75 $12.23 $10.30 $12.04

C. Chore Coat 30 EA
Extra charge for XXL 1 EA
Extra charge for XXXL 1 EA
Extra charge for XXXXL 1 EA

Vendor offers a ____________%  Discount off Catalog Items not listed on the Price 
Sheet % off

The City requires delivery within 10 days from date of order
Vendor offers delivery within days from date of order DAYS

$1,221.60 $40.72 $1,221.60 $41.00 $1,230.00 $43.65 $1,309.50 $40.75 $1,222.50 $37.26 $1,117.80 $37.26 $1,117.80 $35.38 $1,061.40
$5.00 $45.65 $42.75 $39.26 $39.26 $35.38
$6.75 $47.65 $44.75 $40.26 $40.26 $35.38
$8.00 $49.65 $46.50 $41.26 $41.26 $35.38

35.10% varies - 12.00% 20.00% 20.00% 20.00%

10 7-10 10 10 10 10 10      Vendor offers delivery within _______ days from date of order DAYS

City requires vendor to deliver reprints/add-ons within 48 hours of order
      Vendor offers ______ hours for reprints/add-ons HRS

Subtotal

Tax Rate ________% Taxes:

Grand Total:

10 7-10 10 10 10 10 10

48 48 - 48 48 48 -
$41,375.66 $38,179.29 $38,625.95 $47,588.33 $33,093.10 $32,550.94 $26,679.42 $43,517.56

$3,516.93 8.50% 8.30% $3,205.95 8.10% $3,854.65 8.30% $2,746.73 0.00% 0.00% 8.30% $3,611.96

$44,892.59 $38,179.29 $41,831.90 $51,442.98 $35,839.83 $32,550.94 $26,679.42 $47,129.52


