QO06-11, Window Cleaning and Power Washing Services

| Skyline Window Cleaning

Quality Construction

Aardvark Mobile Detailing

l:\i;n Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Base bid
Window Cleaning Services:
I. |Inside and Outside
See Pages 15 thru 18, Section |I.
Building #1: City Hall 4 EA| $ 63750 $ 2,550.00 | $ 1,050.00 $ 4,20000| $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #2: City Court 4 EA | $ 34375 $ 1,375.00| $ 480.00 $ 1,920.00| $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #3: PSAB 4 EA| $ 63750 $ 2,550.00| $ 740.00 $ 2,960.00| $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #4: Council Chambers 4 EA | $ 93.75 $ 375.00 | $ 150.00 $ 600.00 | $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #5: Public Library 4 EA | $ 31250 $ 1,250.00| $ 820.00 $ 3,280.00| $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #6: Municipal Operation Center 4 EA | $ 12500 $ 500.00 | $ 120.00 $ 480.00( $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #7: Fleet Services 4 EA | $ 1875 $ 75.00| $ 25.00 $ 100.00| $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #8: Solid Waste Trailer 4 EA | $ 1875 $ 75.00| $ 25.00 $ 100.00| $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #9: Inventory Warehouse 4 EA | $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 25.00 $ 100.00| $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #10: Community Center & Annex 4 EA | $ 3750 $ 150.00 | $ 90.00 $ 360.00 $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #11: Women'’s Club 4 EA | $ 3125 $ 125.00 | $ 80.00 $ 32000 $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #12: Trailer Units (4 each)
A. Code Compliance 4 EA | $ 3750 $ 150.00 | $ 25.00 $ 100.00| $ 213.00 $ 852.00
B. Utilities 4 EA | $ 3750 $ 150.00 | $ 25.00 $ 100.00| $ 213.00 $ 852.00
C. Finance 4 EA | $ 3750 $ 150.00 | $ 25.00 $ 100.00| $ 213.00 $ 852.00
D. City Hall Annex 4 EA | $ 3750 $ 150.00 | $ 25.00 $ 100.00| $ 213.00 $ 852.00
Building #13: Pinnacle Peak Public Safety Facility 4 EA | $ 21875 $ 875.00 | $ 220.00 $ 880.00 | $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #14: IT Building 4 EA | $ 20625 $ 825.00 | $ 190.00 $ 760.00 | $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #15: Greenway Water Treatment Plant 4 EA | $ 23125 % 925.00 | $ 240.00 $ 960.00 | $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Building #16: Sunrise Family Center 4 EA | $ 16000 $ 640.00 | $ 160.00 $ 640.00 | $ 687.00 $ 2,748.00
Subtotal Section I $ 12,965.00 $ 18,060.00 $ 44,628.00
Base bid
Il. |Power Washing Services:
Entrances and Entire Storefronts
See Page 18, Section Il
Building #1: City Hall 1 EA | $ 8125 $ 8125 $ 360.00 $ 360.00 $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #2: City Court 1 EA | $ 8750 $ 8750 $ 190.00 $ 190.00| $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #3: PSAB 1 EA| $ 12500 $ 125.00 | $ 250.00 $ 250.00 | $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #4: Council Chambers 1 EA | $ 75.00 $ 75.00| $ 190.00 $ 190.00 | $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #5: Public Library 1 EA | $ 75.00 $ 75.00( $ 240.00 $ 240.00 | $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #6: IT Building 1 EA | $ 75.00 $ 75.00( $ 180.00 $ 180.00| $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Subtotal Section II: $ 518.75 $ 1,410.00 $ 4,578.00
Sections | & Il Base Bid Total: $ 13,483.75 $ 19,470.00 $ 49,206.00




QO06-11, Window Cleaning and Power Washing Services

| Skyline Window Cleaning

Quality Construction

Aardvark Mobile Detailing

l:\i;n Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Option [
I. |Window Cleaning Services:
Inside Only
See Pages 15 thru 18, Section |I.
Building #1: City Hall 4 EA $ 500.00 $ 2,000.00| $ 480.00 $ 1,920.00 no bid
Building #2: City Court 4 EA $ 218.75 $ 875.00| $ 200.00 $ 800.00 no bid
Building #3: PSAB 4 EA $ 43750 $ 1,750.00 | $ 340.00 $ 1,360.00 no bid
Building #4: Council Chambers 4 EA | $ 62.50 $ 250.00| $ 80.00 $ 320.00 no bid
Building #5: Public Library 4 EA $ 203.75 % 81500 $ 400.00 $ 1,600.00 no bid
Building #6: Municipal Operation Center 4 EA | $ 62.50 $ 250.00 | $ 70.00 $ 280.00 no bid
Building #7: Fleet Services 4 EA | $ 1250 $ 50.00 | $ 10.00 $ 40.00 no bid
Building #8: Solid Waste Trailer 4 EA | $ 1250 $ 50.00 | $ 10.00 $ 40.00 no bid
Building #9: Inventory Warehouse 4 EA | $ 1250 $ 50.00 | $ 10.00 $ 40.00 no bid
Building #10: Community Center & Annex 4 EA | $ 4750 $ 190.00 | $ 40.00 $ 160.00 no bid
Building #11: Women'’s Club 4 EA $ 3125 % 12500 $ 40.00 $ 160.00 no bid
Building #12: Trailer Units (4 each) $ -
A. Code Compliance 4 EA | $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 10.00 $ 40.00 no bid
B. Utilities 4 EA $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 10.00 $ 40.00 no bid
C. Finance 4 EA | $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 10.00 $ 40.00 no bid
D. City Hall Annex 4 EA $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 10.00 $ 40.00 no bid
Building #13: Pinnacle Peak Public Safety Facility 4 EA | $ 15000 $ 600.00 | $ 100.00 $ 400.00 no bid
Building #14: IT Building 4 EA $ 150.00 $ 600.00 | $ 90.00 $ 360.00 no bid
Building #15: Greenway Water Treatment Plant 4 EA | $ 15000 $ 600.00 | $ 210.00 $ 840.00 no bid
Building # 16 Sunrise Family Center 4 EA | $ 80.00 $ 320.00| $ 80.00 $ 320.00 no bid
Total Option I: $ 8,825.00 $ 8,800.00




QO06-11, Window Cleaning and Power Washing Services

| Skyline Window Cleaning

Quality Construction

Aardvark Mobile Detailing

l:\i;n Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Option II:
Il. ]Window Cleaning Services:
Outside Only
See Pages 15 thru 18, Section |I.
Building #1: City Hall 4 EA $ 500.00 $ 2,000.00| $ 620.00 $ 2,480.00 no bid
Building #2: City Court 4 EA $ 218.75 $ 875.00| $ 220.00 $ 880.00 no bid
Building #3: PSAB 4 EA $ 43750 $ 1,750.00 | $ 41000 $ 1,640.00 no bid
Building #4: Council Chambers 4 EA | $ 62.50 $ 250.00 | $ 110.00 $ 440.00 no bid
Building #5: Public Library 4 EA $ 203.75 % 81500 $ 260.00 $ 1,040.00 no bid
Building #6: Municipal Operation Center 4 EA | $ 62.50 $ 250.00 | $ 90.00 $ 360.00 no bid
Building #7: Fleet Services 4 EA | $ 1250 $ 50.00 | $ 15.00 $ 60.00 no bid
Building #8: Solid Waste Trailer 4 EA | $ 1250 $ 50.00 | $ 15.00 $ 60.00 no bid
Building #9: Inventory Warehouse 4 EA | $ 1250 $ 50.00 | $ 15.00 $ 60.00 no bid
Building #10: Community Center & Annex 4 EA | $ 4750 $ 190.00 | $ 80.00 $ 320.00 no bid
Building #11: Women'’s Club 4 EA $ 3125 % 12500 $ 50.00 $ 200.00 no bid
Building #12: Trailer Units (4 each)
A. Code Compliance 4 EA | $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 15.00 $ 60.00 no bid
B. Utilities 4 EA $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 15.00 $ 60.00 no bid
C. Finance 4 EA | $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 15.00 $ 60.00 no bid
D. City Hall Annex 4 EA $ 1875 $ 75.00 | $ 15.00 $ 60.00 no bid
Building #13: Pinnacle Peak Public Safety Facility 4 EA | $ 15000 $ 600.00 | $ 110.00 $ 440.00 no bid
Building #14: IT Building 4 EA $ 150.00 $ 600.00| $ 130.00 $ 520.00 no bid
Building #15: Greenway Water Treatment Plant 4 EA | $ 15000 $ 600.00 | $ 140.00 $ 560.00 no bid
Building # 16 Sunrise Family Center 4 EA | $ 80.00 $ 320.00| $ 90.00 $ 360.00 no bid
Total Option Il $ 8,825.00 $ 9,660.00
Option I
lll. |Power Washing Services:
Entire Complex
See Page 19, Section Il
Building #1: City Hall 1 Ea. $ 968.75 $ 968.75| $ 1,200.00 $ 1,200.00( $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #2: City Court 1 Ea. $ 343.75 % 343.75| $ 680.00 $ 680.00| $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #3: PSAB 1 Ea. $ 656.25 $ 656.25| $ 870.00 $ 870.00| $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #4: Council Chambers 1 Ea. $ 218.75 % 218.75| $ 480.00 $ 480.00| $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #5: Public Library 1 Ea. $ 875.00 % 875.00| $ 890.00 $ 890.00| $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Building #6: IT Building 1 Ea. $ 250.00 $ 250.00 | $ 480.00 $ 480.00| $ 763.00 $ 763.00
Total Option Il $ 3,312.50 $ 4,600.00 $ 4,578.00




Q06-11, Window Cleaning and Power Washing Services

| Skyline Window Cleaning

Quality Construction

Aardvark Mobile Detailing

I:\leg.] ftem Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Option IV
V. [window washing services | s 2800 s 3000 5 100000
Option V _
V. foiepﬁé? Tazﬁiunrgf?efﬁigfl cellouts 1 Hr. $ 35.00 $ 35.00 $  1,000.00




