
Q05-07 Window Cleaning Services

Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1.  Window Washing Services:
Base Bid

Building # 1:  City Hall 4 Ea. 510.00$     2,040.00$    540.49$       2,161.96$       1,000.00$     4,000.00$       615.00$     2,460.00$    980.00$       3,920.00$     No Bid No Bid

Building # 2:  City Court 4 Ea. 275.00$     1,100.00$    293.55$       1,174.20$       300.00$        1,200.00$       335.00$     1,340.00$    420.00$       1,680.00$     No Bid No Bid

Building # 3:  PSAB 4 Ea. 510.00$     2,040.00$    540.49$       2,161.96$       300.00$        1,200.00$       616.00$     2,464.00$    680.00$       2,720.00$     No Bid No Bid

Building # 4:  Council Chambers 4 Ea. 75.00$       300.00$       64.58$         258.32$          150.00$        600.00$          74.00$       296.00$       160.00$       640.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 5:  Public Library 4 Ea. 250.00$     1,000.00$    258.33$       1,033.32$       300.00$        1,200.00$       294.00$     1,176.00$    790.00$       3,160.00$     No Bid No Bid

Building # 6:  Municipal Operations Center 4 Ea. 100.00$     400.00$       76.26$         305.04$          80.00$          320.00$          87.00$       348.00$       110.00$       440.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 7:  Fleet Services 4 Ea. 15.00$       60.00$         11.47$         45.88$            20.00$          80.00$            35.00$       140.00$       30.00$         120.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 8:  Solid Waste Trailer 4 Ea. 15.00$       60.00$         11.47$         45.88$            20.00$          80.00$            35.00$       140.00$       25.00$         100.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 9:  Inventory Control 4 Ea. 15.00$       60.00$         11.47$         45.88$            20.00$          80.00$            35.00$       140.00$       25.00$         100.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 10: Community Center & Annex 4 Ea 30.00$       120.00$       31.58$         126.32$          50.00$          200.00$          35.00$       140.00$       100.00$       400.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 11: Women's Club 4 Ea 25.00$       100.00$       42.11$         168.44$          50.00$          200.00$          65.00$       260.00$       70.00$         280.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 12: Trailer Units (4 Each)
A. Code Compliance 4 Ea. 30.00$       120.00$       10.00$         40.00$            20.00$          80.00$            45.00$       180.00$       25.00$         100.00$        No Bid No Bid
B. Utilities 4 Ea. 30.00$       120.00$       10.00$         40.00$            20.00$          80.00$            45.00$       180.00$       25.00$         100.00$        No Bid No Bid
C. Finance 4 Ea. 30.00$       120.00$       10.00$         40.00$            20.00$          80.00$            45.00$       180.00$       25.00$         100.00$        No Bid No Bid
D. City Hall Annex 4 Ea. 30.00$       120.00$       10.00$         40.00$            20.00$          80.00$            45.00$       180.00$       25.00$         100.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 13:  PP Public Safety Facility 4 Ea. 175.00$     700.00$       189.47$       757.88$          100.00$        400.00$          216.00$     864.00$       190.00$       760.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 14: IT  Building 4 Ea 165.00$     660.00$       187.87$       751.48$          50.00$          200.00$          214.00$     856.00$       180.00$       720.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 15: Greenway Water Treatment 4 Ea 185.00$     740.00$       189.47$       757.88$          100.00$        400.00$          216.00$     864.00$       210.00$       840.00$        No Bid No Bid

Subtotal A: 9,860.00$    9,954.44$       10,480.00$     12,208.00$  16,280.00$   No Bid No Bid

A Mind for DetailPressure CoachQuality Capital Cleaning US Porters Power CleanSqueeky Kleen Windows
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Q05-07 Window Cleaning Services

Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

A Mind for DetailPressure CoachQuality Capital Cleaning US Porters Power CleanSqueeky Kleen Windows

2. Power Washing Services:
Base Bid

Building #1:  City Hall 1 Ea. 65.00$       65.00$         125.00$       125.00$          350.00$        350.00$          59.00$       59.00$         390.00$       390.00$        375.00$     375.00$       450.00$    450.00$       

Building #2:  City Court 1 Ea. 70.00$       70.00$         110.00$       110.00$          200.00$        200.00$          85.00$       85.00$         280.00$       280.00$        180.00$     180.00$       350.00$    350.00$       

Building #3:  PSAB 1 Ea. 100.00$     100.00$       110.00$       110.00$          200.00$        200.00$          116.00$     116.00$       280.00$       280.00$        450.00$     450.00$       250.00$    250.00$       

Building #4:  Council Chambers 1 Ea. 60.00$       60.00$         65.00$         65.00$            100.00$        100.00$          33.00$       33.00$         180.00$       180.00$        275.00$     275.00$       250.00$    250.00$       

Building #5:  Public Library 1 Ea. 60.00$       60.00$         65.00$         65.00$            200.00$        200.00$          32.00$       32.00$         240.00$       240.00$        290.00$     290.00$       450.00$    450.00$       

Building #6: IT Building 1 Ea. 60.00$       60.00$         65.00$         65.00$            50.00$          50.00$            32.00$       32.00$         180.00$       180.00$        290.00$     290.00$       375.00$    375.00$       

Subtotal B: 415.00$       540.00$          1,100.00$       357.00$       1,550.00$     1,860.00$    2,125.00$    

A & B Base Bid Total: 10,275.00$  10,494.44$     11,580.00$     12,565.00$  17,830.00$   1,860.00$    2,125.00$    
Tax Rate ___________% Taxes: -$            * -$                * -$               * -$            * -$              * -$            * -$            

Total: 10,275.00$  10,494.44$     11,580.00$     12,565.00$  17,830.00$   1,860.00$    2,125.00$    
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Q05-07 Window Cleaning Services

Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

A Mind for DetailPressure CoachQuality Capital Cleaning US Porters Power CleanSqueeky Kleen Windows

1.  Window Washing Services:
Outside Only (Option)

Building # 1:  City Hall 4 Ea. 400.00$     1,600.00$    356.73$       1,426.92$       750.00$        3,000.00$       366.00$     1,464.00$    580.00$       2,320.00$     No Bid No Bid

Building # 2:  City Court 4 Ea. 175.00$     700.00$       193.74$       774.96$          200.00$        800.00$          199.00$     796.00$       190.00$       760.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 3:  PSAB 4 Ea. 350.00$     1,400.00$    356.73$       1,426.92$       200.00$        800.00$          366.00$     1,464.00$    380.00$       1,520.00$     No Bid No Bid

Building # 4:  Council Chambers 4 Ea. 50.00$       200.00$       42.62$         170.48$          100.00$        400.00$          44.00$       176.00$       90.00$         360.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 5:  Public Library 4 Ea. 163.00$     652.00$       170.49$       681.96$          200.00$        800.00$          175.00$     700.00$       240.00$       960.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 6:  Municipal Operations Center 4 Ea. 50.00$       200.00$       50.33$         201.32$          60.00$          240.00$          52.00$       208.00$       70.00$         280.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 7:  Fleet Services 4 Ea. 10.00$       40.00$         7.57$           30.28$            15.00$          60.00$            20.00$       80.00$         15.00$         60.00$          No Bid No Bid

Building # 8:  Solid Waste Trailer 4 Ea. 10.00$       40.00$         7.57$           30.28$            15.00$          60.00$            20.00$       80.00$         15.00$         60.00$          No Bid No Bid

Building # 9:  Inventory Control 4 Ea. 10.00$       40.00$         7.57$           30.28$            15.00$          60.00$            20.00$       80.00$         15.00$         60.00$          No Bid No Bid

Building # 10: Community Center & Annex 4 Ea 38.00$       152.00$       20.84$         83.36$            15.00$          60.00$            20.00$       80.00$         60.00$         240.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 11: Women's Club 4 Ea 25.00$       100.00$       27.79$         111.16$          40.00$          160.00$          29.00$       116.00$       35.00$         140.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 12: Trailer Units (4 Each)
A. Code Compliance 4 Ea. 15.00$       60.00$         5.00$           20.00$            15.00$          60.00$            25.00$       100.00$       15.00$         60.00$          No Bid No Bid
B. Utilities 4 Ea. 15.00$       60.00$         5.00$           20.00$            15.00$          60.00$            25.00$       100.00$       15.00$         60.00$          No Bid No Bid
C. Finance 4 Ea. 15.00$       60.00$         5.00$           20.00$            15.00$          60.00$            25.00$       100.00$       15.00$         60.00$          No Bid No Bid
D. City Hall Annex 4 Ea. 15.00$       60.00$         5.00$           20.00$            15.00$          60.00$            25.00$       100.00$       15.00$         60.00$          No Bid No Bid

Building # 13:  PP Public Safety Facility 4 Ea. 120.00$     480.00$       125.05$       500.20$          80.00$          320.00$          128.00$     512.00$       80.00$         320.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 14: IT  Building 4 Ea 120.00$     480.00$       124.00$       496.00$          40.00$          160.00$          127.00$     508.00$       120.00$       480.00$        No Bid No Bid

Building # 15: Greenway Water Treatment 4 Ea 120.00$     480.00$       125.05$       500.20$          80.00$          320.00$          128.00$     512.00$       130.00$       520.00$        No Bid No Bid

Subtotal: 6,804.00$    6,544.32$       7,480.00$       7,176.00$    8,320.00$     No Bid No Bid
Tax Rate ___________% Taxes: -$            -$                -$               -$            -$              

Total: 6,804.00$    6,544.32$       7,480.00$       7,176.00$    8,320.00$     No Bid No Bid
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Q05-07 Window Cleaning Services

Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

A Mind for DetailPressure CoachQuality Capital Cleaning US Porters Power CleanSqueeky Kleen Windows

2. Power Washing Services:
Entire Complex (Option)

Building #1:  City Hall 1 Ea. 775.00$     775.00$       769.00$       769.00$          800.00$        800.00$          876.00$     876.00$       980.00$       980.00$        1,350.00$  1,350.00$    950.00$    950.00$       

Building #2:  City Court 1 Ea. 275.00$     275.00$       243.00$       243.00$          400.00$        400.00$          276.00$     276.00$       560.00$       560.00$        1,100.00$  1,100.00$    450.00$    450.00$       

Building #3:  PSAB 1 Ea. 525.00$     525.00$       432.00$       432.00$          400.00$        400.00$          492.00$     492.00$       760.00$       760.00$        1,200.00$  1,200.00$    450.00$    450.00$       

Building #4:  Council Chambers 1 Ea. 175.00$     175.00$       127.00$       127.00$          200.00$        200.00$          144.00$     144.00$       380.00$       380.00$        900.00$     900.00$       350.00$    350.00$       

Building #5:  Public Library 1 Ea. 700.00$     700.00$       295.00$       295.00$          400.00$        400.00$          336.00$     336.00$       780.00$       780.00$        1,100.00$  1,100.00$    850.00$    850.00$       

Building #6: IT Building 1 Ea. 200.00$     200.00$       190.00$       190.00$          100.00$        100.00$          216.00$     216.00$       380.00$       380.00$        800.00$     800.00$       650.00$    650.00$       

Subtotal: 2,650.00$    2,056.00$       2,300.00$       2,340.00$    3,840.00$     6,450.00$    3,700.00$    
Tax Rate ___________% Taxes: -$            -$                -$               -$            -$              -$            -$            

Total: 2,650.00$    2,056.00$       2,300.00$       2,340.00$    3,840.00$     6,450.00$    3,700.00$    

*  No tax included
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