P12-0059, Liquid Oxygen

Air Products Air Liquide Airgas Praxair
Unit Extended Unit Extended| | Unit Extended Unit  Extended
Equipment Qty Unit | Price Price Price Price Price  Price Price Price
1 Liquid Oxygen, LOX,>99% Oxygen 5750|100 SCF| 0.379 2,179.25| | 0.429 2,466.75| | 0.570 3,277.50 No Bid
(Qty X Unit Price = Extended Price)
Unit Price is per 100 SCF)
575, 000 SCR per delivery
Subtotal: 2,179.25 2,466.75 3,277.50 No Bid
Tax: 198.31 229.40 298.25
Total: 2,377.56 2,696.15 3,5675.75 No Bid
2 Delivery Charge per Order - - -
3 Hazardous Materials Handling Charge per Order - - -
Total: 0.00 0.00 0.00 No Bid
The City of Peoria is asking for Delivery within 5 days ARO
Bidder is offering delivery within days 2 1-2 5 -
Grand Total: 2,377.56 2,696.15 3,5675.75 No Bid
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