P11-0080, Road Materials
Bid Tabulation

Vulcan Materials Co

Mesa Materials
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. |Base Material

ABC Backfill

Sand (Washed )

% Slurry M.A.G. ABC

No Sack Slurry M.A.G. ABC
Asphalt Millings (GSA)

Section “I” Subtotal

Base Material Delivery Charges

ABC Backfill or Sand (Washed) — Less than 20 Tons
ABC Backfill or Sand (Washed) - 20 to less than 40 Tons
ABC Backfill or Sand (Washed)- 40 to less than 60 Tons
ABC Backfill or Sand (Washed)- 60 to less than 80 Tons
ABC Backfill or Sand (Washed)-80 to less than 100 Tons
Asphalt Millings (GSA)

Minimum Load for Delivery

Base Material Delivery Charges
Slurry — Less than 2 Yards
Slurry — 2 to less than 4 Yards
Slurry — 4 to less than 7 Yards
Slurry — 7 to less than 10 Yards
Slurry — 10 to less than 15 Yards
Slurry — 15 to less than 20 Yards
Slurry — 20 to less than 30 Yards
Slurry — 30 to less than 40 Yards
Slurry — 40 to less than 50 Yards
Standby Time — Flat hourly charge
Minimum Load for Delivery

.|Asphalt Per Specifications

3/8” Fine Dense Graded Hot Mix Asphalt

3/8 Fine Dense Graded Hot Mix Asphalt with Cement
%" Fine Dense Grade Hot Mix Asphalt

%" Fine Dense Grade Hot Mix Asphalt with Cement
3/4” Fine Dense Grade Hot Mix Asphalt

3/4” Fine Dense Grade Hot Mix Asphalt with Cement
#4 Sand Seal

Section “I1” Subtotal

Qty

2500
150
100
100

1000

N

1000
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500
250
1500
1000
500
500
125

u/M

Ton
Ton
CUYD
CUYD
Ton

Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Ton

Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Hour

Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton
Ton

Unit Price Price
$9.00 $22,500.00
$12.00 $1,800.00
no bid -
no bid -
$7.00 $7,000.00
$24,300.00
$5.75 per ton
$5.75 per ton
$5.75 per ton
$5.75 per ton
$5.75 per ton
$5.75 per ton
24.5 ton
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$61.00 $30,500.00
no bid -
$60.00 $90,000.00
no bid -
$59.00 $29,500.00
no bid -
no bid -

$150,000.00

Unit Price

$5.00
$7.00
no bid
no bid
no bid

$137.50
$275.00
$412.50
$550.00
$550.00
no bid
25 ton

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

$63.00
$63.00
$56.50
$56.50
$55.00
$55.00
no bid

Price

$12,500.00
$1,050.00

$13,550.00

$31,500.00
$15,750.00
$84,750.00
$56,500.00
$27,500.00
$27,500.00

$243,500.00




Vulcan Materials Co

Mesa Materials

[y

N

Hot Mix Asphalt Delivery Charges

Hot Mix Asphalt — Less than 20 Tons

Hot Mix Asphalt — 20 to less than 40 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 40 to less than 60 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 60 to less than 80 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 80 to less than 100 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 100 to less than 120 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 120 to less than 140 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 140 to less than 160 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 160 to less than 180 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 180 to less than 200 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 200 to less than 220 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt — 220 to less than 240 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 240 to less than 260 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 260 to less than 280 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 280 to less than 300 Tons
Standby Time

Minimum Load for Delivery

Off-Hour Requirements - Optional

Plant Opening Charge - with 24 hour notice
Hot Mix Asphalt — Less than 20 Tons

Hot Mix Asphalt — 20 to less than 40 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 40 to less than 60 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 60 to less than 80 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 80 to less than 100 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt — 100 to less than 120 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 120 to less than 140 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 140 to less than 160 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 160 to less than 180 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt - 180 to less than 200 Tons
Hot Mix Asphalt — Over 200 Tons

Weekend/Overtime product price differential per Ton
Subtotal | & I1:
Tax Rate % Taxes:
Grand Total:

City of Peoria requires delivery within twenty-four (24) hours
AR.O.

Bidder offers delivery within hours A.R.O.

Does availability depend on what mix a particular plant is
producing at the time? Yes No

Qty
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u/M

Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Hour

Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job
Job

Ton

Unit Price Price

$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$5.75
$85.00/hr
24.5 ton

$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$500.00

$2.00
$174,300.00
9.30%

$16,209.90

$190,509.90

24

Unit Price Price

$225.00
$450.00
$675.00
$900.00
$900.00
$1,125.00
$1,350.00
$1,575.00
$1,800.00
$1,800.00
$2,025.00
$2,250.00
$2,475.00
$2,700.00
$2,700.00
$80/hr
25 ton

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
$1,000.00
$2,000.00
no bid

Saturday
Sunday
$257,050.00
9.05%

$23,263.03

$280,313.03

24
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