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P09-0072 Bid Tabulation - Speed Humps, Speed Tables and Speed Cushions

RK Sanders, Inc.

Specialized Surfacing

Swaine Asphalt Corp.

ABC Asphalt, LLC

Tri V Paving, LLC

Centerline Supply West

Item Description Qty. LFEA. U/M| Unit Price Ext.Price | Unit Price Ext. Price [Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price | Unit Price Ext. Price
1  Speed Hump Installation 2 28 LF $55.84 $3,127.04 $87.50 $4,900.00 $82.45 $4,617.20 $121.86 $6,824.00 $152.00 $8,512.00 NO BID
2 Speed Table Installation 1 28 LF $55.84 $1,563.52 $90.50 $2,534.00 $142.45 $3,988.60 $121.43 $3,400.00 $215.00 $6,020.00 NO BID
3 Speed Cushion Installation 2 30 LF $54.17 $3,350.40 $87.50 $5,250.00 $86.50 $5,190.00 $133.33 $8,000.00 $190.00 $11,400.00 NO BID
4 22" Speed Cushion Installation 2 36 LF $55.84 $4,020.48 $88.50 $6,372.00 $166.50 $11,988.00 $119.31 $8,590.00 $175.00 $12,600.00 NO BID
5 Speed Hump Removal 2 30 LF $111.00 $6,660.00 $76.00 $4,560.00 $50.00 $3,000.00 $118.07 $7,084.00 $125.00 $7,500.00 NO BID
6 Speed Table Removal 3 28 LF $111.00  $9,324.00 $78.00 $6,552.00 $90.00 $7,560.00 $125.11  $10,509.00 $139.00 $11,676.00 NO BID

SUBTOTAL $28,045.44 $30,168.00 $36,343.80 $44,407.00 $57,708.00 NO BID

TAX $1,476.59 $1,588.35 $1,913.50 $2,338.03 $3,038.33 NO BID

BASE BID TOTAL 29,522.03 31,756.35 38,257.30 46,745.03 60,746.33 NO BID
BOND A - A- A- } B
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