
DESCRIPTION UOM QTY Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Exceptions

CATEGORY 1 ARTS & CRAFT SUPPLIES

2107 Chalk, White, Low Dust, 12/box EA 6 $0.42 $2.52 no bid $0.60 $3.60 $0.53 $3.18
2108 Chalk, Assorted Colors, Low Dust, 12/box EA 16 $0.42 $6.72 no bid $0.60 $9.60 $0.53 $8.48
2109 Pom Poms, Assorted Colors and Sizes, 300/pkg EA 27 $4.66 $125.82 no bid $5.11 $137.97 $5.25 $141.75
2110 Kraft Paper Rolls, White, 50#, 36"Wide X 900' Long EA 6 $42.49 $254.94 no bid $62.24 $373.44 no bid
2111 Craft Foam Sheets, (Fun Foam), 9" X 12" 5/pkg. EA 60 $0.84 $50.40 no bid no bid $1.81 $108.60 * 24 sheets/pk
2112 Spaghetti Strings, Black, 1/16" X 50 Yds. (Spool) EA 4 $1.69 $6.76 no bid no bid no bid
2196 Spaghetti Strings, White 1/16" X 50 Yds. (Spool) EA 6 $1.69 $10.14 no bid no bid no bid
2118 Poster Board, White, 22" X 28", 25 sheets/box EA 22 $11.04 $242.88 no bid $8.95 $196.90 $7.77 $170.94
2119 Water Color Set, 16 Colors EA 51 $2.54 $129.54 no bid $3.51 $179.01 $1.23 $62.73
2121 Markers, Tropical, Non-Toxic, Washable, 8/box EA 236 $3.73 $880.28 no bid $3.16 $745.76 $2.00 $472.00
2122 Pencils, Assorted Colors, 12/box EA 58 $1.44 $83.52 no bid $1.24 $71.92 $6.65 $385.70
2124 School Glue, Elmers, 7 5/8 oz. Plastic Bottle EA 102 $1.09 $111.18 no bid $1.96 $199.92 $0.88 $89.76
2125 School Glue, Elmers, 1 Gal. Plastic Bottle EA 14 $8.06 $112.84 no bid $13.35 $186.90 $7.25 $101.50
2126 Pipe Cleaners, 12" Assorted Colors, 100/pkg EA 76 $2.54 $193.04 no bid $1.27 $96.52 $1.35 $102.60
2127 Wiggly Eyes, Assorted Sizes, Black, 100/pkg EA 22 $2.54 $55.88 no bid $1.56 $34.32 no bid
2128 Wiggly Eyes, Assorted Sizes, Multi-Color, 100/pkg EA 17 $2.28 $38.76 no bid $1.56 $26.52 no bid
2129 Craft Sticks, "Popsicle" Style, Wooden, 4 1/2"L X 3/8" W, EA 48 $2.54 $121.92 no bid $4.76 $228.48 $2.05 $98.40
2130 Buttons, Assorted Sizes and Colors, 2 lb. Bag EA 13 $3.39 $44.07 no bid $9.52 $123.76 $3.46 $44.98 * Sold by 1 lb.
2131 Feathers, Assorted Sizes & Colors, 1/2 oz./bag EA 38 $1.52 $57.76 no bid $4.76 $180.88 no bid
2137 Markers, Classic, Non-Toxic, Washable, 8/box EA 233 $3.73 $869.09 no bid $3.16 $736.28 $4.08 $950.64 * 6 bx per unit
2138 Crayons, Wax, 16 Colors/box EA 125 $1.23 $153.75 no bid $1.83 $228.75 $3.65 $456.25 * 12 bx per unit
2203 Felt, Multicolor, 9" X 12" 50/pkg EA 10 * $8.50 $85.00 no bid $6.36 $63.60 $3.29 $32.90
2140 Yarn, White, 100% Acrylic, 3.5 oz Skein EA 11 $1.44 $15.84 no bid $1.84 $20.24 no bid
2141 Sequins & Spangles, 1 oz. bag EA 14 $1.09 $15.26 no bid $3.96 $55.44 no bid
2142 Modeling Clay, 1 lb. (1/4 lb. ea. Blue, Green, Red, & Yellow) EA 35 $2.54 $88.90 no bid $1.56 $54.60 $1.75 $61.25
2146 Art Tissue Paper, Assorted Colors, 12" X 18" 50 sheet/pkg. EA 48 $2.79 $133.92 no bid $2.36 $113.28 no bid
2147 Art Tissue Paper, Red, 20" X 30", 24 sheet/pkg EA 11 $1.99 $21.89 no bid $2.95 $32.45 $1.87 $20.57
2115 Construction Paper, White, 9" X 12", 50 sheet/pkg EA 107 $0.76 $81.32 no bid $1.11 $118.77 $1.26 $134.82
2151 Construction Paper Light Blue, 9" X 12" 80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 38 $0.76 $28.88 no bid $1.11 $42.18 $1.26 $47.88
2152 Construction Paper, Pink, 9" X 12" 80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 30 $0.76 $22.80 no bid $1.11 $33.30 $1.26 $37.80
2153 Construction Paper, Red, 9" X 12"  80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 48 $0.76 $36.48 no bid $1.11 $53.28 $1.26 $60.48
2154 Construction Paper, Blue 9" X 12"  80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 21 $0.76 $15.96 no bid $1.11 $23.31 $1.26 $26.46
2155 Construction Paper, Yellow, 9" X 12" 80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 38 $0.76 $28.88 no bid $1.11 $42.18 $1.26 $47.88
2156 Construction Paper, Green, 9" X 12"  80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 47 $0.76 $35.72 no bid $1.11 $52.17 $1.26 $59.22
2157 Construction Paper, Brown, 9" X 12"  80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 21 $0.76 $15.96 no bid $1.11 $23.31 $1.26 $26.46
2158 Construction Paper, Black, 9" X 12"  80#,  50 sheet/pkg. EA 59 $0.76 $44.84 no bid $1.11 $65.49 $1.26 $74.34
2159 Construction Paper, Orange, 9" X 12" 80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 38 $0.76 $28.88 no bid $1.11 $42.18 $1.26 $47.88
2160 Construction Paper, Purple, 9" X 12" 80#,  50 sheet/pkg. EA 26 $0.76 $19.76 no bid $2.07 $53.82 $1.26 $32.76
2116 Construction Paper, White, 12" X 18", 50 sheet/pkg. EA 36 $1.60 $57.60 no bid $2.07 $74.52 $2.43 $87.48
2161 Construction Paper, Grey, 12" X 18" 80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 19 $1.60 $30.40 no bid $2.07 $39.33 $2.43 $46.17
2162 Construction Paper, Pink, 12" X 18" 80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 12 $1.60 $19.20 no bid $2.07 $24.84 $2.43 $29.16
2163 Construction Paper, Red, 12" X 18"  80#, 50 sheet/pkg. EA 25 $1.60 $40.00 no bid $2.07 $51.75 $2.43 $60.75
2164 Construction Paper, Blue, 12" X 18" 80# 50 sheet/pkg. EA 24 $1.60 $38.40 no bid $2.07 $49.68 $2.43 $58.32
2165 Construction Paper, Yellow, 12" X 18" 80# 50 sheet/pkg. EA 14 $1.60 $22.40 no bid $2.07 $28.98 $2.43 $34.02
2166 Construction Paper, Green, 12" X 18"  80# 50 sheet/pkg. EA 17 $1.60 $27.20 no bid $2.07 $35.19 $2.43 $41.31
2167 Construction Paper, Brown, 12" X 18"  80# 50 sheet/pkg. EA 6 $1.60 $9.60 no bid $2.07 $12.42 $2.43 $14.58
2168 Construction Paper, Black, 12" X 18" 80# 50 sheet/pkg. EA 25 $1.60 $40.00 no bid $2.07 $51.75 $2.43 $60.75
2169 Construction Paper, Orange, 12" X 18" 80# 50 sheet/pkg. EA 14 $1.60 $22.40 no bid $2.07 $28.98 $2.43 $34.02
2170 Construction Paper, Purple, 12" X 18" 80# 50 sheet/pkg. EA 13 $1.60 $20.80 no bid $2.07 $26.91 $2.43 $31.59
2117 Newsprint, 9" X 12", Solid 500 sheet/pkg. EA 102 $2.96 $301.92 no bid $3.59 $366.18 $2.69 $274.38
2136 Tempera Paint, Black, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 15 $1.44 $21.60 no bid $3.16 $47.40 $2.35 $35.25
2171 Tempera Paint, White, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 18 $1.44 $25.92 no bid $3.16 $56.88 $2.35 $42.30
2172 Tempera Paint, Blue, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 22 $1.44 $31.68 no bid $3.16 $69.52 $2.35 $51.70
2173 Tempera Paint, Violet, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 11 $1.44 $15.84 no bid $3.16 $34.76 $2.35 $25.85
2174 Tempera Paint, Orange, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 11 $1.44 $15.84 no bid $3.16 $34.76 $2.35 $25.85
2175 Tempera Paint, Yellow, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 22 $1.44 $31.68 no bid $3.16 $69.52 $2.35 $51.70
2176 Tempera Paint, Red, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 25 $1.44 $36.00 no bid $3.16 $79.00 $2.35 $58.75
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2177 Tempera Paint, Green, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 17 $1.44 $24.48 no bid $3.16 $53.72 $2.35 $39.95
2179 Tempera Paint, Brown, Liquid, Washable, Pint EA 5 $1.44 $7.20 no bid $3.16 $15.80 no bid
2139 Glitter, Green, 16 oz. Shaker Jar EA 8 $5.94 $47.52 no bid $5.56 $44.48 no bid
2197 Glitter, Silver, 16 oz. Shaker Jar EA 7 $5.94 $41.58 no bid $5.56 $38.92 no bid
2198 Glitter, Gold, 16 oz. Shaker Jar EA 8 $5.94 $47.52 no bid $5.56 $44.48 no bid
2199 Glitter, Multi-Color, 16 oz. Shaker Jar EA 2 $5.94 $11.88 no bid $5.56 $11.12 no bid
2200 Glitter, Red, 16 oz. Shaker Jar EA 4 $5.94 $23.76 no bid $5.56 $22.24 no bid
2201 Glitter, Blue, 16 oz. Shaker Jar EA 7 $5.94 $41.58 no bid $5.56 $38.92 no bid
2320 Glue Stick with Twist Dispenser EA 176 $0.25 $44.00 no bid $0.24 $42.24 $0.10 $16.72 * Sold by dz.
2321 Lanyard Lacing, Flat, White, 100 yard Spool EA 25 $1.52 $38.00 no bid no bid no bid
2322 Lanyard Lacing, Flat, Black, 100 yard Spool EA 24 $1.52 $36.48 no bid no bid no bid
2323 Pony Beads, Assorted Colors, 1/2 lb./bag EA 130 $2.54 $330.20 no bid no bid $1.71 $222.30 * 1 lb Bag min.
2324 Fuse Beads, Assorted Colors, Std. Size, 26,000/Bucket EA 49 $16.99 $832.51 no bid no bid $8.25 $404.25 * No Catalog
2325 Pegboard Pack for Fuse Beads,Small Assorted Shapes, EA 51 $2.96 $150.96 no bid no bid no bid
2326 Lanyard Hooks, 7/8", 144/pkg. EA 23 $2.54 $58.42 no bid no bid $1.81 $41.63
2327 Key Rings, 1" Metal Split Rings, 100/pkg. EA 44 $1.69 $74.36 no bid no bid $1.81 $79.64
2328 Pinbacks, 3/4", 12/pkg. EA 38 $0.76 $28.88 no bid no bid no bid
2329 Pencils, #2 Lead with Eraser, 12/box EA 60 $1.35 $81.00 no bid $0.76 $45.60 $1.47 $88.20

 ARTS AND CRAFTS SUB TOTAL: $6,916.01 $6,190.02 $5,864.83

CATEGORY 2  GAMES
2318 Pool Cue Sticks, 52" EA 6 $6.78 $40.68 $3.63 $21.78 no bid no bid
2088 Poker Cards, Standard Size, 12 packs/set EA 47 $15.12 $710.64 $12.92 $607.24 no bid no bid
2089 Dominos, Complete Set EA 13 $2.95 $38.35 $1.43 $18.59 no bid no bid
2090 Bean Bags, Canvas Shell, 5" X 5" 12/set EA 6 $11.80 $70.80 $6.42 $38.52 no bid no bid
2101 Uno Card Game EA 40 $5.85 $234.00 $4.68 $187.20 no bid no bid
2145 Checkers, Standard Size Set and Board EA 33 $3.80 $125.40 $2.28 $75.24 no bid no bid
2330 Sidewalk Chalk, 20 Sticks/Bucket EA 13 $1.44 $18.72 $4.94 $64.22 $3.96 $51.48 $1.12 $14.56
N/A Blunt Tip, Scissors, 24/pack EA 4 $14.44 $57.76 no bid $21.63 $86.52 $14.59 $58.36 * 6 packs only
N/A Poster Board, Assorted Colors, 22" X 28", 25 sheets/box EA 22 $12.74 $280.28 no bid $15.92 $350.24 no bid

GAMES SUB TOTAL : $1,576.63 $1,012.79 $488.24 $72.92
GRAND TOTAL OF BID: $8,492.64 $1,012.79 $6,678.26 $5,937.75

Number of items bid: ALL 93 7 Games Only 66 57
Exceptions Responsive $100.00 Min. Responsive No Co-op

No Catalog
w/ orig. Bid
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