
P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for All Items

Item Description Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price

I. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY A:  (Soccer, Volleyball, 
Basketball, Flag Football) 

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)    Youth Small to Youth Large 24-144 $3.05 145-576 $3.05 577 + $3.05 24-144 $8.50 145-576 $7.00 577 + $6.00 24-144 $4.35 145-576 $4.15 577 + $4.00
2.)    Adult Small to Adult Extra Large 24-144 $3.15 145-576 $3.15 577 + $3.15 24-144 $8.50 145-576 $7.00 577 + $6.00 24-144 $4.43 145-576 $4.26 577 + $4.08
3.)    Adult 2X Large 1-12 $4.35 13-24 $4.35 25 + $4.35 1-12 $10.00 13-24 $9.50 25 + $8.50 1-12 $5.18 13-24 $5.08 25 + $4.83
4.)    Adult 3X Large & up 1-12 $5.70 13-24 $5.70 25 + $5.70 1-12 $10.00 13-24 $9.50 25 + $8.50 1-12 $5.43 13-24 $5.26 25 + $5.08

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large 24-144 $3.35 145-576 $3.35 577 + $3.35 24-144 $10.00 145-576 $8.25 577 + $7.00 24-144 $4.95 145-576 $4.85 577 + $4.67
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large 24-144 $3.45 145-576 $3.45 577 + $3.45 24-144 $10.00 145-576 $8.25 577 + $7.00 24-144 $5.05 145-576 $4.93 577 + $4.74
3.) Adult 2X Large 1-12 $4.65 13-24 $4.65 25 + $4.65 1-12 $11.50 13-24 $10.75 25 + $9.50 1-12 $5.80 13-24 $5.68 25 + $5.98
4.) Adult 3X Large & up 1-12 $5.99 13-24 $5.99 25 + $5.99 1-12 $11.50 13-24 $10.75 25 + $9.50 1-12 $6.05 13-24 $5.93 25 + $5.74

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.)     Coach Adult Large 1-12 $3.25 13-24 $3.25 25 + $3.25 1-12 $9.00 13-24 $8.00 25 + $7.00 1-12 $4.08 13-24 $3.93 25 + $3.84
2.)     Coach Adult Extra Large 1-12 $3.30 13-24 $3.30 25 + $3.30 1-12 $9.00 13-24 $8.00 25 + $7.00 1-12 $4.08 13-24 $3.93 25 + $3.84
3.)     Coach Adult 2X Large 1-12 $4.55 13-24 $4.55 25 + $4.55 1-12 $10.00 13-24 $9.00 25 + $8.00 1-12 $4.83 13-24 $4.68 25 + $4.59
4.)     Coach Adult 3X Large & up 1-12 $5.99 13-24 $5.99 25 + $5.99 1-12 $10.00 13-24 $9.00 25 + $8.00 1-12 $5.08 13-24 $4.93 25 + $4.84

II. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY B:   
(Fast Pitch Softball, Coach Pitch Baseball, T-Ball, Kick Ball)

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)  Youth Small to Youth Large 24-144 $4.65 145-576 $4.65 577 + $4.65 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + no bid 24-144 $6.16 145-576 $5.88 577 + $5.53
2.)  Adult Small to Adult Extra Large 24-144 $4.99 145-576 $4.99 577 + $4.99 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + no bid 24-144 $7.10 145-576 $6.75 577 + $6.34
3.)  Adult 2X Large 1-12 $5.15 13-24 $5.15 25 + $5.15 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $7.85 13-24 $7.50 25 + $7.09
4.)  Adult 3X Large & up 1-12 $6.75 13-24 $6.75 25 + $6.75 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $8.10 13-24 $7.75 25 + $7.34

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large 24-144 $4.75 145-576 $4.75 577 + $4.75 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + no bid 24-144 $6.56 145-576 $6.28 577 + $5.93
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large 24-144 $5.25 145-576 $5.25 577 + $5.25 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + no bid 24-144 $7.50 145-576 $7.15 577 + $6.74
3.) Adult 2X Large 1-12 $5.65 13-24 $5.65 25 + $5.65 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $8.25 13-24 $7.90 25 + $7.49
4.) Adult 3X Large & up 1-12 $6.95 13-24 $6.95 25 + $6.95 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $8.50 13-24 $8.15 25 + $7.74

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.) Coach Adult Large 1-12 $4.60 13-24 $4.60 25 + $4.60 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $7.15 13-24 $6.80 25 + $6.39
2.) Coach Adult Extra Large 1-12 $5.20 13-24 $5.20 25 + $5.20 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $7.15 13-24 $6.80 25 + $6.39
3.) Coach Adult 2X Large 1-12 $5.60 13-24 $5.60 25 + $5.60 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $7.90 13-24 $7.55 25 + $7.14
4.) Coach Adult 3X Large & up 1-12 $6.90 13-24 $6.90 25 + $6.90 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + no bid 1-12 $8.15 13-24 $7.55 25 + $7.39

III. MISCELLANEOUS CATEGORY C:  
A.) Hats:  per specifications

1.) Youth Sizes 24-144 $3.25 145-576 $3.20 577 + $3.15 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + no bid 24-144 $3.33 145-576 $3.20 577 + $3.07
2.) Adult Sizes 24-144 $3.25 145-576 $3.20 577 + $3.15 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + no bid 24-144 $3.33 145-576 $3.20 577 + $3.07

B.)  Socks:  per specifications
1.)  One Size 24-144 $2.75 145-576 $2.65 577 + $2.55 24-144 $3.25 145-576 $3.00 577 + $2.75 24-144 $2.97 145-576 $2.75 577 + $2.70

The City requires delivery within 10 days from date of 
order:  Vendor Offers Delivery 10 days 10 days *Business Days 10 days*

The City requires vendor to delivery reprints/add-ons within 
48 hrs of order:  Vendor Offers Reprints/AddOns 48 hrs 48 hrs 48 hrs
Exceptions No Yes No

Team Sport Outfitters, Inc Eiger Sportswear Chili Davis Premier Baseball



P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for All Items

Item Description

I. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY A:  (Soccer, Volleyball, 
Basketball, Flag Football) 

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)    Youth Small to Youth Large
2.)    Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.)    Adult 2X Large
4.)    Adult 3X Large & up

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.) Adult 2X Large
4.) Adult 3X Large & up

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.)     Coach Adult Large
2.)     Coach Adult Extra Large
3.)     Coach Adult 2X Large
4.)     Coach Adult 3X Large & up

II. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY B:   
(Fast Pitch Softball, Coach Pitch Baseball, T-Ball, Kick Ball)

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)  Youth Small to Youth Large
2.)  Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.)  Adult 2X Large
4.)  Adult 3X Large & up

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.) Adult 2X Large
4.) Adult 3X Large & up

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.) Coach Adult Large
2.) Coach Adult Extra Large
3.) Coach Adult 2X Large
4.) Coach Adult 3X Large & up

III. MISCELLANEOUS CATEGORY C:  
A.) Hats:  per specifications

1.) Youth Sizes
2.) Adult Sizes

B.)  Socks:  per specifications
1.)  One Size

The City requires delivery within 10 days from date of 
order:  Vendor Offers Delivery

The City requires vendor to delivery reprints/add-ons within 
48 hrs of order:  Vendor Offers Reprints/AddOns
Exceptions

Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price

24-144 $5.00 145-576 $3.95 577 + $3.75 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $5.49 24-144 $3.95 145-576 $3.75 577 + $3.55
24-144 $5.00 145-576 $4.80 577 + $4.60 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $5.49 24-144 $3.95 145-576 $3.75 577 + $3.55

1-12 $6.00 13-24 $5.80 25 + $5.60 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $6.49 1-12 $4.95 13-24 $4.75 25 + $4.55
1-12 $7.00 13-24 $6.80 25 + $6.60 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $6.84 1-12 $5.95 13-24 $5.75 25 + $5.55

24-144 $5.00 145-576 $3.95 577 + $3.75 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $6.20 24-144 $4.25 145-576 $4.05 577 + $4.25
24-144 $5.00 145-576 $4.80 577 + $4.60 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $6.20 24-144 $4.25 145-576 $4.05 577 + $4.25

1-12 $6.00 13-24 $5.80 25 + $5.60 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $7.20 1-12 $5.25 13-24 $5.05 25 + $5.25
1-12 $7.00 13-24 $6.80 25 + $6.60 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $7.50 1-12 $6.25 13-24 $6.05 25 + $6.25

1-12 $5.00 13-24 $5.00 25 + $4.85 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $4.50 1-12 $3.95 13-24 $3.75 25 + $3.55
1-12 $5.00 13-24 $5.00 25 + $4.85 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $4.50 1-12 $3.95 13-24 $3.75 25 + $3.55
1-12 $6.00 13-24 $6.00 25 + $5.85 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $5.50 1-12 $4.95 13-24 $4.95 25 + $4.95
1-12 $7.00 13-24 $7.00 25 + $6.85 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $5.80 1-12 $5.95 13-24 $5.95 25 + $5.95

24-144 $5.50 145-576 $5.50 577 + $5.50 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $6.99 24-144 $5.90 145-576 $5.70 577 + $5.50
24-144 $7.50 145-576 $6.50 577 + $6.50 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $7.75 24-144 $7.90 145-576 $7.70 577 + $7.50

1-12 $8.50 13-24 $7.50 25 + $7.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $8.75 1-12 $8.00 13-24 $7.80 25 + $7.60
1-12 $9.50 13-24 $8.50 25 + $8.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $9.00 1-12 $8.10 13-24 $7.90 25 + $7.70

24-144 $5.50 145-576 $5.50 577 + $5.50 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $7.80 24-144 $6.20 145-576 $6.00 577 + $5.80
24-144 $7.50 145-576 $6.50 577 + $6.50 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $8.65 24-144 $8.20 145-576 $8.00 577 + $7.80

1-12 $8.50 13-24 $7.50 25 + $7.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $9.65 1-12 $8.30 13-24 $8.10 25 + $7.90
1-12 $9.50 13-24 $8.50 25 + $8.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $10.00 1-12 $8.40 13-24 $8.20 25 + $8.00

1-12 $6.50 13-24 $5.50 25 + $5.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $6.50 1-12 $7.90 13-24 $7.70 25 + $7.50
1-12 $7.50 13-24 $6.50 25 + $6.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $6.50 1-12 $8.00 13-24 $7.80 25 + $7.50
1-12 $8.50 13-24 $7.50 25 + $7.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $7.50 1-12 $8.00 13-24 $7.80 25 + $7.50
1-12 $9.50 13-24 $8.50 25 + $8.50 1-12 no bid 13-24 no bid 25 + $8.00 1-12 $8.10 13-24 $7.90 25 + $7.70

24-144 $3.50 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.50 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $2.95 24-144 $4.20 145-576 $4.10 577 + $4.00
24-144 $3.50 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.50 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + $2.95 24-144 $4.30 145-576 $4.20 577 + $4.10

24-144 $3.40 145-576 $3.10 577 + $3.10 24-144 no bid 145-576 no bid 577 + no bid 24-144 $3.99 145-576 $3.89 577 + $3.79

N/A 10 days n/a

N/A 36 hrs n/a
No No No

M & J Trophies & Apparel Touchdown Sportswear Artcraft Embroidery



P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for All Items

Item Description

I. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY A:  (Soccer, Volleyball, 
Basketball, Flag Football) 

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)    Youth Small to Youth Large
2.)    Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.)    Adult 2X Large
4.)    Adult 3X Large & up

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.) Adult 2X Large
4.) Adult 3X Large & up

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.)     Coach Adult Large
2.)     Coach Adult Extra Large
3.)     Coach Adult 2X Large
4.)     Coach Adult 3X Large & up

II. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY B:   
(Fast Pitch Softball, Coach Pitch Baseball, T-Ball, Kick Ball)

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)  Youth Small to Youth Large
2.)  Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.)  Adult 2X Large
4.)  Adult 3X Large & up

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.) Adult 2X Large
4.) Adult 3X Large & up

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.) Coach Adult Large
2.) Coach Adult Extra Large
3.) Coach Adult 2X Large
4.) Coach Adult 3X Large & up

III. MISCELLANEOUS CATEGORY C:  
A.) Hats:  per specifications

1.) Youth Sizes
2.) Adult Sizes

B.)  Socks:  per specifications
1.)  One Size

The City requires delivery within 10 days from date of 
order:  Vendor Offers Delivery

The City requires vendor to delivery reprints/add-ons within 
48 hrs of order:  Vendor Offers Reprints/AddOns
Exceptions

Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price

24-144 $5.50 145-576 $4.75 577 + $4.50 24-144 $4.80 145-576 $4.80 577 + $4.80 24-144 $6.15 145-576 $6.15 577 + $6.15
24-144 $5.50 145-576 $4.75 577 + $4.50 24-144 $4.88 145-576 $4.88 577 + $4.88 24-144 $6.30 145-576 $6.30 577 + $6.30

1-12 $7.75 13-24 $6.75 25 + $6.50 1-12 $6.24 13-24 $6.24 25 + $6.24 1-12 $7.55 13-24 $7.55 25 + $7.55
1-12 $7.90 13-24 $6.90 25 + $6.65 1-12 $6.37 13-24 $6.37 25 + $6.37 1-12 $7.55 13-24 $7.55 25 + $7.55

24-144 $6.50 145-576 $5.65 577 + $5.40 24-144 $5.79 145-576 $5.79 577 + $5.79 24-144 $6.80 145-576 $6.80 577 + $6.80
24-144 $6.50 145-576 $5.65 577 + $5.40 24-144 $5.87 145-576 $5.87 577 + $5.87 24-144 $6.95 145-576 $6.95 577 + $6.95

1-12 $7.95 13-24 $7.00 25 + $6.75 1-12 $7.23 13-24 $7.23 25 + $7.23 1-12 $8.20 13-24 $8.20 25 + $8.20
1-12 $8.15 13-24 $7.15 25 + $6.90 1-12 $7.36 13-24 $7.36 25 + $7.36 1-12 $8.20 13-24 $8.20 25 + $8.20

1-12 $6.75 13-24 $5.25 25 + $4.75 1-12 $4.16 13-24 $4.16 25 + $4.16 1-12 $5.90 13-24 $5.90 25 + $5.90
1-12 $6.75 13-24 $5.25 25 + $4.75 1-12 $4.16 13-24 $4.16 25 + $4.16 1-12 $5.90 13-24 $5.90 25 + $5.90
1-12 $8.25 13-24 $6.75 25 + $6.25 1-12 $5.52 13-24 $5.52 25 + $5.52 1-12 $7.15 13-24 $7.15 25 + $7.15
1-12 $8.40 13-24 $6.90 25 + $6.40 1-12 $5.65 13-24 $5.65 25 + $5.65 1-12 $7.15 13-24 $7.15 25 + $7.15

24-144 $7.50 145-576 $6.70 577 + $6.40 24-144 $6.62 145-576 $6.62 577 + $6.62 24-144 $7.60 145-576 $7.60 577 + $7.60
24-144 $8.25 145-576 $7.45 577 + $7.15 24-144 $7.49 145-576 $7.49 577 + $7.49 24-144 $8.40 145-576 $8.40 577 + $8.40

1-12 $9.45 13-24 $8.70 25 + $8.40 1-12 $8.68 13-24 $8.68 25 + $8.68 1-12 $9.45 13-24 $9.45 25 + $9.45
1-12 $10.45 13-24 $9.70 25 + $9.40 1-12 $9.87 13-24 $9.87 25 + $9.87 1-12 $10.10 13-24 $10.10 25 + $10.10

24-144 $8.75 145-576 $7.70 577 + $7.15 24-144 $7.40 145-576 $7.40 577 + $7.40 24-144 $8.20 145-576 $8.20 577 + $8.20
24-144 $9.50 145-576 $8.45 577 + $7.95 24-144 $8.27 145-576 $8.27 577 + $8.27 24-144 $8.90 145-576 $8.90 577 + $8.90

1-12 $10.50 13-24 $9.45 25 + $9.15 1-12 $9.46 13-24 $9.46 25 + $9.46 1-12 $10.10 13-24 $10.10 25 + $10.10
1-12 $11.50 13-24 $10.45 25 + $10.15 1-12 $10.65 13-24 $10.65 25 + $10.65 1-12 $11.15 13-24 $11.15 25 + $11.15

1-12 $9.75 13-24 $7.95 25 + $7.40 1-12 $6.77 13-24 $6.77 25 + $6.77 1-12 $7.90 13-24 $7.90 25 + $7.90
1-12 $9.75 13-24 $7.95 25 + $7.40 1-12 $6.77 13-24 $6.77 25 + $6.77 1-12 $7.90 13-24 $7.90 25 + $7.90
1-12 $10.75 13-24 $8.95 25 + $8.40 1-12 $7.96 13-24 $7.96 25 + $7.96 1-12 $9.15 13-24 $9.15 25 + $9.15
1-12 $11.75 13-24 $9.95 25 + $9.40 1-12 $9.15 13-24 $9.15 25 + $9.15 1-12 $10.15 13-24 $10.15 25 + $10.15

24-144 $3.75 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.25 24-144 $3.13 145-576 $3.13 577 + $3.13 24-144 $3.25 145-576 $3.25 577 + $3.25
24-144 $3.75 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.25 24-144 $3.13 145-576 $3.13 577 + $3.13 24-144 $3.25 145-576 $3.25 577 + $3.25

24-144 $2.45 145-576 $2.25 577 + $1.99 24-144 $3.25 145-576 $3.25 577 + $3.25 24-144 $2.25 145-576 $2.25 577 + $2.25

10 days 10 days 10 days

48 hrs 48 hrs 48 hrs
No No No

K & S Sports PromotionsAwards by C&L All Star Embroidery



P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for All Items

Item Description

I. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY A:  (Soccer, Volleyball, 
Basketball, Flag Football) 

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)    Youth Small to Youth Large
2.)    Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.)    Adult 2X Large
4.)    Adult 3X Large & up

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.) Adult 2X Large
4.) Adult 3X Large & up

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.)     Coach Adult Large
2.)     Coach Adult Extra Large
3.)     Coach Adult 2X Large
4.)     Coach Adult 3X Large & up

II. SPORTS UNIFORMS CATEGORY B:   
(Fast Pitch Softball, Coach Pitch Baseball, T-Ball, Kick Ball)

A.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s Only on Back 
(per specifications)

1.)  Youth Small to Youth Large
2.)  Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.)  Adult 2X Large
4.)  Adult 3X Large & up

B.) T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, #’s & Sponsor 
Logo on Back (per specs)

1.) Youth Small to Youth Large
2.) Adult Small to Adult Extra Large
3.) Adult 2X Large
4.) Adult 3X Large & up

C.) Coach T-Shirts:  Program Logo on Front, “COACH” 
on Back (per specs)

1.) Coach Adult Large
2.) Coach Adult Extra Large
3.) Coach Adult 2X Large
4.) Coach Adult 3X Large & up

III. MISCELLANEOUS CATEGORY C:  
A.) Hats:  per specifications

1.) Youth Sizes
2.) Adult Sizes

B.)  Socks:  per specifications
1.)  One Size

The City requires delivery within 10 days from date of 
order:  Vendor Offers Delivery

The City requires vendor to delivery reprints/add-ons within 
48 hrs of order:  Vendor Offers Reprints/AddOns
Exceptions

Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price Quantity Unit Price

24-144 $6.27 145-576 $6.15 577 + $6.04 24-144 $5.50 145-576 $5.15 577 + $5.15 24-144 $8.00 145-576 $7.25 577 + $6.00 24-144 $7.90 145-576 $7.20 577 + $6.15
24-144 $6.49 145-576 $6.35 577 + $6.25 24-144 $5.50 145-576 $5.15 577 + $5.15 24-144 $8.00 145-576 $7.25 577 + $6.00 24-144 $7.90 145-576 $7.20 577 + $6.15

1-12 $8.23 13-24 $8.15 25 + $8.05 1-12 $6.50 13-24 $6.15 25 + $6.15 1-12 $9.25 13-24 $8.50 25 + $7.25 1-12 $9.90 13-24 $9.20 25 + $8.15
1-12 $8.50 13-24 $8.40 25 + $8.30 1-12 $7.50 13-24 $7.15 25 + $7.15 1-12 $9.50 13-24 $8.75 25 + $7.50 1-12 $10.90 13-24 $10.20 25 + $9.15

24-144 $7.77 145-576 $7.67 577 + $7.57 24-144 $6.50 145-576 $6.30 577 + $6.30 24-144 $8.25 145-576 $7.50 577 + $6.25 24-144 $8.55 145-576 $7.55 577 + $6.80
24-144 $7.99 145-576 $7.89 577 + $7.79 24-144 $6.50 145-576 $6.30 577 + $6.30 24-144 $8.25 145-576 $7.50 577 + $6.25 24-144 $8.55 145-576 $7.55 577 + $6.80

1-12 $9.73 13-24 $9.63 25 + $9.53 1-12 $7.50 13-24 $7.30 25 + $7.30 1-12 $9.50 13-24 $8.75 25 + $7.50 1-12 $10.55 13-24 $9.55 25 + $8.80
1-12 $9.85 13-24 $9.75 25 + $9.65 1-12 $7.50 13-24 $8.30 25 + $8.30 1-12 $9.75 13-24 $9.00 25 + $7.75 1-12 $11.55 13-24 $10.55 25 + $10.80

1-12 $10.50 13-24 $10.40 25 + $10.30 1-12 $6.00 13-24 $4.80 25 + $4.80 1-12 $6.00 13-24 $5.50 25 + $5.00 1-12 $7.90 13-24 $7.20 25 + $7.20
1-12 $10.50 13-24 $10.40 25 + $10.30 1-12 $6.00 13-24 $4.80 25 + $4.80 1-12 $6.00 13-24 $5.50 25 + $5.00 1-12 $7.90 13-24 $7.20 25 + $7.20
1-12 $12.00 13-24 $11.90 25 + $11.80 1-12 $7.00 13-24 $5.80 25 + $5.80 1-12 $7.25 13-24 $6.75 25 + $6.25 1-12 $9.90 13-24 $9.20 25 + $9.20
1-12 $13.85 13-24 $13.75 25 + $13.65 1-12 $8.00 13-24 $6.80 25 + $6.80 1-12 $7.50 13-24 $7.00 25 + $6.50 1-12 $10.90 13-24 $10.20 25 + $10.20

24-144 $6.27 145-576 $6.15 577 + $6.04 24-144 $10.90 145-576 $10.70 577 + $10.70 24-144 $10.00 145-576 $9.25 577 + $8.50 24-144 $9.15 145-576 $8.15 577 + $7.15
24-144 $6.49 145-576 $6.35 577 + $6.25 24-144 $12.50 145-576 $11.80 577 + $11.80 24-144 $10.00 145-576 $9.25 577 + $8.50 24-144 $10.55 145-576 $9.55 577 + $8.55

1-12 $8.23 13-24 $8.15 25 + $8.05 1-12 $13.50 13-24 $12.80 25 + $12.80 1-12 $11.25 13-24 $10.50 25 + $9.75 1-12 $12.55 13-24 $12.55 25 + $12.55
1-12 $8.50 13-24 $8.40 25 + $8.30 1-12 $14.50 13-24 $13.80 25 + $13.80 1-12 $12.00 13-24 $11.25 25 + $10.50 1-12 $13.55 13-24 $13.55 25 + $13.55

24-144 $7.77 145-576 $7.67 577 + $7.57 24-144 $12.35 145-576 $11.85 577 + $11.85 24-144 $10.25 145-576 $9.50 577 + $8.75 24-144 $10.00 145-576 $8.55 577 + $7.55
24-144 $7.99 145-576 $7.89 577 + $7.79 24-144 $13.45 145-576 $12.95 577 + $12.95 24-144 $10.25 145-576 $9.50 577 + $8.75 24-144 $11.40 145-576 $10.40 577 + $9.40

1-12 $9.73 13-24 $9.63 25 + $9.53 1-12 $14.45 13-24 $13.95 25 + $13.95 1-12 $11.50 13-24 $10.75 25 + $10.00 1-12 $13.40 13-24 $12.40 25 + $12.40
1-12 $8.50 13-24 $9.75 25 + $9.65 1-12 $15.45 13-24 $13.95 25 + $13.95 1-12 $12.00 13-24 $11.50 25 + $11.00 1-12 $14.40 13-24 $13.40 25 + $13.40

1-12 $10.50 13-24 $10.40 25 + $10.30 1-12 $11.95 13-24 $11.45 25 + $11.45 1-12 $6.00 13-24 $5.50 25 + $5.00 1-12 $10.40 13-24 $10.40 25 + $10.40
1-12 $10.50 13-24 $10.40 25 + $10.30 1-12 $11.95 13-24 $11.45 25 + $11.45 1-12 $6.00 13-24 $5.50 25 + $5.00 1-12 $10.40 13-24 $10.40 25 + $10.40
1-12 $12.00 13-24 $11.90 25 + $11.80 1-12 $12.95 13-24 $12.45 25 + $12.45 1-12 $7.00 13-24 $6.50 25 + $6.00 1-12 $12.40 13-24 $12.40 25 + $12.40
1-12 $13.85 13-24 $13.75 25 + $13.65 1-12 $13.95 13-24 $13.40 25 + $13.45 1-12 $7.50 13-24 $7.00 25 + $6.50 1-12 $13.40 13-24 $13.40 25 + $13.40

24-144 $4.00 145-576 $3.90 577 + $3.80 24-144 $3.50 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.50 24-144 $4.00 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.25 24-144 $4.50 145-576 $4.07 577 + $4.07
24-144 $4.00 145-576 $3.90 577 + $3.80 24-144 $3.50 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.50 24-144 $4.00 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.25 24-144 $4.50 145-576 $4.07 577 + $4.07

24-144 $1.92 145-576 $1.92 577 + $1.92 24-144 $1.99 145-576 $1.99 577 + $1.99 24-144 $4.00 145-576 $3.50 577 + $3.25 24-144 $2.50 145-576 $2.50 577 + $2.50

10 days 10 days 10 days *subject to product availability 10 days*

48 hrs 168 hrs 48 hrs *subject to product availability 48 hrs*
No Yes No Yes

Screenprint Plus Byassee Screen Printing & EmbroideryArizona ShirtworksInternational Corporate Apparel



P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for "Sample" Order

Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

Volleyball 
1.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL 96 Each $3.05 $292.80 96 Each $7.00 $672.00 96 Each $4.35 $417.60
2.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL 312 Each $3.15 $982.80 312 Each $7.00 $2,184.00 312 Each $4.26 $1,329.12
3.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L 34 Each $3.25 $110.50 34 Each $7.00 $238.00 34 Each $4.08 $138.72
4.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL 34 Each $3.30 $112.20 34 Each $7.00 $238.00 34 Each $4.08 $138.72

Basketball 
5.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL 222 Each $3.05 $677.10 222 Each $7.00 $1,554.00 222 Each $4.15 $921.30
6.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL 278 Each $3.15 $875.70 278 Each $7.00 $1,946.00 278 Each $4.26 $1,184.28
7.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L 44 Each $3.25 $143.00 44 Each $7.00 $308.00 44 Each $3.84 $168.96
8.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL 56 Each $3.30 $184.80 56 Each $7.00 $392.00 56 Each $3.84 $215.04

Soccer
9.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL 554 Each $3.05 $1,689.70 554 Each $6.00 $3,324.00 554 Each $4.15 $2,299.10
10.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL 166 Each $3.15 $522.90 166 Each $6.00 $996.00 166 Each $4.26 $707.16
11.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L 60 Each $3.25 $195.00 60 Each $7.00 $420.00 60 Each $3.84 $230.40
12.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL 60 Each $3.30 $198.00 60 Each $7.00 $420.00 60 Each $3.84 $230.40
13.) Socks 720 Each $2.55 $1,836.00 720 Each $2.75 $1,980.00 720 Each $2.70 $1,944.00

T-Ball, Kickball
14.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL 336 Each $4.75 $1,596.00 336 Each no bid no bid 336 Each $5.88 $1,975.68
15.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L 23 Each $4.60 $105.80 23 Each no bid no bid 23 Each $6.80 $156.40
16.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL 28 Each $5.20 $145.60 28 Each no bid no bid 28 Each $6.39 $178.92
17.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL 5 Each $5.60 $28.00 5 Each no bid no bid 5 Each $7.90 $39.50
18.) Youth Hats 336 Each $3.20 $1,075.20 336 Each no bid no bid 336 Each $3.20 $1,075.20
19.) Adult Hats 56 Each $3.25 $182.00 56 Each no bid no bid 56 Each $3.33 $186.48

Coach Pitch Baseball
20.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL 144 Each $4.65 $669.60 144 Each no bid no bid 144 Each $6.16 $887.04
21.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL 19 Each $5.20 $98.80 19 Each no bid no bid 19 Each $6.80 $129.20
22.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL 5 Each $5.60 $28.00 5 Each no bid no bid 5 Each $7.90 $39.50
23.) Youth Hats 144 Each $3.25 $468.00 144 Each no bid no bid 144 Each $3.33 $479.52
24.) Adult Hats 24 Each $3.25 $78.00 24 Each no bid no bid 24 Each $3.33 $79.92

no bid no bid
Fast Pitch Softball

25.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL 132 Each $4.65 $613.80 132 Each no bid no bid 132 Each $6.16 $813.12
26.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL 126 Each $4.99 $628.74 126 Each no bid no bid 126 Each $7.10 $894.60
27.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L 5 Each $4.60 $23.00 5 Each no bid no bid 5 Each $7.15 $35.75
28.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL 20 Each $5.20 $104.00 20 Each no bid no bid 20 Each $6.80 $136.00
29.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL 15 Each $5.60 $84.00 15 Each no bid no bid 15 Each $7.55 $113.25
30.) Socks 258 Each $2.65 $683.70 258 Each no bid no bid 258 Each $2.75 $709.50

Base Bid Subtotal $14,432.74 $14,672.00 $17,854.38
Tax 8.50% $1,226.78 6.10% $894.99 8.10% $1,446.20

Base Bid Total $15,659.52 $15,566.99 $19,300.58

Chili Davis Premier BaseballEiger SportswearTeam Sport Outfitters, Inc



P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for "Sample" Order

Item Description

Volleyball 
1.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
2.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
3.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
4.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL

Basketball 
5.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
6.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
7.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
8.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL

Soccer
9.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
10.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
11.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L
12.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
13.) Socks

T-Ball, Kickball
14.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
15.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L
16.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
17.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
18.) Youth Hats
19.) Adult Hats

Coach Pitch Baseball
20.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
21.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
22.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
23.) Youth Hats
24.) Adult Hats

Fast Pitch Softball
25.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
26.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
27.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
28.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
29.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
30.) Socks

Base Bid Subtotal
Tax

Base Bid Total

Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

96 Each $3.95 $379.20 96 Each $5.49 $527.04 96 Each $3.95 $379.20
312 Each $4.80 $1,497.60 312 Each $5.49 $1,712.88 312 Each $3.75 $1,170.00
34 Each $4.85 $164.90 34 Each $5.49 $186.66 34 Each $3.55 $120.70
34 Each $4.85 $164.90 34 Each $5.49 $186.66 34 Each $3.55 $120.70

222 Each $3.75 $832.50 222 Each $5.49 $1,218.78 222 Each $3.75 $832.50
278 Each $4.60 $1,278.80 278 Each $5.49 $1,526.22 278 Each $3.75 $1,042.50
44 Each $4.85 $213.40 44 Each $5.49 $241.56 44 Each $3.75 $165.00
56 Each $4.85 $271.60 56 Each $5.49 $307.44 56 Each $3.55 $198.80

554 Each $3.75 $2,077.50 554 Each $5.49 $3,041.46 554 Each $3.55 $1,966.70
166 Each $4.60 $763.60 166 Each $5.49 $911.34 166 Each $3.75 $622.50
60 Each $4.85 $291.00 60 Each $5.49 $329.40 60 Each $3.55 $213.00
60 Each $4.85 $291.00 60 Each $5.49 $329.40 60 Each $3.55 $213.00
720 Each $3.10 $2,232.00 720 Each no bid no bid 720 Each $3.79 $2,728.80

336 Each $5.50 $1,848.00 336 Each $6.99 $2,348.64 336 Each $5.70 $1,915.20
23 Each $6.50 $149.50 23 Each $7.75 $178.25 23 Each $7.70 $177.10
28 Each $6.50 $182.00 28 Each $7.75 $217.00 28 Each $7.80 $218.40
5 Each $7.50 $37.50 5 Each $8.75 $43.75 5 Each $8.00 $40.00

336 Each $3.50 $1,176.00 336 Each $2.95 $991.20 336 Each $4.10 $1,377.60
56 Each $3.50 $196.00 56 Each $2.95 $165.20 56 Each $4.30 $240.80

144 Each $5.50 $792.00 144 Each $6.99 $1,006.56 144 Each $5.90 $849.60
19 Each $6.50 $123.50 19 Each $7.75 $147.25 19 Each $7.80 $148.20
5 Each $7.50 $37.50 5 Each $8.75 $43.75 5 Each $8.00 $40.00

144 Each $3.50 $504.00 144 Each $2.95 $424.80 144 Each $4.20 $604.80
24 Each $3.50 $84.00 24 Each $2.95 $70.80 24 Each $4.30 $103.20

132 Each $5.50 $726.00 132 Each $6.99 $922.68 132 Each $5.90 $778.80
126 Each $6.50 $819.00 126 Each $7.75 $976.50 126 Each $7.90 $995.40
5 Each $6.50 $32.50 5 Each $7.75 $38.75 5 Each $7.90 $39.50

20 Each $6.50 $130.00 20 Each $7.75 $155.00 20 Each $7.80 $156.00
15 Each $7.50 $112.50 15 Each $8.75 $131.25 15 Each $7.80 $117.00
258 Each $3.10 $799.80 258 Each no bid no bid 258 Each $3.89 $1,003.62

$18,207.80 $18,380.22 $18,578.62
8.30% $1,511.25 8.10% $1,488.80 8.30% $1,542.03

$19,719.05 $19,869.02 $20,120.65

Touchdown Sportswear Artcraft EmbroideryM & J Trophies & Apparel



P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for "Sample" Order

Item Description

Volleyball 
1.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
2.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
3.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
4.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL

Basketball 
5.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
6.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
7.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
8.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL

Soccer
9.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
10.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
11.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L
12.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
13.) Socks

T-Ball, Kickball
14.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
15.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L
16.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
17.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
18.) Youth Hats
19.) Adult Hats

Coach Pitch Baseball
20.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
21.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
22.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
23.) Youth Hats
24.) Adult Hats

Fast Pitch Softball
25.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
26.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
27.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
28.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
29.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
30.) Socks

Base Bid Subtotal
Tax

Base Bid Total

Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

96 Each $5.50 $528.00 96 Each $4.80 $460.80 96 Each $6.15 $590.40
312 Each $4.75 $1,482.00 312 Each $4.88 $1,522.56 312 Each $6.30 $1,965.60
34 Each $4.75 $161.50 34 Each $4.16 $141.44 34 Each $5.90 $200.60
34 Each $4.75 $161.50 34 Each $4.16 $141.44 34 Each $5.90 $200.60

222 Each $4.75 $1,054.50 222 Each $4.80 $1,065.60 222 Each $6.15 $1,365.30
278 Each $4.75 $1,320.50 278 Each $4.88 $1,356.64 278 Each $6.30 $1,751.40
44 Each $4.75 $209.00 44 Each $4.16 $183.04 44 Each $5.90 $259.60
56 Each $4.75 $266.00 56 Each $4.16 $232.96 56 Each $5.90 $330.40

$0.00
$0.00

554 Each $4.75 $2,631.50 554 Each $4.80 $2,659.20 554 Each $6.15 $3,407.10
166 Each $4.75 $788.50 166 Each $4.88 $810.08 166 Each $6.30 $1,045.80
60 Each $4.75 $285.00 60 Each $4.16 $249.60 60 Each $5.90 $354.00
60 Each $4.75 $285.00 60 Each $4.16 $249.60 60 Each $5.90 $354.00
720 Each $1.99 $1,432.80 720 Each $3.25 $2,340.00 720 Each $2.25 $1,620.00

336 Each $6.70 $2,251.20 336 Each $6.62 $2,224.32 336 Each $7.60 $2,553.60
23 Each $7.95 $182.85 23 Each $6.77 $155.71 23 Each $7.90 $181.70
28 Each $7.40 $207.20 28 Each $6.77 $189.56 28 Each $7.90 $221.20
5 Each $10.75 $53.75 5 Each $7.96 $39.80 5 Each $9.15 $45.75

336 Each $3.50 $1,176.00 336 Each $2.98 $1,001.28 336 Each $3.25 $1,092.00
56 Each $3.75 $210.00 56 Each $3.13 $175.28 56 Each $3.25 $182.00

144 Each $7.50 $1,080.00 144 Each $6.62 $953.28 144 Each $7.60 $1,094.40
19 Each $8.25 $156.75 19 Each $6.77 $128.63 19 Each $7.90 $150.10
5 Each $10.75 $53.75 5 Each $7.96 $39.80 5 Each $7.90 $39.50

144 Each $3.75 $540.00 144 Each $3.13 $450.72 144 Each $3.25 $468.00
24 Each $3.75 $90.00 24 Each $3.13 $75.12 24 Each $3.25 $78.00

132 Each $7.50 $990.00 132 Each $6.62 $873.84 132 Each $7.60 $1,003.20
126 Each $8.25 $1,039.50 126 Each $7.49 $943.74 126 Each $8.40 $1,058.40
5 Each $9.75 $48.75 5 Each $6.77 $33.85 5 Each $7.90 $39.50

20 Each $7.95 $159.00 20 Each $6.77 $135.40 20 Each $7.90 $158.00
15 Each $8.95 $134.25 15 Each $7.96 $119.40 15 Each $9.15 $137.25
258 Each $2.25 $580.50 258 Each $3.25 $838.50 258 Each $2.25 $580.50

$19,559.30 $19,791.19 $22,527.90
8.10% $1,584.30 8.10% $1,603.09 8.70% $1,959.93

$21,143.60 $21,394.28 $24,487.83

All Star EmbroideryAwards by C&L K & S Sports Promotions



P08-0021, Youth Sports Uniforms
Bid Tabulation for "Sample" Order

Item Description

Volleyball 
1.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
2.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
3.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
4.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL

Basketball 
5.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
6.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
7.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
8.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL

Soccer
9.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
10.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
11.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L
12.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
13.) Socks

T-Ball, Kickball
14.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
15.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: L
16.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
17.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
18.) Youth Hats
19.) Adult Hats

Coach Pitch Baseball
20.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
21.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
22.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
23.) Youth Hats
24.) Adult Hats

Fast Pitch Softball
25.) Youth T-Shirts, Size: YS-YL
26.) Adult T-Shirts, Size: AS-AXL
27.) Coach T-Shirts, Size:  L
28.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: XL
29.) Coach T-Shirts, Size: 2XL
30.) Socks

Base Bid Subtotal
Tax

Base Bid Total

Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price

96 Each $6.27 $601.92 96 Each $5.15 $494.40 96 Each $8.00 $768.00 96 Each $7.90 $758.40
312 Each $6.35 $1,981.20 312 Each $5.15 $1,606.80 312 Each $7.25 $2,262.00 312 Each $7.20 $2,246.40
34 Each $10.30 $350.20 34 Each $4.80 $163.20 34 Each $5.00 $170.00 34 Each $7.20 $244.80
34 Each $10.30 $350.20 34 Each $4.80 $163.20 34 Each $5.00 $170.00 34 Each $7.20 $244.80

222 Each $6.15 $1,365.30 222 Each $5.15 $1,143.30 222 Each $7.25 $1,609.50 222 Each $7.20 $1,598.40
278 Each $6.35 $1,765.30 278 Each $5.15 $1,431.70 278 Each $7.25 $2,015.50 278 Each $7.20 $2,001.60
44 Each $10.50 $462.00 44 Each $4.80 $211.20 44 Each $5.00 $220.00 44 Each $9.20 $404.80
56 Each $10.30 $576.80 56 Each $4.80 $268.80 56 Each $5.00 $280.00 56 Each $9.20 $515.20

554 Each $6.04 $3,346.16 554 Each $5.15 $2,853.10 554 Each $7.25 $4,016.50 554 Each $7.20 $3,988.80
166 Each $6.35 $1,054.10 166 Each $5.15 $854.90 166 Each $7.25 $1,203.50 166 Each $7.20 $1,195.20
60 Each $10.30 $618.00 60 Each $4.80 $288.00 60 Each $5.00 $300.00 60 Each $7.20 $432.00
60 Each $10.30 $618.00 60 Each $4.80 $288.00 60 Each $5.00 $300.00 60 Each $7.20 $432.00
720 Each $1.92 $1,382.40 720 Each $1.99 $1,432.80 720 Each $3.25 $2,340.00 720 Each $2.50 $1,800.00

336 Each $6.15 $2,066.40 336 Each $10.70 $3,595.20 336 Each $9.25 $3,108.00 336 Each $8.15 $2,738.40
23 Each $10.40 $239.20 23 Each $11.45 $263.35 23 Each $5.50 $126.50 23 Each $10.40 $239.20
28 Each $10.30 $288.40 28 Each $11.45 $320.60 28 Each $5.00 $140.00 28 Each $10.40 $291.20
5 Each $12.00 $60.00 5 Each $12.95 $64.75 5 Each $7.00 $35.00 5 Each $12.40 $62.00

336 Each $3.90 $1,310.40 336 Each $3.50 $1,176.00 336 Each $3.50 $1,176.00 336 Each $4.07 $1,367.52
56 Each $4.00 $224.00 56 Each $3.50 $196.00 56 Each $4.00 $224.00 56 Each $4.07 $227.92

144 Each $6.27 $902.88 144 Each $10.70 $1,540.80 144 Each $10.00 $1,440.00 144 Each $10.00 $1,440.00
19 Each $10.40 $197.60 19 Each $11.45 $217.55 19 Each $5.50 $104.50 19 Each $10.40 $197.60
5 Each $12.00 $60.00 5 Each $11.95 $59.75 5 Each $7.00 $35.00 5 Each $12.40 $62.00

144 Each $4.00 $576.00 144 Each $3.50 $504.00 144 Each $4.00 $576.00 144 Each $4.07 $586.08
24 Each $4.00 $96.00 24 Each $3.50 $84.00 24 Each $4.00 $96.00 24 Each $4.07 $97.68

132 Each $6.27 $827.64 132 Each $10.70 $1,412.40 132 Each $10.00 $1,320.00 132 Each $9.15 $1,207.80
126 Each $6.27 $790.02 126 Each $11.45 $1,442.70 126 Each $10.00 $1,260.00 126 Each $10.55 $1,329.30
5 Each $10.50 $52.50 5 Each $11.95 $59.75 5 Each $6.00 $30.00 5 Each $10.40 $52.00

20 Each $10.40 $208.00 20 Each $11.95 $239.00 20 Each $5.50 $110.00 20 Each $10.40 $208.00
15 Each $11.90 $178.50 15 Each $12.95 $194.25 15 Each $6.50 $97.50 15 Each $12.40 $186.00
258 Each $1.92 $495.36 258 Each $1.99 $513.42 258 Each $3.50 $903.00 258 Each $2.50 $645.00

$23,044.48 $23,082.92 $26,436.50 $26,800.10
8.10% $1,866.60 8.10% $1,869.72 6.30% $1,665.50 8.80% $2,358.41

$24,911.08 $24,952.64 $28,102.00 $29,158.51

Byassee Screen Printing & EmbroideryArizona ShirtworksScreenprint PlusInternational Corporate Apparel
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