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1215 Copper Tubing, ¾” Soft, 100 Ft. Coil, Single Roll EA 15 no bid no bid $335.00 $5,025.00 no bid
1216 Copper Tubing, 1” Soft, 100 Foot Coil, Single Roll EA 40 no bid no bid $516.00 $20,640.00 no bid
1218 Copper Tubing, 2” K-40 Roll EA 2 no bid no bid $480.80 $961.60 no bid
1267 Grip Cable, WKG510 EA 4 $220.00 $880.00 $134.64 $538.56 $513.80 $2,055.20 no bid
1269 Cutting Head, ¾” X 1” WCH500 EA 2 $255.00 $510.00 $156.06 $312.12 $310.73 $621.46 no bid
1270 Tail Piece,1/2"for 3/4"WAD534 EA 3 $51.67 $155.01 $31.62 $94.86 $62.93 $188.79 no bid
1283 Cable, 50 Ft., 3/8” - 6 X 19 w/ ¾” Lead EA 1 $160.00 $160.00 $97.92 $97.92 $194.93 $194.93 no bid
1284 Cable, 75 Ft., 3/8 ”- 6 X 19 w/ ¾” Lead EA 2 $180.00 $360.00 $110.16 $220.32 $219.33 $438.66 no bid
1285 Cable, 100 Ft., 3/8” - 6 X 19 w/ ¾” Lead EA 1 $210.00 $210.00 $128.52 $128.52 $255.87 $255.87 no bid
1286 Bolt, Brass, 1 1/2" Meter EA 300 $6.65 $1,995.00 $4.07 $1,221.00 $3.01 $903.00 no bid
1287 Bolt, Brass, 2" Meter MFG EA 400 $6.65 $2,660.00 $16.32 $6,528.00 $3.01 $1,204.00 no bid
1288 Nut, Brass for 1 1/2"meter EA 250 $1.45 $362.50 $0.99 $247.50 $0.75 $187.50 no bid
1289 Nut, Brass for 2"meter EA 400 $1.45 $580.00 $1.42 $568.00 $0.75 $300.00 no bid
1293 Angle Meter Stop, 3/4", #KV43332W EA 100 $29.35 $2,935.00 $17.87 $1,787.00 $17.42 $1,742.00 $19.19 $1,919.00
1294 Meter Coupling, 3/4"x2.5", #C3823-2.5 EA 1100 $7.18 $7,898.00 $4.37 $4,807.00 $4.30 $4,730.00 $4.68 $5,148.00
1295 Elbow, Brass, 90 Degree - 3/4", #62235 EA 50 $3.33 $166.50 $2.12 $106.00 $2.48 $124.00 no bid
1296 Elbow, Brass, 45 Degrees - 3/4", #3407545NS EA 10 no bid $2.12 $21.20 $2.48 $24.80 no bid
1299 Nipple, Brass, 3/4" Close EA 20 $1.67 $33.40 $1.24 $24.80 $1.47 $29.40 no bid
1302 Nipple, Brass, 3/4"x 4" EA 20 $5.00 $100.00 $2.71 $54.20 $3.34 $66.80 no bid
1305 Gasket, Rubber meter 3/4"x1/8",GT114 EA 6500 $0.32 $2,080.00 $0.20 $1,300.00 $0.21 $1,365.00 $0.25 $1,625.00
1307 Gasket, Rubber, 1" x 1-1/8", #GT120 EA 5000 $0.33 $1,650.00 $0.22 $1,100.00 $0.23 $1,150.00 $0.28 $1,400.00
1310 Bushing, Brass Reducer, 3/4" x 1" EA 50 $3.33 $166.50 $1.80 $90.00 $2.21 $110.50 no bid
1311 Adapter, Male, 3/4",  #C84-33, Brass EA 50 $11.40 $570.00 $6.73 $336.50 $6.73 $336.50 $7.22 $361.00
1312 Adapter, Female, 3/4", #C14-33 EA 10 $11.63 $116.30 $7.08 $70.80 $7.16 $71.60 $7.58 $75.80
1313 Meter Adapter, 3/4" x 1", #A-34 EA 500 $14.07 $7,035.00 $4.28 $2,140.00 $4.40 $2,200.00 $4.60 $2,300.00
1314 Valve, Brass T-Head ball, 3/4", #B11-333W EA 50 $39.53 $1,976.50 $24.07 $1,203.50 $24.30 $1,215.00 $25.77 $1,288.50
1315 Adapter,3/4", A95016 EA 50 $20.70 $1,035.00 $12.61 $630.50 no bid no bid
1316 Coupling, Brass, 3/4", #C44-33 EA 25 $13.90 $347.50 $8.20 $205.00 $8.19 $204.75 $8.78 $219.50
1317 Corp Stop, CTS/PJ 3/4", #F1100-3 EA 50 $24.70 $1,235.00 $15.04 $752.00 $14.67 $733.50 $16.12 $806.00
1318 Corp Stop, Tapered 3/4", #F1000-3 EA 10 $24.70 $247.00 $15.04 $150.40 $14.67 $146.70 $16.12 $161.20
1319 Elbow, Brass, 90 Degree - 1", #62235 EA 10 $5.00 $50.00 $3.26 $32.60 $3.83 $38.30 no bid
1320 Elbow, Brass, 45 Degree - 1", #34145 EA 10 no bid $3.57 $35.70 $4.19 $41.90 no bid
1321 Tee, Brass, 1", #62460 EA 10 $8.33 $83.30 $4.62 $46.20 $5.42 $54.20 no bid
1322 Coupling, Brass, Threaded 1", # EA 5 $5.00 $25.00 $2.74 $13.70 $3.05 $15.25 no bid
1323 Plug, Brass, 1", #62396 EA 5 $1.67 $8.35 $1.63 $8.15 $1.91 $9.55 no bid
1324 Nipple, Brass, 1" Close EA 10 $3.33 $33.30 $1.82 $18.20 $2.17 $21.70 no bid
1325 Valve, Brass Gate 1", #T1-8 / 514T05 EA 10 $14.17 $141.70 $4.00 $40.00 $5.78 $57.80 no bid
1326 Nipple, Brass, 1" x 3", #33103 EA 10 $5.00 $50.00 $3.04 $30.40 $3.59 $35.90 no bid
1327 Nipple, Brass, 1" x 4" EA 10 $6.67 $66.70 $3.95 $39.50 $4.68 $46.80 no bid
1328 Valve, Ball, 1", #B43-444W EA 20 $75.20 $1,504.00 $45.80 $916.00 $46.20 $924.00 $49.04 $980.80
1331 Valve, Brass T-Head Ball, 1", #B11-444W EA 25 $60.57 $1,514.25 $36.88 $922.00 $37.21 $930.25 $39.49 $987.25
1332 Adapter, Female, 1", #C14-44, Brass EA 25 $15.78 $394.50 $9.81 $245.25 $10.29 $257.25 $10.29 $257.25
1333 Adapter, Male, 1", #C84-44 EA 40 $13.10 $524.00 $7.99 $319.60 $7.95 $318.00 $8.55 $342.00
1334 Coupling, Meter 1"x 2 1/2", #C38-44-2-625 EA 2500 $11.05 $27,625.00 $6.74 $16,850.00 $6.34 $15,850.00 $7.22 $18,050.00
1335 Elbow, Brass, 1", #L44-44 EA 25 $22.37 $559.25 $13.62 $340.50 $12.93 $323.25 $14.59 $364.75
1336 Coupling,C44-44, 1", Brass EA 40 $15.40 $616.00 $9.38 $375.20 $8.94 $357.60 $10.05 $402.00
1337 Angle Meter Stop, 1", #KV43-444W EA 40 $40.18 $1,607.20 $24.47 $978.80 $23.87 $954.80 $26.28 $1,051.20
1338 Adapter, Iron Pipe, 1", #A95017 EA 40 $26.45 $1,058.00 $16.11 $644.40 no bid no bid
1339 Angle Stop, 1", #BA43-444W EA 25 $84.02 $2,100.50 $51.16 $1,279.00 $51.63 $1,290.75 $54.79 $1,369.75
1340 Corp Stop, 1", #F1100-4 EA 40 $37.37 $1,494.80 $22.76 $910.40 $22.21 $888.40 $24.37 $974.80
1341 Elbow, 90 Degree, Brass - 1 1/2", #L44-66 EA 10 $65.63 $656.30 $39.97 $399.70 $39.85 $398.50 $42.82 $428.20
1342 Gasket, Rubber GT 120 1"x1 1/8" EA 5 $0.33 $1.65 $0.22 $1.10 $0.23 $1.15 $0.28 $1.40
1343 Angle Stop, 1 1/2", #FV43-666W EA 10 $127.20 $1,272.00 $77.46 $774.60 $75.52 $755.20 no bid
1344 Repair Nut, Asm,1 1/2", NGJJJ4 EA 5 $20.72 $103.60 $12.66 $63.30 no bid no bid
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1347 Corp Stop, 1 1/2", #FB11006 EA 10 $96.17 $961.70 $58.58 $585.80 $57.14 $571.40 $62.72 $627.20
1349 Nipple, Brass, 1 1/2" Close, #BN15-000 EA 10 $6.67 $66.70 $3.57 $35.70 $4.25 $42.50 no bid
1350 Bushing, Brass Reducer, 2"x 1 1/2", #62144 EA 10 $10.00 $100.00 $5.83 $58.30 $6.48 $64.80 no bid
1351 Flange, Meter, 1 1/2", #CF31-66 EA 40 $29.23 $1,169.20 $17.80 $712.00 $19.07 $762.80 $19.07 $762.80
1352 Gasket, Rubber, 1 1/2" EA 200 $2.75 $550.00 $1.69 $338.00 $1.14 $228.00 no bid
1353 Adapter, Male, 1 1/2", #C84-66 EA 25 $32.80 $820.00 $19.97 $499.25 $19.92 $498.00 $21.40 $535.00
1354 Adapter, Female, 1 1/2", #C14-66 EA 5 $41.95 $209.75 $25.55 $127.75 $25.46 $127.30 $27.37 $136.85
1355 Coupling, 1 1/2", #C44-66 EA 10 $47.13 $471.30 $28.70 $287.00 $28.60 $286.00 $30.74 $307.40
1356 Elbow, Brass, 45 Degree - 1 1/2", #62290 EA 5 $13.33 $66.65 $7.15 $35.75 $8.40 $42.00 no bid
1358 Elbow, Brass 90' 1 1/2" EA 5 $11.67 $58.35 $6.47 $32.35 $7.60 $38.00 no bid
1360 Coupling, Brass Threaded, 2", #62195 EA 5 $18.33 $91.65 $9.60 $48.00 $10.66 $53.30 no bid
1361 Elbow, Brass, 45 Degree - 2", #62290 EA 5 $21.67 $108.35 $11.59 $57.95 $13.61 $68.05 no bid
1362 Elbow, Brass, 90 Degree - 2", #62235 EA 5 $20.00 $100.00 $10.55 $52.75 $12.38 $61.90 no bid
1363 Bushing, Brass Reducer, 2"x1", #62144 EA 10 $13.33 $133.30 $7.01 $70.10 $7.81 $78.10 no bid
1365 Nipple, Brass 2" Close EA 5 $10.00 $50.00 $5.44 $27.20 $6.48 $32.40 no bid
1366 Nipple, Brass 2" x 3" EA 5 $13.33 $66.65 $6.68 $33.40 $8.07 $40.35 no bid
1367 Nipple, Brass 2" x 4" EA 5 $16.67 $83.35 $8.74 $43.70 $10.56 $52.80 no bid
1369 Flange, Meter, 2", #CF31-77 EA 50 $38.17 $1,908.50 $23.24 $1,162.00 $24.89 $1,244.50 $24.89 $1,244.50
1370 Gasket, Rubber, 2" GT141 EA 250 $3.13 $782.50 $1.91 $477.50 $1.56 $390.00 $2.25 $562.50
1372 Adapter, Male, 2", #C84-77, Brass EA 5 $47.80 $239.00 $29.11 $145.55 $29.02 $145.10 $31.17 $155.85
1373 Adapter, Female, 2", #C14-77 EA 5 $49.97 $249.85 $30.43 $152.15 $30.35 $151.75 $32.58 $162.90
1374 Coupling, 2", #C44-77 EA 5 $63.63 $318.15 $38.75 $193.75 $38.63 $193.15 $41.50 $207.50
1375 Elbow, Brass, 90 Degree - 2", #L44-77 EA 5 $132.80 $664.00 $80.88 $404.40 $80.63 $403.15 $86.62 $433.10
1376 Valve, Brass T-Head Ball , 2", #B11-777W EA 10 $163.12 $1,631.20 $99.34 $993.40 $100.23 $1,002.30 $106.38 $1,063.80
1377 Corp Stop, 2", #FB11007 EA 5 $159.07 $795.35 $96.88 $484.40 $93.50 $467.50 $103.74 $518.70
1378 Angle Stop, 2", #BFA43-777W EA 10 $224.93 $2,249.30 $136.96 $1,369.60 $124.59 $1,245.90 $146.68 $1,466.80
1379 Plastic Repair ring,2" EA 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1381 Corp Stop Repair Nut Assembly, 2", #67NGK4NSS EA 5 no bid $12.99 $64.95 $13.22 $66.10 no bid
1382 Meter Stop, w/Flange, 2", #BF13-777W EA 5 $185.17 $925.85 $112.77 $563.85 $113.71 $568.55 $120.76 $603.80
1387 Saddle, Brass AC/IP, 6" x 1", #202B750-IP4 EA 25 $97.77 $2,444.25 $59.59 $1,489.75 $57.50 $1,437.50 $63.92 $1,598.00
1388 Saddle, Brass AC/IP, 8" x 2", #202B962-IP7 EA 5 $138.67 $693.35 $84.45 $422.25 $83.45 $417.25 $90.66 $453.30
1389 Saddle, Brass AC/IP, 10" x 1", #202B1212-IP4 EA 5 $149.88 $749.40 $91.28 $456.40 $90.11 $450.55 $97.99 $489.95
1392 Saddle, PVC, 6.625" x 3/4", #S71603 EA 1 $43.40 $43.40 $26.44 $26.44 $25.50 $25.50 $28.38 $28.38
1397 Saddle, Brass C900, 9.05" x 1", #S90804 EA 1 no bid $37.00 $37.00 $38.72 $38.72 $39.73 $39.73
1400 Saddleback/IP 6x2",202B750IP7 EA 1 $122.80 $122.80 $74.78 $74.78 $73.85 $73.85 $80.28 $80.28
1401 Saddle, Brass AC/IP, 8" x 1", #202B962-IP4 EA 10 $120.98 $1,209.80 $73.68 $736.80 $72.73 $727.30 $79.09 $790.90
1402 Saddle, Brass AC/IP, 12" x 2", #202B1438-IP7 EA 5 $201.42 $1,007.10 $122.66 $613.30 $121.14 $605.70 $131.68 $658.40
1409 Repair Band, 6.84-7.24" x 12", #FSI724-12.5 EA 5 $80.58 $402.90 $49.08 $245.40 $155.61 $778.05 no bid
1410 Repair Band, 7.05-7.45" x 7.5", #FSI745-7.5 EA 5 $60.48 $302.40 $36.88 $184.40 $97.61 $488.05 no bid
1413 Repair Band, 8.39-9.39" x 7.5", #FSI939-7.5 EA 4 $59.10 $236.40 $35.99 $143.96 $102.26 $409.04 no bid
1415 Repair Band, 8.99-9.39" x 10", #FSI939-10 EA 1 no bid $44.48 $44.48 $164.61 $164.61 no bid
1416 Repair Band  8.99-9.39"x12" EA 1 $88.43 $88.43 $53.88 $53.88 $164.61 $164.61 no bid
1417 Repair Band, 9.27-9.67" x 12", #FSI967-12.5 EA 4 $88.43 $353.72 $53.88 $215.52 $164.61 $658.44 no bid
1440 Copper Tubing (K), 1 ½” Hard, 20 Ft. Length, FT 2 no bid no bid $146.20 $292.40 no bid
1441 Copper Tubing (K), 2” Hard, 20 Ft. Length FT 4 no bid no bid $209.00 $836.00 no bid
1442 Meter Box, Riser (1/2 box), #82CMB15NS EA 10 no bid no bid $34.54 $345.40 no bid
1443 Meter Box, for 3/4" meter, #82CMB1 EA 25 $16.67 $416.75 no bid $34.54 $863.50 no bid
1444 Meter Box, for 1" meter, #82CMB2 EA 30 $33.08 $992.40 no bid $73.24 $2,197.20 no bid
1445 Meter Box, for 1 1/2" & 2" meters, #82CMB4 EA 25 $46.83 $1,170.75 no bid $120.36 $3,009.00 no bid
1454 Sleeve, DI MJ 6" x 6", #18L06SS EA 5 $37.12 $185.60 no bid $26.95 $134.75 no bid
1455 Sleeve, DI MJ 6" x 12", #18L06SL EA 5 $46.18 $230.90 no bid $36.27 $181.35 no bid
1456 Valve, DI, FLG x MJ 6" EA 5 $569.33 $2,846.65 no bid $379.54 $1,897.70 no bid
1457 Valve, DI, MJ x MJ 6" EA 10 $569.33 $5,693.30 no bid $379.54 $3,795.40 no bid
1459 Mega-lug Retainer, PVC C900 6", #UFR-1500-C-6 EA 6 $29.65 $177.90 $18.06 $108.36 $21.09 $126.54 no bid
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1464 Mega-lug Retainer, MJ 8", #UFR1400-D-8 EA 6 $35.75 $214.50 $21.77 $130.62 $25.44 $152.64 no bid
1466 Follower Kit, MJ 8" MJ8STD Kit EA 6 $15.63 $93.78 no bid $8.75 $52.50 no bid
1479 Valve, I MJ x MJ 12" EA 1 $1,789.33 $1,789.33 $949.25 $949.25 $1,192.63 $1,192.63 no bid
1480 Valve, DI, MJ x MJ 8" EA 4 $906.87 $3,627.48 $479.80 $1,919.20 $604.50 $2,418.00 no bid
1481 Mega-lug Retainer, Split 12", #UFR-1300-C-12 EA 2 $85.20 $170.40 $51.88 $103.76 $61.97 $123.94 no bid
1484 Flex Coupling, 6.90-7.20", #FCI-720-720 EA 6 no bid $33.52 $201.12 $130.70 $784.20 no bid
1486 Maxistep, 6.59" x 7.60", #62XR50506NS EA 20 $130.12 $2,602.40 $76.41 $1,528.20 $130.70 $2,614.00 no bid
1487 Flex Coupling, 7.21" x 7.56", #FC2A756-756 EA 6 $86.03 $516.18 $52.39 $314.34 $130.70 $784.20 no bid
1488 Maxistep Coupling, 8.90" x 9.84", #62XR50108NS EA 10 $152.78 $1,527.80 $89.20 $892.00 $142.99 $1,429.90 no bid
1489 Lid, Sewer 8", #51LDI8S EA 10 $13.33 $133.30 no bid $11.03 $110.30 no bid
1490 Monument, Valve Box, Cast Iron Detail 198, #51198 EA 60 $34.48 $2,068.80 no bid $39.22 $2,353.20 no bid
1491 Lid, Water, 8", Detail 198, #51LDI8W EA 75 $14.03 $1,052.25 no bid $13.46 $1,009.50 no bid
1492 Bury, 16", #57P16BNS EA 5 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1493 Bury, 24", #57H624 EA 5 $169.09 $845.45 no bid no bid no bid
1494 Hydrant Installation Kit, #7077636-00 EA 75 $9.25 $693.75 no bid $17.33 $1,299.75 no bid
1495 Extension, 6" Wet Barrel, #5706EXTNS EA 10 $51.67 $516.70 no bid $48.72 $487.20 no bid
1496 Check Valve, Wet Barrel, #LB400 EA 25 $976.08 $24,402.00 no bid $523.33 $13,083.25 no bid
1497 Hydrant, Head only, Residential, #AVK850 Yellow EA 15 no bid $485.35 $7,280.25 $555.56 $8,333.40 no bid
1498 Hydrant, Head Only, Commercial, #AVK 24-150-90 Yellow EA 15 no bid $679.75 $10,196.25 $777.78 $11,666.70 no bid
1912 Follower Kit, MJ 6", #18A06 EA 16 $13.26 $212.16 no bid $6.78 $108.48 no bid
1954 Waterous Operating Nut #17, One-piece, #57W17L150P EA 5 $195.20 $976.00 no bid $234.24 $1,171.20 no bid
1974 Hydrant, Brass Coupling, #SA-39S10-AB EA 10 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1975 Hydrant, Brass Coupling, #SA-3910-AB EA 10 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1976 Hydrant, Brass Coupling, #SA-3906-AB EA 10 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1977 Hydrant, Brass Coupling - #76-1 EA 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1978 Hydrant, Brass Coupling, 76-2, #9576NSS EA 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1979 Gasket, Rubber, 2.5", #73P2546 EA 30 $4.83 $144.90 no bid no bid no bid
1980 Valve, Gate 3", Female X Female, Iron Pipe Thread, #TI-8 EA 5 no bid no bid $51.31 $256.55 no bid
2065 Adapter, Meter, 1" to 2" Flange, #A47 EA 15 $103.03 $1,545.45 $31.42 $471.30 $72.73 $1,090.95 $32.55 $488.25
2066 Adapter, Meter, 1 1/2" to 1" Flange, #A46 EA 20 $100.67 $2,013.40 $30.66 $613.20 $71.06 $1,421.20 $31.80 $636.00
2193 Angle Meter, 3/4" x 1", #KV43-342W EA 125 $32.48 $4,060.00 $19.78 $2,472.50 $20.29 $2,536.25 $21.24 $2,655.00
2204 Gasket, Hydrant Cap, 1.625 x 3.125 Ring, Sm, EA 1050 $0.65 $682.50 no bid no bid no bid
2205 Gasket, Hydrant Cap, 3.125 x 5.75 Ring, Lge, EA 1000 $1.33 $1,330.00 no bid no bid no bid
2228 Hose Nozzle, NST 2.5, #57W12ANST25 EA 2 $70.15 $140.30 no bid no bid no bid
2229 Hose Nozzle, NST 2.5, #57K8140HNST EA 3 $67.42 $202.26 no bid $55.49 $166.47 no bid
2230 Pumper Nozzle, NST 4 1/2", #57W12ANST EA 1 $199.27 $199.27 no bid no bid no bid
2231 Extension Assembly, 6", #57WE06 EA 5 $333.47 $1,667.35 no bid no bid no bid
2232 Steamer Nozzle, NST, #57K8142SNST EA 1 $149.75 $149.75 no bid no bid no bid
2233 Cross Arm, Bronze No. 30, #57W30B EA 1 $77.47 $77.47 no bid no bid no bid
2274 Gasket, 1.5" Meter, #67GT15NS EA 10 no bid no bid $1.14 $11.40 no bid
2275 Gasket, 2" Meter, #67GT2NS EA 20 no bid no bid $1.56 $31.20 no bid
2282 Break Coupling Pin, #K8122 EA 1 $9.38 $9.38 no bid no bid no bid
2283 Drain Valve Pin, #K8133 EA 1 $9.18 $9.18 no bid no bid no bid
2284 Hose Nozzle, #62-20-3 EA 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid
2285 Hose Nozzle O-Ring, #62-20-4 EA 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid
2286 Steamer Nozzle, #62-25-3 EA 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid
2287 Steamer Nozzle O-Ring, #62-25-4 EA 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid
2288 Rod Coupling, #62-29-30 EA 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid
2289 Coupling Sleeve, #67 EA 1 $17.44 $17.44 no bid no bid no bid
2290 Main Valve, #K8131 EA 1 $98.24 $98.24 no bid no bid no bid
2292 Close Brass Nipple, 3" x 3", #BN30.000 EA 1 no bid $22.10 $22.10 $24.15 $24.15 no bid
2339 #HDM3220AB 2 1/2" Male Pipe Thread NTS by 2 1/2" NSF Male EA 60 no bid $34.75 $2,085.00 $10.81 $648.60 no bid
2340 Gate Valve, 2 1/2" X 2 1/2", #BGV.025 EA 1 no bid $23.44 $23.44 $54.48 $54.48 no bid
2341 Close Nipple, 2 1/2" X 2 1/2" Long, #BN25.000 EA 1 no bid $66.66 $66.66 $17.09 $17.09 no bid
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2345 3" NPT MALE X 2 1/2" NST MALE, HDM 3222 AB Hydrant Adaptor EA 1 no bid $39.95 $39.95 no bid no bid
2529 1 1/2" Meter Flange to 2" Meter Flange  #A67 EA 4 no bid $51.85 $207.40 $104.65 $418.60 $43.06 $172.24
2642 Meter coupling adapter 2x2 1/2 MIP-NST# 953208 EA 20 no bid $33.77 $675.40 no bid no bid
2643 Suck Tube, #LQS EA 25 no bid $40.70 $1,017.50 $29.41 $735.25 no bid
N/A Mega-Lug Retainer, D. I. P. 6” EA 25 $24.00 $600.00 $14.14 $353.50 $16.67 $416.75 no bid
N/A 6” RW Valve EA 4 no bid $301.25 $1,205.00 $379.54 $1,518.16 no bid
N/A 8” RW Valve EA 6 no bid $479.80 $2,878.80 $604.50 $3,627.00 no bid
N/A 10” RW Valve EA 4 no bid $747.75 $2,991.00 $942.52 $3,770.08 no bid
N/A 12” RW Valve EA 2 no bid $949.25 $1,898.50 $1,192.63 $2,385.26 no bid
N/A 6” Maxi Fit Coupling EA 4 no bid $76.41 $305.64 $130.70 $522.80 no bid
N/A 8” Maxi Fit Coupling EA 4 no bid $89.20 $356.80 $142.99 $571.96 no bid
N/A 10” Maxi Fit Coupling EA 4 $193.83 $775.32 $114.15 $456.60 $220.35 $881.40 no bid
N/A 12” Maxi Fit Coupling EA 4 $229.42 $917.68 $134.70 $538.80 $281.88 $1,127.52 no bid
N/A 16” Maxi Fit Coupling EA 2 no bid $660.00 $1,320.00 $620.51 $1,241.02 no bid
N/A 6” 90 Bends EA 2 no bid no bid $37.64 $75.28 no bid
N/A 8” 90 Bends EA 2 no bid no bid $58.49 $116.98 no bid
N/A 10” 90 Bends EA 2 no bid no bid $88.36 $176.72 no bid
N/A 12” 90 Bends EA 2 no bid no bid $118.22 $236.44 no bid
N/A 6” Mega Lug EA 12 no bid $14.14 $169.68 $16.67 $200.04 no bid
N/A 8” Mega Lug EA 12 no bid $21.77 $261.24 $25.44 $305.28 no bid
N/A 10” Mega Lug EA 8 no bid $32.24 $257.92 $37.66 $301.28 no bid
N/A 12” Mega Lug EA 8 no bid $46.80 $374.40 $54.77 $438.16 no bid
N/A 6” Solid Sleeve EA 4 no bid no bid $36.27 $145.08 no bid
N/A 8” Solid Sleeve EA 4 no bid no bid $47.73 $190.92 no bid
N/A 10” Solid Sleeve EA 2 no bid no bid $56.00 $112.00 no bid
N/A 12” Solid Sleeve EA 2 no bid no bid $75.60 $151.20 no bid
N/A 16” Solid Sleeve EA 2 no bid no bid $193.20 $386.40 no bid
N/A 6” X 18” Stainless Repair Band EA 4 no bid $83.14 $332.56 $182.91 $731.64 no bid
N/A 8” X 18” Stainless Repair Band EA 4 no bid $90.12 $360.48 $200.85 $803.40 no bid
N/A 10” X 18” Stainless Repair Band EA 4 no bid $111.61 $446.44 $256.89 $1,027.56 no bid
N/A 12” X 18” Stainless Repair Band EA 4 no bid $132.55 $530.20 $304.85 $1,219.40 no bid
N/A 3 Ft. Direct Bury Hydrant Barrel EA 6 no bid no bid no bid no bid
N/A 6” Hydra Stop Sleeve EA 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
N/A 8” Hydra Stop Sleeve EA 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
N/A 10” Hydra Stop Sleeve EA 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
N/A 12” Hydra Stop Sleeve EA 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid
N/A 4½ “ bury depth residential wet barrel hydrant assembly to include: 

hydrant head with one 4 ½ NST pumper nozzle, one 2 ½ “ NST hose 
nozzle, one 36” MJ bury, one LB400 break off check valve. As per 
Peoria detail 360 –R

EA 1 no bid no bid $1,266.67 $1,266.67 no bid

N/A 3 ½ “ bury depth commercial wet barrel hydrant assembly to include: 
hydrant head with one 4 ½ NST pumper nozzle, one 2 ½ “ NST hose 
nozzle, one 24” MJ bury, one LB400 break off check valve. As per 
Peoria detail 360 –C

EA 1 no bid no bid $1,466.67 $1,466.67 no bid

N/A 4 ½ “ bury depth commercial wet barrel hydrant assembly to include: 
hydrant head with one 4 ½ NST pumper nozzle, one 2 ½ “ NST hose 
nozzle, one 36” MJ bury, one LB400 break off check valve. As per 
Peoria detail 360 –C

EA 1 no bid no bid $1,488.89 $1,488.89 no bid
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