P07-0018 Auto Parts

Axle Seals Lawson Auto Supply Inc CSK Auto, Inc Cummins Rocky Mountain LLC Lighthouse Inc. Hawkes Vehicle Main Prog. Bus Parts Warehouse
City of Peoria Item # |Description QTY UOoM Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended NON- NO BID NO BID
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price RESPONSIVE
2250[Axle Seal, Stemco Voyager 392-9063, 8 EA Stemco Voyager
Manufacturer: Stemco, No Substitutes. 392-9063
$96.32 $770.56| $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00}
2251|Axle Seal, Stemco Voyager 3930173 34 EA Stemco Voyager
Manufacturer: Stemco, No Substitutions. 3930173
$44.64 $1,517.76) $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00}
2474]Axle Seal, Chicago Rawhide, 19784 2 EA Chicago Rawhide
10784 $1.88 $3.76 $1.40 $2.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2475|Axle Seal, Chicago Rawhide, 21756 4 EA Chicago Rawhide
21756 $1.71] $6.84] $1.28| $5.12 $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
Subtotal: $2,298.92] $7.92] $0.00} $0.00}
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $186.21] $0.64} $0.00} $0.00}
Total: $2,485.13] $8.56] $0.00} $0.00}
Batteries
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY UOoM Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
1844|Battery,12 Volt 603575/ 75DT72 42 EA EXIOE
$46.99| s197358]  7SPT72M $57.96) $2,434.32 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1845(Battery, Optima, 800U 28 EA NAPA EXIOE
9934-78 ORB780T-84
$110.19) $3,085.32] $157.96} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00}
2547|Battery, 12V # 8465 53 EA EXIOE
$70.94] $3,750.82) 6584 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2299 Battery, Group 31 Stud 7238 45 EA EXIOE
$72.44] $3,259.80 HC31D $4,498.20] $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
ZASA]Eanew, Lawn & Garden, Heavy Duty 9 EA EXIOE
$23.59) $212.31 6092639 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
0.081]
Subtotal: $15,651.92] $0.00} $0.00}
Tax Rate % Taxes: $1,267.81] $0.00} $0.00}
Total: $16,919.73] $0.00} $0.00}
Belts
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY UoM Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
5|Belt, 25-080726 Cummings, Fan 1 EA DAYCO
$20.96 $20.96 $0.00) s0.00] 5080725 $44.19 $44.19 $0.00) $0.00)
1952|Belt, 25-060960 8 EA GOODYEAR DAYCO
$23.95 $191.60) 4060960 $20.93] $167.44} 5060960 $35.54] $284.32 $0.00} $0.00}
2187Belt, Serpentine 25-060919 20 EA GOODYEAR DAYCO
$26.94 $538.80) 4060919 $24.80} sa96.00] NOTCOOD# $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00}
2466Serpentine Belt #25-061000 7 EA GOODYEAR DAYCO
$18.04 $126.28] 4061000 $15.98] $111.86] 5061000 $26.34] $184.38] $0.00} $0.00}
2549|V BELT #25-9695 10 EA DAYCO
NOT GOOD #
$13.55 $135.50) $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00}
2550 Serpentine Belt #25-070975 10 EA GOODYEAR DAYCO
4070975 5070973
$31.35 $313.50) $27.85| $278.50} $46.83] $468.30} $0.00} $0.00}
2622 Serpentine Belt #25-060908 14 EA GOODYEAR DAYCO
$24.42 $341.88] 4060910 $22.01) $308.14} 5060910 $37.98] $531.72 $0.00} $0.00}
2670[Serpentine Belt #3289503 6 EA DAYCO
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 so.00] 5080725 $44.19) $265.14) $0.00 $0.00
Number To Be|Serpentine Belt #25-061005 10 EA GOODYEAR DAYCO
Assigned|
$22.17] $221.70) 4061005 $19.84] $198.40] NOT GOOD # $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
Number To Be|Serpentine Belt #25-061031 12 EA GOODYEAR DAYCO
Assigned 4061030 NOT GOOD #
seon $25.82 $300.84 $23.55| $282.60) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $1,842.94] $1, 77E,0J $0.00}
0.081
TaxRate % Taxes: $149,2ﬂ $144.02 $0.00}
Total: $1,992.22] $1,922.07] $0.00}




Brakes & Rotors

City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uoMm Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer |Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
169|Park knob,KN20901 6 EA
$8.20) $49.20) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
173|Brake Diaphragm #24 10 EA
DP24L $3.14) $31.40) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
174|Brake Diaphragm #30 12 EA
OP30]  s3.4 $37.68] $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
175|3030 Spring Brake Asm. 4 EA
MC3030B]  $52.20 $208.80} $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
188|Air Govn,D2, KN18530 6 EA
$17.31] $103.86| $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
212|Brake Pads,AE-7576M / MKD702 F 3 EA RAYBESTOS]
PG0702M
$58.92] $176.76| $44.64) $133.92 $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
214|Pads, Brake, AE-7584M/MKD-711 4 EA RAYBESTOS|
PGD711M|
$48.53| $194.12] $37.40) $149.60} $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
215|Front/Pads AE-7070A/ MKD154 8 EA RAYBESTOS|
$23.62] $188.96| PODLSAM 59516 $201.28] $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
221|Disc Pads, AE-7260M 8 EA
PGD370M|
$38.23] $305.84] $28.52] $228.16} $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
227|Disc Pads Kit 15615PM 12 EA
$0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
1855|Brake Pads # AE7555AE 20 EA NAPA|
AETSSSAM] 45,41 $908.20) PGDE7AM $33.56| $671.20] $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
1858|Brake Pads, MKD748, FRONT 24 EA NAPA| RAYBESTOS]
AE7617M|  $46.46| $1,115.04 PGD748M| _ $35.04) $840.96| $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2513|Brake Pads # AE7834M 38 EA
$47.50) $1,805.00 PGD931M|  $37.16| $1,412.08] $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2514|Brake Pads # AE7835M 24 EA
$46.46) $1,115.04) PGDI32M| 335,96 $863.04] $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2623|Brake Pads #AE7339M 12 EA
$46.46| $557.52] PGD459M| _ $35.40) $424.80) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2624Brake Pads #AE7837M 10 EA
$59.92] $599.20) PGD934M|  $47.16| $471.60} $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2625|Brake Pads #AE7838M 16 EA
$51.93] $830.88| PGD939M|  $42.80) $684.80) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2626|Brake Pads #AE7558M 16 EA
$56.58 $905.28] PGD679M] _ $41.56| $664.96] $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00}
2653|Rotor Drilled # PR880110L 18 EA
$122.04] $2,106.72 $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2652|Rotor Drilled # PR880110R 18 EA
$122.04] $2,196.72 $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2651 Rotor Drilled # PR880129L 18 EA
$64.91] $1,168.38 $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2650|Rotor Drilled # PR880129R 18 EA
$64.91] $1,168.38 $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2468|park Brake Shoes# AE10745PB 10 EA
$16.75] $167.50) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2554]Brake Pads # AE7259B 2 EA NAPA|
AE7259BM|  $41.43 $82.86 PGD369M|  $31.88| $63.76f $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2555|Brake Pads # AE7623 11 EA
$46.01 $506.11] NO CROSS| $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00} $0.00}
2623|Brake Pads # AE7339M 11 EA
$46.46 $511.06} PGD459M|  $35.40 $389.40f $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
Subtotal: $17,130.51 $7,199.56| $0.00) $0.00)
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $1,387.57 $583.16} $0.00) $0.00)
Total: $18,518.08] $7,782.72] $0.00)
Breakers
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uomMm Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
351|Circuit Breaker 30 30055-30 15 EA LITTLEFUSE] COLCHERSEE]
7823105  ¢s.03 $88.95| MAX-307 NO $44.85) $0.00 $0.00 S0055-30]  g0.04 $33.60)
2189|Circuit Breaker, 50 amp w/bracket 10 EA NAPA] LITTLEFUSE| COLCHERSEE]
762-3001 $6.61] $66.10] X0 NO CROSS] $29.90) $0.00) $0.00) 30055-50 $2.96| $29.60)
Subtotal: $155.05| $74.75) $0.00) $63.20)
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $12.56| $6.05 $0.00 $5.12
Total: $167.61] sao.aol $0.00) $68.32]




Beams and Lenses

City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uoMm Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
422|Sealed - Beam 4411 2 EA SYLVANIUM G.E.
$5.92f $11.84] 6.98 $6.98] $13.96] $0.00 $0.00 44111 $4.15| $8.30]
426|Sealed Beam 4436 4 EA G.E.
$10.38| $41.52 NOCROSS|  $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
431|Sealed Beam 6014 34 EA SYLVANUM)
$3.21] $109.14] H6024] $8.91 $302.94] $0.00 $0.00
432|Sealed Beam H6054 10 EA SYLVANIUM
$8.04] $80.40) HB6054] $9.34f $93.40 $0.00 $0.00 H6054] $6.50] $65.00
438|Headlamp Bulb 9007 10 EA ECKO| G.E|
$5.97] $59.70) 9007, $3.29] $32.90| $0.00 $0.00 9007BP, $4.90| $49.00
439|Work Lamp 620WD 12 EA GROTC|
620w] $20.91] $250.92] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 64931 $6.50 $78.00
440[Flood Lamp Rectangular 5 EA NAPA PETERSON|
610W]| $98.45] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 V503HF| $10.34] $51.70
458|Sealed Red Lamp VSC527723 30 EA NAPA GROTC
50-40282R3) $88.80) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 52772-3 $2.99 $89.70
459|Tail Grommet 9127 10 EA NAPA| GROTC|
40700 $20.30) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 91740 $1.25| $12.50
460|Sealed Clear Lamp Asm PMM426 10 EA NAPA PETERSON|
40004 $103.90] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 415 $4.60 $46.00
265|2inch Red Sealed Lamp 5030200R3 5 EA NAPA TRUCKLITE|
30200R] $14.15] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 30LOOR] $1.75| $8.75
466[2.5inch Amber Lamp 45833-3 5 EA NAPA GROTC
50-1020Y3) $8.15] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 45833-3 $1.03| $5.15|
467|2.5inch Red Sealed Lamp 45832-3 35 EA NAPA] GROTC|
50-10202R3 $57.05] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 45832-3 $1.03| $36.05]
471|SNG Lamp Ft Asm Sq 482 2 EA NO BID|
4842 $29.52] $59.04] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
47grLigh| Assy, Lthse #506020R3 5 EA NAPA] TRUCKLITE|
50-60202R3) $5.47] $27.35| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 60202R| $5.30] $26.50
479|Strobe Lamp ASM 12 Volt 20121-1PA 10 EA NAPA] UHELEN|
6611A] $135.76 $1,357.60] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 2012HPA| $62.00 $620.00)
2511]Bulb, 24 V. Halogen #80560 20 EA NAPA HELLA|
$4.38] $87.60) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 78145 $3.24] $64.80
2512|Grommet, Rubber #10700 10 EA TRUCKLITE]
$18.40) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1070t $0.96} $9.60
2610|Pig Tail 3 Prong, Stop & Turn #94926 5 EA
$11.25| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.29 $6.45]
2654[{Osram 56W Bulb # BP1255H1 10 EA
$5.40] $54.00) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.01 $20.10
2488|Signal Lamp Front/Side Amber # 4073A 8 EA
$8.81 $70.48| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5.86] $46.88]
Subtotal: $2,630.04] $443.20] $0.00 $1,352.32]
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $213.03] $35.90| $0.00 $109.54]
Total: $2,843.07| $479.10] $0.00 $1,461.86]
Chemicals
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uoMm Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
540|Freon R134A 30 Ibs. Cylinder 5 CcyL R134A
$199.00] $995.00]R134A-30 $0.00} $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
797|Starting Fluid, Ether # 7216 24 EA PYROID
$1.93| $46.32|SFR11 $1.33| $31.92| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
798[Battery Cleaner 7651072 24 EA PERMATEX
$5.12f $122.88| 80369, $3.79 $90.96 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
799|Carb/Choke Cleaner 8700 36 EA PYROID
$2.11 $75.96[C16 $1.67) $60.12) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
800|Washer Solvent 7300 156 EA NAPA SUM W/WASH
WSW-12 $0.99 $154.44 6480693]  $1.25 $195.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
801|Engine Degreaser 6200 60 EA GUNK
$1.84] $110.40) EBl $2.59 $1565.40] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
805|Belt Dressing 765-1397 4 EA CRC
$23.52) 5350 $2.99 $11.96] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
806|Brake Cleaner 4800 180 EA PYROID
$545.40|NCBPC-13 $1.90| $342.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
807|Penetrating Oil 6300 144 EA PYROID
$383.04] 6199665 $2.93] $421.92 $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
808|Disc Brake Quiet # 765-1064 12 EA CRC
$71.76] 5016  s4.49) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
810|Armor All 10160 192 EA ARMOR ALL
$1,284.48 10160 $4.99 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
815|-RTV, Clear Silicone # 765-1344 12 EA PERMAYEX
$43.08 80050]  s5.49) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00




2238|Right Stuff, #765-2427 39 EA
$662.61] 40ZTUBE25223 $12.99 $506.61} $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2300|BLK, Silicone, #765-1589 6 EA PERMAXEY
$29.94] 8| $5.49 $32.94f $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2491|Brake Fluid, 1 QT 35-032 17 EA PYROID
$66.13|BF32 $2.97 $50.49| $0.00) $0.00) $0.00) $0.00)
2272|Anti-Freeze, Dex-Cool #2840A 26 EA HAVOLINE DEX
$337.74 6226401 $225.94 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2351|Grease, Tube #985 40 EA VALVOLINE
$227.60) 615 $3.99 $159.60] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $5,180.30] $3,362.70) $0.00 $0.00
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $419.60} $272.38 $0.00} $0.00}
Total: $5,599.90] $3‘635.08| $0.00 $0.00
Eilters
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY Uom Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer  |Unit Price |[Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
395Filter, Oil 21036/LF782 48 EA RAM FLEETGUARD
$2.08] $99.84] PH3980] $3.01 $144 .48 LF782) $3.21 $154.08] $0.00 $0.00
396|Filter, Oil 21040/LF780 96 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$2.08] $199.68] PH3387 $3.01 $288.96 LF780) $3.20 $307.20) $0.00 $0.00
397|Filter, Oil 21061/LF653 60 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
21060 $2.08] $124.80] PHS5| $3.01 $180.60) LF653) $3.42 $205.20) $0.00 $0.00
496|Filter, Oil 21334 5 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$2.08] $10.40] PH3593A| $3.01 $15.05 LF3462] $3.92 $19.60 $0.00 $0.00
497|Filter, Oil 21348/LF3335 6 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$2.08] $12.48| PH3614 $3.01 $18.06} LF3335 $3.14] $18.84) $0.00 $0.00
498|Filter, Oil 21372 300 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$2.08 $624.00) PH2) $3.28 $984.00] LF3681] $3.72 $1,116.00} $0.00 $0.00
501Filter, Oil 1459 6 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$5.25] $31.50) PHI77A| $4.68] $28.08 LF699 $4.68| $28.08] $0.00 $0.00
504|Filter, Oil 21516/LF3339 108 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$2.08] $224.64] PH3600] $3.01 $325.08 LF3339] $3.g $397.44] $0.00 $0.00
510|Filter, Oil 1660 156 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$15.62] $2,436.72 P9407 $33.99] $5,302.44] LF3654 $13.62) $2,124.72] $0.00 $0.00
511fFilter, OIL 1734 12 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$9.77] $117.24] PH3786) $8.57 $102.84] LF3630] $7.91 $94.92) $0.00 $0.00
515|Filter, Oil 1791/LF667 192 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$6.23] $1,196.16 PH49A $5.20 $998.40] LF667| $4.93| $946.56] $0.00 $0.00
552|Filter, Fuel 23097/FF5097 3 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$6.33] $18.99| 63802A $5.31 $15.93| FF5097| $6.58] $19.74) $0.00 $0.00
563|Filter, Fuel 23296 10 EA NO CROSS| FLEETGUARD
$5.81 $58.10) $0.00 $0.00 FF5244) $5.41 $54.10 $0.00 $0.00
565|Filter, Fuel 3358/FF5018 36 EA FLEETGUARD
$5.38] $193.68| P4102A] $4.44] $159.84] FF5018| $4.24] $152.64] $0.00 $0.00
566|Filter, Fuel 23311 96 Lumina 2 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$7.92] $15.84] G7315 $6.64) $13.28 FF5503] $6.77 $13.54] $0.00 $0.00
572|Filter, Fuel 23481/FF5026 3 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$5.12f $15.36| G3727, $6.68] $20.04} FF5026 $6.95] $20.85| $0.00 $0.00
578|Filter, Air 26077 30 EA NOCROSS] FLEETGUARD
$5.35] $160.50) $0.00 $0.00 AF4965 $5.16) $154.80] $0.00 $0.00
584Filter 26117 16 EA NO CROSS| FLEETGUARD
$7.37] $117.92] $0.00 $0.00 AF25256 $8.15 $130.40] $0.00 $0.00
586|Air Filter 26134 80 EA CA5056 FLEETGUARD
$4.80] $384.00) $3.83 $306.40] AF4619| $5.22 $417.60) $0.00 $0.00
588|Filter 26174/AF4624 2 EA CAB366 FLEETGUARD
$4.40] $8.80] $3.83 $7.66] AF4624] $5.27 $10.54] $0.00 $0.00
597|Filter, Air 26302 5 EA FLEETGUARD
$6.13] $30.65 NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 AF25754] $5.73 $28.65| $0.00 $0.00
603|Prefilter, Air 7-02287 1 EA
$4.49| $4 g NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 NOT GOOD # $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
604|Filter, Trans., Allison 295268 22 EA NAPA]
7740XE]| $49.90) $1,097.80] NOCROSS| $0.00 $0.00 NOT GOOD # $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
620|Filter, Trans, Crown Victoria, 1-8098 25 EA FRAM
$17.00) $425.00) FT1167| $11.75 $293.75) NOT GOOD # $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
621Filter, Trans 17957 3 EA FRAM
$6.07] $18.21] FT1039| $3.22 $9.66] NOT GOOD # $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
623|Filter, Trans 1-7975 10 EA FRAM
$23.59) $235.90) FT1130) $16.27| $162.70] NOT GOOD # $0.00 $0.00} $0.00] $0.00}
633|Filter, Air #2124 4 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$25.30) $101.20] CAK259] $21.09] $84.36] AF351-K] $21.27, $85.08] $0.00 $0.00
641|Filter, Air 2226/AF821M 200 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$21.54] $4,308.00] CA535S! $18.11] $3,622.00) AF821-M $17.78 $3,556.00) $0.00 $0.00
662|Filter, Air 2691/AF888M 200 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$71.91 $14,382.00| CA1503| $64.71] $12,942.00 AF888-M $62.47| $12,494.00 $0.00 $0.00
686|Filter, Air 6433 10 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$24.02] $240.20] CAT7139| $18.70 $187.00) AF4878| $19.09] $190.90] $0.00 $0.00
715]Filter, Air, 6144 26 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD
$6.10] $158.60) CA3914] $6.50 $169.00] AF25316 $9.41 $244.66 $0.00 $0.00
727|Filter, Air 26418, Ford Expedition 118 EA FLEETGUARD|
$12.44] $1,467.92f NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 AF25590) $11.41] $1,346.38] $0.00 $0.00
743]Filter, Air 26440 5 EA FLEETGUARD
$12.85] $64.25] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 AF25258| $11.66 $58.30] $0.00 $0.00
751]Filter, Oil 1792 25 EA FLEETGUARD
$12.25] $306.25] PH3335| $10.71 $267.75) LF691A] $8.88 $222.00] $0.00 $0.00
1921]Fuel Filter, Ford, C/V, 3595 35 EA FLEETGUARD
$5.46 $191.10] G8018} $4.27 $149.45] FF5455) $6.66 $233.10) $0.00 $0.00
1922|Filter, Oil 7106 7 EA FLEETGUARD
$6.58 $46.06 NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 LF3828] $9.11 $63.77| $0.00 $0.00
1946|Filter, Fuel 3484 6 EA 1 FLEETGUARD
$7.37] $44.22] G7333 $6.04f $36.24 FF5199) $8.75 $52.50] $0.00 $0.00




1951]Filter, Fuel, 3579 6 EA NOT GOOD #
$6.94] $41.64] G8219 $5.44| $32.64} $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2041]Filter, Air, 6596 14 EA FLEETGUARD)|
$43.44] $608.16 CA3863| $495.32] $0.00 $0.00
2050(Filter, Air 6648 7 EA
$9.73] $68.11] CAB925) $57.12) $0.00 $0.00
2190(Filter, Air 26253 12 EA
$7.711 $92.52) NO CROSS| AF25684] $99.00 $0.00 $0.00
2191Filter, Air 6472 10 EA NOT GOOD #
$6.62 $66.20) CAB606 $5.67 $56.70 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2543|Filter, Oil #7746XD 30 EA NOT GOOD #
$30.28| $908.40) NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2546(Filter, Transmission #1-8565 6 EA NOT GOOD #
$13.01] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2611Filter, Oil # 1056 15 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$6.03] PH8172 $4.24) $63.60 $87.00 $0.00 $0.00
2612Filter, Oil #7314 12 EA
$13.39) CH9549 $11.87 $142.44] $114.84] $0.00 $0.00
2613|Filter, Oil # 21042 24 EA
$2.87] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 LF42502] $4.41 $105.84] $0.00 $0.00
2614(Filter, Oil # 1215 10 EA NOT GOOD #
$3.31f PH6022 $3.74) $37.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2615Filter, Air # 2013 15 EA NOT GOOD #
$11.70) $175.50] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2616|Filter, Air # 2484 8 EA FRAM NOT GOOD #
$7.07] $56.56] CA9332] $4.66] $37.28 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2617|Filter, Air # 6804 10 EA FRAM NOT GOOD #
$12.70) $127.00) CA9687] $5.14f $51.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2618|Filter, Air # 2731 6 EA FLEETGUARD)|
$39.26] $235.56 NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $214.14] $0.00 $0.00
2619]Filter, Air # 6153 24 EA FRAM
$4.58 $109.92] CAB479| $3.83 $91.92) $162.00] $0.00 $0.00
2620|Filter, Air # 2845 14 EA
$7.911 $110.74] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 AF25967, $17.55| $245.70] $0.00 $0.00
2627|Filter, Air # 2845 14 EA FLEETGUARD)|
$7.911 $110.74] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 AF25967, $17.55| $245.70] $0.00 $0.00
2649]Filter, Air # 6458 12 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$57.30) $687.60) CA9242] $63.99] $767.88 AF25469) $46.32) $5565.84) $0.00 $0.00
2648|Filter, Air # 6459 12 EA FLEETGUARD)|
$38.64] $463.68| NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 AF25470) $40.83| $489.96] $0.00 $0.00
2655]Filter, Oil, # 1748XD 10 EA NOT GOOD #
$29.99 $299.90) NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2235Filter, Air, # CA7438/6417 4 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$15.56] $62.24] CAT7438| $14.11 $56.44f AF25255) $15.52) $62.08] $0.00 $0.00
2234]Filter, Air, # CA829SY/6417 10 EA FLEETGUARD)|
$15.56] $155.60) NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $15.52) $155.20) $0.00 $0.00
2246|Filter, Air, # 6562 15 EA FLEETGUARD)|
$21.90) $328.50) CA8737] $24.48| $367.20) $40.25| $603.75) $0.00 $0.00
2259(Filter, Air, # 6556 30 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$45.73] $1,371.90] CAT7140| $41.84) $1,255.20] NOT GOOD #| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2280|Filter, Air, # 2488/CA8755 10 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$8.65] $86.50) CABT755A) $10.29] $102.90] AF25636) $8.99 $89.90] $0.00] $0.00}
2298|Filter, Air, # 2725/0EM5303204AA 7 EA NOT GOOD #
$10.91] $76.37| NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2487|Filter, Air, # 6573 9 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$9.92f CA9269 $9.43| $84.87 AF25854) $26.53 $238.77] $0.00 $0.00
2492Filter, Air, Broom Bear # 6595 4 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$27.42] CAT74845 $74.99 $299.96 $107.80 $0.00 $0.00
2495|Filter, Air, Broom Bear # 6607 4 EA FRAM|
$32.17] CAT74845 $85.99 $343.9 $0.00 $0.00
2544 14 EA
Filter, Air, Inter Centurion Sweeper# 6665
$243.04] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2245 14 EA
Filter, Air, Outer Centurion Sweeper#6664
$511.70] CAB466) $33.64 $470.96] $0.00 $0.00
2278|Filter, Oil, # 2-1522/PH3675 53 EA FRAM
$110.24] PH3675 $3.01 $159.53] $233.73] $0.00 $0.00
2352Filter, Oil, # 2-1085 147 EA
$305.76 NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $3.39] $498.33] $0.00 $0.00
2613fFilter, Oil, Chevy Colorado# 2-1042 23 EA
$66.01] NO CROSj $0.00 $0.00 $4.41 $101.43] $0.00 $0.00
2663 15 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
Filter, Oil, AutoCar,WX64,2006, #7746XD
$454.20) CA217A] $58.99] $884.85] LF795) $6.20 $93.00 $0.00 $0.00
ZGSJFiI(er. Oil, Ford Escape Hybrid # 7203 2 EA NOT GOOD #
$4.92f NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2671Filter, Fuel Water Separator # FS1000 16 EA FRAM FLEETGUARD)|
$182.24] PS8048| $14.11 $225.76] $139.20] $0.00 $0.00
2672|Filter, Oil, AutoCar, WX64, 2006, # 16 EA FRAM
LF9001
$484.48| CA217A] $58.99] $943.84] $382.08] $0.00 $0.00
2673]Filter, Coolant, AutoCar, # WF2071 20 EA FRAM
$147.60) PR3908] $6.72 $134.40] WF2071 $5.77| $115.40] $0.00 $0.00
2679(Filter, Air, Ford 500, #6924 12 EA NOT GOOD #
$100.08] NO CROSS} $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $0.00
Subtotal: $38,784.92 $34,227.87 $31,547.34f $0.00
0.081
Tax Rate Y% Taxes: $3,141.58 $2,772 45| $2,555.33] $0.00
Total: $41, 92643 $37,000.33 $34,102.67 $0.00]

Gaskets




Unit Price |Extended Price

Unit Price |Extended Price

City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uoMm Manufacturer Manufacturer Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
612|O-Ring, Cover, 075-0711-00 40 EA
$0.00] $0.00] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
613|O-Ring, Insert, 075-0711-006 40 EA
$0.00] $0.00] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
614|Gasket, By Pass, 075-0711-007 20 EA
$0.00] $0.00] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
1 , RLS075711010 20 EA
Mfg. al $0.00] $0.00] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2309|Gasket, Axle, Trucks West #3972854 35 EA
$0.00] $0.00] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $0.00] $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $0.00] $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total: $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Hardware
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uoMm Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer |Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
153|Radiator Cap — 7031447 8 EA STMT]
$5.63] $45.04] 10231 $3.33 $26.64} $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
796|Grease Gun Tip 715-1151 30 EA PUR
$2.79] $83.70) 6487611 $4.49] $134.70] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2185[Spotlight Handle, UNI6701-0101 125 EA
730-9534) $32.30) $4,037.50] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2342|4" Exhaust Clamp, #733-5976 24 EA
$9.64] $231.36] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Sub(olall $4,397.60] $161.34] $0.00 $0.00
0.081
Tax Rate Y% Taxes: $356.21] $13.07| $0.00 $0.00
Total: $4,753.81 $174.41 $0.00 $0.00
Mirrors
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uoMm Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer |Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
387|Mirror 3.75 Spot 1201-7044 8 EA NAPA K-SOURCE|] GROTC
7044D] $1.48] $11.84] C037, $3.99 $31.92) $0.00 $0.00 12014 $0.96] $7.68]
388| Mirror West Coast Style, CHA20100 10 EA NAPA K-SOURCE|] CHAMCAL]
97860 $7.59] $75.90) 3541 $289.90] $0.00 $0.00 20100 $4.67 $46.70
392]8.5 inch Convex Mirror 5 EA NAPA] K-SOURCE| CHAMCAL|
97804 $15.47] $77.Cq 90015 $89.95| $0.00 $0.00 10801 $9.72| $48.60]
Subtotal: $165.09) $411.77, $0.00 $102.Sﬁ
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $13.37] $33.35 $0.00 $8.34]
Total] $178.46) $445.12| $0.00) $111.32]
Refrigeration
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uomMm Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price | Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price| Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
333|Drier, Receiver, Air source E80 2 EA
$0.00] $0.00] NO CROSS| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $0.00] $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $0.00] $0.00] $0.00 $0.00
Total: $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Spark Plugs
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uomMm Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
2476|Spark Plug, Autolite, APP103 16 EA
$4.68] $74.88] $3.99 $63.84} $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2477|Spark Plug, Autolite, APP764 71 EA
$4.68 $332.28] $3.99 $283.29 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $407.16 $347.13] $0.00 $0.00
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $32.ﬁ $28.12) $0.00 $0.00
Total] $440.14] $375.25 $0.00 $0.00




Switches

City of Peoria Item # Description QTY uoMm Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer  |Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended Price Manufacturer Unit Price |Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number
373|Toggle Switch, ON/OFF, # 5582 12 EA NAPA
TG6260) $4.57] $54.84] $47.88 $0.00 $0.00 $2.31 $27.72)
376|Trailer Plug, Male, 15-730 12 EA PHILLIPS PHILLIPS|
15730 $7.32] $87.84] $83.88 $0.00 $0.00 15-730] $5.10| $61.20
377|Trailer Connector, Female, PHM15-720 20 EA PHILLIPS PHILLIPS|
15720 $8.28 $165.60) $99.80 $0.00 $0.00 15-720] $5.70| $114.00]
379|Dash Lamp, Green, 17411 2 EA K-F|
$0.00] $0.00] $5.98] $0.00 $0.00 17-411 $4.00| $8.00
382|Back Up Alarm, ECC520 6 EA ECCO
$0.00] $0.00] $59.94f $0.00 $0.00 520 $19.50| $117.00]
902|Relay, Bosch, 87499 36 EA NAPA] HELLA
AR462) $5.20] $187.20) $215.64) $0.00 $0.00 87499 $2.90| $104.40]
910|Flasher HD, 2 Prong, 45 AMP 12 EA NAPA GROTC|
50-267-3] $8.69 $104.28] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 44530-3 $6.95] $83.40
2273|Rocker Switch, RS 1022 2 EA NAPA NO BID|
RS1022| $11.35) $22.70) $6.98] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2489|Rocker Switch, Red, HEL80567 2 EA NAPA HELLA
BKHEL80567] $3.54] $7.08] 85920 $3.49| $3.49 $0.00] 80567, $1.84f $3.68
2635|Brake Pressure Switch, Meritor RN15364G| 6 EA MBI NO BID|
BEI3241 $18.45| $110.70] NO CROSS] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Subtotal: $740.24] $523.59| $0.00 $519.40]
0.081
TaxRate % Taxes: $59.96) $42.41 $0.00 $42.07)
Total] $800.20) $566.00] $0.00 $561.47]
Wipers
City of Peoria Item # Description QTY [Sle] ] er Unit Price Price er Unit Price| Extended Price| Manufacturer | Unit Price| Extended Price| ~Manufacturer | Unit Price| Extended
Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Offered & Part Price
Number Number Number Number
757|Wiper 16"-2 16 EA NAPA TRICO| ANCOJ
60-016-2| $6.50) $104.00) 16-2 $4.44) $71.04] $0.00} $0.00} 31-16) $4.63} $74.08]
7§|'W\per Blades, 60-018-1 Napa 80 EA NAPA TRICO| ANCO|
$6.72] $537.60) 18-1) $5.40} $432.00f $0.00} $0.00} 31-18 $4.51) $360.80f
760|Wiper 20" 25-20 220 EA NAPA TRICO| ANCO|
60-020-1 $7.45 $1,639.00 201 $5.50) $1,210.00) $0.00 $0.00 31-20) $1,293.60)
761|Wiper Blade 22" 170 EA NAPA TRICO| ANCOJ
60-022-1] $8.01 $1,361.70] 22-1] $6.39] $1,086.30) $0.00 $0.00] 31-22] $999.60)
Subtotal: $3,642.30] $2,799.34] $0.00 $2 723.08'
0.081
Tax Rate % Taxes: $295.03] $226.75) $0.00 $220.97]
Total: $3,937.33 $3,026.09] $0.00 $2,949.05]
[ SUBTOTAL OF ALL PARTS:| $9 $67,054.03] $33,325.39)] $4,765.98] ——
Lawson Auto Supply Inc | CSK Auto, Inc | Cummins Rocky Mountain LLC Lighthouse Inc. |Hawkes Vehicle Main Prog. Bus Parts Warehouse





