
Item No. Item Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 #959 Sign Blank 12"X6" 100 EA 2.50$      250.00$      1.51$      151.00$      2.51$      251.00$      1.55$      155.00$      2.38$      238.00$      -$          -$        -$        
2 #960 Sign Blank 24"X6" 50 EA 3.85$      192.50$      2.92$      146.00$      3.74$      187.00$      2.80$      140.00$      4.75$      237.50$      -$          -$        -$        
3 #961 Sign Blank 30"X6" 1 EA 4.53$      4.53$          3.66$      3.66$          4.53$      4.53$          3.50$      3.50$          5.55$      5.55$          -$          -$        -$        
4 #963 Sign Blank 42"X6" 1 EA 5.88$      5.88$          5.12$      5.12$          6.34$      6.34$          4.80$      4.80$          8.50$      8.50$          -$          -$        -$        
5 #964 Sign Blank 48"X6" 1 EA 6.55$      6.55$          5.85$      5.85$          7.24$      7.24$          5.40$      5.40$          8.85$      8.85$          -$          -$        -$        
6 #965 Sign Blank 12"X12" 10 EA 3.85$      38.50$        3.00$      30.00$        3.74$      37.40$        2.90$      29.00$        4.75$      47.50$        -$          -$        -$        
7 #966 Sign Blank 18"X12" 150 EA 5.20$      780.00$      4.41$      661.50$      4.97$      745.50$      4.25$      637.50$      7.13$      1,069.50$   -$          -$        -$        
8 #968 Sign Blank 36"X12" 200 EA 9.25$      1,850.00$   8.63$      1,726.00$   9.94$      1,988.00$   8.31$      1,662.00$   14.25$    2,850.00$   -$          -$        -$        
9 #970 Sign Blank 18"X18" 20 EA 7.23$      144.60$      6.62$      132.40$      7.61$      152.20$      6.23$      124.60$      10.70$    214.00$      -$          -$        -$        

10 #971Sign Blank 24"X18" 100 EA 9.25$      925.00$      8.73$      873.00$      9.80$      980.00$      8.31$      831.00$      14.25$    1,425.00$   -$          -$        -$        
11 #973 Sign Blank 24"X24" 30 EA 11.95$    358.50$      11.58$    347.40$      12.09$    362.70$      11.00$    330.00$      19.00$    570.00$      -$          -$        -$        
12 #975 Sign Blank 36"X24" 30 EA 18.00$    540.00$      17.21$    516.30$      18.12$    543.60$      16.38$    491.40$      28.50$    855.00$      -$          -$        -$        
13 #976 Sign Blank 48"X24" 20 EA 24.00$    480.00$      23.21$    464.20$      24.16$    483.20$      24.00$    480.00$      38.00$    760.00$      -$          -$        -$        
14 #977 Sign Blank 30"X30" 200 EA 18.75$    3,750.00$   18.06$    3,612.00$   18.27$    3,654.00$   17.13$    3,426.00$   29.75$    5,950.00$   -$          -$        -$        
15 #979 Sign Blank 36"X36" 1 EA 27.00$    27.00$        25.81$    25.81$        29.34$    29.34$        27.00$    27.00$        42.75$    42.75$        -$          -$        -$        
16 #981 Sign 24"X6" Dbl Face 150 EA 6.93$      1,039.50$   7.48$      1,122.00$   7.13$      1,069.50$   9.64$      1,446.00$   8.25$      1,237.50$   -$          -$        -$        
17 #982 Sign 30"X6" Dbl Face 40 EA 8.35$      334.00$      9.36$      374.40$      8.77$      350.80$      12.05$    482.00$      10.25$    410.00$      -$          -$        -$        
18 #983 Sign 36"X6" Dbl Face 20 EA 9.77$      195.40$      11.23$    224.60$      10.64$    212.80$      14.46$    289.20$      12.35$    247.00$      -$          -$        -$        
19 #984 Sign 42"X6" Dbl Face 25 EA 11.19$    279.75$      13.10$    327.50$      12.07$    301.75$      16.87$    421.75$      14.45$    361.25$      -$          -$        -$        
20 #985 Sign 48"X6" Dbl Face 20 EA 12.61$    252.20$      14.97$    299.40$      13.43$    268.60$      19.28$    385.60$      16.45$    329.00$      -$          -$        -$        
21 #988 Sign 18"x18", 9 Ball 100 EA 13.83$    1,383.00$   20.71$    2,071.00$   11.52$    1,152.00$   20.60$    2,060.00$   16.75$    1,675.00$   -$          -$        -$        
22 #991 Sign Blank 30"X24" 500 EA 15.00$    7,500.00$   14.40$    7,200.00$   14.87$    7,435.00$   13.70$    6,850.00$   23.75$    11,875.00$ -$          -$        -$        
23 #2522 Sign 30" School Xing   Blank 50 EA 18.75$    937.50$      15.98$    799.00$      17.44$    872.00$      16.50$    825.00$      21.95$    1,097.50$   -$          -$        -$        
24 #2523 Sign 36"Sch- Xing  Blank 50 EA 27.00$    1,350.00$   23.23$    1,161.50$   24.84$    1,242.00$   26.10$    1,305.00$   31.45$    1,572.50$   -$          -$        -$        
25 #1002 Sign, STOP, 36"   1 EA 70.20$    70.20$        42.35$    42.35$        79.03$    79.03$        72.50$    72.50$        37.70$    37.70$        -$          -$        -$        
26 #2048 Stop 30" High Intensity 250 EA 28.38$    7,095.00$   29.61$    7,402.50$   34.44$    8,610.00$   30.80$    7,700.00$   27.45$    6,862.50$   -$          -$        -$        
27 #2064 Sign blank, 48"x30" 5 EA 30.00$    150.00$      28.84$    144.20$      28.59$    142.95$      30.00$    150.00$      47.50$    237.50$      -$          -$        -$        
28 #2480 Sign Blank 48"x36" No Holes 25 EA 36.00$    900.00$      34.47$    861.75$      34.31$    857.75$      36.00$    900.00$      57.00$    1,425.00$   -$          -$        -$        
29 #2524 24"X12" Bare Universal 50 EA 6.55$      327.50$      5.81$      290.50$      6.62$      331.00$      5.60$      280.00$      9.50$      475.00$      -$          -$        -$        
30 #2515 24"x9" Sign Dbl Faced Type IV 10 EA 9.77$      97.70$        11.23$    112.30$      10.08$    100.80$      14.46$    144.60$      12.35$    123.50$      -$          -$        -$        
31 #2516 30"x9" Sign Dbl Faced Type IV 1 EA 11.90$    11.90$        14.04$    14.04$        12.62$    12.62$        18.08$    18.08$        15.45$    15.45$        -$          -$        -$        
32 #2517 36"x9" Sign Dbl Faced Type IV 1 EA 14.03$    14.03$        16.84$    16.84$        15.10$    15.10$        21.69$    21.69$        18.50$    18.50$        -$          -$        -$        
33 #2518 42"x9" Sign Dbl Faced Type IV 200 EA 16.16$    3,232.00$   19.66$    3,932.00$   17.44$    3,488.00$   25.31$    5,062.00$   21.50$    4,300.00$   -$          -$        -$        
34 #2519 48"x9" Sign Dbl Faced Type IV 75 EA 18.29$    1,371.75$   22.45$    1,683.75$   19.88$    1,491.00$   28.92$    2,169.00$   24.75$    1,856.25$   -$          -$        -$        
35 #2520 36"x30" Sign Dbl Faced Type IV 50 EA 44.85$    2,242.50$   55.78$    2,789.00$   50.36$    2,518.00$   54.90$    2,745.00$   61.75$    3,087.50$   -$          -$        -$        
36 #2522 30" School Crossing Blank 50 EA 18.75$    937.50$      15.98$    799.00$      17.44$    872.00$      16.50$    825.00$      21.90$    1,095.00$   -$          -$        -$        
37 #2523  36" School Crossing Blank 60 EA 27.00$    1,620.00$   23.23$    1,393.80$   24.84$    1,490.40$   26.10$    1,566.00$   31.45$    1,887.00$   -$          -$        -$        
38 #1007 Bracket Cantilever Arm KC250 125 EA 7.61$      951.25$      5.13$      641.25$      9.25$      1,156.25$   10.00$    1,250.00$   6.75$      843.75$      11.50$        1,437.50$ -$        -$        
39 #1008 Bracket Sign Banding D022 50/Box 18 Box 93.37$    1,680.66$   77.50$    1,395.00$   89.35$    1,608.30$   64.50$    1,161.00$   52.00$    936.00$      49.97$        899.46$    -$        -$        
40 #1009 Bracket Sign 134SF 50 EA 5.24$      262.00$      4.39$      219.50$      5.55$      277.50$      5.77$      288.50$      5.85$      292.50$      3.10$          155.00$    -$        -$        
41 #1010 Bracket Sign 45SF 1 EA 4.64$      4.64$          3.70$      3.70$          5.55$      5.55$          5.75$      5.75$          4.90$      4.90$          5.25$          5.25$        -$        -$        
42 #1011 Bracket Sign 922SF 100 EA 5.17$      517.00$      4.32$      432.00$      6.20$      620.00$      4.91$      491.00$      5.75$      575.00$      2.85$          285.00$    -$        -$        
43 #1012 Bracket Sign 990SF 250 EA 4.93$      1,232.50$   4.11$      1,027.50$   5.95$      1,487.50$   4.71$      1,177.50$   5.48$      1,370.00$   3.10$          775.00$    -$        -$        
44 #1013 Branding Metal 100'x.030 Ga. 10 EA 47.26$    472.60$      65.48$    654.80$      38.86$    388.60$      50.25$    502.50$      -$        No Bid 24.95$        249.50$    -$        -$        
45 #1015 Buckle Sign Banding 1/2" 5 EA 35.59$    177.95$      0.55$      2.75$          29.63$    148.15$      9.12$      45.60$        -$        No Bid 18.00$        90.00$      -$        -$        

Subtotal: 45,993.09$ 46,138.17$ 48,037.00$ 48,987.47$ 58,529.95$ 3,896.71$ -$        -$        

Tax :

Total: 45,993.09$ 46,138.17$ 48,037.00$ 48,987.47$ 58,529.95$ 3,896.71$ -$        -$        

Delivery shall be made _10_ days ARO 21-30 Days 30-45 Days 10 Days 10 Days 10 Days 10 Days 30 Days 30 Days
Discount offered off price sheet/catalog for 
signs _______%

0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

Discount offered off price sheet/catalog for 
hardware _______%

0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0%

 Exception to 
delivery time 

frame 

 Exception to 
delivery time 

frame 

 Exception 
to delivery 
time frame 

 Exception 
to delivery 
time frame 

P06-0085 Street Signs & Hardware
Safeway Sign Hall Signs Zumar Custom Product Municipal Supply Dyna Engineering Rocal Inc Southwest Indust

NO BID NO BID


