P06-0012

1 1% x 1 %" x 120" square tubing
2 19" x 19" x 144" square tubing
3 27 x 2" x 30" single anchor
4 2" x 2" x 30" two piece breakaway anchor
5 Stainless steel strapping in a plastic carrying
case %" wide by .030 inch nominal thickness by 100’

6 Stainless steel buckles for Item #5

Subtotal:
Tax:

Total:

1 1% x 1 %" x 120" square tubing
2 1% x 1% x 144" square tubing
3 2" x 2" x 30" single anchor
4 27 x 2" x 30" two piece breakaway anchor
5 Stainless steel strapping in a plastic carrying
case %2" wide by .030 inch nominal thickness by 100’

6 Stainless steel buckles for Item #5

Subtotal:
Tax:
Total:

Quantity

1,500
100
500
250
500

3,000

Quantity

1,500
100
500
250
500

3,000

Unit

EA
EA
EA
EA

EA

Unit
EA
EA
EA
EA
EA

EA

SIGN POSTS, SUPPORTS & HARDWARE

|Dyna Engineering | [IS-Square Tube Products | [Traffic Control Service |
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Price Price Price Price Price Price
$ - $ - $ 1740 $ 26,100.00 $ 25.00 $ 37,500.00 *
$ - $ - $ 20.88 $ 2,088.00 $ 29.75 $ 2,975.00
$ - $ - $ 528 $ 2,640.00 $ 6.80 $ 3,400.00
$ - $ - $ - $ - $ 1225 $ 3,062.50 *
$ 2495 $ 12,475.00 no bid no bid $ 36.75 $ 18,375.00
$ 017 $ 510.00 no bid no bid $ 027 $ 810.00
$ 12,985.00 $ 30,828.00 $ 66,122.50
$ 1,012.83 $ 2,404.58 $ 5,157.56
$ 13,997.83 $ 33,232.58 $ 71,280.06

| Centerline Supply West

| [Pacific Products & Services |

Unit
Price
20.35
24.40
5.97
4.20
27.80

0.19

@ P B BB

B B B|H

Extended
Price
30,525.00

2,440.00
2,985.00
1,050.00
13,900.00

570.00

4,014.66
55,484.66

@ BB P

51,470.00

LR R

* B BB

Extended
Price
34,800.00
2,784.00
3,895.00
3,077.50
28,600.00

74,296.50
5,795.13
80,091.63

1,140.00



