P05-002: Replacement Parts
for Refuse Trucks

RLS Heil McNeilus

Line Description Qty. | UOM Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 Spring, 60/90, RLS-0180804 10 |Each $ 440 $ 44.00 | [ $ 1557 $ 155.70 || $ 414 $ 41.40
2 Linkage Pin 1.5, RLS-P2560 1 |Each ||$ 2777 $ 2777 | | $ 39.92 $ 39.92 (| $ 24.92 % 24.92
3 Bushing,1", RLS-0016169003 1 [Bach ||$ 6.30 $ 6.30(|$ 569 $ 5.69 (| $ 9.66 $ 9.66
4 1.50 Bushing Heil X3P10 1 [Each ||$ 12.00 $ 12.00 | [ $ 48.43 $ 48.43 || $ 62.24 $ 62.24
5 Bearing, 2", RLS-0034432 45 |EBach || $ 1776 $  799.20 | | $ 13.65 $ 614.25 || $ 2735 $ 1,230.75
6 Bearing,4", RLS-0034438 10 |Each || $ 5344 $ 53440 |$ 75.36 $ 753.60 || $ 75.60 $ 756.00
7 Rod Eye, Lift, RLS-0016161014 1 [EBach ||$ 54.00 $ 54.00 | [ $ 69.55 $ 69.55 || $ 5255 $ 52.55
8 Rod Eye, Grip, RLS-0321545 3 |Each | [$ 69.00 $  207.00 | |$ 7350 $ 220.50 || $ 97.64 $ 292.92
9 Fuel, Shutoff, 3800675 1 |Each No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Lrg, Cushion In/Out Cyl. RLS-L1013 1 [Each ||$ 20.16 $ 2016 | [ $ 4571 $ 4571 (1 $ 2720 $ 27.20
11 Cushion, Sml, In/Out Cyl. RLS-L1014 1 [Each ||$ 16.54 $ 1654 | [ $ 61.80 $ 61.80 || $ 2231 $ 22.31
12 Hyd, Cyl, Elbow, RL S05433-40006 7 |Each | [$ 541 $ 3787 || $ 1119 $ 78.33 || $ 14.44 $ 101.08
13 Bearing Keeper, RLS-P14 5 |Each || $ 6.80 $ 34.00 | [$ 3143 $ 157.15 || $ 528 $ 26.40
14 Spacer, Lift Arm, RLS-0152926 1 [Each ||$ 741 $ 741 30.00 $ 30.00 || $ 6.74 $ 6.74
15 Drive arm, RLS-0932277 1 [Bach ||$ 23917 $ 23917 |($ 210.00 $ 210.00 || $ 250.00 $ 250.00
16 Grip, Gear, Heil, RLS-0932292 14 [Each [|$ 19298 $ 2,701.72(|$ 189.00 $ 2,646.00 || $ 21711 $ 3,039.54
17 Paddle Asm, Reblt, RLS-P1610R 16 |Each $ 91500 $ 14,640.00 | | $ 925.00 $ 14,800.00 || $ 1,403.97 $ 22,463.52
18 Actuator Plate, Reblt, RLS-P2510R 10 [Each [|$ 299.00 $ 2,990.00(|$ 42500 $  4,250.00 || $ 568.50 $ 5,685.00
19 Bdt, 47, 60/90, Heil, #071-0843 5 |Each $ 8.43 $ 4215 || $ 950 $ 4750 || $ 10.46 $ 52.30
20 SingleLink, RLS-P2540 16 |Each || $ 5520 $ 88320 (% 4285 $ 685.60 || $ 4480 $ 716.80
21 Double Link, RLS-P252 22 |Each $ 7830 $ 1,72260||$ 7425 $ 163350 $ 85.44 $ 1,879.68
22 Double Link, RLS-P253 16 |Each || $ 3968 $ 634.88 | [ $ 2571 $ 411.36 || $ 3164 $ 506.24
23 Crank,assy,93-2278 16 |Each [|$ 23917 $ 3,826.72||$ 210.00 $  3,360.00 || $ 259.92 $ 4,158.72
24 Roller,rubber,62-0717 180 [Each || $ 425 $ 765.00 | [ $ 1283 $ 2,309.40 || $ 498 $ 896.40
25 Bdt,dump arm,71-0837 37 |Each || $ 1295 $  479.15| | $ 14.85 $ 549.45 || $ 1353 $ 500.61
26 Arm,Gripper,93-2614 10 |Each ||$ 21875 $ 218750 |$ 33849 $ 3,384.90 (| $ 42552 $ 4,255.20
27 Arm,lnner,93-2642 10 |Each || $ 54.05 $ 54050 | ($ 97.49 $ 974.90 || $ 114.80 $ 1,148.00
28 Gripper,Outer,93-2686 1 [Bach ||$ 53.05 $ 53.05| [ $ 241.63 $ 24163 || $ 233.62 $ 233.62
29 Gripper,Inner, 93-2632 10 |Each || $ 61.00 $ 61000 |($ 17231 $  1,723.10(| $ 199.93 $ 1,999.30
30 Pressure Switch, Heil, 063-0111 12 |Each || $ 4772 $ 57264 | | $ 56.60 $ 679.20 || $ 7136 $ 856.32
31 Whisker kit, 108-5031-001 1 |Each $ 2315 $ 23.15( | $ 3544 $ 35.44 || $ 51.26 $ 51.26
32 Spacer, #RLS015-2928 80 |Each || $ 217 $ 17360 || $ 395 $ 316.00 || $ 230 $ 184.00
33 Pin, cylinders,48-5644 1 [Bach ||$ 10.04 $ 10.04 | | $ 15.60 $ 15.60 || $ 1149 $ 11.49
34 Cable, Camera, CCA395-100 2 |Each ||$ 13230 $ 264.60 | [ $ 17263 $ 34526 || $ 4084 $ 81.68
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35 In/Out Cylinder, 001-6403 13 |Each || $ 570.00 $ 7,410.00 (% 685.00 $  8,905.00 || $ 658.05 $ 8,554.65
36 Rodeye, Female, RLS0016169014 4 |Each ||$ 50.97 $ 23988 (9% 122.00 $ 488.00 || $ 98.98 $ 395.92
37 Limit Switch, #RL S108738 17 |Each ||$ 15031 $ 2,555.27 | |$ 7490 $  1,273.30 || $ 176.63 $ 3,002.71
38 Arm Actuator, #RL S1082096 4 |Each [|$ 1395 $ 55.80 | | $ 2440 $ 97.60 || $ 18.05 $ 72.20
39 Pin, Lift Pivot, #RL S0485856 1 [EBach ||$ 4050 $ 4050 | [ $ 79.30 $ 79.30 || $ 49.44 $ 49.44
40 Middle Harness, #RL S263-0273-002 4 |Each [|$ 22275 $ 891.00]($ 395.00 $  1,580.00 || $ 312.09 $ 1,248.36
41 Harness, Valve End, #RL S-263-0273-003 5 |[Each [[$ 229.00 $ 1,145.00|($ 107.00 $ 535.00 || $ 128.38 $ 641.90
42 Cushion Kit, Small, In/Out Cylinder, #L19 1 [Each ||$ 84.00 $ 84.00 | [$ 113.00 $ 113.00 || $ 116.00 $ 116.00
43 Cushion Kit, Large, In/Out Cylinder, #L 19N 15 |Each || $ 99.00 $ 1,485.00 (9% 149.00 $ 2,235.00 (| $ 136.00 $ 2,040.00
44 Pin, 11/2 in. Machined, #RL SP2563 8 |Each | [$ 1885 $ 150.80 | | $ 3285 $ 262.80 || $ 2492 $ 199.36
45 Grip Cylinder, Hyd Tube, #354-1670 1 [Bach ||$ 5724 $ 5724 | [ $ 21.00 $ 21.00 || $ 34.00 $ 34.00
46 Grip Cylinder, Hyd Tube, #354-1671 1 [Each ||$ 5419 $ 5419 | [ $ 26.00 $ 26.00 || $ 36.70 $ 36.70
47 Tailgate Cylinder, #RL S0016405 10 |Each ||$ 48125 $ 4,81250]($% 449.00 $  4,490.00 | $ 402.04 $ 4,020.40
48 Roaller, Rubber, 4 in., #062-0712 5 |Each || $ 473 $ 2365 | [$ 10.18 $ 50.90 || $ 8.85 $ 44.25
49 Bushing for Rollers, #093-23-98 2 |Each || $ 161 $ 322 | (% 350 $ 7.00 || $ 0.90 $ 1.80
50 H1082096S, Extra Long Actuator Arm 6 |[Each ||$ 1720 $ 103.20 | | $ 2440 $ 146.40 || $ 18.05 $ 108.30
51 Spacer Plate, Thick H0063251SP 5 |Each || $ 4875 $  243.75|($ 189.00 $ 945.00 || $ 166.14 $ 830.70
52 PTO PSI Swicth (Muncie) 30T37954 10 |Each || $ 46.20 $  462.00 No Bid $ 3060 $ 306.00
53 Hydraulic Fitting, Packer Cylinder H0543340010 | 10 |Each || $ 6.75 $ 6750 | [ $ 15.00 $ 150.00 || $ 964 $ 96.40
54 Turbo Charger, New 3593877-D 5 |Each No Bid No Bid No Bid

55 Tube Clamp, 1" 12-3254 10 |Each || $ 212 $ 21.20 No Bid No Bid

56 Pump 16-219p 1 |Each | |$ 1,337.53 $ 1,337.53 No Bid $  2,655.00 $ 2,655.00
57 Hyd Tube 8-1x156 4 |Each || $ 8595 $  343.80 No Bid No Bid

58 Fitting 8-64-16-12 2 |Bach |[$ 479 $ 9.58 No Bid No Bid

59 Valve H-0316115001 2 |Each |[[$ 53270 $ 1,065.40 | ($ 77400 $  1,548.00 No Bid

60 Valve, Directional H-0316194008 4 |Each [|$ 171.00 $ 684.00]($ 479.84 $ 191936 || $ 47051 $ 1,882.04
61 Clamp With Cushion H-0361474004 1 |Each || $ 210 $ 210 | [ $ 467 $ 467 (| $ 149 $ 1.49
62 Clamp, Tube H-0361474006 1 |Each ||$ 264 $ 264 530 $ 530 | $ 174 $ 1.74
63 Clamp, Tube H-0361474008 24 |Each || $ 288 $ 69.12 | [ $ 579 $ 138.96 || $ 1.96 $ 47.04
64 1 1/4" Clamp With Cushion H-0361474009 20 |Each || $ 382 $ 76.40 | [ $ 744 $ 148.80 || $ 251 $ 50.20
65 Clamp, Tube 1/2" Double H-0361633 5 |Each || $ 262 $ 1310 | [ $ 11.85 $ 59.25 || $ 472 $ 23.60
66 Clamp Tube Twin H-0361637 36 |Each || $ 318 $ 11448 || $ 14.00 $ 504.00 || $ 459 $ 165.24
67 Hose Clamp, Half 2 R H-0361819 4 |Each || $ 15.60 $ 62.40 | [ $ 19.44 $ 77.76 || $ 771 $ 30.84
68 Clamp Bracket Pack H-0361881 8 [EBach |[$ 33.08 $ 26464 | (% 10150 $ 812.00 || $ 97.38 $ 779.04
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69 Collar Tailgate Pin H-0402219 1 |Each || $ 552 $ 552 | (% 460 $ 460 (| $ 549 $ 5.49
70 Collar Body Pivot H-0402483 1 |Each || $ 3.04 $ 3.04| (% 464 $ 464 (| $ 7.00 $ 7.00
71 Collar Tailgate Pin H-0402497 1 |Each || $ 144 $ 144 || $ 350 $ 350 | $ 525 $ 5.25
72 Spacer H-0402499 2 |Each ||$ 371 $ 742 | |$ 6.00 $ 12.00 || $ 325 $ 6.50
73 Clamp H-0402664 1 |Each | [$ 10961 $ 10961 |($ 95.00 $ 95.00 || $ 9288 $ 92.88
74 Pin, Packer H-0485810 2 |Each || $ 4050 $ 81.00 | [$ 55.34 $ 110.68 || $ 2596 $ 51.92
75 Pin, Body Hoist H-0485835 1 |Each || $ 15.15 $ 1515 | [ $ 18.22 $ 18.22 || $ 2322 $ 23.22
76 Pin, Quick Release H-0485840 1 |Each || $ 278 $ 278 | $ 253 $ 253 | $ 382 $ 3.82
77 Pin, Tailgate H-0486023001 1 |Each || $ 6.75 $ 6.75| [ $ 717 $ 717 || $ 6.90 $ 6.90
78 Pin, Tailgate H-0486024001 10 |Each || $ 6.08 $ 60.80 | | $ 740 $ 74.00 || $ 8.82 $ 88.20
79 Latch Tailgate H-0532017 10 |Each || $ 3823 $ 38230 ($ 53.99 $ 539.90 || $ 1713 $ 171.30
80 Elbow, 3/4" 90 Deg H-0542988008 44 |Each || $ 395 $ 17380 | | $ 11.39 $ 501.16 || $ 1452 $ 638.88
81 Elbow, 1" 90 Deg H-0542988010 10 |Each || $ 6.93 $ 69.30 | [ $ 2344 $ 234.40 || $ 19.54 $ 195.40
82 Fitting, 90 Degree Elbow H-0543340006 22 |[Each || $ 541 $ 119.02 | | $ 11.27 $ 247.94 No Bid

83 Fitting, 90 Degree Elbow H-0543340010 10 |Each || $ 775 $ 7750 | [ $ 15.10 $ 151.00 No Bid

84 Union 90 Degree 1 1/2" H-0543533006 15 |Each || $ 961 $ 14415 | | $ 952 $ 142.80 No Bid

85 Bulkhead Fitting H-0543533008 2 |Each || $ 1562 $ 3124 | [ 2375 $ 47.50 No Bid

86 Tube, Hydraulic Lift Cylinder H-0548774 4 |Each || $ 2955 $ 11820 | | $ 2340 $ 93.60 || $ 25.02 $ 100.08
87 Tube, Hydraulic Dump Cylinder H-0548777 4 |Each || $ 5281 $ 21124 |$ 17.40 $ 69.60 || $ 31.20 $ 124.80
88 Tube, Hydraulic Dump Cylinder H-0548778 4 |Each || $ 48.48 $ 193.92 | | $ 43.05 $ 172.20 || $ 39.16 $ 156.64
89 Tube, Hydraulic Grip Cylinder H-0549015 4 |Each || $ 60.64 $ 24256 | |$ 16.13 $ 64.52 || $ 40.86 $ 163.44
90 Washer, In/Out Cylinder H-0551391009 1 |Each ||$ 039 $ 039|($ 0.43 $ 043 (|$ 062 $ 0.62
91 Thrust Washer H-0551452 4 |Each || $ 1261 $ 50.44 | | $ 2759 $ 110.36 || $ 14.70 $ 58.80
92 Sight Gauge H-0670630c 2 |Each || $ 2279 $ 4558 | [ $ 46.90 $ 93.80 || $ 18.70 $ 37.40
93 Gauge, Pressure H-0670640 4 |Each $ 1045 $ 4180 (| $ 2716 $ 108.64 || $ 3464 $ 138.56
94 Filter Element H-0750711001 4 |Each || $ 73.03 $ 29212 (9% 64.08 $ 256.32 || $ 58.86 $ 235.44
95 O-Ring H-0750711003 4 |Each || $ 0.86 $ 344 % 1.04 $ 416 (| $ 157 $ 6.28
96 O-Ring Filter H-0750711006 4 |Each || $ 134 $ 536 | |$ 122 $ 488 (| $ 094 $ 3.76
97 Gasket H-0750711007 2 |Each || $ 12.18 $ 24.36 | [ $ 14.70 $ 29.40 || $ 859 $ 17.18
98 Indicator Filter H-0750711012 2 |Each || $ 4135 $ 82.70 | [ $ 4799 $ 95.98 || $ 2777 $ 55.54
99 Air Regulator H-0750721 4 |Each || $ 6219 $ 24876 || $ 3575 $ 143.00 || $ 62.30 $ 249.20
100 Gauge H-0750721g 10 |Each || $ 1145 $ 11450 || $ 1595 $ 159.50 || $ 536 $ 53.60
101 Element H-0750724001 4 |Each || $ 7334 $ 29336 |($ 54.28 $ 217.12 (| $ 5355 $ 214.20
102 Grip Gear H-0932278 2 |Each |[[$ 239.17 $ 47834 | $ 210.00 $ 420.00 || $ 260.00 $ 520.00
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103 Dump Arm R/R H-0932280 3 |Each [[$ 1,215.00 $ 3,64500|($ 1,425.00 $  4,275.00 || $ 1,007.38 $ 3,022.14
104 Track Weldment H-0932498 1 |Each | [$ 1,25000 $ 1,25000(|$ 1,995.00 $  1,995.00 || $ 1,294.72 $ 1,294.72
105 Arm Gripper Tri-Cuff H-0932614 1 |Each |[$ 21875 $ 21875 (% $ 338.49 $ 33849 || $ 42551 $ 425.51
106 Belt Retainer H-0932630 1 |Each ||$ 1386 $ 1386 | | $ 328 $ 328 || $ 15.10 $ 15.10
107 Arm Inner Tri-Cuff H-0932642 2 |Each || $ 54.05 $ 108.10 |*| $ 97.49 $ 194.98 || $ 11477 $ 229.54
108 Roller Arm Assy. H-1082096 1 |Each ||$ 13.95 $ 13.95 | $ 2440 $ 2440 || $ 18.05 $ 18.05
109 Arm, Limit Switch H-1082096s 1 |Each || $ 17.20 $ 17.20 No Bid $ 18.05 $ 18.05
110 Counter H-1085683 2 |Each |[$ 58.00 $  116.00| (% 160.00 $ 320.00 (| $ 9285 $ 185.70
111 Timer Dual Pump H-1085685 12 |Each || $ 59.07 $ 70884 |$ 50.00 $ 600.00 || $ 17181 $ 2,061.72
112 Limit Switch Heavy Duty H-1087381 28 |Each [|$ 150.31 $ 4,208.68 |* $ 7490 $  2,097.20 || $ 176.63 $ 4,945.64
113 Coordinator Ii Module H-1087697 28 |[Each [|$ 13095 $ 3,666.60|($ 195.00 $ 5,460.00 || $ 519.94 $ 14,558.32
114 Pump H-2191938 25 |Each [|$ 92750 $ 23,18750(|$ 1,185.00 $ 29,625.00 || $ 1,519.25 $  37,981.25
115 Pump H-21920720em 1 |Each | |$ 1,14700 $ 1,147.00||$ 1,19500 $ 1,195.00 (| $ 1,519.25 $ 1,519.25
116 Pump Dennison Tandem R/R H-2192075 3 |Each ||$ 1,367.35 $ 4,10205||$ 2,14500 $  6,435.00 || $ 2,655.00 $ 7,965.00
117 Wear Strip H-2340055001 1 |Each || $ 5535 $ 5535 | [ $ 69.00 $ 69.00 No Bid

118 Loader Harness J-Box End H-2630273001 6 |Each ||$ 17286 $ 1,037.16||$ 185.00 $ 1,110.00 || $ 135.66 $ 813.96
119 Harness Center Section H-2630675002 6 [Each [[$ 229.00 $ 1,37400|($ 345.00 $  2,070.00 || $ 403.75 $ 2,422.50
120 Loader Harness 4-Stack End H-2630975005 3 |Each [|$ 364.00 $ 1,092.00]($ 275.00 $ 825.00 || $ 29750 $ 892.50
121 Lift Arm Assembly H-2726631 2 |Each | |$ 1,190.00 $ 2,380.00||$ 1,47500 $  2,950.00 || $ 1,417.17 $ 2,834.34
122 Floor Liner H-2727278001 4 |Each [|$ 81675 $ 3,267.00(|$ 815.00 $  3,260.00 || $ 679.66 $ 2,718.64
123 Latch Mechanism Asm. H-2727614 15 [Each [|$ 399.00 $ 5,985.00(|$ 875.00 $ 13,125.00 || $ 407.74 $ 6,116.10
124 Fitting 90 Degree H-3109-56-11 4 |Each || $ 281 $ 11.24 No Bid No Bid

125 Chain Mounting Bracket H-3110160 2 |Each || $ 49.00 $ 98.00 | [ $ 50.75 $ 101.50 || $ 49.96 $ 99.92
126 Tube, Hyd. Packer Pressure H-3540434 4 |Each [|$ 156.00 $ 624.00]|($ 46.40 $ 185.60 || $ 17156 $ 686.24
127 Tube, Hydraulic H-3540435 2 |Each [|$ 12656 $ 25312 ($ 3780 $ 75.60 || $ 127.24 $ 254.48
128 Tube, Grip H-3540985 1 |Each |[$ 49.30 $ 4930 || $ 1865 $ 18.65 || $ 3876 $ 38.76
129 Tube, Hydraulic H-3540988 7 |Each || $ 3620 $ 25340 (9% 21.00 $ 147.00 || $ 43.70 $ 305.90
130 Tube, Hydraulic H-3541664 1 |Each |[$ 3193 $ 3193 (| $ 30.00 $ 30.00 || $ 25.02 $ 25.02
131 Tube, Hydraulic H-3541665 1 |Each ||$ 26.36 $ 26.36 | | $ 26.45 $ 26.45 (| $ 2439 $ 24.39
132 Tube, Hydraulic H-3541667 1 |Each ||$ 5298 $ 5298 | [ $ 2275 $ 2275 || $ 48.98 $ 48.98
133 Tube, Dump Pressure H-3541669 1 |[Each $ 4951 $ 4951 (| $ 32.00 $ 32.00 || $ 2994 $ 29.94
134 Tube, Grip Pressure H-3541670 1 |Each |[$ 57.24 $ 5724 || $ 2317 $ 2317 (| $ 34.00 $ 34.00
135 Tube, Hydraulic H-3541680 1 |Each | [$ 13524 $ 135.24 | | $ 63.30 $ 63.30 No Bid

136 Tube, Hydraulic H-3541681 1 |Each ||$ 13254 $ 13254 | | $ 39.25 $ 39.25 No Bid
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137 Tri-Cuff Grabber H-3720233 2 |Each $ 33649 $ 67298 | | $ 550.00 $ 1,100.00 || $ 697.00 $ 1,394.00
138 Lift Arm Assembly H-3720332a 1 |Each | [$ 128070 $ 1,280.70(|$ 2,250.00 $  2,250.00 || $ 1,312.20 $ 1,312.20
139 Support Vertical H-B1622 1 |Each || $ 69.66 $ 69.66 No Bid $ 50.00 $ 50.00
140 Angle Brace H-B16163 3 |Each || $ 1269 $ 38.07 No Bid $ 6.62 $ 19.86
141 Nut, 7/8-14 Gr8 H-Fs251700 1 |Each $ 0.78 $ 078]|$ 1.30 $ 130 $ 1.06 $ 1.06
142 Pin 1 /2" Machine H-P256 1 |Each |[$ 18.85 $ 18.85 || $ 3285 $ 3285(|$ 24.92 % 24.92
143 Split Bushing Pm-21111161 3 |Each || $ 14.18 $ 42.54 No Bid $ 10.63 $ 31.89
144 Eye Bolt, 1/6 Pm-2503252 1 |Each ||$ 1155 $ 11.55 No Bid $ 2272 $ 22.72
145 Turnbuckle Pac-Mor Pm-4108164 1 |Each || $ 2213 $ 22.13 No Bid $ 83.86 $ 83.86
146 Cylinder, Tailgate Pm-4149067 1 |Each | |$ 675.00 $  675.00 No Bid $ 78242 $ 782.42
147 Turnbuckle Assy. Pm-4218127 2 |Each || $ 84.00 $ 168.00 No Bid $ 102.10 $ 204.20
148 Filter Element Pm-K 25002 2 |Bach |[$ 29.35 $ 58.70 No Bid $ 30.18 $ 60.36
149 Lid, 36x58 Prt-58 2 |Bach |9 17.70 $ 35.40 No Bid No Bid
150 Cable 7/8" X 21' W/ D-Ring Ro-780021d 1 |Each | |$ 13681 $ 136.81 No Bid No Bid
Sub Total: $125,458.17 $ 151,885.19 $  178,064.62
Tax: $ 10,162.11 $ 14,423.23
Grand Total: $135,620.28 $ 151,885.19 $  192,487.85
City of Peoria requires delivery within two (2) days
A.R.O. Monday thru Friday
Bidder offers days for delivery A.R.O. 1Day 0 Days 1 Day
City of Peoria requires delivers of back orders within
four (4) days A.R.O. Monday thru Friday
Bidder offers days for delivery on back
orders A.R.O. 2 Day 4 Days 4 Day
Discount percentage offered off catalog % 10% 10% 15%
The City of Peoria’s Fleet Department hours of
operation are 6:00 a.m. to 9:00 p.m.
Bidder hours of operation a.m. to p.m. 5a.m. to 10p.m. 6a.m. to 4p.m. 7a.m. to 5p.m.
Bidder delivery hours a.m. to p.m. 5a.m. to 10p.m. 7a.m. to 7p.m. 7a.m. to 5+p.m.
After hours delivery _ p.m.to____ p.m. 10p.m. to 5a.m. As Required N/A

* Line differs on solicitation



